New Castle, CO 81647

Posted:

Remove:
"Town of New Castle Administration Department
450 W. Main Street Phone: (970) 984-2311
PO Box 90 Fax: (970) 984-2716

www.newcastlecolorado.org

Agenda

New Castle Town Council Regular Meeting
Tuesday, March 21, 2023, 7:00 PM

Starting times on the agenda are approximate and intended as a guide for Council.
The starting times are subject to change by Council, as is the order of items on the agenda.

Virtual Meetings are subject to internet and technical capabilities.

To join by computer, smart phone or tablet click HERE

If you prefer to telephone in:
Please call: 1-346-248-7799
Meeting ID: 709 658 8400

Follow the prompts as directed. Be sure to set your
phone to mute until called on

The Council Packet is available HERE

Call to Order

Pledge of Allegiance
Roll Call

Meeting Notice
Conflicts of Interest
Agenda Changes

Citizen Comments on Items not on the Agenda
-Comments are limited to three minutes-

Consultant Reports
Consultant Attorney
Consultant Engineer

Items for Consideration

A. Discussion: 2021 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code page 3

B. Ordinance TC 2023-1 - an Ordinance of the New Castle Town Council

Amending Chapter 16.12.120 of the Municipal Code (1st reading) page 20

Page 1



http://www.newcastlecolorado.org/
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/7096588400
https://www.newcastlecolorado.org/meetings?field_microsite_tid_1=27

C. Capital Committee Report page 23

D. Consider a Letter of Support to Reduce Train Speeds Through New Castle P29¢ 24

Consent Agenda

Items on the consent agenda are routine and non-controversial and will be approved by one
motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items unless a council member or citizen
requests it, in which case the item will be removed from the consent agenda.

February 21, 2023 minutes page 25

March 7, 2023 minutes page 31

Resolution TC 2023-6 - Approving an MOU with Garfield County for Mosquito Control page 39
Kum & Go Modification of Premises for FMBW Liquor License page 46

Staff Reports

Town Administrator
Town Clerk

Town Treasurer
Town Planner

Public Works Director

Commission Reports

Planning & Zoning Commission
Historic Preservation Commission
Climate and Environment Commission
Senior Program

RFTA

AGNC

GCE

EAB

Council Comments

Adjourn

Page 2



"Town of New Castle Administration Department
450 W. Main Street  Phone: (970) 984-231 |

PO Box 90  Fax: (970) 984-2716
New Castle, CO 81647

www.newcastlecolorado.org

Memorandum
To: Mayor & Council
From: David Reynolds, Paul Smith, Lauren Prentice
Re: Agenda Item: Adoption of the Wildland-Urban Interface Code
Date: 03/21/23
Purpose:

The purpose of this agenda item is to review and discuss the possible adoption of the 2021 Wildland Urban
Interface Code (WUI Code). In discussions with Colorado River Fire Rescue (CRFR), town staff has been working
to understand threat levels that might be associated with New Castle development, both existing and future,
as it relates to our proximity to wildfire risk.

The International Code Council (ICC) has developed the WUI Code in order to assist towns in understanding
area risk levels, determining area building code standards, assigning fire resistant building material
classifications, and addressing defensible space including vegetation and secondary structures. With the help
of CRFR, staff has developed a proposal for adoption of the WUI Code with appropriate modifications specific
for the Town of New Castle.

Staff will present the WUI Code with modifications in order to share our understanding of the code and gain
feedback from Town Council in order to properly adopt this code for the residents of New Castle.

Page 3


http://www.newcastlecolorado.org/

TOWN OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. TC 2023-03

AN ORDINANCE OF THE NEW CASTLE TOWN COUNCIL ADDING
CHAPTER 15.25 TO THE NEW CASTLE MUNICIPAL CODE FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE 2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL WILDAND
URBAN INTERFACE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS.

WHEREAS, pursuant to Article 1V of the Charter of the Town of New Castle (“Town”)
and C.R.S. 8 31-16-202, the Town is authorized to adopt codes by reference; and

WHEREAS, the Town has previously adopted by reference the 2015 editions of the
International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Mechanical
Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Plumbing Code, the International Existing
Building Code, and the International Fire Code (collectively, the “ICodes”);

WHEREAS, the ICodes serve as the building codes for the Town as set forth in Title 15 of
the New Castle Municipal Code (“Town Code”),

WHEREAS, Colorado River Fire Rescue (“CRFR”) has recommended that the Town adopt
regulations to protect from potential wildfire impacts within Town limits by requiring improved
fire resistance of new buildings and provisions for vegetative fuel management; and

WHEREAS, other neighboring municipalities with high exposure to wildland fire risk have
adopted similar ordinances meant to improve resilience and safety during a wildfire event; and

WHEREAS, to be consistent with these communities and promote the health, safety, and
welfare of Town residents, the Town Building Official has recommended that the Town adopt the
2021 version of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code (“WUI Code”); and

WHEREAS, Town staff has reviewed the WUI Code in light of the Town’s unique physical
setting and development needs and determined that the amendments set forth herein will ensure
efficient administration and enforcement; and

WHEREAS, on ******* Town Council (“Council”) conducted a public workshop to
discuss the merits and practicality of such adoption; and

WHEREAS, on ******* Council conducted a duly notice public hearing regarding the
adoption of the updated editions of the International Codes pursuant to C.R.S. § 31-16-203; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN
OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Recitals. The foregoing Recitals are incorporated as findings of the Town
Council.

Page 4



Section 2. Adoption. Council hereby adopts by reference the 2021 edition of the International
Wildland Urban Interface Code, subject to the amendments set forth in Section 3 of this Ordinance.
The new provisions will occupy Chapter 15.25 to the New Castle Municipal Code.

Section 3. Code Amendments to Town Code Chapter 15.25. New section Chapter 15.25 of
the Town Code include the following amendments to the WUI Code. Appendices A through H
will not be mandatory but may serve to inform risk assessments and vegetation management
planning. Those sections of the WUI Code not expressly amended in this Ordinance shall remain
unchanged and in full force and effect. All title pages and tables of contents shall be updated
accordingly.

Chapter 15.25 — International Wildland Urban Interface Code
15.25.010 Adoption by reference.

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by the Town Charter and C.R.S. § 31-16-
201 et seq., there is adopted by reference thereto the International Wildland Urban Interface Code,
2021 Edition, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 Flossmoor Road, Country
Club Hills, lllinois 60478. The purpose and subject matter of this code is to regulate and govern
the safeguarding of life and property from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy
of buildings and premises in the Town and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of
fees therefor.

15.26.020 Amendments.
The International Wildland Urban Interface Code, 2021 Edition, is hereby amended as follows:
Section 101.1 Insert: “Town of New Castle”
Section 102.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code
shall be those that are listed in Chapter 7 and such codes and standards shall be considered
as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extents of each reference and as
further regulated in Sections 102.4.1. and 102.4.2. References to the 2021 editions of the
International Building Code and the International Fire Code will be replaced with the
currently adopted 2015 editions.
Section 103.1 Insert: “The Town of New Castle Building Department”

Sections 104.3 through 104.3.1 is hereby deleted. Section 15.04.030 of the Municipal Code
shall control.

Subsection 106.3 #2 is hereby repealed. Chapter 15.48 of the Municipal Code shall control.

Page 5



Chapter 3 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:
Chapter 3: Wildland-Urban Interface Area

Section 301.1 Studies provided by the Garfield County Community Wildfire Protection
Plan (2022, see Exhibit **) demonstrate that all lands within Town boundaries and all lands
within the proposed the Urban Growth Boundary as represented in the New Castle
Comprehensive Plan (Exhibit **) are subject to wildland fire potential that poses hazards
to human life, safety, and property. CRFR therefore deems the entirety of these lands to
lie within the Wildland-Urban Interface Area as defined in WUI Code Chapter 2 and
thereby subject to the mitigation provisions of this Chapter. Council, in consultation with
the staff, CRFR, and any other outside referral agencies, may reevaluate and recommend
modification to the wildland-urban interface area as necessary.

Chapter 4 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:
Chapter 4: Wildland-Urban Interface Area Requirements

Section 401.1 As part of the wildland-urban interface area, all new land use applications
submitted to the municipality, including but not limited to annexations, master plans,
planned urban developments (“PUDs”), subdivisions, rezoning, PUD or master plan
amendments, or any other land use proposals considered by the Building Official to be at
risk to wildland fire impact, shall be subject to review and comment by CRFR.

Section 402.1 Applications subject to CRFR review will be evaluated for wildfire hazard
posed to persons and/or property as well as mitigation measures considered with the
proposals. CRFR will be asked to evaluate the site plan for planned or existing roads, water
supply facilities, configuration and location of lots, topography of the site, types and
density of vegetation or other fuels present, the fire protection measures proposed by the
applicant, and any other relevant factors in making its recommendation.

Section 403.1 If CRFR finds that wildfire hazards exist to persons and property as a result

of the proposed land use, CRFR is requested to recommend mitigation techniques to be
incorporated by the Town into the land use application approval, including but not limited
to additional access for emergency vehicles, turnouts, establishment of adequate grades
and sight distances, the establishment of fuel breaks, location of proposed vegetation, and
any mitigation measures for current vegetation.

Section 404.1 The Town will consider the recommendations of CRFR and incorporate
them into any final land use approval that is determined to be appropriate.

Section 502 and Table 502.1 is hereby repealed.
Section 503.1 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:

503.1 General. Buildings and structures hereafter constructed, modified, or relocated into

3
Page 6



or within wildland-urban interface areas shall meet the construction requirements for Class
1 ignition-resistant construction in Section 504. Materials required to be ignition-resistant
shall comply with the requirements of Section 503.2.

Subsection 503.2 #1.1 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:

1.1 Flame Spread. Materials shall exhibit a flame spread index not exceeding 75 (Class
B). However, in no instance shall materials be excluded from structures which exhibit a
lower flame spread index of 25 or less (Class A).

Section 504 shall be amended to include the following exception in all instances were compliance
with Section 2303.2 of the International Building Code is listed as an approved method for fire
resistant construction:

Exception: Materials exhibiting a flame spread index not exceeding 75 (Class B).
However, in no instance shall building materials be excluded from structures which exhibit
a lower flame spread index of 25 or less (Class A).
Section 504.10 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:
504.10 Vents. Attic ventilation openings, foundation or underfloor vents, or other
ventilation openings in vertical exterior walls and vents through roofs shall not exceed 144
square inches (0.0929 m?) each. Such vents shall be covered with noncombustible
corrosion-resistant mesh with openings not to exceed a minimum of 1/16-inch and a
maximum of 1/8-inch.
Exception: Openings size is not limited where approved rated vents are installed.
Subsection 504.10.1 is hereby amended to include the following exception:

Exception: Attic ventilation may be permitted in soffits if vents are listed with an
approved testing agency in compliance with ASTM E2886.

Section 505 is hereby repealed.

Section 506 is hereby repealed.

Section 602 is hereby repealed.

Section 603.2 and Table 603.2 are hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:
603.2 Fuel Modification. The fuel modification distance shall not exceed 30 feet or the
distance to the lot line, whichever is less. The distance shall be measured on a horizontal
plane from the perimeter or projection of the building or structure as shown in Figure 603.2.

The fuel modification distance may be modified at the discretion of the Building Official
if it is found that conditions on the site exist such that the required distance is impracticable.

4
Page 7



Section 604.1 is hereby amended to include the following exception:

Exception: The Building Official or a designated representative may allow
vegetative clustering or the densification of certain species only if such species are
listed on the FireWise Plant List provided by Colorado State University or other
equivalent list. For purposes of this code, a cluster is any grouping of shrubs,
bushes or trees whose stems or trunks occupy no more than fifty (50) square feet
(e.g. 8 foot diameter circle). Each vegetative cluster must maintain the required
separation between other clusters or vegetation as provided by this Chapter.

Section 604.4 is hereby repealed and replaced by the following text:

604.4 Trees. Tree crowns extending to within 10 feet of any structure shall be pruned to
maintain a minimum horizontal clearance of 10 feet. Tree crowns within the fuel
modification distance shall be pruned to remove limbs up to a minimum of 4 feet above
the adjacent ground surface.

Exception: For newly planted trees, pruning of limbs above the ground surface
shall not be required to exceed a pruning height to tree height ratio of 1:6. However,
at no time shall any tree limbs be any lower than one (1) foot above the adjacent
ground surface.

Section 4. Severability. Each section of this Ordinance is an independent section and a
holding of any section or part thereof to be unconstitutional, void, or ineffective for any cause shall
not be deemed to affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section or part thereof.

Section 5. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be effective fourteen days after final
publication pursuant to section 4.3 of the Town Charter.

INTRODUCED on *********x% at which time copies were available to the Council and
to those persons in attendance at the meeting, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered
published in full and posted in at least two public places within the Town as required by the
Charter.

INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the Town of New
Castle, Colorado on **********x 'ragd by title and number, passed with amendments, approved,
ordered, and published as required by the Town Charter.

TOWN OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO
TOWN COUNCIL

By:

Art Riddile, Mayor
ATTEST:

Page 8



Melody Harrison, Town Clerk

A

Page 9



New Castle
: | ~ | Comprehensive Plan
i Nl e Future Land Use

i : ' Legend

S 3 -BusinessCampus

- Mixed Use-Commer Focus

- Industrial

I:I Mixed Use-Res Focus 6-10/Ac
Mixed Use-Res Focus 4-6/Ac

: : Gl Rural Low Density
v . 0 =
s “-"-.i.- o 3 . .
5 L . Clustered Residential
L e g g N : :
e g I g e : < Planned Urban Center
e o e : ;
"‘_‘:._-ﬂ"i" > Pi"&ﬂs‘- . e Open Space
g s +! ek gl + el 05 aa g ¥ . . N
; l =i 7":::: ___‘::u‘: ."i_ﬁ 7":::: '.“;\us-."‘:_,_m- sl - Environmental Protection
b e e e e

FhL L e e S

East Gateway
South_Gateway
West Gateway
North Gateway

L
e
%
%*

=== CountyRoads

Hard Surface Trails

Soft Surface Trails

Coloro NC Trails

Maderas Trail

of .
L nnmE City
Future_Collector

StreamsDitches

e UGB

—— CityStreets

CountyRoads

—+— Railroads

—— Highways

\:I Rivers Lakes

SubdivisionStreets

0 015 03 06 0.9 12 Western Slope PaRfultthg LLC
Miles May 25, 2009



() CALTOPO (#) Help new castle, co (] Settings () Close ‘Sign Up.

i W Map Layers

r

2016 — : 3 . A - ] o I L O/ . - : ’/ e [ 3 e : = / -7 L
- —I FICEANCE | Big S020 £ / / v * W , {:j-‘x i e, o s [ i .
”; Unsaved h’hp - - T N et ¢ Y o A ; . ¥ W L) 38977688, -107.97707
Jrs oy i 3 i-M : Y ¥ 007 i : b i - LWl il T ) ! = =" [ p— =i TN
| . 2017 | i (¢ EAST/MEADOW/CREEK. . [ .E“”Et':":' MesZs 4 WhitgRiver Pdltwu B X g P d A e
T e DEERIGULCH . b o o gl Y / ; b : S e = ik i 77601 WGS84 [
== £ r—' ke 1 - A ! / ' ’ & :: Qé:‘j'" : - HH "} = Er} wem = | | MapBuilder Topo W
AT | '- - ; o e, { TNEEC 0L j : e, L - = s ! oy ¢ P
- W )\ 'DEEP/CREEK POINT & ; - , : \ T AN - 9 ) |

Pt
E
f

| 5
)| % | + Stack ba
L

') :IH"'_.\, lr 4 'r.. - 3 ol .1 -'-- o .;'\- ! - ....x.l —:J\.\_-‘-l T -: | L\-\_r"-; I'_
.y L2010 f A e g = - ) - g ; EMiap She

w, L e L i 1 I .'
. MEADOW. CREEK I . By \ T D I_l_—l j
s ho 2007 / o 2000% 2003 L d - |__ LI 14 [

o Coneey . e ; \ iR _ _
Sar =4 HSPRING CREEK [ N CRANE.PARK o . ] : B . Stack May

e ' . o Joe : % \ P e IR Blowaut > !

~-BLM L T N ' r E e 5 R, = g 5
Calorado .‘.J 7 ’% s o Lo b e Baxter | e

F;l'q'.Ef 'y L ELrﬂ .I .-" : - & L q |h:' .. %

\IFEIIL!FI;'F -‘CEiiﬁ'Fa‘-El"g %) [ . ; / Flatm:nn 3004 . eIt 2il Gulch o {

River W jri WhiteRiver Natiofal £ !e | i S ‘gl : SLDOTSERD.CRATER Tl | - :
Office y f V] - IR P’ : ofest - | R ; ] et = | = ! e -
Jﬂ}ﬂ ""E.'L‘E’ i &/ T v i R R G T K pol L e [oRtim ek
rJ_Ll_r] fiice. | - !—i:]_r\ AL AN g Pt S X ol d N e i PSSt i -
{ [TColbFado A I 2 RSy " : f
\ .;' River .-H‘L"_"L.. i ‘_.J K f'%FI'{ i3 / B \ L ! HI\"{ v . 8410
~ W ; L oy : L-L." ] _I A & i ! A
.&ndgee Ber -Lu.rglmrk b 1—513(}:'3 Figld rlf D Ij _ _| : oo kL \\ L
A : % !
L—L#L—- |erry E!iem;hmarle E-]"l?rJB @Tj‘g "—g CO7Seet %, =3 :] ': Il g . F'[m.
3 ‘~=|' E : ] 20204 ; —-
: "ﬁf'jljr E!-'.J"nll'lg 68051 ROCKINIEINEST) | —LrBLM, g 3 (A 1"'-[': 2011 _ iy
AP I AT . ™ "L NS ool -mmm{ﬂ-'ﬂL g —— \ Guzziyciceia IO Bino creen
mMesa ./ “rz007 NEWCASTLES  Rives 5 | | N _IJ—v .
b LU 3 ’edarm Tkl L Aratiey '—v A S S
LT RAM!UANES T 1 n PR lgga | Saat % ? ) Ly
: Ji=2005 NewsEastle g4 Field - 5 N T

et

{ Horse, 20137 |
i , i

F'EIEEL.'_

sl
Brus

Rig Blanen

i

Edbj g1gpa 2018 [

=

oy

: 4 * i 2008
N ' I Colorado P HIGHWAY 13

()= N PR 82010
Bl . . WATER GREEK

-

BH|@

y
J

Redl

]
|
L

7 A i ] i Do e YR R{:ﬂahLP’%t&au
! B | X ol ot

: : ara
S T Lo T 1 aner -
d ﬁ F [ ; N [ | Malley Roan Cls

RS ®
v

- g 4 P s Fleld, e fei ond A CHI G TR 5 i o,
] ! Y G - : L& Ly SURUGHTERIGULCHTR TR rﬂﬁ'jnm- ; L A s L
i . . o ™ e | ._‘.-I; g - ! fia - Rt it ]
LT v - i . Hog'Back L 2002 ¥ f e

i { % - I— |._|.-.|.I"'.|. EF.-"J'-"
f ""-i""__nl-l I:!, I"-"I,__-.a ! o, T HD"’ e {

|
pjalLES

'g920

I_I . e 3
v Web*_-.teq Mesa 3 IOLLUEY MESAY ! . - o ’:I = e ! ! Suicide
: Weible ™/ 1 ) 3 L b _ 1 M 4 ¢
0 ;"U‘.' T} Sl \ WO A ‘ 201380 | | B = s
! | : i Dividel Cree 'i_| 2005. =A% Ky Vogodd 20159 L~ . : Ty
| - il : S 1 — 1l F \T : i i ; o
[~ g ' LI oL Llil 1L_1A = L J I__f | Red La| Yo ,. > r.'f
':'.*'ITau-_:Jhr:nlm[mqh Mesa,. '5_ ' . :x . —l- |— o ah ; “:, 3 \2020 5 4 _ e
\ 22 J ) 33 ot :,. A | ‘LLL %‘lJ_‘__ . | G nyo| Tl - . _.H.c!__uan?r Eenfhm:s‘lfrk
J _J -} ” LS ». _ ,]‘:FEIUEI_ [_,I ,_‘ TLEL. ! I I: S o3 .
RED AP P'- PLERL I GrassMesa =2l ; BT il BLiM . | ) "

2002 S i | R
PEMORAMA

H|:- J*-'T-.‘_lr' Mrl "|“F_.|I"|

1 ‘ i 5 I-"-_ l_l_ ’_[ |_‘ 7 | . _: [ ] I_l l'ﬁ'ﬂlil?':," . Ij T.--I_' '
P | " | - | Y il Ti by, = 1 I, b .
] . o e 3'—’”' L' unterMesa | YV /T & o ol ’ | M A 5
ran [_} Al | F-:'H"l FINE | rl_ H pie | WE i I LLi ==/ 15U '_—i ?nm W e T \
. _ - _I - [ B ¥ I Ug MESE > _.; e - F | __.II "y ., = _: e li-"'-l . —— 5 e i " | ik
_JJ _ ::| 1 F:_ ' ' 'v'uhtw. River Natignal Forest -] "'_ I_"—| ' Ly A PR e e -|_|_i| '-’ﬁ DIVID L it L AR
I - G . - i /] ¢ i u - L 4 * Little Baldy B
. Hbuston .' S J / 3 \_LJ I ~|—‘ : l_llle el Pl
| 1 K 1 - il 1 ; .:I{ " L. T
.'I Ry WL .. e : | - E - ----___:- o - . i } [ I._ i .
Cacheltreek ; JJJ I -1._:[.' = ___EEEE!I_‘_L ____f’IJ v o #y
w I:guth Mdmm o i RN ™ e

Cle

4

| - i i l-\_L r g i |
. " p IJ Ea ra - Centery "
HU““*’ I""“w.*[-l“ _I..l_‘-a lf“ f_l Fli tlrnnl—ll'-ﬂesa . 4 I .—] {" ( . CIE.'I::ETD LL_. = ~a- ’

= B Weather Stations (pro)

B Aircraft (pro)

3

m

BLM
feolorada
River
Valley

Held. [

3
Basalt

fi2018
La-lre Christine

Leigan

LJHT (6 -L_LF." Y

2006 ri'llf-."'lJ - e .—-"'o._,_‘__.,..—r'- 1 ITime
Spring CII'_‘I'k..? | L Fa : T : d :"

1 | IMesa _ \

e Woss Bald—

Garfield S . Colaradn

il RiRitkin ey
) "| Walley | { o r—LL:Ix
FPfFmenJEenchmark

Office el

|' e ETI ] rJI.Jl.Js
Riverii} 4 an'rF Hluer I"-.Ia'rlnrlal Forest ~ ./ o ,._1:] i o | _ ' r'J .'r I:-
I '-ﬂ'rl”ﬂ"‘r' | 1 i ~ i uﬂ. : Eﬂ - -y 3o ___' L o . : : ez L [ _r:l i ;'.
Field e o B e53 A L 4, . A b W
it I HE'FStE'C“ SoUth Mamis, e -T y Jar BLM ; i .
r 1| '__;Garheldl_

Lnicle Bob | g : _Pu*-}

L Oreek Mesa~—— o ] -_'é._'_ ..... l Sugarioaf

H oo BT o b F o - =
7| @ Smﬂmrgl £20085%. \
; Sﬂer_.'.J ETOR

/1 5 km _h;dLh.l.-'
MITH. GULEH : Horse

Flagpole /

Flatiran 7 A ’ - ':.I:-|'I}F-:|d{|
4y ol T e e, e River
| 17-2021 5= e 12002 Ei:] ok
| | - J HLLHa— "irE-FlE'f,.f il

THOMPSON €

7 ot =~ PR Siga
N '.'.njfﬁn:u : -

bl .'II -"r Elk Bald -~_

.l| ] | !

A o Little Eald;'r_

py— L i A, . f N . h Y ————
a 1 Grand Mesa National Forest k:cup X -l | ; — - | LT . 1Rl LA £ il iy,
L‘\"'J f‘r’r_‘m\ !-— ] | | - ':n:-l. o ll r :'—| - .-—-.E—UI:JI.E. i g I.| Ao e Baid}l Am -y z | - .F-rﬂ*ﬁ LQ |l'. i = E




Risk Assessment

Figure 14: Urban Interface Study Area Wildfire Hazard Areas

Fos i | b
. - Communities
Wildfire Risk

L [ 1 - Lowest Risk

[ 2- Low Risk

Rio Blanco County [ 3 - Moderate Risk

B 4 - High Risk

\- 5 - Highest Risk

Garfield County.

S
y

s

O
Glenwood w

Springs g

Eagle Coun

Garfield County.

Mesa County Pitkin Count

s}
Q
4 O"/)a, %2
9 Urban Interface Study Area
:Cg ,g_;—
=13 2022 Hazard Mitigation Plan _
Wildfire Hazard

54 Garfield County Community Wildfire Protection Plan ¢ 2022

Page 12



CONSTRUCTION ALLOWED

FOR EXTERIOR WALLS

MAXIMUM 6" GAP

SLOPE 23% IS
4~ GREATER THAN 10%

-

Commentary Figure 504.7.1

PROTECTION UNDER DECK ON A SLOPE
Page 13

2021 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE®and COMM



Unmodified
fuel

Modified
fuel

Modified
fuel

fuel

Tabular —— | >

le—— Tabular

FIGURE 603.2
MEASUREMENTS OF FUEL MODIFICATION DISTANCE

Unmodified

MINIMUM
10’

GRASSES
MOWED

MINIMUM
10'

Commentary Figure 603.2.2
10-FOOT SEPARATION BETWEEN TREE CROWNS AND STRUCTURES

Page 14

921 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE®and COMMENTARY

6-3







SPARK
ARRESTER

/

MINIMUM
10

] MINIMUM
MINIMUM 6 10

Commentary FiguF26i1.44
TREES MUST BE TRIMMED AND MAINTAINED










LUXURY MOUNTAIN LODGE - FIRELINE FIRE TREATMENT - MONTANA TIMBER PRODUCTS

Page 19




"Town of New Castle Administration Department
450 W. Main Street  Phone: (970) 984-231 |

PO Box 90  Fax: (970) 984-2716
New Castle, CO 81647

www.newcastlecolorado.org

Memorandum
To: Mayor & Council
From: David Reynolds
Re: Agenda Item: Ordinance TC 2023-1 Dog Barking Ordinance
Date: 03/21/23
Purpose:

The purpose of this agenda item is to consider TC 2023-1 which makes adjustments to the Town’s Municipal
Code Section 6.12.120 “Barking Dogs.”

During our regular meeting held on March 7, 2023, town staff reported concerns regarding our municipal code
related to barking dogs. According to current Municipal Code, the enforcement of Barking Dog issues in New
Castle relies on “two or more complaining witnesses from separate households who have signed such
complaint ...” Staff has found that this section of code limits the response that our law enforcement officers
may take when addressing issues of barking dogs. Having to rely on two or more complainants is not always a
practical solution to addressing barking dog reports, and often leaves our Police Officers with very few
enforcement options.

With the help of our Town Attorney, Council reviewed the history of this code section, and discussed possible
updates that would lower the burden of needing two complainants in order to effectively address a barking
dog nuisance. Staff was instructed to address the issue by returning to Council at a later meeting with an
adjusted Municipal Code Section for Council consideration.

Page 20


http://www.newcastlecolorado.org/

TOWN OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. TC 2023-1

AN ORDINANCE OF THE NEW CASTLE TOWN COUNCIL AMENDING
SECTION 6.12.120 OF THE NEW CASTLE MUNICIPAL CODE.

WHEREAS, Section 6.12.120 of the New Castle Municipal Code (“Code”) prohibits any
person within the Town of New Castle (the “Town”) from keeping or harboring any dog or other
animal that, without provocation, by frequent, habitual or continued barking, yelping, howling or
other audible sound causes an unreasonable disturbance to any person, and declares such harboring
or keeping a public nuisance (the “Barking Dog Offense”); and

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Barking Dog Offense currently requires two or more
complaining witnesses from separate households; and

WHEREAS, the Town finds that this requirement has had a chilling effect on complaints and
enforcement of the Barking Dog Offense; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council now desires to amend Section 6.12.120 of the Code to
remove the requirement of two or more complaining witnesses from separate households and
instead implement a warning procedure as set forth below.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN
OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO:

1. Recitals. The foregoing recitals are incorporated by reference herein as findings
and determinations of the Town Council.

2. Amendment. The Town Council hereby amends Section 6.12.120 of the Code as
follows, with added language in bold and underlined and removed language stricken. Those
provisions of the Municipal Code not expressly amended by this Ordinance shall remain
unchanged and in full force and effect.

6.12.120 — Barking dogs.

separate-heuseholdsshalHhave testified-attrial- Upon receipt of a complaint of an alleged
violation of this Section, the Town shall issue a written warning citing this section and
describing the nature of the alleged violation. Should the Town receive a second
complaint for the same dog or animal, the following penalties shall be imposed, in
order of escalation:

Second offense: $ fine
Third offense: $ fine
Fourth offense: $ fine

Page 21



Fifth offense: $ [fine] [municipal court summons and compliant]

Complaints may be filed by any citizen of the Town or a A-code enforcement officer or
pollce offlcer of the Town Who has personally investigated the complaint-ef-a-single
M and or who has personally

observed the problem behaV|or of the dog or other animal Wlth regard to its frequent,

habitual or contmued barkmg yelping or howhng—sh&“—sahs@—the—rewpement—fepthe

pepsenal—ebsewatlen—at—m&l. AII complalnts must be S|qned bv the comblalnant or the

investigating officer.

3. Severability. If any section, subsection, or clause of this Ordinance shall be deemed
to be unconstitutional or otherwise invalid, the validity of the remaining sections, subsections, and
clauses shall not be affected thereby.

4. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be effective 14 days after final publication
pursuant to Section 4.3 of the Town Charter.

INTRODUCED on March 21, 2023, at which time copies were available to the Town
Council and to those persons in attendance at the meeting, read by title, passed on first reading,
and ordered published in full and posted in at least two public places within the Town as required
by the Charter.

INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Town Council of the Town of
New Castle, Colorado, on , 2023, read by title and number, passed without
amendment, approved, and ordered published as required by the Charter.

TOWN OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO
TOWN COUNCIL

By:

Art Riddile, Mayor
ATTEST:

Melody Harrison, Town Clerk

Page 22



"Town of New Castle Administration Department
450 W. Main Street  Phone: (970) 984-231 |

PO Box 90  Fax: (970) 984-2716
New Castle, CO 81647

www.newcastlecolorado.org

Memorandum
To: Mayor & Council
From: David Reynolds
Re: Agenda ltem: 2022 Capital Committee Report
Date: 03/21/23
Purpose:

The purpose of this agenda item is to review and discuss the 2023 Capital Committee findings and suggestions.

Since the beginning of 2023, the Capital Committee (consisting of Department Heads and two Council
members) has met on two separate occasions, and has discussed the following items:

Completed 2022 projects

Status of any projects currently in progress

Review of the total funding available for 2023 projects

Review of long-term capital project funds

Identification of 2023 available grants

Identification of new projects to be added to the Capital Project List

Prioritization of projects within the tiered project list

Targeted 2023 projects with estimated costs and funding sources

Review of the workload and staffing needs required to complete the 2023 projects
Finale estimated balance of capital funds to be carried forward for future projects

AN N NN VY N NN

During this agenda item Committee Members will present details of the items listed above and discuss any
suggested updates that Council may have.

Page 23


http://www.newcastlecolorado.org/

Town of New Castle

Whereas, In 1888 the Colorado Midland Railroad reached New Castle, affording mine owners the means
to transport coal to market, and the Denver and Rio Grande Railroad continued tracks west toward
Grand Junction; and

Whereas, Now, 135 years later the same train corridor still runs through town, immediately behind the
businesses and homes on the south side of Main Street; and

Whereas, Approximately ___ trains per day pass through downtown New Castle, two Amtrak and the
rest freight trains carrying variety of materials; and

Whereas, Recent railroad accidents across the country have raised awareness of the dangers such
accidents impose; and

Whereas, just as with trucks and automobiles, speed can be a deciding factor in rail accidents; and

Whereas, residents of New Castle have regularly noted that fully-loaded freight trains pass through
town at excessive speeds; and

Whereas, These speeds create a danger to animals, people and property;

Now Therefore, the Town Council of the Town of New Castle (as well as the councilors individually) do
hereby request that the Garfield County Board of County Commissioners vigorously support the Town as
it seeks enroll state and federal officials in a quest to improve rail safety through town.

Page 24



OCoOoONOOTUTDA WN

Call to Order

New Castle Town Council Regular Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023, 7:00 PM

Virtual Meetings are subject to internet and technical capabilities.

To join by computer, smart phone or tablet click HERE

If you prefer to telephone in:
Please call: 1-346-248-7799
Meeting ID: 709 658 8400

Follow the prompts as directed. Be sure to set your
phone to mute until called on.

The Council Packet is available HERE
or by going to www.newcastlecolorado.org

Mayor A Riddile called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.

Pledge of Allegiance

Roll Call
Present

Absent

Councilor Mariscal
Councilor Carey
Councilor Hazelton
Mayor A Riddile
Councilor Leland
Councilor G Riddile
Councilor Copeland

Also present at the meeting were Town Administrator Dave Reynolds, Town Clerk Melody
Byram, Town Treasurer Loni Burk, Assistant Town Treasurer Viktoriya Ehlers, Town
Prosecutor Tim Graves and members of the public.

MOTION: Mayor A Riddile made a motion to approve Councilor Copeland’s
absence. Councilor Mariscal seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.

Meeting Notice
Town Clerk Melody Byram verified that her office gave notice of the meeting in accordance
with Resolution TC 2023-1.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

1 Page 25


https://us02web.zoom.us/j/7096588400
https://www.newcastlecolorado.org/meetings?field_microsite_tid_1=27

OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Conflicts of Interest
There were no conflicts of interest.

Agenda Changes
Clerk Byram noted that the two executive sessions that had been on the agenda the week
prior had been rescheduled for the March 7, 2023, meeting.

Citizen Comments on Items not on the Agenda
There were no citizen comments.

Consultant Reports
Consultant Attorney - not present.
Consultant Engineer - not present.

Items for Consideration

Presentation: Aviation Economic Growth - Evan Zislis, Aspen Institute

Town Administrator Dave Reynolds told the council that Evan Zislis worked for the Aspen
Institute and had been working for several years to encourage the communities from
Aspen to Parachute to work together for the common good. Recently, he said that Mr.
Zislis was working for the Colorado River Valley Economic Development Partnership whose
focus was from New Castle to Parachute on an economic development idea that was
aviation based.

Mr. Evan Zislis greeted the council and said that he was grateful for the opportunity to
share his idea with them. He described the work done by the Aspen Institute across the
globe in economic development, health and medicine, technology, issues of social justice,
energy, climate, the arts and more. He said the Institute worked with local officials,
regional, national and international officials on the full range of human experience
globally. He said he was not representing Aspen or Pitkin County, in fact his superiors
were in Washington DC.

Mr. Zislis explained the vision of the Colorado River Valley Economic Development
Partnership to grow and diversify the local economic base to create good paying and
sustainable jobs for the valley’s workforce. The concept is to utilize the existing Garfield
County Airport, local terrain, existing shops, hotels, restaurants, workforce and many
other assets in order to build and grown an aviation base and create good paying and
sustainable jobs for the workforce in the valley.

Mr. Zislis explained some of the areas in the concept which included professional rescuer
training (US Military, wildland fire training and aviation fore training); tourism and civilian
applications (“Air Sports” teams, pilot academy, aviation mechanic training); Equipment
manufacturing & renewable propulsion research and development (light aviation
manufacturing, safety equipment manufacturing, electric and green hydrogen research

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

2 Page 26



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

and development); and long-term community development (base village neighborhoods,
social services and transportation hubs). Mr. Zislis said that he will not be asking anyone
for money because he planned to do the fundraising himself to bring an internationally
renowned aviation consultation firm to do a feasibility study on the concept. He said that
he expected the study would likely take a year.

Mr. Zislis asked the council if they would fill out a survey about the concept.

The council agreed. The council asked Mr. Zislis to keep them informed as the project
moved along and they also thanked Mr. Zislis for a great presentation.

Discussion: Model Traffic Code Update and Moving Driving Under Restraint /
Inoperable Vehicle Infractions to Municipal Court

Clerk Byram introduced Town Prosecutor Tim Graves to the council.

Mr. Graves greeted the council and thanked them for their time.

Mr. Graves told the council that the town was currently using the 2010 Model Traffic Code
(MTC), and every ten years the Department of Transportation updates the MTC. He said
that adopting the newest version of the MTC was appropriate.

Mr. Graves also told the council that staff had been discussing adoption of two additional
charges to the code that were not in the MTC, but did have analogous provisions in the
statutes. He said the first was driving under restraint, which was exactly as it sounded: a
person who was driving with a license, but a license that was restrained, revoked,
suspended or otherwise invalid. He noted that those types of tickets were written into
district court, and one of two things will happen. It will be dismissed because the DA’s
office was too busy to handle such minor offenses or the offender will be given 60 to 90
days to obtain their license, and if they do the charge is dismissed or they are offered a
lower plea. Mr. Graves said that the problem was that the cases were being dismissed at a
very high rate and subsequently, the police were not writing the tickets so as to not waste
everyone’s time. Mr. Graves said that if driving under restraint was moved into municipal
court it gave the town some ability to help regulate the issue. He described how the issue
was handled in other jurisdictions and how it would be handled in New Castle. He said also
that the little bit revenue that the fines brought would somewhat offset the expense of the
additional cases brought into court and the additional police activity. Mr. Graves said that
ultimately, it will put New Castle in the position of knowing that the people driving on
town streets were doing so legally.

Mr. Graves said that in regard to inoperable vehicles, he had been studying it and
essentially there were two types of inoperable vehicles. Mechanically inoperable and
unlicensed vehicles. Using the City of Rifle as an example of a jurisdiction that had
adopted an inoperable vehicle code, he described how the code read, what it meant and
how tickets could be written into municipal court. Mr. Graves said that it will provide an
opportunity for New Castle to help bring people into compliance with vehicle registration.
The council agreed that an ordinance could be drafted.

Mr. Graves thanked the council and said that he was glad to work with the town attorney
on the ordinance to move forward.

Consent Agenda
February 7, 2023 minutes

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

3 Page 27



OCoOoONOOTUDWNHKH

Resolution TC 2023-04 - A Resolution of the New Castle Town Council Supporting the
Application for a Grant from the Garfield County Mineral Lease District for the Construction
of a Dog Park

Resolution TC 2023-5 - A Resolution of the New Castle Town Council Supporting the
Application for a Grant from the Garfield County Federal Mineral Lease District for the
Streets Capital Maintenance Project

MOTION: Councilor A Riddile made a motion to approve the consent agenda.
Councilor G Riddile seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.

Staff Reports

Town Administrator — Administrator Reynolds said that there were several staff members
wanted to attend the Colorado Municipal League Conference and that there was an
opportunity for a scholarship. He said he had a letter for the mayor to sign supporting the
scholarship application if that was okay with the council. Administrator Reynolds told the
council that he had attended several meetings of the steering committee for the detox
center, and it had turned out that bids for building the facility had come in more than
double the grant funding of $700k. Mind Springs had been working with the contractor
and the bid amount had dropped to about 1.4 million. Mind Springs said that they would
make up the difference, and the offer caused the committee to question why.
Administrator Reynolds said that Mind Springs will submit a whole new proforma at the
next steering committee meeting. Administrator Reynolds said that the Middle Colorado
Watershed Council has gathered a group of all the municipalities along the Colorado River
as well as fire districts, and the group is called the Middle Colorado Collaborative. He said
that he learned that there were federal and state monies to fund wildfire mitigation,
wildfire pre and post work, and the best way to get those funds was through the
collaborative. Administrator Reynolds said that staff had been successful in getting an
AGNC grant for funding to move the ice rink to Burning Mountain Park. Administrator
Reynolds said that public works had started painting in town hall, and the new carpeting
had been ordered. Administrator Reynolds said that there was a meeting scheduled the
following day with the DOLA representative, and he and Public Works Director John
Wenzel with walk them through some idea for DOLA grants. Administrator Reynolds said
that he will likely be at the AGNC meeting because they will be talking about broadband.
Town Clerk - Clerk Byram said that she will have her first training on utility billing the
following week, and that she will be doing billing for the next several months. Clerk Byram
said that staff had gone live with a program called Monsido that assisted with the town
website ADA compliance. Clerk Byram told Director Wenzel that she had posted the public
works positions on the town website. Clerk Byram said that she had met with
Administrator Reynolds and Administrator Reynolds to discuss the potential of duplicating
meeting technology equipment in the community center. Clerk Byram said that
registration for the CML conference was open and said that if any of the council members
wanted her to register them for the conference to please let her know.

Town Treasurer — Treasurer Loni Burk said that training for Assistant Treasurer Viktoriya
Ehlers had been going well. Asst. Treasurer Ehlers had been busy with worker
compensation audit, a CIRSA volunteer medical audit, an upcoming unemployment audit,
she has attended several Caselle webinars, she had been attending some Colorado

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

4 Page 28



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Government Finance Officer Association training sessions, she has been attending the
capital committee meetings all while completing payroll accurately. Treasurer Burk said
that Asst. Treasurer Ehlers was anxious to learn and asked great questions. Treasurer
Burk said that she will be in Colorado at the end of March or early April to help with the
audit preparations.

Town Planner - not present.

Public Works Director — not present.

Commission Reports

Planning & Zoning Commission - nothing to report.

Historic Preservation Commission — nothing to report.

Climate and Environment Commission — nothing to report.

Senior Program - nothing to report.

RFTA - Mayor A Riddile said that the Hogback ridership was increasing percentagewise
more than anywhere else in valley. He said they had been speaking to Dan Blankenship
about extending his employment with RFTA. He said that they Talked to Blankenship to
extend employment. He said they also talked about getting Silt and Rifle into RFTA.
AGNC - nothing to report.

GCE - nothing to report.

EAB - nothing to report.

Council Comments

Councilor Mariscal said that she had received a fake e-mail from the mayor.

Councilor Mariscal said she was having trouble with her town e-mails going into the spam
folder.

Councilor Mariscal said that she had a meeting Friday with the emergency
communications board that she now held a seat on.

Councilor Carey said that she had seen an article in the newspaper about Caleb
Thompson, a Coal Ridge exchange student in Turkey who was helping with relief because
of the earthquakes. She felt that the council could honor him when he returned to the
u.S.

Councilor Carey said that the first bear meeting would be the following week on the 1%,
Councilor Carey had good talk with Tina White from Snowmass who will comment on a
wildlife ordinance, what worked and did not.

Councilor G Riddile said there was another capital improvement committee meeting on
Friday and they will report to the council soon.

Councilor Leland said that Clerk Byram mentioned ADA compliance on the town website.
He said that he had learned that website compliance was incredibly complicated, so it was
good to hear that there were people and companies that do that work.

Councilor Leland said that Spellebration will be on March 3, and there was not a town
team.

Councilor Leland said that he had received questions about the newsletter including write
ups about town council members. He said it was a good year to do so since it was not an
election year. He asked the council members to begin writing about themselves. Clerk
Byram suggested that the same could be done about the town staff.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

5 Page 29



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Councilor Leland said there had been a Facebook discussion about the bridge potholes and
a lot of the discussion was about CDOT coming in summer 2023 to do work. He asked
when the town could officially announce the traffic circle. Administrator Reynolds said that
he felt that the town could safely announce that the phase I utility work will be done in
the 2023 construction season, and then the roundabout in the 2024 construction season.
Councilor Mariscal said she had met with Ana Guytan with the New Castle library about
events for the Latino community.

Mayor A Riddile said that Ambleside School approached him about putting the 7" graders
to work volunteering. He said that Elk Creek Elementary was interested in that.

MOTION: Mayor A Riddile made a motion to adjourn. Councilor Carey seconded
the motion and it passed unanimously.

The meeting adjourned at 8:15 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Mayor A Riddile

Town Clerk Melody Byram, CMC

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, February 21, 2023

6 Page 30



coNOuULT A W N

New Castle Town Council Regular Meeting
Tuesday, March 07, 2023, 7:00 PM

Virtual Meetings are subject to internet and technical capabilities.

To join by computer, smart phone or tablet:
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/7096588400

If you prefer to telephone in:
Please call: 1-346-248-7799
Meeting ID: 709 658 8400

Follow the prompts as directed. Be sure to set your
phone to mute until called on

The Council Packet is available online by scanning this code:

or by going to www.newcastlecolorado.org

Call to Order
Mayor A Riddile called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.

Pledge of Allegiance

Roll Call
Present Councilor Carey

Councilor Hazelton (virtual)
Mayor A Riddile
Councilor Copeland
Councilor Leland
Councilor G Riddile
Councilor Mariscal (arrived at 7:22 p.m.)

Also present at the meeting were Town Administrator Dave Reynolds, Town Clerk Melody
Byram, Town Treasurer Loni Burk, Assistant Treasurer Viktoriya Ehlers, Town Attorney
David McConaughy, Police Chief Chuck Burrows, Town Planner Paul Smith and members
of the public.

Meeting Notice
Town Clerk Melody Byram verified that her office gave notice of the meeting in accordance
with Resolution TC 2023-1.

Conflicts of Interest
There were no conflicts of interest.

Agenda Changes

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

1 Page 31



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Clerk Byram asked Attorney McConaughy if he wanted to combine the two executive
sessions. Attorney McConaughy said that they could be combined in a single motion, and
it will be helpful to the CIRSA attorney who will be joining.

Citizen Comments on Items not on the Agenda
There were no citizen comments.

Consultant Reports
Consultant Attorney - nothing to report.
Consultant Engineer - nothing to report.

Items for Consideration

Proclamation Honoring the Coal Ridge High School Coed Cheer Team

Mayor A Riddile greeted the Coal Ridge Coed Cheer Team and their Head Coach Alyssa
Thurmon. He congratulated them on their fifth year in a row winning state competitions.
Mayor A Riddile read the proclamation into the record. Mayor A Riddile asked each of the
team members to introduce themselves and say what grade they were in and their goal
for the future. Councilor Leland gave the team a framed photo of the cheer team of New
Castle in 1925 which they thought was fun.

The council congratulated the team and thanked them for coming in.

Introduction: Jake Stanton, Colorado Parks & Wildlife

Town Administrator Dave Reynolds told the council that Colorado Parks and Wildlife
Officer Jake Stanton was present to meet the council.

Councilor Carey told the council that there were two wildlife two wildlife officers in the
area. Jake Stanton who was north of the river and Travis Black who was south of the
river. Councilor Carey said they had done a wonderful job at the first bear meeting.

Jake Stanton, Colorado Parks and Wildlife. Officer Stanton greeted the council, and said
that he was brand new to the area, and so any time he had the opportunity to meet
people, he appreciated it. Officer Stanton said that first and foremost, wildlife officers
managed wildlife. In the summer, they do wildlife counts and in the winter they used
airplanes and helicopters for the counts. They also worked with the fisheries, and the job
was often fun. He said there was human/wildlife conflict as well, and that was how the
conversation with Councilor Carey began. Officer Stanton said they were doing the
education programs in the schools; during hunting season they were enforcing CPW laws.
He said they were also peace officers for the State of Colorado, so they have to enforce
every other law as well. He said it was a huge job, and any time they were able to partner
with a municipality to get things done, it took something off their plate and it made
everything better.

Officer Stanton said that he appreciated being present and looked forward to working with
the town.

Mayor A Riddile asked if Officer Stanton worked at the South Canyon location.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

2 Page 32



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Councilor Carey said that the offices in South Canyon served the Roaring Fork Valley and
the offices that served the New Castle area were out of Grand Junction. She also said that
one of the thing she had learned is that CPW officers were more than just law
enforcement, they were al scientists because they had biology degrees.

Councilor G Riddile asked if there was anything the council could help Officer Stanton
with. He said no, in fact, he suggested that they could probably tell him. Councilor Carey
asked that he just keep in touch. Councilor G Riddile felt that CPW had been a great
resource especially with the unusual bear activity the previous fall. Councilor G Riddile
said that he was surprised to learn where the wolves will be sent, and it was close so he
expected that there will be questions about that. The council and Officer Stanton
discussed the wolf reintroduction briefly. Councilor Carey said that she had spoken to CPW
Officer Kirk Oldham who agreed that if the formatting of the bear meetings went well,
they may bring them back to discuss the wolf reintroduction plans before they are
released in December 2023.

The council thanked Officer Stanton.

Review and Discussion of Barking Dog Ordinance

Administrator Reynolds told the council that recently he and Police Chief Chuck Burrows
had a meeting with the CVR HOA, and they had heard from other neighbors. He said that
situation was that the current municipal code section related to barking dogs required that
in the case of a nuisance barking dog, there needed to be two complainants unrelated to
one another that witness the barking dog and were willing to testify. He said that did not
work well most times. Administrator Reynolds said that staff was studying it and it
seemed that other municipal code did not require two complainants, and that staff was
looking to amend the code to have more teeth in it.

Police Chief Burrows said that New Castle was the only place he was aware of that
handled barking dogs with the two-complaint rule. He explained that two people from two
separate households were not required in other places, and that warnings were issued at
first complaint, and tickets after that if the issue persisted. He felt that once a complaint
was established against someone and they had been warned by the police, he felt that
they should be able to go out as law enforcement officers, see it, hear it and issue a
ticket. Typically, there was a graduated fine schedule as well, and that got people’s
attention pretty quickly.

After a brief discussion between staff the council, they agreed that the two-person
complaint rule could be removed from the code.

MOTION: Councilor Leland made a motion at 7:35 p.m. to go into Executive Session
(1) for a conference with the Town Attorney for the purpose of receiving legal
advice on specific legal questions under C.R.S. Section 24-6-402(4)(b) regarding
the CVR Investors lawsuit and (2), for a conference with the Town Attorney for
the purpose of receiving legal advice on specific legal questions under C.R.S.
Section 24-6-402(4)(b) regarding Property on CR 335. Councilor

Executive Session concluded.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

3 Page 33



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

At the end of the executive session, Mayor A Riddile made the following statement:

“The time is now 8:25 p.m. and the executive session has been concluded. The participants
in the executive session were: Councilors Mariscal, Carey and Hazelton; Mayor A Riddile;
Councilors Copeland, Leland, and G Riddile; Town Treasurer Burk, Town Administrator
Reynolds, Assistant Treasurer Ehlers and Town Clerk Byram, Public Works Director Wenzel,
and Town Attorney McConaughy. For the record, if any person who participated in the
executive session believes that any substantial discussion of any matters not included in
the motion to go into the executive session occurred during the executive session, or that
any improper action occurred during the executive session in violation of the Open Meetings
Law, I would ask that you state your concerns for the record.”

No concerns were stated.

Clerk's Office Update

Clerk Byram briefly reviewed the clerk’s office report for the council. The report included
information about meetings, training, schooling, projects, licensing, utility billing and court
work accomplished since the beginning of the year.

The council asked about the ‘magic mushroom’ study. Clerk Byram explained that
Proposition 122 was passed in the November 2022 general election. The proposition
legalized the use of some natural medicines, and the rules for those medicines were still
being developed. She also stated that local government controls were mostly non-
existent, and the Colorado Municipal League was looking to propose some responsive
legislation to implement local control. Clerk Byram said that staff will bring the subject to
the next council meeting for further discussion.

The council also asked about the utility billing/meter reading project. Clerk Byram said
that they were looking into possible ways to reduce the amount of manpower/hours that
were put into reading meters and accomplishing utility billing. Mayor A Riddile said that he
understood many municipalities were reading meters electronically. Clerk Byram said that
was true, however it turned out that was not as efficient as it may appear. Director
Wenzel said that he implemented electronic meter reading in Basalt some years ago, and
while it solved some problems, it created a lot of unexpected problems and they found
themselves disappointed with the system.

Councilor Leland noted that he was disappointed in that there had only been 115 dog
licenses issued. Clerk Byram said that her office kept a database of licenses issued, and
renewals were mailed or e-mailed every year. She said that they do have the few that call
at say they no longer live in town or their dog had passed away, but getting people to
license their pet was difficult. The council agreed that it was an enforcement issue.
Administrator Reynolds said that he felt the answer was to seriously consider getting a
code enforcement officer, and the council agreed.

Clerk Byram said that if the council had time later, there was new carpet and paint in the
clerk’s office and the office spaces had been rearranged and it was quite lovely.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

4 Page 34



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

Consent Agenda

February Bills of $529,174.89

MOTION: Councilor Leland made a motion to approve the consent agenda.
Councilor G Riddile seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.

Staff Reports

Town Administrator — Administrator Reynolds told the council that the Know B4 training
had been gong pretty well, and a new round will come out soon. Administrator Reynolds
said that the detox center project had hit some snags. Bids for the project had come in
significantly over budget, and Mind Springs has offered to cover the difference, which did
not sit well with the committee. He said the saga was continuing, and no work had been
done on the facility yet. Administrator Reynolds said that he had been working with a local
wildfire collaborative. He said there was a lot of grant money out there for pre and post
wildfire mitigation and the collaborative had been working as a team to understand what
that will look like. He said he expected an MOU will come to the town for their
consideration in the near future. Administrator Reynolds met earlier in the day with a
group called the River Valley Economic Development Partnership which was a partnership
of the towns from New Castle to Parachute along with a few others. It was the project
that Evan Zislis was speaking to the council about at the last meeting. They had met that
same day and it looked like everyone was on board with the project and Mr. Zislis will
pursue grant money to do a feasibility study. Administrator Reynolds said he had met with
the Town of Silt Manager Jeff Layman to talk about the special recreation district. He said
that the Silt Board of Trustees basically had the same opinion as New Castle in that the
public would agree to the district until they were asked about the funding mechanisms.
The Silt Trustees felt is was a worthy project and they wanted to do some further
research. Administrator Reynolds said that staff will meet with the owners of a parcel of
land near River Park Condos, between the interchange and the condos, on the river. The
new owners were working on a development plan. Administrator Reynolds said that he
and Administrative Assistant Rochelle Firth had met with representatives from Senator
Hickenlooper’s office regarding congressional direct spending. Initially he said they came
away feeling that the raw water project was a good fit, but later they learned that ARPA
funds could not be used at match money for congressional direct spending funds.
Administrator Reynolds said that the broadband project for the carrier-neutral location up
near Shibui had also hit snags. The issue was that the permit through CDOT to access the
broadband fiber that runs up and down I-70, CDOT will require in Parachute that they
access the fiber a mile or two away and run parallel fiber lines to get to the access vaults.
The project calls for the connection to be near the interchanges. He said that the county
commissioners have been upset by the issue and have written letters to the governor that
state that it was a governor mandate that broadband be provided in rural areas and now
there were serious timeline snags in CDOT permitting. There will be a meeting the next
day with CDOT. Administrator Reynolds told the council that there will be an upcoming
council workshop on April 4 at 5:30 p.m. on the Romero site in Lakota and the corner of
Faas Ranch Road and Castle Valley Boulevard. He said that P&Z will be invited as well,
and they will witness the story pole that council had asked for that indicate the building
heights. Administrator Reynolds said that he and Planner Smith and Director Wenzel had a
preapplication meeting with the new owners of the Craven property which is the mixed-
use property near the elementary school. He said that the presentation was a good one,

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

5 Page 35



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

there was a lot of time and effort put into it by the new owner. Administrator Reynolds
said that he will be out of the office on March 17 as well as March 23 and 24.
Administrator Reynolds said that the property west of public works that had been
approved for a conditional use permit the previous year had hit a few difficulties with the
owner in the development of the property that staff was working resolving that.
Administrator Reynolds said that the flooring project was 99% done, and thanks to the
FMLD for that. Administrator Reynolds said that he will be attending an FMLD meeting the
next morning to report on the LoVa Trail grant. He said that groundbreaking for the 800-
foot section should begin soon. Administrator Reynolds said that there were several
council members that wanted to attend the CML conference. He asked that registration be
funneled through staff so that who attended which classes could be coordinated so that
everything could be covered. Administrator Reynolds said that the bear meeting the
previous week was excellent and he encouraged council members to attend. Administrator
Reynolds said that the emergency evacuation plan had been sent to the county
emergency team to review. It prompted the 2009 emergency plan to be reviewed as well.
Town Clerk - nothing to report.

Town Treasurer — Town Treasurer Loni Burk said that the representative for Colorado
Retirement Association had held a lunch meeting for the staff and gave a presentation. It
was well-attended. Treasurer Burk said the finance office was busy as usual. Training for
Assistant Treasurer Viktoriya Ehlers and Finance Assistant Michelle Mills was ongoing in
preparation for transition. Treasurer Burk said that she planned to b in Colorado at the
end of March.

Assistant Treasurer — Assistant Treasurer Ehlers told the council that Finance Assistant
Mills was doing well, and that was exampled the prior week during the office move, which
had gone well.

Town Planner — Planner Smith said that he had received the final application in for the
Romero project that looked close to what the council had seen previously with some
refinements. He said it should go to P&Z in April and council in May. Planner Smith said
that his office had been working on adoption of the 2021 International codes as well as
the Wildland-Urban Interface code. Planner Smith said that they had put energy
incentives on the building department website. Planner Smith said that Assistant Planner
Lauren Prentice was close to getting her certification as a building inspector. Planner
Smith said they had some discussions over the past year and a half about the McInnis
property. He said there were some obstacles to it but many people were interested. He
said that staff had discussed in regard to updating the future land use.

Public Works Director — Director Wenzel said that they had selected a contractor and
construction will begin the second week of April. Director Wenzel said they had begun
working on the security camera installation project for town facilities, and a contractor had
been selected. That should begin in the next few weeks as well. Director Wenzel said that
he had met with Town Engineer Jeff Simonson regarding final revisions of the digester
blower building, trying to get that project finalized. Director Wenzel said they had been
looking at the raw water expansion project with Engineer Simonson, trying to finalize that
as well. Director Wenzel said he had just finished writing two FMLD grants, one streets
capital maintenance and the other the dog park grant. Director Wenzel said that the parks
department had defined a scope of work for the Red Rocks Ditch, piping part of that and
lining the rest. Director Wenzel said that he was in the process of hiring for three
positions: streets maintenance technician, public works coordinator and a water treatment

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

6 Page 36



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

plant operator. He said that Kim Rider had let him know that she will be retiring in
September of 2024. Director Wenzel said that Utilities Supervisor Daniel Becker and his
crew were exploring the addition of a surge tank at the River Park lift station to alleviate
any potential overflows into those basements. Director Wenzel said they were monitoring
the flow levels in the south side interceptor. Engineer Simonson had put out a sonar
device that determines the remaining capacity of that interceptor that will assist in the
timing of reconstruction. Director Wenzel said he had completed the capital street
maintenance scope and that will go out to bid shortly. Last, Director Wenzel said they will
pick up two new vehicles the following day.

Commission Reports

Planning & Zoning Commission — nothing to report.

Historic Preservation Commission — nothing to report.

Climate and Environment Commission — nothing to report.

Senior Program - Clerk Byram said a few years ago some municipalities were questioning
the Traveler expenses and wanted details on rides/uses. The Board made some changes
to include more details on the types of rides the traveler provided for people, whether to
school or work or the doctor or the salon. Clerk Byram said that detailing the types of
rides was causing issues in that they were invading people’s privacy and perhaps HIPAA.
She said they had a very lengthy conversation trying to redefine types of rides in ways
that would still indicate uses without breaching user’s privacy.

RFTA - nothing to report.

AGNC - Councilor Hazelton said that they discussed the broadband issues, and they would
appreciate letters of support. He said the AGNC was also watching some bills that were
being introduced.

GCE - Councilor Leland said that Councilor G Riddile will be attending the meeting for him
in March.

EAB - nothing to report.

Council Comments

Councilor Carey said that she had been watching some house and senate bills as they had
been debated. She said there were some coming down that will impact affordable
housing, rent control, language in leasing, and prohibition in fees in rents if they are
approved.

Councilor Carey said that each time she watched a BOCC meeting, they were somehow
talking about development in New Castle. She felt they were excited about it.

Councilor Carey said she had spoken to John Martin, and he asked if the town could put
together a letter, asking for the BOCC's help in getting the train speeds in New Castle
reduced. She said that he preferred that all the council signed it.

Councilor Carey said that she and Administrator Reynolds had spoken after the bear
meeting about code enforcement officers, but also, based on information they got from
the CPW officers, it may be better to consider a wildlife ordinance rather than a trash
ordinance.

Councilor Carey said that she had randomly run into Perry Will a few weekends ago and
he had been a joy to get to know.

Councilor Copeland said that HPC had met and they allocated some budgeted money back
to the museum for electrical work to be done.

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

7 Page 37



OCoNOTU DA~ WNK

26

Councilor Copeland thought it may be a good idea to ask the new owners of the Craven
property to allow expansion of the dog park onto their property.

Councilor Copeland thanked Director Wenzel and his team for their terrific snow plowing.
Mayor A Riddile thanked Councilor Carey for the bear meeting.

Mayor A Riddile said that the residents at senior housing were again contacting him with
issues, primarily parking.

MOTION: Mayor A Riddile made a motion to adjourn. Councilor Copeland
seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.

The meeting adjourned at 9:15 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Mayor A Riddile

Town Clerk Melody Byram, CMC

Town Council Meeting
Tuesday, March 7, 2023

8 Page 38



TOWN OF NEW CASTLE, COLORADO
RESOLUTION NO. TC 2023-06

A RESOLUTION OF THE NEW CASTLE TOWN COUNCIL APPROVING A(N)
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT WITH GARFIELD COUNTY AND OTHER
MUNICIPALITIES WITHIN THE COUNTY.

WHEREAS, Garfield County, the Town of New Castle (“Town’) and the other
municipalities within Garfield County desire to work together to provide a county-wide
mosquito control and program; and

WHEREAS, the Town will benefit from such a program and its services; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council finds that entering into the Intergovernmental
Agreement (“IGA”) attached hereto as Exhibit “A” will further the Town’s goals and is in
the Town’s best interests.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE NEW CASTLE TOWN
COUNCIL:

1. Recitals. The foregoing recitals are incorporated by reference as findings and
determinations of the Council.

2. Adoption. Pursuant to Section 14.4 of the Town Charter, the Town Council hereby
approves the IGA attached as Exhibit A and authorizes the Mayor to execute the same.

INTRODUCED, PASSED, AND ADOPTED by a vote of __ to __ at a regular
meeting of the New Castle Town Council held on March 21, 2023.

TOWN COUNCIL OF TOWN OF
NEW CASTLE, COLORADO

Mayor Art Riddile
ATTEST:

Town Clerk Melody Harrison, CMC

Page 39



INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL - 2023

THE PARTIES to this Intergovernmental Agreement for Mosquito Control (“IGA™) are
the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARFIELD COUNTY, STATE OF
COLORADO, (hereinafter referred to as “County”); the CITY OF GLENWOOD SPRINGS,
STATE OF COLORADO, (hereinafter referred to as “Glenwood”); the TOWN OF
CARBONDALE, STATE OF COLORADO,(hereinafter referred to as “Carbondale”); the
CITY OF RIFLE, STATE OF COLORADO,(hereinafter referred to as “Rifle”); the TOWN
OF SILT, STATE OF COLORADO,(hereinafter referred to as “Silt”); the TOWN OF NEW
CASTLE, STATE OF COLORADO, (hereinafter referred to as “New Castle”); and the TOWN
OF PARACHUTE, STATE OF COLORADO, (hereinafter referred to as “Parachute”).

WHEREAS, the parties to this IGA are authorized by Section 29-1-201, et seq., C.R.S.,
as amended, to provide for joint funding and cooperation to provide services and functions which
each is otherwise lawfully authorized to provide; and

WHEREAS, the parties to this IGA desire to cooperate in funding and making available a
County-wide mosquito control and education program; and

WHEREAS, a coordinated effort by the County and the municipalities within the County
will permit a more effective mosquito control and education program and specifically will aid
control of the mosquito species responsible for the spread of West Nile Virus.

NOW, THEREFORE, in mutual consideration of the premises and the covenants and
promises set forth below, the parties to this IGA agree as follows:

1. PROJECT. The Project that is the subject of this IGA is a comprehensive integrated
larval and adult mosquito control program, on public and private property throughout Garfield
County that will be designed specifically for Garfield County and the municipalities by an
independent contractor. The Project will provide surveillance, identifying mosquito breeding
habitats and areas with high numbers of mosquito larvae and adults, with an emphasis on Culex
mosquitoes. Surveillance will include the use of GIS mapping technology. The Project will
include the use of chemical pesticides for adult and larval mosquito control in a manner safe to
citizens, the environment and pets. Chemical applications will only be done when the elected
officials of each pertinent jurisdiction, or their designated staff member, determine that mosquito
levels have reached a threshold that poses a public health risk. Each jurisdiction is responsible for
working with the Contractor to ensure that their jurisdiction is in compliance with the Federal
Clean Water Act and the Colorado Discharge Permit System as administered by the Colorado
Department of Public Health and Environment. The independent contractor will also provide
community outreach and public education.

2. PROJECT COSTS. The cost for the entire Project that is the subject of this IGA
shall not exceed Two Hundred Five Thousand Dollars and No Cents ($205,000.00), with each
town and city contributing the amounts set forth below for a total contribution of Fifty-Nine
Thousand Seven Hundred Dollars and No Cents ($59,700.00) of the Project Cost. The remainder
will be contributed by the County for the twenty-nine (29) square miles of service area outside of
the municipalities.

3. COUNTY RESPONSIBILITIES. The County shall be the coordinating entity and
the contracting and fiscal authority for the Project. The County's responsibilities shall include the

Page 40




creation of the Request For Proposals (“RFP”’), management of the RFP process, selection of the
contractor and management of the contract. The County shall pay an amount not to exceed One
Hundred Forty-Five Thousand Three Hundred Dollars and No Cents ($145,300.00) of the total
Project Cost of Two Hundred Five Thousand Dollars and No Cents ($205,00.000), unless
emergency services are required.

4. GLENWOOD SPRINGS RESPONSIBILITIES. Glenwood Springs shall be
responsible for payment to the County of $6,200.00.

5. CARBONDALE RESPONSIBILITIES: Carbondale shall be responsible for
payment to the County of $8,200.00.

6. RIFLE RESPONSIBILITIES: Rifle shall be responsible for payment to the County
of $22,250.00.

7. SILT RESPONSIBILITIES: Silt shall be responsible for payment to the County of
$6,000.00.

8. NEW CASTLE RESPONSIBILITIES: New Castle shall be responsible for
payment to the County of $6,750.00.

9. PARACHUTE RESPONSIBILITIES: Parachute shall be responsible for payment
to the County of $10,300.00.

10. PARTY RESPONSIBILITIES: All parties to this IGA shall cooperate with and
assist the independent contractor chosen by the County to perform the work of the Project.

11. REMEDIES. If any of the cities or towns, identified in Paragraphs 4 through 9
above, fails to perform their payment obligation(s), the County may assume responsibility for the
defaulting payment(s), and all other obligations of this IGA shall remain in full force and effect.

12. CONTRACT AWARD. The contract anticipated to define the Scope of Work
needed for the Project shall be awarded by Garfield County pursuant to the terms of its
Procurement Manual. The Notice to Proceed may be awarded prior to the payment obligations of
the municipalities and towns being met.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. The parties acknowledge each is subject to the
constitutional prohibitions against indemnification in Colo. Const. art XI, § 1. Neither can
indemnify the other.

Nothing herein shall be interpreted as a waiver of governmental immunity to which each
party would otherwise be entitled under Section 24-10-101, et seq., C.R.S., as amended.

14.  APPROPRIATION. This IGA is contingent upon appropriation and budgeting for
the costs required for the Project. Should any party fail to appropriate or have available sufficient
funds to pay for the costs of its obligations set forth herein, this IGA shall be considered of no
force or effect, except to the extent that the County has assumed the obligations of another party,
as set forth herein. This IGA is not intended to, nor does it create a multi-year fiscal obligation as
defined by Section 20, Article X of the Constitution of the State of Colorado.

2
2023 - IGA - Mosquito Page 41




15. EFFECTIVE DATE. This IGA shall be effective January 1, 2023 through
December 31, 2023, no matter the date of execution.

16. AMENDMENT. This IGA may be amended by the parties solely through a written
agreement signed by each.

17. FACSIMILES AND COUNTERPARTS. This IGA may be signed in counterparts,
and facsimile signatures may be substituted for original signatures.

18. GOVERNING LAW. The laws of the State of Colorado shall govern the validity,
performance and enforcement of this IGA. Venue for any action instituted pursuant to this IGA
shall lie in Garfield County, Colorado.

19. AUTHORITY. Each person signing this IGA represents and warrants that said
person is fully authorized to enter into and execute this IGA and to bind the party represented to
the terms and conditions hereof.

20. NOTICE. All notices required under this IGA shall be in writing and shall be hand
delivered or sent by registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage prepaid to the
addresses of the parties set forth below. Notice addresses may be changed without amendment to
this IGA.

Notice to County: Board of County Commissioners
Attn: County Manager
108 8" Street, Suite 213
Glenwood Springs, CO 81601
Phone: (970) 945-9150
Fax: (970) 384-5005

Notice to Glenwood: City of Glenwood Springs
Attn: City Manager
101 W. 8™ st.
Glenwood Springs, CO 81601
Phone: 384-6400

Notice to Carbondale: Town of Carbondale
Attn: Town Manager
511 Colorado Avenue
Carbondale, CO 81623
Phone: (970) 963-2733
Fax: (970) 963-9140

2023 - IGA - Mosquito Page 42



Notice to Rifle:

Notice to Silt:

Notice to New Castle:

Notice to Parachute:

City of Rifle

Attn: City Manager
202 Railroad Avenue
P.O. Box 1908

Rifle, CO 81650
Phone: (970) 625-2121

Town of Silt

Attn: Town Administrator
231 N. 7" St., Box 70
Silt, CO 81652

Phone: (970) 876-2353

Town of New Castle
Attn: Town Administrator
450 W. Main

P.O. Box 90

New Castle, CO 81647
Phone: (970) 984-2311

Town of Parachute

Attn: Town Administrator
222 Grand Valley Way
Box 100

Parachute, CO 81635
Phone: (970) 285-7630

REMATINDER OF THIS PAGE LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY

2023 - IGA - Mosquito

Page 43



ATTEST:

Clerk to the Board

ATTEST:

City Clerk

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

ATTEST:

City Clerk

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

2023 - IGA - Mosquito

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARFIELD COUNTY, COLORADO

By:

Chairman

Dated:

CITY OF GLENWOOD SPRINGS,
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

TOWN OF CARBONDALE
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

CITY OF RIFLE
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

TOWN OF SILT
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

Page 44



ATTEST:

Town Clerk

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

TOWN OF NEW CASTLE
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

TOWN OF PARACHUTE
STATE OF COLORADO

By:

Mayor

Dated:

T:\Vegetation Management\IGAs - Intergovernmental\MOSQUITO IGA\2023-IGA Mosquitos.doc

2023 - IGA - Mosquito

Page 45



DR 8442 (06/15/22)

COLORADO DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Liquor Enforcement Division

(303) 205-2300

Permit Application and Report of Changes

All Answers Must Be Printed in Black Ink or Typewritten

1. Applicant is a

License Number

[] Corporation..........cc........ [] Individual
[ JPartnership ......c.cccccocc.... MLimited Liability Company 12-40424-0005
2. Name of Licensee 3. Trade Name of Establishment (DBA)
Kum & Go LC Kum & Go #927

4. Address of Premises (specify exact location of premises)

801 Castle Valley Blvd

5. Business Email Address
licenses@kumandgo.com

Please note that

authority as well.

[] Change of Manager (Other Licenses pursuant to
section 44-3-301(8), C.R.S.) NO FEE

Restaurant, Lodging & Entertainment, and Tavern licenses
requires a local fee with submission to the local licensing

authorities directly regarding local processing and fees.

City County State | ZIP Business Phone Number
New Castle Garfield CO | 81647 515-274-7793
SELECT THE APPROPRIATE SECTION BELOW AND PROCEED TO THE INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE 2.
Section A — Manager Reg/Change Section C

[[IManager's Registration (Hotel & Restr.)........... $30.00 | []Retail Warehouse Storage Permit (ea) ............ $100.00
|:] Manager's Registration (Tavern) ...........c.c........ $30.00 [[]Wholesale Branch House Permit (€a).e $100.00
] Change Corp. or Trade Name Permit (ea)......... $50.00

[[IManager's Registration
(Lodging & Entertainment) ........cccceceevennen. $30.00 | [[]Change Location Permit (€a).........c..ccocevuenen... $150.00

Manager's Registration for Hotel &

Please reach out to local licensing

[] Winery/Limited Winery Noncontiguous or Primary

Manufacturing Location Change..............ccccoeueveneen. $150.00

M Change, Alter or Modify Premises
$150.00 x Total Fee: 150.00

[]Addition of Optional Premises to Existing H/R
$100.00 x

Total Fee:

Section B — Duplicate License

[]Addition of Related Facility to an Existing Resort or
Campus Liquor Complex

$160.00 x Total Fee:
[ ] Duplicate LICENSE .........ccvrerereeriirrineerenisnines $50.00 , L
P []Campus Liguor Complex Designation ............... No Fee
[] Sidewalk Service Area ........ccoeeeeeeeeeeveeevcenennnn $75.00
Do Not Write in This Space — For Department of Revenue Use Only
Date License Issued License Account Number Period
The State may convert your check to a one time electronic banking transaction. Your bank account
may be debitgd as earl);l as the same day received by the State.glf converted, your check will not TOTAL AMOUNT
be returned. If your check is rejected due to insufficient or uncollected funds, the Department DUE
of Revenue may collect the payment amount directly from your bank account electronically. $ 1 50 o OO
Page 10of 5

Page 46



DR 8442 (06/15/22)

Instruction Sheet

For All Sections, Complete Questions 1-5 Located on Page 1

[ ] Section A

To Register or Change Managers, check the appropriate box in section A and complete question
9 on page 4. Proceed to the Oath of Applicant for signature. Submit to State Licensing Authority
for approval.

[] Section B

For a Duplicate license, be sure to include the liquor license number in section B on page 1 and
proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature.

M Section C
Check the appropriate box in section C and proceed below.

1) For a Retail Warehouse Storage Permit, go to page 3 complete question 5 (be sure to check the
appropriate box). Submit the necessary information and proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature.
Submit to State Licensing Authority for approval.

2) For a Wholesale Branch House Permit, go to page 3 and complete question 5 (be sure to check the
appropriate box). Submit the necessary information and proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature.
Submit to State Licensing Authority for approval.

3) To Change Trade Name or Corporation Name, go to page 3 and complete question 6 (be sure to check the
appropriate box). Submit the necessary information and proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature.
Retail Liquor License submit to Local Liquor Licensing Authority (City or County). Manufacturer, Wholesaler
and Importer's Liquor Licenses submit to State Liquor Licensing Authority.

4) To modify Premise, or add Sidewalk Service Area, go to page 4 and complete question 10. Submit the
necessary information and proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature. Retail Liquor License submit to
Local Liquor Licensing Authority (City or County). Manufacturer, Wholesaler and Importer's Liquor Licenses
submit to State Liquor Licensing Authority.

5) For Optional Premises go to page 4 and complete question 10. Submit the necessary information and
proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature. Retail Liquor License submit to Local Liquor Licensing
Authority (City or County).

6) To Change Location, go to page 3 and complete question 7. Submit the necessary information and
proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature. Retail Liquor License submit to Local Liquor Licensing
Authority (City or County). Manufacturer, Wholesaler and Importer's Liquor Licenses submit to State Liquor
Licensing Authority.

7) Winery/Limited Winery Noncontiguous or Primary Manufacturing Location Change, go to page 4,
and complete question 8. Use this section to make a current Noncontiguous Manufacturing Location into a
Primary Manufacturing Location, or a Primary Manufacturing Location into a Noncontiguous Manufacturing
Location. To be eligible for a Winery/Limited Winery Noncontiguous or Primary Manufacturing Location
Change, you must be a Colorado state licensed manufacturer of vinous liquor pursuant to section 44-3-402
or 44-3-403, C.R.S.

8) Campus Liquor Complex Designation, go to page 5 and complete question 11. Submit the necessary
information and proceed to page 5 for Oath of Applicant signature.

9) To add another Related Facility to an existing Resort or Campus Liquor Complex, go to page 5 and
complete question 12.

Page 2 of 5
Page 47



DR 8442 (06/15/22)

Storage Permit

5. Retail Warehouse Storage Permit or a Wholesalers Branch House Permit

[0 Retail Warehouse Permit for:
[0 On-Premises Licensee (Taverns, Restaurants etc.)
[ Off-Premises Licensee (Liquor stores)

[0 Wholesalers Branch House Permit

Address of storage premise:

City , County ZIP

Attach a deed/lease or rental agreement for the storage premises.
Attach a detailed diagram of the storage premises.

Change Trade Name or
Corporate Name

. Change of Trade Name or Corporation Name

[0 Change of Trade name/DBA only
O Corporate Name Change (Attach the following supporting documents)

1. Certificate of Amendment filed with the Secretary of State, or
2. Statement of Change filed with the Secretary of State, and
3. Minutes of Corporate meeting, Limited Liability Members meeting, Partnership agreement.

Old Trade Name New Trade Name

Old Corporate Name New Corporate Name

Change of Location

7. Change of Location

NOTE TO RETAIL LICENSEES: An application to change location has a local application fee of $750 payable to your local licensing
authority. You may only change location within the same jurisdiction as the original license that was issued. Pursuant to 44-3-311(1)
C.R.S. Your application must be on file with the local authority thirty (30) days before a public hearing can be held.

Date filed with Local Authority Date of Hearing

(a) Address of current premises

City County ZIP

(b) Address of proposed New Premises (Attach copy of the deed or lease that establishes possession of the
premises by the licensee)

Address

City County ZIP

(c) New mailing address if applicable.

Address

City County State ZIP

(d) Attach detailed diagram of the premises showing where the alcohol beverages will be stored, served,
possessed or consumed. Include kitchen area(s) for hotel and restaurants.

Page 3 of 5
Page 48



DR 8442 (06/15/22)

Winery/Limited WineryNoncontiguous or

Primary Manufacturing Location Change

8. Winery/Limited Winery Noncontiguous or Primary Manufacturing Location Change
Select the option that applies to your situation:
[] Make a current Primary Manufacturing Location (Location 1) into a Noncontiguous Location (Location 2); or
[]Make a current Noncontiguous Manufacturing Location (Location 1) into a Primary Manufacturing Location
(Location 2).

(a) Address of Location 1:

City County ZIP

(b) Address of Location 2:

City County ZIP

Change of Manager

9. Change of Manager or to Register the Manager of a Tavern, Hotel and Restaurant, Lodging & Entertainment
liquor license or licenses pursuant to section 44-3-301(8), C.R.S.

(a) Change of Manager

Former manager's name

New manager's name

(b) Date of Employment

Has manager ever managed a liquor licensed establishment?..........cccoovvvivciiniviiieininnen, OYes [ONo
Does manager have a financial interest in any other liquor licensed establishment?............. OYes [ONo

If yes, give name and location of establishment

Modify Premises or Addition of Optional
Premises, Related Facility, or Sidewalk Service Area

10. Modification of Premises, Addition of an Optional Premises, Addition of Related Facility, or Addition of
a Sidewalk Service Area

NOTE: Licensees may not modify or add to their licensed premises until approved by state and local authorities.

(a) Describe change proposed Removing 3 feet of non-alcohol product and replacing with 3 feet of wine product

(b) If the modification is temporary, when will the proposed change:
Start (mo/dayl/year) End (mo/dayl/year)
NOTE: THE TOTAL STATE FEE FOR TEMPORARY MODIFICATION IS $300.00

(c) Will the proposed change result in the licensed premises now being located within 500 feet of any public or
private school that meets compulsory education requirements of Colorado law, or the principal campus of any
college, university or seminary?

(If yes, explain in detail and describe any exemptions that apply) .........cccceeevieeinieiiineennnen COYes MNo
(d) Is the proposed change in compliance with local building and zoning laws?............cccccevvve.e. MYes [ONo

(e) If this modification is for an additional Hotel and Restaurant Optional Premises has the local authority
authorized by resolution or ordinance the issuance of optional premises?.........ccccecvevieereeinns OYes MNo

(f) Attach a diagram of the current licensed premises and a diagram of the proposed changes for the
licensed premises.

(g) Attach any existing lease that is revised due to the modification.

(h) For the addition of a Sidewalk Service Area per Regulation 47-302(A)(4), 1 C.C.R. 203-2, include
documentation received from the local governing body authorizing use of the sidewalk. Documentation may
include but is not limited to a statement of use, permit, easement, or other legal permissions.

Page 4 of 5
Page 49



DR 8442 (06/15/22)

11. Campus Liquor Complex Designation

(a) I wish to designate my existing

An institution of higher education or a person who contracts with the institution to provide food services

Liquor License #

to a Campus

Campus Liquor
Complex Designation

LIGQUOT COMPIEX ..ttt ettt ettt et eab s ent e et e e e ensteeeteseneearneeenneeann

[OYes [INo

12. Additional Related Facility

To add a Related Facility to an existing Resort or Campus Liquor Complex, include the name of the Related

o

Q

k.

Q

ot E Facility and include the address and an outlined drawing of the Related Facility Premises.

[ T

,§ L (a) Address of Related Facility

§ (D) OULINET IAGFAM PrOVIAE ...........eeeeeeeeeeeeeeoreseeeee e eeeeeeeseees e ee oo eeeeeeeee oo OYes CNo
Oath of Applicant

| declare under penalty of perjury in the second degree that | have read the foregoing application and all attachments
_~_thereto, and that all infopmation therein is true, correct, and complete to the best of my knowledge

Print name and Title

Signature,
( W @WCamille Hayes - Compliance Analyst

Date

3/1/2023

Report and Approval of LOCAL Licensing Authority (CITY / COUNTY)

The foregomg application has been examined and the premises, business conducted and character of the applicant is
satisfactory, and we do report that such permit, if granted, will comply with the applicable provisions of Title 44,

Articles 4 and 3, C.R.S., as amended. Therefore, This Application is Approved.

Local Licensing Authority (City or County)

Date filed with Local Authority

Signature Title

Date

Report of STATE Licensing Authority
The foregoing has been examined and complies with the filing requirements of Title 44, Article 3, C.R.S., as amended.

Signature

Title

Date

Page 5of 5
Page 50



|
1
|
|
f
I
|

DG,
A I e A mmpee o CEERE
DOOR_AND FRAME SCHEDULE e e o/ e oy NEY VUG SR ST Wumumm
; REWARRS EERR PR & s o /B, [ mu
L T - ‘|.~|lm.2.3rul.n , o \ \ul_..lx.ﬁ!lu:laﬁ. =Z -
| st B 2 R P 9 o
T | == NE o
&t 3 |sgl 5 | . A LN vt D =
[Sh d[d3) & | T e s T G 1 22 GRSy M —
E Tl = — e — e => w0
: el S Lol Pl : \ T s a1 . s A TR T Eaa
. b il e e s R I U . C O — N 3 N w
LR DO bl B i el = . e— | vt il ] P SENS ——— >=0
! < l.l.ﬂ b I T S | | eiande It m——— W
| v | { i [, @
P ('H]I.ﬂ. T TR T A | | _ ﬁz \4 T — T e . @«
el .,.T = e N | €77 e ——= || | ] NI N i Bl
[ % (G TN B — : — - -
[y L e fe e it ,pu,ﬂnﬁaﬂ:s, -\ e 02 |
| e _ oo LR st 2o oSO O oy LTI B e e e et =)
‘"u - B .

e N n ) i3

GOO_N hrm.<>.:02m ﬂm>§ﬁ m_vm<>._,_02.u

o] FINI!
| o g R e A B z
AU T R —
INTERIOR FINISH COLOR SCHEDULE e N o
TEMS FINISH PRODUCTS . | =
o o e v v o | L e Lo [ B =
e FCG 3 oy gy £ __Smites 3
P |yt .ﬂl o
B Sy o i 8
SR anie pae e S / L n?.r i il o g °
. | Sur, ; o O
el e S (o] g
H S8R G mackaoom (&) m w.
s 1 R Y 2 o
| e W &
s oA LT -ty ] ¢ m
et ’
. R s - 2 s
7 = 1 5 &l
(o 8 s it ta [ s (0]
or o i
et = w
= R =y N ®
SRR Mg AR % S 3
[CIETTRE RN (PO ar <<
- ool N - R \.MM o
S G A
= ‘e X
) s o - q
r:.'kir{lil-l.Q -. I~
AE e, Wi ey 13

Ty
R R I /o
! G vy

A e

g oW
DATES
i TN
Qe T 5 I \uh::. wan s
i S .Fi _
macoi 4n 2 . = Ak A
| P oA B .Js. w
o> LAV AT
—— By
L -l; s OHARMG TILE
4 o Ysvos EXTERIOR
| e BAIE e e
it s DAy ELEVATION
§ P e et LONTNN roota %M.

N Fl FLOOR PLAN

Har U e e e

. %@

Page 51



!

DT TN weer et ﬁ “C. mmnm
DOOR_AND FRAME SCHEDULE Ih CTOMT 5000 %/ CLLAY (N~ v oo
PRI T L
[ RA'SC DOCR REMARKS Ty /T MANNG S mooinG (RE3) | ==z m -
I opening] | _ GLASS == 2y : I 2
z Bl 2 V rmonr sums wm e oz 1]
mmsm_w_m T 1. / i«zg 2a gl
z@ | 2 | & H - b
Wi -4 | 4 3 » Y £ 3
£2(5 4 : s |1 I
= AT =>w
e B g oW
=~ oo w oo
i - =>=0
Lo ¥
. e
Y s o L
. i :

{ “
_ =
i ,
A N " y
DOOR_ELEVATIONS FRAME ELEVATION
¥od 6l F veatoh wovg sobuex AL Vet iy whrh SR m
=
PRODUCTS o M
e o | T e v Lo . 2 o
v (e - 11| e S e o gy =l »
o 5 i sy O I8
-0 e Ry v | o o
AR ANENE / [ 3 r @
2 I | L e,
= T i . r
- R e Hl e fwl [lo &
TS i o &
Peoseny T ' 8
Ee — b - w o
e AT par b
A simi |[WARS L i, | g
=4 W .W\ e I fat [ 3
P lr:.lnru:..njl ! = N F
N e || TR gy -
- fousby-bey o
Ea H
—— LS4 A Cwain 3 E
s - e &l
s o = B 5 |18
[IRTREY i g W= m_,._ <
i © ™ |t e - s e Pl
L £ 5 o v £ >
et A s et A
. . = =X | =
B L R EX iy Al
e aman v a3 |
‘_F.E At
o
i'm O
~ﬂﬂﬂ..l.‘.un«17/
s v 47 5 ¥
LA T, g e
WA - rJum CORM
e
L
T N

FLOOR PLAN

AL V&<

Page 52



Wine

YBON [BUOSRRS _

= ol f— sdo o—]

T 2ur-uj fpued-

}-saty Big Bag —]

——sa1poon———ispuig 211000 —uonian—— spaas g siN— 51 vos—1

ﬁ Asa2019 7 1M _l—

H
I

dod Wig 1
d v

L2760 3401S

Page 53



	Top
	A.	Discussion: 2021 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code
	Memo to Council 3.21.23 WUI Code
	3.17.23 DRAFT - Ordinance No. TC 2023-XX adopting WUI Code
	PRESENTATION SLIDES

	B.	Ordinance TC 2023-1 - an Ordinance of the New Castle Town Council Amending Chapter 16.12.120 of the Municipal Code (1st reading)
	Memo to Council 3.21.23 Dog Barking Code Change
	Ord. TC 2023-1 Amending Section 6.12.120 (Barking Dogs)

	C.	Capital Committee Report
	Memo to Council 3.21.23 Capital Committee Report

	D.	Consider a Letter of Support to Reduce Train Speeds Through New Castle
	Train speed letter version 2

	February 21, 2023 minutes
	4. February 21, 2023

	March 7, 2023 minutes
	5. March 7, 2023

	Resolution TC 2023-6 - Approving an MOU with Garfield County for Mosquito Control
	tc2023-06 - Approving 2023 mosquito control IGA
	2023 IGA Mosquitos SA mls

	Kum & Go Modification of Premises for FMBW Liquor License
	DOC003

	Bottom



