CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

CITY COUNCIL SPECIAL HYBRID MEETING
Tuesday, May 02, 2023 at 5:00 PM

MERCER ISLAND CITY COUNCIL: LOCATION & CONTACT:
Mayor Salim Nice, Deputy Mayor David Rosenbaum, Mercer Island Community & Even Center and via Zoom
Councilmembers: Lisa Anderl, Jake Jacobson, 8236 SE 24th Street | Mercer Island, WA 98040
Craig Reynolds, Wendy Weiker, and Ted Weinberg 206.275.7793 | www.mercerisland.gov

We strive to create an inclusive and accessible experience. Those requiring accommodation for meetings should notify the City Clerk’s Office
3 days prior to the meeting at 206.275.7793 or by emailing cityclerk@mercerisland.gov.

The hybrid meeting will be broadcast live on MITV Channel 21 and live streamed on the City Council’s YouTube Channel

Registering to Speak for Appearances: Individuals wishing to speak live during Appearances (public comment period) or during
the Public Hearing must register with the City Clerk at 206.275.7793 or cityclerk@mercerisland.gov before 4 PM on the day
of the Council meeting.

Please reference "Appearances" or “Public Hearing” on your correspondence and state if you would like to speak either in
person at the Mercer Island Community & Event Center or remotely using Zoom. If providing your comments using Zoom,
staff will be prepared to permit temporary video access when you enter the live Council meeting. Please remember to
activate the video option on your phone or computer, ensure your room is well lit, and kindly ensure that your background
is appropriate for all audience ages. Screen sharing will not be permitted, but documents may be emailed to
council@mercerisland.gov.

Each speaker will be allowed three (3) minutes to speak. A timer will be visible to online to speakers, City Council, and
meeting participants. Please be advised that there is a time delay between the Zoom broadcast and the YouTube or
Channel 21 broadcast.

Join by Telephone at 5:00 PM (Appearances will start sometime after 5:30 PM): To listen to the meeting via telephone, please
call 253.215.8782 and enter Webinar ID 856 8473 5545 and Password 730224 if prompted.

Join by Internet at 5:00 PM (Appearances will start sometime after 5:30 PM): To watch the meeting over the internet via your
computer, follow these steps:
1) Click this link
2) |If the Zoom app is not installed on your computer, you will be prompted to download it.
3) If prompted for Webinar ID, enter 856 8473 5545; Enter Password 730224
4) The City Clerk will call on you by name or refer to your email address when it is your turn to speak.
Please confirm that your audio works prior to participating.

Join in person at Mercer Island Community & Event Center at 5:00 PM (Appearances will start sometime after 5:30 PM): —
8236 SE 24" Street

Submitting Written Comments: Email written comments to the City Council at council@mercerisland.gov.

MEETING AGENDA - Revised
CALL TO ORDER & ROLL CALL, 5 PM
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
AGENDA APPROVAL
STUDY SESSION

Page 1



mailto:cityclerk@mercerisland.gov
https://www.youtube.com/c/mercerislandcouncil
mailto:cityclerk@mercerisland.gov
mailto:council@mercerisland.gov
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85684735545?pwd=c3VVMjljbUdiM2JLUkoyN251bUhQUT09
mailto:council@mercerisland.gov

1. AB 6244: Police Department Annual Report.
Recommended Action: Receive report. No action necessary.
CITY MANAGER REPORT

APPEARANCES
(This is the opportunity for anyone to speak to the City Council on any item.)

CONSENT AGENDA
2. AB 6260: April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification.

Recommended Action: Approve the April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification (Exhibit 1) in the amount of
$973,786.50 and authorize the Mayor to sign the certification on behalf of the entire City Council.

3. Certification of Claims:
A. Check Register | 215549-215598 | 4/14/2023 | $576,920.88

Recommended Action: Certify that the City Council has reviewed the documentation supporting claims
paid and approved all checks or warrants issued in payment of claims.

4. AB 6261: Affordable Housing Week (Proclamation No. 306).

Recommended Action: Approve Proclamation No. 306 proclaiming May 7 to 13, 2023, as Affordable
Housing Week in Mercer Island.

5. AB 6262: Construction Code Adoption (2nd Reading).

Recommended Action: Adopt Ordinance No. 23C-04 amending MICC Chapter 17 with the updated
editions of the Construction Codes to be effective on July 1, 2023, as mandated by the State of
Washington.

REGULAR BUSINESS

6. AB 6264: Formation of a City Council Ad Hoc Committee to Assist City Manager in Review and Evaluation of
Regional Fire Service Proposals.

Recommended Action: Create the City Council Regional Fire Service Proposal Review Ad Hoc Committee
to assist the City Manager with review and evaluation of regional fire service proposals in May and June of
2023.

7. AB 6258: 2024-2029 Six-Year Transportation Improvement Program Review and Public Hearing.
Recommended Action: Receive comments from the public hearing and provide feedback to staff.

OTHER BUSINESS

8. Planning Schedule — Revised 4/28/2023

9. Councilmember Absences & Reports

EXECUTIVE SESSION

10. Pending or Potential Litigation
Executive Session to discuss with legal counsel pending or potential litigation pursuant to RCW 42.30.110(1)(i).

Collective Bargaining

Executive Session for planning or adopting the strategy or position to be taken by the City Council during the
course of any collective bargaining, professional negotiations, or grievance or mediation proceedings, or
reviewing the proposals made in the negotiations or proceedings while in progress pursuant to RCW
42.30.140(4)(b).

ADJOURNMENT

Page 2



BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL AB 6244

CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

AGENDA BILL INFORMATION

May 2, 2023
Study Session

Iltem 1.

TITLE:

AB 6244: Police Department Annual Report

RECOMMENDED ACTION:

Receive report. No action necessary.

Discussion Only
[ Action Needed:
[] Motion
[ Ordinance
[] Resolution

DEPARTMENT:

Police

STAFF:

Ed Holmes, Police Chief

Mike Seifert, Operations Commander
Jeff Magnan, Services Commander

Chad Schumacher, Marine Patrol Sergeant
Dominic Amici, Detective Sergeant

COUNCIL LIAISON: n/a
EXHIBITS: n/a
CITY COUNCIL PRIORITY: n/a

AMOUNT OF EXPENDITURE Sn/a
AMOUNT BUDGETED Sn/a
APPROPRIATION REQUIRED Sn/a

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The purpose of this agenda bill is to highlight the activities of the Mercer Island Police Department

(“Department”) in 2022. The report will focus on three areas:

e The “Who We Are” section will focus on the Department’s organizational structure, staffing, and

training.

e The “What We Did” section will focus on general statistics, community outreach and partnerships,
crime prevention, use of force, and de-escalation. This section will also highlight the Marine Patrol

program.

e The “How Our Community Responded” section will highlight the support the Department has
received from the community.

BACKGROUND

The Police Department provides an annual report summarizing the highlights of the previous year. The report

includes information on personnel changes, patrol activity, investigations, use of force, records work, and

community outreach.

Page 1




Iltem 1.

ISSUE/DISCUSSION

WHO WE ARE

The Department has two divisions: Operations and Services. The Operations Division includes Patrol, Marine
Patrol, and Special Teams. The Services Division includes Detectives, Police Records, Public Records, Evidence,
Training, and Personnel.

In 2022, four employees left the Department; two departures were due to retirements, one was due to a
relocation out of state, and one officer resigned while still on probation. During this same time, five new
officers were hired to fill these four vacant positions as well as a vacancy from 2021. The hiring process has a
number of steps designed to bring the best candidates forward to serve this community.

The Department continued its commitment to ensuring all the personnel are well trained. Officers attended
over 2,000 hours of training, including classes on use of force, de-escalation, anti-biased policing, legal
updates, autism awareness, special teams, and leadership development.

WHAT WE DID

Police Legislation
Command staff monitored new police legislation proposed during the 2022 legislative session. The following
bills passed, and adjusted some of the police reform bills that were passed during the 2021 session.

e HB 1735 Specifically allowed officers to once again use a reasonable amount of force to take
someone into protective custody if the person is suffering from a mental health crisis.

e HB 2037 Defined “physical force” as any act reasonably likely to cause physical pain or injury or any
other act exerted upon a person’s body to compel, control, constrain, or restrain the person’s
movement. Physical force does not include pat downs, incidental touching, verbal commands, or
compliant handcuffing where there is no physical pain or injury.

e HB 1719 Modified the prohibition on the use of military equipment. The bill still prohibited rifles of
.50 caliber or greater (and a list of other military equipment) but allowed for other types of less lethal
munitions that are .50 caliber or greater.

Command staff and the City Manager continue to monitor the bills proposed in the 2023 state legislative
session.

Operations Division

Patrol
Patrol officers were very busy with proactive patrols and responding to calls for assistance. In 2022, officers:
e Responded to 11,919 calls for service ranging from simple theft cases to robbery and assault cases.
e Investigated 355 larceny cases including theft, mail theft, and motor vehicle prowls and 59 reported
burglaries.
e Wrote 940 citations and made 210 arrests.

The Automatic License Plate Readers (ALPRs) continue to assist officers with identifying stolen vehicles and
wanted individuals. The ALPR system also helps with the enforcement of parking violations.

Page 2



https://app.leg.wa.gov/billsummary?BillNumber=1735&Initiative=false&Year=2021
https://app.leg.wa.gov/billsummary?BillNumber=2037&Initiative=false&Year=2021
https://app.leg.wa.gov/billsummary?BillNumber=1719&Initiative=false&Year=2021

Iltem 1.

The officers also continued to work with the City’s ordinance that governs the use of public property. Officers
maintained a compassionate approach when encountering people who were experiencing or potentially
experiencing homelessness. No arrests have been made nor have any citations for violations of this ordinance
been issued, but rather, this ordinance has been used as a way to get people connected to the resources they
need. The officers are also able to call the outreach workers from two area shelters to streamline getting
people the help they need.

Use of Force

The Department is well-trained in the use of force and continues to emphasize an approach to training that
seeks to integrate de-escalation principles and tactics in all areas of policing. During 2022, there were only
seven times when officers had to use some degree of force to gain compliance. All of these incidents involved
a very low level of force, for example controlling someone’s arms and legs to allow for the proper application
of handcuffs. One of these incidents involved the officers displaying their firearms during a high-risk vehicle
stop. The amount of force used by officers during these incidents was reviewed by the Operations
Commander and the Chief, and deemed appropriate, justified, and within policy.

The Department continues to participate as a member of the Independent Force Investigation Team (IFIT)
that investigates officer — involved shootings or serious applications of force. The Chief serves on the
Executive Board and Sgt. Amici serves as an investigator. As a reminder, if a Mercer Island Police Officer is
involved in an incident that warrants the activation of the IFIT, Mercer Island will not have any role in the
ensuing investigation.

Marine Patrol

The Marine Patrol program provides service to Mercer Island, Renton, Bellevue, Medina, Hunts Point, and in
2023 began providing service to Yarrow Point as well. Most of the patrol officers are trained to operate the
marine patrol vessels, so the Department can respond to emergencies throughout the year. The Marine
Patrol Unit was exceptionally busy during 2022, responding to 325 calls for service including four vessel
collisions with one fatality. The team also completed 270 vessel safety inspections. The annual Seafair event
was a very busy weekend for the team, during which they made 21 arrests for boating under the influence.
Despite the busy event, there were no drownings or major injuries that weekend.

The Marine Patrol supervisor, Sgt. Schumacher, became a state-certified marine patrol trainer. He now
teaches classes to officers from across the state. His expertise has proven very valuable for Mercer Island’s

program.

Services Division

Records and Evidence

The Records staff processed close to 1,100 case reports and responded to approximately 600 public records
requests. Staff also participated in the Drug Takeback event and was instrumental in the installation of the
takeback bin in the police lobby. Oversight of property and evidence kept the Evidence Technician busy,
especially managing the destruction of almost 400 items of evidence as per the state’s destruction schedule.

Community Outreach

Outreach efforts continue to be a priority for the staff, particularly through the Department’s social media
platforms. The community is kept apprised of cases of interest, upcoming events, and introductions of the
new officers. Recruiting new officers remains a priority for the Department, so staff focused efforts on
attracting highly qualified candidates to consider working for the Department.

Page 3



Iltem 1.

The Department continued community outreach via a number of events to include Coffee with a Cop, Battle
of the Badges, Paws on Patrol, and National Night Out. The slow transition to in-person events has been
particularly helpful in making personal connections with the community.

Emergency Management and Crime Prevention

The City’s Emergency Manager/Crime Prevention Officer was very busy keeping emergency plans up to date,
and training the City’s volunteer teams on Community Emergency Response Team (CERT) courses, Emergency
Well training, the Map Your Neighborhood program, and hosting Emergency Management informational
booths. Managing the COVID-19 pandemic response continued to take staff resources, as did the preparation
of the cooling center during heat events.

Detectives and School Resource Officer

The detective section was busy following up on criminal cases, and they welcomed their new School Resource
Officer, Foster Barragan. SRO Barragan spent time meeting the students and staff and serving as a resource
on matters related to juveniles.

Special Operations Team
The Special Operations Team participated in training sessions to maintain proficiency in responding to
incidents that may require advanced tactics or specialized systems like Patrol Bikes.

HOW OUR COMMUNITY RESPONDED

Support from the Mercer Island community remains very strong. Community members routinely express their
appreciation by dropping off baked goods and other treats, bringing in dinners around the holidays, and
sharing their thanks via written expressions of their gratitude. Such support has a very positive impact on
morale and retention. It is widely known that the Mercer Island community appreciates their police officers,
as evidenced by the new officers often citing this support as one of the reasons they applied to work on
Mercer Island. The Department greatly appreciates the strong partnership they have with the community.

RECOMMENDED ACTION

Receive report. No action necessary.

Page 4



Item 2.

BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL A8 6260
May 2, 2023
CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

Consent Agenda

AGENDA BILL INFORMATION

TITLE: AB 6260: April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification [ Discussion Only
Action Needed:
RECOMMENDED ACTION: | Approve the April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification in the Motion
amount of $973,786.50. ] Ordinance
[] Resolution

DEPARTMENT: Administrative Services
STAFF: Ali Spietz, Chief of Administration
Nicole Vannatter, Human Resources Manager
COUNCIL LIAISON: n/a
EXHIBITS: 1. April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification

2. FTE/LTE Counts
CITY COUNCIL PRIORITY: n/a

AMOUNT OF EXPENDITURE Sn/a

AMOUNT BUDGETED Sn/a

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED Sn/a

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

This agenda bill is to approve the payroll certification for the City of Mercer Island for the period from April 1,
2023 through April 14, 2023 in the amount of $973,786.50 (see Exhibit 1).

BACKGROUND

RCW 42.24.080 requires that all claims presented against the City by performing labor must be certified by
the appropriate official to ensure that the labor was performed as described, and that the claims are just,
due, and unpaid obligations against the City, before payment can be made. RCW 42.24.180 allows the
payment of claims to occur prior to City Council approval to expedite processing of the payment of claims,
provided, however, that review and approval of the claims’ documentation occurs at the next regularly
scheduled public meeting. The Payroll Certification details the total payment to employees for labor
performed and benefits payments made for each payroll. The City is on a bi-weekly payroll schedule with
payments every other Friday.

Page 1


https://app.leg.wa.gov/rcw/default.aspx?cite=42.24.080
https://app.leg.wa.gov/RCW/default.aspx?cite=42.24.180

Item 2.

ISSUE/DISCUSSION

Each payroll varies depending on several factors (i.e., number of employees, pay changes, leave cash outs,
overtime, etc.). In addition to regular pay for employees, this payroll has variants that are outlined below.

Additional payments: Overtime hours by department:
e 5$9,009.22 in leave cash outs for current
employees. Administrative Services

City Attorney’s Office
City Manager’s Office
Community Planning & Development

e $2,018.84 in service and recognition awards.
e $54,527.71 in overtime earnings (see chart for

overtime hours by department). Finance 28.00
Fire 583.00
Municipal Court
Police 52.75
Public Works 66.50
Thrift Shop

Youth & Family Services
Total Overtime Hours 730.25

NEXT STEPS
FTE/LTE COUNTS

The table in Exhibit 2 shows the budgeted versus actual counts for Full Time Equivalents (FTEs) and Limited
Term Equivalents (LTEs) for the current payroll. Casual labor employees (temporary and seasonal) are not
included in the counts.

Casual Labor

In addition to FTE and LTE employees, the City utilizes casual labor to address workload needs that exceed the
capacity or expertise of the City’s regular staff and that are time limited or seasonal. Casual labor is used
primarily to address seasonal workload needs and short-term workload issues created by special projects or
position vacancies. Compared to an LTE position, a casual labor position has limited benefits and is filled for a
shorter period of time (1-3 months, 6 months, or 9 months). The departments/divisions that utilize casual
labor the most are Parks Maintenance, Recreation, Public Works, and the Thrift Shop.

RECOMMENDED ACTION

Approve the April 21, 2023 Payroll Certification (Exhibit 1) in the amount of $973,786.50 and authorize the
Mayor to sign the certification on behalf of the entire City Council.

Page 2



I, the undersigned, do hereby certify under penalty of perjury that the materials have been furnished, the services rendered or
the labor performed as described herein, that any advance payment is due and payable pursuant to a contract or is available as
an option for full or partial fulfillment of a contractual obligation, and that the claim is a just, due and unpaid obligation against

CITY OF MERCER ISLAND PAYROLL CERTIFICATION

Item 2.

PAYROLL PERIOD ENDING 04.14.2023
PAYROLL DATED 04.21.2023
Net Cash S 638,672.84
Net Voids/Manuals S -

Net Total S 638,672.84
Federal Tax Deposit S 105,321.96
Social Security and Medicare Taxes S 58,176.30
Medicare Taxes Only (Fire Fighter Employees) S 2,734.42
State Tax (Oregon, Massachusetts and North Carolina) S 53.79
Family/Medical Leave Tax (Massachusetts) S 14.66
Public Employees' Retirement System (PERS Plan 2) S 29,409.92
Public Employees' Retirement System (PERS Plan 3) S 8,189.80
Public Employees' Retirement System (PERSIM) S 587.22
Public Safety Employees' Retirement System (PSERS) S 236.44
Law Enforcement Officers' & Fire Fighters' Retirement System (LEOFF Plan2) S 30,479.77
Regence & LEOFF Trust Medical Insurance Deductions S 14,117.41
Domestic Partner Medical Insurance Deductions S 1,488.77
Kaiser Medical Insurance Deductions S 1,024.29
Health Care - Flexible Spending Account Contributions S 1,981.55
Dependent Care - Flexible Spending Account Contributions S 1,538.48
ICMA Roth IRA Contributions S 638.46
ICMA 457 Deferred Compensation Contributions S 40,850.28
Fire Nationwide 457 Deferred Compensation Contributions S 17,190.46
Fire Nationwide Roth IRA Contributions S 4,007.25
ICMA 401K Deferred Compensation Contributions S -

Garnishments (Chapter 13) S 572.00
Child Support Wage Garnishment S 706.03
Mercer Island Employee Association Dues S 220.00
AFSCME Union Dues S 2,964.00
Police Union Dues S 2,531.23
Fire Union Dues S 2,060.91
Fire Union Supplemental Dues S 162.00
Standard - Supplemental Life Insurance S 409.70
Unum - Long Term Care Insurance S 839.15
AFLAC - Supplemental Insurance Plans S 238.52
Coffee Club Dues S 144.00
Transportation - Flexible Spending Account Contributions S -

Fire HRA-VEBA Contributions S 6,224.00
Miscellaneous S -

GET $ -

Oregon Transit Tax and Oregon Benefit Tax S 0.89
Tax & Benefit Obligations Total S 335,113.66

TOTAL GROSS PAYROLL

$ 973,786.50

the City of Mercer Island, and that | am authorized to authenticate and certify to said claim.

e e

Finance Director

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that the City Council has reviewed the documentation supporting claims paid and approved

all checks or warrants issued in payment of claims.

Mayor

Date
AB 6260 | Exhibit 1 | Page 3




Full Time Equivalents (FTEs)

Administrative Services

City Attorney's Office

City Manager's Office

Community Planning & Development

Finance

Fire

Municipal Court

Police

Public Works
Recreation

Youth & Family Services

Thrift Shop

Total FTEs

Limited Term Equivalents (LTEs)

Administrative Services

City Manager's Office

Community Planning & Development
Finance

Public Works

Youth & Family Services

10

Thrift Shop
Total LTEs

FTE AND LTE COUNTS AS OF 4/14/2023

Item 2.

FTE Vacancies:
1.0 Asset Mgmt Bus Systems Analyst
1.0 CIP Project Inspector
2.0 CIP Project Manager
1.0 Deputy Fire Chief (contracted out)
1.0 Financial Analyst

1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0

Fire Chief (contracted out)

Parks Maintenance Team Member
Payroll Analyst

Utility Billing Admin Assistant

2023 2023
Budgeted Actual
15.00 14.00
2.00 2.00
3.00 3.00
18.00 18.00
9.00 7.00
31.50 29.50
3.10 3.10
37.50 37.50
64.80 59.80
10.25 10.25
11.43 11.43
2.00 2.00
207.58 197.58
2023 2023
Budgeted Actual
1.00
0.50 1.00
0.25
1.00 1.00
3.00 3.75
3.03 3.83
7.50 6.00

15.03

Total FTEs & LTEs

222.61




11

CERTIFICATION OF CLAIMS

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify under penalty of perjury that the materials have been
furnished, the services rendered, or the labor performed as described herein, that any
advance payment is due and payable pursuant to a contract or is available as an option for
full or partial fulfillment of a contractual obligation, and that the claim is a just, due and
unpaid obligation against the City of Mercer Island, and that | am authorized to
authenticate and certify to said claim.

k> e

Finance Director

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that the City Council has reviewed the
documentation supporting claims paid and approved all checks or warrants issued in
payment of claims.

Mayor Date
Report Warrants Date Amount
Check Register 215549-215598 4/14/2023 $576,920.88

$576,920.88

\\CHFS1\share\FINANCEVENNIFER\COUNCIL.doc

Item 3.




City of Mercer Iland Finance Departn
Accounts Payable Report by GL Key ltem 3.
PO # Check # Vendor: Transaction Description Check Amount
Org Key: 402000 - Water Fund-Admin Key
P0117831 00215566 GRAINGER INVENTORY PURCHASES 241.00
OrgKey: CR1100 - Human Resources
P0117820 00215584  PUBLIC SAFETY TESTING INC PD Promotional Testing - 22,182.30
P0117819 00215573 MATZKE, NORMAN Polygraphs for entry level 750.00
P0117801 00215584  PUBLIC SAFETY TESTING INC Q1 2023 subscription fee - Fir 386.00
Org Key: CT1100 - Municipal Court
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 24.76
OrgKey: DS1100 - Administration (DS)
P0117839 00215578 MICRO COM SYSTEMSLTD Inv 17684; Document 2,570.34
P0117839 00215578 MICRO COM SYSTEMSLTD Inv 17685; Data Entry/Scanning 1,256.39
Org Key: FN2100 - Data Processing
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 E-SERVICE PORTAL AD 75.00
OrgKey: FN4501 - Utility Billing (Water)
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 99.05
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 79.85
Org Key: FN4502 - Utility Billing (Sewer)
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 99.05
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 79.85
Org Key: FN4503 - Utility Billing (Storm)
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 99.06
P0117822 00215575 METROPRESORT MARCH 2023 PRINTING & MAILING 79.85
OrgKey: FR1100 - Administration (FR)
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 17281
P0117802 00215549  Alvarialnc Telestaff monthly minimumin a 165.15
Org Key: FR2100 - Fire Operations
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 7609 2,266.74
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 7608 2,126.35
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 4604 899.20
P0117798 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 4603 860.18
P0117798 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 8614 854.80
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 7607 664.15
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 6603 583.65
P0O117797 00215550 AT&T MOBILITY Cell and tablets 552.12
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 8610 434.15
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 8613 273.15
P0117796 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus maintenance 8611 238.65
P0117798 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 7609 210.81
P0117798 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 8613 172.50
P0117798 00215562 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE Apparatus Maintenance 8614 170.95
PO117757 00215571 KROESENS UNIFORM COMPANY Uniform ops 551
OrgKey: FR2500 - Fire Emergency Medical Svcs
P0117799 00215572  LIFE ASSIST INC Aid supplies 1,182.30
P0117800 00215572  LIFE ASSIST INC Aid Supplies 825.90
Date: 04/14/23 Report Name:  Accounts Payable Report by GL Key
14:26:44 CouncilAP5

12

Page: 1



City of Mercer Iland

PO #

Check #

Finance Departn

Accounts Payable Report by GL Key

Vendor:

Transaction Description

Item 3.

Check Amount

Org Key: GB0100 - Building Repairs

P0117773 00215580 PACIFIC GLASS & DOOR INC. INSTALL REPLACEMENT GLASS FOR 2,301.09
Org Key: GGMO004 - Gen Gowt-Office Support
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 314.17
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 278.99
P0117814 00215557 CONFIDENTIAL DATA DISPOSAL City Shredding Service - 250.00
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 230.03
PO117814 00215557 CONFIDENTIAL DATA DISPOSAL City Shredding Service - 225.00
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 164.36
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 159.25
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 118.58
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 118.05
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 57.14
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 53.37
Org Key: GGMOOS5 - Genera Gowt-L 1 Retiree Costs
P0117834 00215563 ELSOE, RONALD LEOFF1 Retiree Medical Expense 998.80
OrgKey: 151100 - 1GS Mapping

00215587  RINGEL, MATT FLIGHT TO GIS-ESRI CONFERENCE 209.44
OrgKey: 1S2100 - 1GS Network Administration
P0117823 00215589  Smarsh Inc. Smarsh Additional March 80.21
OrgKey: 153101 - GIS Analyst Water Fund

00215587  RINGEL, MATT FLIGHT TO GIS-ESRI CONFERENCE 209.45
OrgKey: 153102 - GISAnalyst Sewer Fund

00215587 RINGEL, MATT FLIGHT TO GIS-ESRI CONFERENCE 209.45
OrgKey: 153103 - GIS Analyst Storm Fund

00215587  RINGEL, MATT FLIGHT TO GIS-ESRI CONFERENCE 209.45
Org Key: MT2100 - Roadway Maintenance
P0117821 00215577  MI UTILITY BILLS MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL 119.10
Org Key: MT2300 - Planter Bed Maintenance
P0117821 00215577  MI UTILITY BILLS MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL 643.14
OrgKey: MT2500 - ROW Administration
P0117790 00215556 COMPLETE OFFICE FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES 5,235.47
Org Key: MT3000 - Water Service Upsizes and New
P0117829 00215567 H D FOWLER FACC-1320 12" ABANDONED CORPC 1,081.70
P0117765 00215592 TACOMA SCREW PRODUCTSINC NUTS & BOLTS FOR WATER METERS 592.94
Org Key: MT3100 - Water Distribution
P0117161 00215561 DITCH WITCH WEST VAC TRAILER RENTAL 2,972.70
P0117821 00215577 MI UTILITY BILLS MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL 2,021.55
Org Key: MT3400 - Sewer Collection
P0117821 00215577  MI UTILITY BILLS MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL 973.61
P0117827 00215567 H D FOWLER 6" ADS SOLID CORRUGATED PIPE 809.24

Date: 04/14/23 Report Name:  Accounts Payable Report by GL Key
14:26:44 CouncilAP5

13

Page: 2



City of Mercer Iland

PO # Check #

Accounts Payable Report by GL Key

Vendor: Transaction Description

Finance Departn

Item 3.

Check Amount

Org Key: MT3800 - Storm Drainage

P0117821 00215577

MI UTILITY BILLS

OrgKey: MT4101 - Support Services - General Fd

P0117790 00215556

COMPLETE OFFICE

OrgKey: MT4150 - Support Services - Clearing

P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554

CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460

OrgKey: MT4200 - Building Services

P0117821 00215577
P0117821 00215577

MI UTILITY BILLS
MI UTILITY BILLS

Org Key: MT4300 - Fleet Services

P0117824 00215574

P0117667 00215553
P0117826 00215579

MERCER ISLAND CHEVRON FUEL
CHARGEPOINT INC

NAPA AUTO PARTS REPAIR PARTS

OrgKey: MT4420 - Transportation Planner Eng

P0117661 00215595

TRAFFIC SAFETY SUPPLY

Org Key: MT6100 - Park Maintenance

P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554
P0117828 00215554

CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460
CINTAS CORPORATION #460

Org Key: PO0000 - Police-Revenue

P0117815 00215596
P0117815 00215596

WASHINGTON STATE PATROL
WASHINGTON STATE PATROL

OrgKey: PO1100 - Administration (PO)

P0117810 00215550
P0117808 00215591
P0117790 00215556
P0117790 00215556
P0117808 00215591
P0117790 00215556

AT&T MOBILITY

COMPLETE OFFICE
COMPLETE OFFICE

COMPLETE OFFICE

Org Key: PO1350 - Police Emergency Management

P0117811 00215585

REMOTE SATELLITE SYSTEMSINT'L Sat Phone Servicefor EMAC - D

Org Key: PO1800 - Contract Dispatch Police

P0117825 00215583

PowerDMS Accreditation and training Sof

Org Key: PO1900 - Jail/Home Monitoring

P0117803 00215588
P0117817 00215569
P0117817 00215569
P0117803 00215588
P0117803 00215588

SCORE Score Jail Housing Costs and
Issaquah Jail Housing - Invoic
Issaquah Jail Housing - Invoic
SCORE Score Jail Housing and medical
SCORE Score Jail Housing (Hospital

ISSAQUAH JAIL, CITY OF
ISSAQUAH JAIL, CITY OF

MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL

FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES

2023 PW COVERALL SERVICES
2023 PW COVERALL SERVICES
2023 PW COVERALL SERVICES
2023 PW COVERALL SERVICES

MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL
MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL

CHARGEPOINT replacement part

IRS, TUFF CURB XLP, (40" X 8"

PARKS 2023 COVERALL SERVICE
PARKS 2023 COVERALL SERVICE
PARKS 2023 COVERALL SERVICE
PARKS 2023 COVERALL SERVICE

CPL Background Checks -
CPL Background Checks -

PD Phone and Data Services -
T-MOBILE PD Cdll Service- Data- March
FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES
FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES
T-MOBILE Change in service - dated 3/2/
FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES

95.38

63.15

700.02
700.02
700.02
700.02

9,832.43
231.58

1,494.29
1,386.82
591.64

818.70

31.69
31.69
31.69
31.69

145.75
100.50

1,029.67
357.69
54.48
38.69
25.00
13.62

69.95

7,243.05

11,759.00
7,665.00
6,385.00
1,703.90

318.75

Date: 04/14/23

14:26:44
14

Report Name:  Accounts Payable Report by GL Key

CouncilAP5

Page: 3



City of Mercer Iland

PO #

Check #

Finance Departn

Accounts Payable Report by GL Key

Vendor:

Transaction Description

Item 3.

Check Amount

Org Key: PO2100 - Patrol Division

P0117812
P0117813
P0117812
P0117812
P0117805

00215571
00215590
00215571
00215571
00215576

KROESENS UNIFORM COMPANY

STARBUCK'S TOWING

KROESENS UNIFORM COMPANY
KROESENS UNIFORM COMPANY

MI HARDWARE - POLICE

Org Key: P0O2200 - Marine Patrol

P0117804

00215597

WEST MARINE PRO

Org Key: P0O3100 - Investigation Division

P0117806
P0117807

00215594
00215564

THOMSON REUTERS - WEST

EQUIFAX INFORMATION SVCSLLC

Org Key: PO4100 - FirearmsTraining

P0117809

00215551

AXON ENTERPRISE INC

Org Key: PO4300 - Police Training

P0117816

00215560

CRIMINAL JUSTICE TRAINING COMM

Org Key: PR4100 - Community Center

P0117821

00215577

MI UTILITY BILLS

Org Key: PR5900 - Summer Celebration

P0117793

00215598

WESTERN DISPLAY FIREWORKSLTD

Org Key: VCP104 - CIP Streets Salaries

P0117760

00215552

BlueBeam Inc.

OrgKey: VCP402 - CIP Water Salaries

P0117790

00215556

COMPLETE OFFICE

Org Key: WR152R - 80th Ave Sidewalk (28th-32nd)

P0104658

00215570

KPG

Org Key: WUO0100 - Emergency Water System Repairs

P0111663

00215586

RH2 ENGINEERING INC

Org Key: WUO0117 - Meter Replacement | mplementati

P0115874
P0115874
P0115874
P0115874
P0115874
P0102980
P0115874
P0115874
P0115874
P0115874
P0115874

00215565
00215565
00215565
00215565
00215565
00215568
00215565
00215565
00215565
00215565
00215565

FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
HDR ENGINEERING INC

FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC
FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC

OrgKey: YF1100 - YFS General Services

P0117790

00215556

COMPLETE OFFICE

Org Key: YF1200 - Thrift Shop

Uniform Supplies - Invoice(s):
Impound Fees - Invoice: #2-800
Uniform Supplies - Invoice(s):
Uniform Supplies - Invoice(s):
Patrol Supplies - Invoice# 14

MP Equipment

West investigative Services -
Investigative Services - Invoi

Taser Supplies - Invoice INUS1

Instructor Development - Invoi

MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL

FIREWORKS SHOW 7/15/23

Bluebeam Revu Standard 1 addit

FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES

80TH AVE SE PEDESTIAN IMPROVEM

RESERVOIR PUMP-MOTOR

ELECTRONIC METERS
ELECTRONIC METERS
ELECTRONIC METERS
ELECTRONIC METERS
ELECTRONIC METERS
WATER METER REPLACEMENT
ESTIMATED TAXESAT 10,1%
ESTIMATED TAXESAT 10,1%
ESTIMATED TAXESAT 10,1%
ESTIMATED TAXESAT 10,1%
ESTIMATED TAXESAT 10,1%

FEB 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES

754.35
279.65
277.76
27.53
9.49

587.46

497.61
153.95

1,440.11

2,400.00

4,564.36

10,000.00

537.56

38.05

32,213.78

16,474.21

110,497.28
102,397.44
70,249.50
32,855.50
19,216.82
16,083.20
11,160.23
10,342.14
7,095.20
3,318.41
1,940.90

14.31

Date: 04/14/23
14:26:44

15

Report Name:  Accounts Payable Report by GL Key

CouncilAP5

Page: 4



City of Mercer Iland Finance Departn
Accounts Payable Report by GL Key ltem 3.

PO # Check # Vendor: Transaction Description Check Amount

P0117821 00215577 MI UTILITY BILLS MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL 844.89

OrgKey: YF2600 - Family Assistance

P0117867 00215593 TAURAN PROPERTY MANAGEMENT CO Rental assistance for EA clien 2,000.00

P0117869 00215558 COUNTRY VILLAGE DAY SCHOOL Preschool scholarship for EA ¢ 1,466.66

P0117868 00215559 CREATIVE LEARNING CENTER Preschool scholarship for EA ¢ 643.80

P0117871 00215581 PEBBLE @ MIPC, THE Preschool scholarship for EA ¢ 450.00

P0117870 00215582 PEBBLE @ MIPC, THE Preschool Scholarship for EA ¢ 420.00
Total 576,920.88

Date: 04/14/23 Report Name:  Accounts Payable Report by GL Key
14:26:44 CouncilAP5

16 Page: 5




City of Mercer Idand

Accounts Payable Report by Check Number

Finance Dej

Item 3.

Check No Check Date Vendor Name/Description PO # Invoice # I nvoice Date Check Amount

00215549 04/14/2023 Alvarialnc P0117802 ASI075851 04/05/2023 165.15
Telestaff monthly minimumin a

00215550 04/14/2023 AT&T MOBILITY P0117810 X03192023 03/11/2023 1,581.79
Cell and tablets

00215551 04/14/2023 AXON ENTERPRISE INC P0O117809 INUS140002 02/24/2023 1,440.11
Taser Supplies - Invoice INUSL

00215552 04/14/2023 BlueBeam Inc. P0O117760 1596345 04/05/2023 537.56
Bluebeam Revu Standard 1 addit

00215553 04/14/2023 CHARGEPOINT INC P0117667 IN181597 03/17/2023 1,386.82
CHARGEPOINT replacement part

00215554 04/14/2023 CINTAS CORPORATION #460 P0117828 4150547517 03/27/2023 2,926.84
2023 PW COVERALL SERVICES

00215556 04/14/2023 COMPLETE OFFICE PO117790 2189909-1 02/06/2023 7,149.28
MAR 2023 OFFICE SUPPLIES

00215557 04/14/2023 CONFIDENTIAL DATA DISPOSAL P0117814 217400 02/28/2023 475.00
City Shredding Service -

00215558 04/14/2023 COUNTRY VILLAGE DAY SCHOOL P0117869 041323 04/13/2023 1,466.66
Preschool scholarship for EA ¢

00215559 04/14/2023 CREATIVE LEARNING CENTER P0117868 9890/9942 04/13/2023 643.80
Preschool scholarship for EA ¢

00215560 04/14/2023 CRIMINAL JUSTICE TRAINING COMM  P0117816 201137655 03/03/2023 2,400.00
Instructor Development - Invoi

00215561 04/14/2023 DITCH WITCH WEST PO117161 90088702 03/30/2023 2,972.70
VAC TRAILER RENTAL

00215562 04/14/2023 EASTSIDE FIRE & RESCUE P0117796 5363 03/28/2023 9,755.28
Apparatus Maintenance 4603

00215563 04/14/2023 ELSOE, RONALD P0117834 LEOFF1MED EXP  04/11/2023 998.80
LEOFF1 Retiree Medical Expense

00215564 04/14/2023 EQUIFAX INFORMATION SVCSLLC P0117807 2054545844 03/23/2023 153.95
Investigative Services - Invoi

00215565 04/14/2023 FERGUSON ENTERPRISESLLC P0115874 1185561 03/07/2023 369,073.42
ELECTRONIC METERS

00215566 04/14/2023 GRAINGER P0117831 9663904184 04/04/2023 241.00
INVENTORY PURCHASES

00215567 04/14/2023 H D FOWLER P0117827 16357483 04/07/2023 1,890.94
FACC-1320 12" ABANDONED CORPC

00215568 04/14/2023 HDR ENGINEERING INC P0102980 1200505228 03/07/2023 16,083.20
WATER METER REPLACEMENT PROGRA

00215569 04/14/2023 ISSAQUAH JAIL, CITY OF PO117817 23000108 03/03/2023 14,050.00
Issaquah Jail Housing - Invoic

00215570 04/14/2023 KPG P0104658 194602 03/30/2023 32,213.78
80TH AVE SE PEDESTIAN IMPROVEM

00215571 04/14/2023 KROESENS UNIFORM COMPANY PO117812 72622 03/13/2023 1,065.15
Uniform ops

00215572 04/14/2023 LIFE ASSIST INC P0117800 1307523 04/03/2023 2,008.20
Aid supplies

00215573 04/14/2023 MATZKE, NORMAN PO117819 32923 03/28/2023 750.00
Polygraphs for entry level

00215574 04/14/2023 MERCER ISLAND CHEVRON P0117824 FUEL MAR 2023 03/31/2023 1,494.29
FUEL

00215575 04/14/2023 METROPRESORT P0117822 IN653274 04/05/2023 611.71
MARCH 2023 E-SERVICE PORTAL AD

Date: 04/14/23 Time: 14:25:52 Report Name: AP Report by Check Number CouncilAP

17

Page: 1



City of Mercer Island Accounts Payable Report by Check Number Finance Def 'em 3

Check No Check Date Vendor Name/Description PO # Invoice # I nvoice Date Check Amount

00215576 04/14/2023 M| HARDWARE - POLICE P0O117805 145607 03/11/2023 9.49
Patrol Supplies - Invoice# 14

00215577 04/14/2023 M| UTILITY BILLS PO117821 MAR?2023U AND W 03/31/2023 19,326.04
MARCH 2023 PMT OF UTILITY BILL

00215578 04/14/2023 MICRO COM SYSTEMSLTD P0O117839 17685 04/06/2023 3,826.73
Inv 17684; Document

00215579 04/14/2023 NAPA AUTO PARTS P0117826 MAR2023 03/31/2023 591.64
REPAIR PARTS

00215580 04/14/2023 PACIFIC GLASS & DOOR INC. P0O117773 5171 03/27/2023 2,301.09
INSTALL REPLACEMENT GLASS FOR

00215581 04/14/2023 PEBBLE @ MIPC, THE P0O117871 041323 04/13/2023 450.00
Preschool scholarship for EA ¢

00215582 04/14/2023 PEBBLE @ MIPC, THE P0117870 041323B 04/13/2023 420.00
Preschool Scholarship for EA ¢

00215583 04/14/2023 PowerDMS P0117825 INV-34128 03/29/2023 7,243.05
Accreditation and training Sof

00215584 04/14/2023 PUBLIC SAFETY TESTING INC P0O117801 2023-282 04/03/2023 22,568.30
PD Promotional Testing -

00215585 04/14/2023 REMOTE SATELLITE SYSTEMSINT'L PO117811 00122257 03/10/2023 69.95
Sat Phone Servicefor EMAC - D

00215586 04/14/2023 RH2 ENGINEERING INC P0111663 89764 03/14/2023 16,474.21
RESERVOIR PUMP-MOTOR ASSESMENT

00215587 04/14/2023 RINGEL, MATT 04072023 04/07/2023 837.79
FLIGHT TO GIS-ESRI CONFERENCE

00215588 04/14/2023 SCORE P0117803 6709 03/03/2023 13,781.65
Score Jail Housing Costs and

00215589 04/14/2023 Smarsh Inc. P0117823 INV-89388 03/31/2023 80.21
Smarsh Additional March

00215590 04/14/2023 STARBUCK'S TOWING P0117813 2-8003 03/17/2023 279.65
Impound Fees - Invoice: #2-800

00215591 04/14/2023 T-MOBILE P0117808 (022123-032023 03/21/2023 382.69
Changein service - dated 3/2/

00215592 04/14/2023 TACOMA SCREW PRODUCTSINC PO117765 100187732-00 04/03/2023 592.94
NUTS & BOLTS FOR WATER METERS

00215593 04/14/2023 TAURAN PROPERTY MANAGEMENT CO P0117867 041123 04/11/2023 2,000.00
Rental assistance for EA clien

00215594 04/14/2023 THOMSON REUTERS - WEST P0117806 847937734 03/01/2023 497.61
West investigative Services -

00215595 04/14/2023 TRAFFIC SAFETY SUPPLY P0O117661 INV057871 03/29/2023 818.70
IRS, TUFF CURB XLP, (40" X 8"

00215596 04/14/2023 WASHINGTON STATE PATROL P0117815 123004992 03/01/2023 246.25
CPL Background Checks -

00215597 04/14/2023 WEST MARINE PRO P0117804 6122 03/09/2023 587.46
MP Equipment

00215598 04/14/2023 WESTERN DISPLAY FIREWORKSLTD  P0117793 04042023 04/04/2023 10,000.00

FIREWORKS SHOW 7/15/23

Total 576,920.88

Date: 04/14/23 Time: 14:25:52 Report Name: AP Report by Check Number CouncilAP

18 Page: 2




19

Iltem 4.

BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL 485261
May 2, 2023
CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

Consent Agenda

AGENDA BILL INFORMATION

TITLE: AB 6261: Affordable Housing Week (Proclamation No. | [ Discussion Only
306) Action Needed:
Motion
RECOMMENDED ACTION: | Approve Proclamation No. 306 proclaiming the week [J Ordinance
of May 7 to 13, 2023 as Affordable Housing Week. ] Resolution

DEPARTMENT: Community Planning and Development
STAFF: Salim Nice, Mayor

Alison Van Gorp, Deputy CPD Director
COUNCIL LIAISON: n/a
EXHIBITS: 1. Proclamation No. 306

CITY COUNCIL PRIORITY: n/a

AMOUNT OF EXPENDITURE Sn/a

AMOUNT BUDGETED Sn/a

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED Sn/a

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY
The purpose of this agenda bill is to proclaim May 7-13, 2023 as Affordable Housing Week in Mercer Island.

e Homelessness remains a major challenge in King County and current economic conditions continue to
put pressure on low- and middle-income households in our region.

e Significant investments in building, preserving, and subsidizing new affordable homes are needed.

e The Growth Management Act now requires cities like Mercer Island to plan to accommodate
projected housing needs as a part of the 2024 periodic update of comprehensive plans.

e In addition to planning for housing, the City also contributes to affordable housing development and
preservation as a member of ARCH (A Regional Coalition for Housing).

e Proclaiming May 7-13 as Affordable Housing Week in Mercer Island shines a light on both the
substantial need for more affordable housing in King County, as well as the important work already
underway to understand and address that need.

BACKGROUND

Homelessness remains one of the most difficult and complex issues facing King County. The King County
Regional Homelessness Authority estimates that more than 53,000 people experienced homelessness in King
County in 2022, up from 40,000 people in 2020. The impacts of the COVID-19 Pandemic continue to
exacerbate the challenges low- and middle- income people face in the region. Market rents surged more than

Page 1



20

Iltem 4.

15% last year in East King County. Furthermore, the high rates of inflation and increases in costs of goods and
services mean that family budgets are stretched.

King County currently faces a shortfall of 149,000 affordable homes. That number is expected to grow to
212,000 homes by 2044.

In 2022, the City completed a Housing Needs Assessment to understand Mercer Island’s existing and future
housing needs and to inform the 2024 periodic update to the Comprehensive Plan. City staff continue to
coordinate with other East King County jurisdictions to address affordable housing needs through ARCH,
including annual investments in the ARCH Housing Trust Fund, which has helped create over 7,000 units of
affordable housing in East King County.

ISSUE/DISCUSSION

Since 2016, the Housing Development Consortium (HDC) of Seattle-King County has partnered with its diverse
membership body to coordinate Affordable Housing Week, aimed at recognizing the need to preserve and
increase affordable housing in King County communities. HDC’'s members encompass all major nonprofit
housing developers in King County as well as financial institutions, consultants, architects, building
contractors, attorneys, accountants, service providers, local housing authorities, and government agencies.

Each year, Affordable Housing Week brings together residents from across King County to focus attention on
affordable housing and to promote thriving communities where everyone has an opportunity to live with
dignity in safe, healthy, and affordable homes. Affordable Housing Week activities are attended and led by
cities, organizations, advocates, and residents.

Proclaiming May 7-13 as Affordable Housing Week in Mercer Island shines a light on both the need for more
affordable housing in King County, as well as the important work already underway to understand and
address that need. For more information on affordable housing in King County and to learn about the events
and activities planned for May 7-13, visit the Affordable Housing Week webpage.

RECOMMENDED ACTION
Approve Proclamation No. 306 proclaiming May 7 to 13, 2023, as Affordable Housing Week in Mercer Island.

Page 2


https://www.housingconsortium.org/
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.housingconsortium.org%2Faffordable-housing-week%2F&data=05%7C01%7Calison.vangorp%40mercergov.org%7C7b142b6e04444e744efa08db16c02823%7Cced2aa098b804de2b9dd7410b6965ed0%7C0%7C0%7C638128786801100144%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=LF2ttxqtFZi0z4oeY31orgFTWgm1RlIIJQAPO9aBsfw%3D&reserved=0

<

\/
¢

5000 0-0-0--O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-Or-O-O<C |
\_/

City of Mercer Island, Washington
Proclamation

WHEREAS, all people should have access to safe, healthy, and affordable homes
within communities that provide opportunity.

The US Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD) defines affordable
housing as “housing on which the occupant is paying no more than 30 percent of
gross income for housing costs, including utilities.”

The WA State Department of Commerce projects that by 2044, King County needs
nearly 200,000 net new housing units for households at or below 80% area median
income. Studies have also shown that each $100 increase in median rent results in a
15% increase in homelessness in metro areas and a 39% increase in homelessness in
nearby suburbs and rural areas.

The COVID-19 pandemic has exacerbated many existing financial constraints for low-
and moderate-income households. Additionally, the CDC recognizes safe, healthy,
and affordable housing within communities of opportunity as key social
determinants of health.

Everyone benefits from affordable housing, including residents, neighbors,
businesses, and employers. Recognizing this, people, organizations, and
communities throughout King County are united to raise public awareness and are
participating in local Affordable Housing Week activities to elevate the critical need
to create healthy communities with ample affordable housing.

The City of Mercer Island endorses the goals, objectives, and purposes of Affordable
Housing Week, and firmly recommits itself to ensuring that our community’s
recovery from the crises at hand is equitable, and that all people in Mercer Island live
with dignity in safe, healthy, and affordable homes.

NOW, THEREFORE, |, Salim Nice, Mayor of the City of Mercer Island, do hereby
proclaim the week of May 7 to 13, 2023, as:

AFFORDABLE HOUSING WEEK
APPROVED, this 2nd day of May, 2023

Mayor Salim Nice

HOUSING 24
Proclamation No. 306 ' [jﬂﬂ

AB 6261 | Exhibit 1 | Page 3

2-20-O-O--O-O--O--Or-O-O-RHRHH-O-O--O-Or-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O- O O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-Or-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O-O

Item 4.



22

Item 5.

BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL AB 5262
May 2, 2023
CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

Regular Business

AGENDA BILL INFORMATION

TITLE: AB 6262: Construction Code Adoption (2nd Reading) [ Discussion Only
Action Needed:
RECOMMENDED ACTION: | Adopt Ordinance No. 23C-04 amending MICC Chapter ] Motion
17 with the updated editions of the Construction Ordinance

Codes to be effective on July 1, 2023, as mandated by
the State of Washington.

(] Resolution

DEPARTMENT: Community Planning and Development

STAFF: Jeff Thomas, Director Community Planning & Development
Don Cole, Building Official
Jeromy Hicks, Fire Marshal

COUNCIL LIAISON: n/a

EXHIBITS: 1. Proposed Ordinance No. 23C-04 with Attachment A
2. Summary of Significant Code Changes

CITY COUNCIL PRIORITY: n/a

AMOUNT OF EXPENDITURE Sn/a

AMOUNT BUDGETED Sn/a

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED Sn/a

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The purpose of this agenda bill is to adopt state-mandated updates to the City’s construction codes to
improve public safety and welfare by staying current with new code requirements. Typically, the model codes
are updated on a three-year cycle and the state then mandates adoption by local jurisdictions.

e Mercer Island must adopt the state-mandated construction codes no later than July 1, 2023.

e Additional construction code amendments are also recommended to align with regional model codes.

e Training will be available to building professionals to aid with the transition to the new construction
codes. Information regarding the significant code updates is posted on the City’s website.

e City Council completed its first reading of Ordinance No. 23C-04 (Exhibit 1) on April 25, 2023 (AB
6250) and scheduled the second reading and adoption for May 2, 2023.

BACKGROUND

The Washington State construction codes are amended on a three-year cycle, beginning with the release of
the new editions of international model codes and ending with formal adoption of the construction codes as
amended by the State Building Code Council (SBCC). The SBCC is a state agency created by the legislature to

Page 1


https://mccmeetingspublic.blob.core.usgovcloudapi.net/mercerwa-meet-b0f42d8e7480482a830e304de4763042/ITEM-Attachment-001-38420c6df2a84e149e0e51861351e122.pdf
https://mccmeetingspublic.blob.core.usgovcloudapi.net/mercerwa-meet-b0f42d8e7480482a830e304de4763042/ITEM-Attachment-001-38420c6df2a84e149e0e51861351e122.pdf

23

Item 5.

provide independent analysis and objective advice to the legislature and the Governor's Office on state
building code issues. The SBCC establishes the minimum building, mechanical, fire, plumbing and energy code
requirements necessary to promote the health, safety, and welfare of the people of the state of Washington,
by reviewing, developing, and adopting the state building code. The SBCC undertakes an extensive technical
review and public outreach process in developing the state construction codes each cycle. The state
construction code adoption process is summarized in more detail here.

As indicated above, State updates to the construction codes occur every three years. Local jurisdictions are
now required to adopt the state construction codes two years after adoption by the SBCC. Therefore, the city
must adopt the 2021 construction codes by July 1, 2023. City Council completed its first reading of Ordinance
No. 23C-04 on April 25, 2023.

ISSUE/DISCUSSION
2021 STATE CONSTRUCTION CODE MANDATE

Effective July 1, 2023, Washington statutes require all jurisdictions in the state to adopt and enforce the
following updated Construction Code editions as adopted and amended by the State of Washington:

e 2021 International Building Code (IBC)

e 2021 International Residential Code (IRC)

e 2021 International Mechanical Code (IMC)

e 2021 International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC)

e 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC)

e 2021 International Fire Code (IFC)

e 2021 International Existing Building Code

e 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code
e 2021 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code (WUIC)
e Washington State Energy Code (WSEC)

e Washington Cities Electrical Code (WCEC)

Proposed Ordinance No. 23C-04 (Exhibit 1) updates Mercer Island City Code Title 17 to adopt the updated
State Construction Codes. Except for items presented in the section titled “Optional Changes,” the proposed
changes to the existing construction codes are limited to code changes deemed necessary to provide
conformity with mandated updates or for clarification purposes.

MANDATED CHANGES

The mandated code updates include hundreds of changes with various levels of impact on safety, energy
efficiency, construction costs, and more. For example, the updates include fire-resistive construction changes
to improve fire and life safety and more stringent energy code requirements to improve energy efficiency.
Both updates will result in small increases in construction costs. The analysis of such cost relationships was
part of the state code adoption process.

Impactful and higher profile changes include:

e Restrictions on fossil fuel heating equipment,

e Requirements for heat pump space heaters and service water heaters,
e Provisions for electric vehicle (EV) charging infrastructure,

e Accessibility changes to accommodate larger wheelchairs, and

Page 2



https://www.sbcc.wa.gov/sites/default/files/2022-09/Building%20Code%20Review%20and%20Adoption%20Process_Summary.pdf

24

Item 5.

e Enforcement of the Wildland-Urban Interface Code.
A more detailed listing of significant code changes is provided in Exhibit 2.

OPTIONAL CHANGES

In addition to moving all mandated changes forward to second reading, the City Council also moved the
following optional changes forward to align City requirements with those of other regional jurisdictions:

1. Update the Administrative Provisions to remain consistent with the Regional Model Code
(MyBuildingPermit.com).
This proposed update includes minor alterations to the administrative provisions within the existing
MICC Title 17, Construction Codes, enabling the Mercer Island Administrative Code to remain
consistent with the regional model administrative code for cities participating within
MyBuildingPermit.com. Examples include designating the authority for interpretations and
enforcement, setting expiration criteria for permit applications and permits, and similar
administrative provisions.

2. Update the Fire Code as recommended by Zone 1 Fire Marshals. Updates to the Fire Code are aimed
at providing clarity to the adopted code as related to jurisdictional specific requirements.
Furthermore, the recommended changes were modified to closely align with the City’s regional
partners to provide consistency for residents, business owners, and contractors.

Participation in the regional model codes for code administration and fire code requirements helps provide
the following:

e Permit applicants will have consistent administration and enforcement when working in the region
(MyBuildingPermit.com and Zone 1 Fire Marshal jurisdictions).

e Asingle reference to one administrative provision for all construction codes rather than eleven
different codes created by multiple organizations.

e Resolves conflicts between administrative provisions within various adopted codes — IBC, UPC, NFPA,
NEC, etc.

e Resolves conflicts, aligns, and provides administrative provisions consistent with other MICC
provisions (fees, violations, appeals, etc.)

o Simplifies the addition of administrative provisions that are not addressed within the differing
construction codes (such as fees, violations, penalties, appeals, etc.).

e Creates less work when adopting and amending administrative provisions. Specifically, only one code
is amended instead of eleven codes.

There are no other changes proposed to the construction codes beyond the state mandated changes and the
two aforementioned items. It should be noted that local jurisdictions have little authority to adopt
construction codes that differ from the state mandated codes. State law (WAC 51-04-030) requires review
and approval of local amendments to certain construction codes by the Washington State Building Code
Council (SBCC). Locally adopted construction codes shall not become effective without approval from the
SBCC.

OUTREACH AND TRAINING FOR STAFF AND BUILDING PROFESSIONALS

Extensive public outreach and training has occurred at various levels, statewide through the Washington
Association of Building Officials (WABQ) and regionally by MyBuildingPermit.com, to which the Mercer Island

Page 3


http://mybuildingpermit.com/
https://apps.leg.wa.gov/wac/default.aspx?cite=51-04-030

25

Item 5.

is a member. WABO just completed its “2023 WABO Annual Education Institute” from March 20-24 in
Lynnwood. MyBuildingPermit.com has its annual “I-Code Update Week” scheduled for May 15-19 in Kirkland.

Locally, City staff are providing information regarding the significant code updates on the City’s website,
sending email communications to customers as well as answering specific questions regarding the updates.
Staff participates in the development of low-cost 2021 Code update training seminars targeted at contractors
and design professionals, along with providing informational handouts and website information.

NEXT STEPS

Adopting the ordinance on May 2, 2023, will provide for the updated Construction Codes to take effect on
July 1, 2023, as mandated by the State of Washington.

RECOMMENDED ACTION

Adopt Ordinance No. 23C-04 amending MICC Chapter 17 with the updated editions of the Construction Codes
to be effective on July 1, 2023, as mandated by the State of Washington.

Page 4



26

CITY OF MERCER ISLAND
ORDINANCE NO. 23C-04

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MERCER ISLAND AMENDING TITLE 17 OF
THE MERCER ISLAND CITY CODE, CONSTRUCTION CODES, BY ADOPTING
THE 2021 AMENDMENTS TO THE STATE BUILDING CODE, PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY, AND ESTABLISHING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, Washington statutes require all jurisdictions in the state to adopt by reference and
enforce the updated versions of the Construction Codes throughout Washington; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Mercer Island has adopted by reference numerous
Construction Codes for the health, safety and welfare of the citizens as set forth in Title 17 of the
Mercer Island City Code (MICC), Construction Codes, and

WHEREAS, the Washington State Building Code Council adopted the 2021 editions of the
International Codes, and all jurisdictions in the state are required to adopt and enforce the 2021
International Codes effective July 1, 2023; and

WHEREAS, the City of Mercer Island adopted the 2018 International Codes and wishes to adopt
the 2021 amendments to the International Codes, to be effective July 1, 2023; and

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.040 permits a city to amend the International Codes as they apply to that
city, so long as the minimum performance standards of the Codes and the objectives enumerated
in RCW 19.27.020 are not diminished; and

WHEREAS, Title 17 MICC was previously adopted and amended to be consistent with the
regional model code established by jurisdictions participating within MyBuildingPermit.com; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MERCER ISLAND,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: Title 17 MICC “Construction Codes” Amended. The amendments to Title 17
MICC set forth in Exhibit A to this ordinance shall be adopted and become effective
on July 1, 2023, but not sooner than the effective date of this ordinance.

Section 2: Scrivener’s Errors. The City Council authorizes the Building Official, Fire Marshal,
and the City Clerk to correct any scrivener’s errors in Exhibit A.

Section 3: Severability. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance or any
municipal code section amended hereby should be held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity of any other section, sentence, clause
or phrase of this ordinance or the amended code section.

Section 4: Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force 5 days after its
passage and publication.

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Mercer Island, Washington at its meeting on the 2nd
day of May 2023 and signed in authentication of its passage.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1 | Page 5

Item 5.




27

Approved as to Form:

CITY OF MERCER ISLAND

Item 5.

Salim Nice, Mayor

ATTEST:

Bio Park, City Attorney

Date of Publication:

Andrea Larson, City Clerk

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1 | Page 6




28

Chapter 17.01 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

17.01.010 Adoption.

The 2048-2021 Edition of the International Building Code (IBC), including the adoption of ICC/ANSI A117.1-
20092017, Requirements for Accessible and Useable Buildings and Facilities, as adopted and amended by the State
Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-50, as published by the International Code Council, excluding Chapter 1,
Administration, is adopted by reference, together with the following amendments and additions. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be used in place of IBC Chapter 1, Administration.
The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made
available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

Exceptions. The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for the
commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits.
"Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and roof covered with polyethylene, polyvinyl,
or similar flexible synthetic material and is used to provide plants with either frost protection or increased heat
retention. A temporary growing structure is not considered a building for purposes of this code.

The provisions of this code do not apply to the construction, alteration, or repair of temporary worker housing
except as provided by rule adopted under RCW Chapter 70.114A or Chapter 37, Laws of 1998 (SB 6168).
"Temporary worker housing" means a place, area, or piece of land where sleeping places or housing sites are
provided by an employer for his or her employees or by another person, including a temporary worker housing
operator, who is providing such accommodations for employees, for temporary, seasonal occupancy, and includes
"labor camps" under RCW 70.54.110.

A.  The following appendices of the 2648-2021 Edition of the International Building Code are also adopted
by reference: Appendix E — Supplementary Accessibility Requirements, and Appendix H — Signs.

S Miseelleneots:

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 1; Ord. 13C-06 § 1; Ord. 10C-03 & 1; Ord. 07C-04 & 1; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 7

Item 5.




29

17.01.020 Amendments and additions.

A.  IBC Section 202 Amended — Definitions, High-Rise Building. Section 202 of the International Building Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor or rooftop located more than 75 feet (22,860 mm)
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

B.  IBCSection 312.1 Amended — Utility and Miscellaneous Group U, General. Section 312.1 of the International
Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 312.1 — General. Buildings and structures of an accessory character and miscellaneous structures not
classified in any specific occupancy shall be constructed, equipped and maintained to conform to the requirements
of this code commensurate with the fire and life hazard incidental to their occupancy. Group U shall include, but
not be limited to, the following:

Agricultural buildings

Aircraft hangars, accessory to a one- or two-family residence (see Section 412.5412.4)
Barns

Carports

Communication equipment structures with a gross floor area of less than 1500 square feet (139 square
meters)

Fences more than 6 feet (1,829 mm) high

Grain silos, accessory to a residential occupancy
Livestock shelters

Private garages

Retaining walls

Sheds

Stables

Tanks

Towers

Waterfront structures

C.  IBC Section 405.8 Amended — Underground Buildings, Standby Power. Section 405.8 of the International
Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 405.8 — Standby power and emergency power. A standby power system complying with Section
2702 shall be provided for standby power loads specified in Section 405.8.1. An emergency power system
complying with Section 2702 shall be provided for the emergency power loads specified in Section
405.8:-1-405.8.2. Fuel-fired emergency generator sets and associated fuel storage, including optional
generator sets, located more than 30 feet below the lowest level of exit discharge requires the approval of
the Fire Code Official.

D.  IBC Section 502.1 Amended — General Building Heights and Areas, General, Address Identification. Section
502.1 of the International Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 502.1 — New and existing buildings shall be provided with approved address identification. The
address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 8

Item 5.

[ Formatted: Section




30

Item 5.

the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address numbers shall
be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each character shall be not less
than six (6) inches high with a minimum stroke width of 1/2 inch. Where required by the fire code official,
address identification shall be provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response.
Where access is by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a
monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be
maintained.

IBC Section 903.2 Amended — Fire Protection Systems, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Where Required. Section
903.2 of the International Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in all newly constructed
buildings and structures with a gross floor area of 5,000 square feet or greater and shall be provided in the
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.

IBC Section 903.3.1.2 Amended — NFPA 13R Sprinkler Systems. Section 903.3.1.2 of the International Building
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in one and two family dwellings
shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R. One and two family dwellings
10,000 square feet and larger shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 13R or 13. Systems in accordance
with NFPA 13R shall not be installed in R-1 or R-2 Occupancies.

IBC Section 903.4.3 Amended — Sprinkler System Monitoring and Alarms, Floor Control Valves. Section
903.4.3 of the International Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control valves shall be provided at the
point of connection to the riser on each floor.

Exception: When approved by the Fire Code Official in NFPA 13D and NFPA 13R Systems.

IBC Section 907.2 Amended — Where Required—New Buildings and Structures. Section 907.2 of the
International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

907.2 Where required—new buildings and structures. An approved fire alarm system installed in
accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings and structures in
accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23. For all newly constructed buildings with a gross floor
area of 3,000 or greater square feet an approved manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be installed.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings, Group R-3, Group R-4, and Group U Occupancies having adequate fire
flow and approved access. Dwelling units shall have interconnected single station smoke detectors in
accordance with RCW 48.48.140 and WAC Chapter 212-10.

2. Buildings under 10,000 square feet that are protected throughout by an approved and monitored
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with section 903.3.1.1 unless required by other
sections of this code.

The system shall provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements
are provided by another section of this code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a fire alarm
signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or water-flow detection devices. Where
other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a single fire alarm box shall
be installed.

Exceptions:

1.  The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall control
and supervisory service.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 9



31

Item 5.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless required by the fire code
official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system
impairment event. Where provided, the manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is
accessible to the public.

Remodels and tenant improvements. When undergoing remodel and tenant improvements, existing
occupancies equipped with smoke detectors that are 10 or more years old shall have all such detectors
replaced with modern units. Those occupancies without the protection of smoke detection shall add a
manual and automatic fire alarm system in accordance with the applicable requirements in this section and
other sections that may apply.

Additions. Additions to existing buildings shall meet the requirements of, Remodels and Tenant
improvements, for the whole building and additionally provide the same coverage level to the addition as
the rest of the building unless authorized by the Fire Code Official.

IBC Section 1608.1 Amended — Snow Loads—General. Section 1608.1 of the International Building Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

1608.1 Snow Loads—General. Design snow loads shall be determined in accordance with Chapter 7 of ASCE
7, but the design roof load shall not be less than that determined by Section 1607. Furthermore, the design
roof snow load shall not be less than 25 pounds per square feet. When using this design roof snow load it will
be left to the engineer's judgment whether to consider drift or sliding snow. However, the engineer shall
consider a rain on snow surcharge of at least 5 pounds per square feet for roof slopes less than 5 degrees.

IBC Section 3112-Revised3116 Added —- Waterfront Structures. Section 3412-3116 of the International
Building Code is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 33123116 — WATERFRONT STRUCTURES

Section 31123116.1 General. In addition to other requirements of this code, all waterfront structures
including but not limited to docks, piers, wharves, floats, mooring piles, anchor buoys, bulkheads, submerged
or overhead wires, pipes, and cables, and any object passing beneath, through or over the water beyond the
line of ordinary high water shall comply with the regulations of this section.

Section 31123116.2 Approvals required. Before any permit for a new waterfront structure or revisions to an
existing waterfront structure is issued by the building official, the applicant shall obtain prior approval from
all applicable state and federal agencies.

Section 31123116.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section, certain terms are defined as follows:

BULKHEAD. A retaining wall or erosion-control structure along a waterfront.
COVERED WATERFRONT STRUCTURE. Any waterfront structure covered in whole or in part by a roof.

COVERED WATERFRONT STRUCTURE BUILDING AREA. The area lying directly beneath the portion of a
structure covered by a roof.

SUBSTRUCTURE. That portion of the construction of a dock, pier, wharf or other similar waterfront
structure below and including the deck.

SUPERSTRUCTURE. That portion of the construction of a dock, pier, wharf or other similar waterfront
structure above the deck.

Section 31123116.4 Construction Requirements. Waterfront structures shall comply with Sections
31123116.4.1 through 34123116.4.3.

Section 31123116.4.1 Substructure. The substructure may be constructed of any materials allowed by this
code. All decks shall sustain, within the limitations of this code, all dead loads plus a live load of not less than
100 pounds per square foot, assumed to act vertically. In addition to the live load requirement, all structures
and every portion thereof shall be designed and constructed to resist a horizontal force of not less than 100
pounds per lineal foot acting at the deck line, in any direction.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 10



32

Exception: For waterfront structures serving only a single dwelling, a live load of 40 psf may be used and a
horizontal force need only be considered where applicable.

Section 31123116.4.2 Superstructure. The superstructure shall be designed and constructed to sustain all
dead loads, live loads, and wind loads required by this code, and shall be constructed of any materials
allowed by this code, except when the building area of a covered waterfront structure exceeds 1,000 square
feet the entire superstructure and deck shall be constructed of noncombustible materials or as required for
Type IV-HT Construction per IBC Section 602.4.

Section 31123116.4.3 Hardware. All hardware used structurally shall be of a corrosive-resistant metal such
as aluminum, brass, copper, and stainless steel, or be completely protected by an approved corrosion-
resistant metal, such as zinc.

K. IBC Appendix H, Section H101.3 Added — Signs, General, Conflict with Mercer Island City Code. Appendix H,
Section H101.3 of the International Building Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section H101.3, Conflict with Mercer Island City Code. If any provisions of IBC Appendix H are in conflict
with any provisions of the Mercer Island City Code, the applicable provisions of the Mercer Island City Code
shall govern.

Chapter 17.02 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

17.02.010 Adoption.

The 2648-2021 Edition of the International Residential Code (IRC), as adopted and amended by the State
Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-51, as published by the International Code Council, is adopted by
reference with the following additions, deletions and exceptions. Provided, that Chapter 1, Part 2, Administration
and Enforcement, is not adopted and the Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC,
shall be used in place of IRC Chapter 1, Part 2, Administration and Enforcement. Provided, that Chapters 11 and 25
through 43 of the International Residential Code are not adopted. Provided, that the energy code is regulated by
WAC Chapter 51-11R; the plumbing code is regulated by WAC Chapter 51-56; the electrical code is regulated as
adopted by MICC 17.13.020. Provided, that the standards for liquefied petroleum gas installations shall be 2647
2020 NFPA 58 (Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code) and 2018-2021 NFPA 54 (National Fuel Gas Code). Provided, that all
other fuel gas installations shall be regulated by the International Mechanical Code and International Fuel Gas
Code. Provided, that Appendix AF, Radon Control Methods, Appendix AQ, Tiny HemesHouses, and Appendix U,
Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems, and Appendix V, Fire Sprinklers, are adopted. The codes, appendices, and
standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made available for use and
examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

Exceptions. The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for the
commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits.
"Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and roof covered with polyethylene, polyvinyl,
or similar flexible synthetic material and is used to provide plants with either frost protection or increased heat
retention. A temporary growing structure is not considered a building for purposes of this code.

The provisions of this code do not apply to the construction, alteration, or repair of temporary worker
housing except as provided by rule adopted under RCW Chapter 70.114A or RCW Chapter 37, Laws of 1998 (SB
6168). "Temporary worker housing" means a place, area, or piece of land where sleeping places or housing sites
are provided by an employer for his or her employees or by another person, including a temporary worker housing
operator, who is providing such accommodations for employees, for temporary, seasonal occupancy, and includes
"labor camps" under RCW 70.54.110.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 11

Item 5.




33

17.02.020 Amendments and additions.

A.  IRC Table R301.2(1) Amended. International Residential Code Table R301.2(1) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R301.2

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

Item 5.

GROUND WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM ICE BARRIER ELOOD MEAN ANNUAL
SNOW DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT | HAZARD® | FREEZING TEMP
LOAD?® | speedb | Topographic Special wind Windborne CATEGORY | weatheringd | Frostline | Termite REQUIRED INDEX

(psf) (mph) effects® region debris zone depth
Slight to
Moderate
25 98 Yes No No D2 Moderate 12”7 No NA 113 53 °F
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA
Elevation Altitude correction factor Coincident wet bulb Indoor winter design dry- | Indoor winter design dry- |Qutdoor winter design dry- Heating temperature
bulb temperature bulb temperature bulb temperature difference
338 feet 0.99 66 °F 72°F 72 °F 24 °F 48 °F
Latitude Daily Range Indoor summer design Summer design gains Indoor summer design Outdoor summer design Mte_mm
relative humidity dry-bulb temperature dry-bulb temperature difference
50% RH
47°34'39” M 50% 5 75 °F 83 °F 8 °F
a. This is the minimum roof snow load. When using this snow load it will be left to the engineer's judgment whether to consider drift or sliding snow. However, rain on snow surcharge of 5 psf
must be considered for roof slopes less than 5 degrees.
b. The basic wind speed is determined from the basic wind speed map in Figure R301.2(2). Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section
R301.2.1.4.
c. Topographic effects (Wind Speed-up Kzt factor) shall be determined on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.5.
d. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this code. The grade of masonry units shall be determined

from ASTM C34, C55, C62, C73, €90, C129, C145, C216 or C652.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 12




e. The City of Mercer Island participates in the National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP); Regular Program (No Special Flood Hazard Area). Further NFIP participation information: CID 530083

Item 5.

Initial FHBM Identified 06/28/74, Initial FIRM Identified 05/16/95, Current Effective Map Date (NSFHA), Reg-Emer Date 06/30/97, 53033C0654G effective 8/19/2020.

34

IRCTableR301.2(1}
cli . G hic Desian Criteri
HOCk MR D-DIESIGR SHERIE SHHH - O-PAAG RO SIS [ Hook A5 BAEAAL
SNOW | Speed® | Topographic | Special | Windborne DESIGN Weathering? | Frost Fermite DESIGN BARRIER | HAZARDS: | FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD? | (mph) effectse wind debris CAHEGORY Lire At UNBER- LRt S
tpst) region zone Depth HEAT/COOL | LAYMENT
DECNED
25 110 Yes Ne Ne D2 Moderate 12t | slightto 83/24 Ne A 113 53
flocerae
MARIALL DESIGR CRITERLA
e e et e e e
338feat 470 e 5O paia 000 er s de8s
24300
el sl el
heating coeling
oS bl bl 66 b S s

B. IRCAV107.2 Added. International Residential Code Appendix V, Section AV107.2 is hereby added as follows:

AV107.2 Fire sprinklers in Existing Buildings. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the residence in existing
one-family and two-family dwellings (and townhouses) in accordance with Appendix U when undergoing a remodel or addition when the

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 13




35

construction value of all additions, alterations or repairs performed within a sixty-month period exceeds 50% of the value of the residence. Value
shall be determined by a method approved by the fire code official.

IRC AV107.3 Added. International Residential Code Appendix V, Section AV107.3 is hereby added as follows:

AV107.3 Household Fire Alarm System. An approved Household Fire Alarm System shall be installed throughout the residence in existing one-
family and two-family dwellings (and townhouses) that have deficiencies in Fire Flow, hydrants or access. This system shall be installed in
accordance with NFPA 72 chapter 29 when undergoing a remodel or addition when the construction value of all additions, alterations or repairs

performed within a sixty-month period is within 10% to 50% of the value of the residence. Value shall be determined by a method approved by the
fire code official.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 17C-01 § 2; Ord. 16C-04 § 2; Ord. 13C-06 § 2; Ord. 10C-03 § 2)

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 14

Item 5.




36

Chapter 17.03 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

17.03.010 Adoption.

The 2618-2021 Edition of the International Mechanical Code (IMC), as adopted and amended by the State
Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-52, as published by the International Code Council, is adopted by
reference with the following additions, deletions and exceptions. Provided, that Chapter 1, Part 2, Administration
and Enforcement, is not adopted and the Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC,
shall be used in place of IMC Chapter 1, Part 2, Administration and Enforcement. Provided, that the installation of
fuel gas distribution piping and equipment, fuel gas-fired appliances and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems
shall be regulated by the International Fuel Gas Code. Provided, that detached one- and two-family dwellings and
multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories high with separate means of egress and
their accessory structures shall comply with the International Residential Code. Provided, that the standards for
liquefied petroleum gas installations shall be the 2647-2020 Edition of NFPA 58 (Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code)
and the 2018-2021 Edition of ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54 (National Fuel Gas Code). References in this code to Group R
shall include Group I-1, Condition 2 assisted living facilities licensed by Washington State under WAC Chapter 388-
78A and Group I-1, Condition 2 residential treatment facilities licensed by Washington State under WAC Chapter
246-337. The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy
made available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

Exceptions. The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for the
commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits.
"Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and roof covered with polyethylene,
polyvinyl, or similar flexible synthetic material and is used to provide plants with either frost protection or
increased heat retention. A temporary growing structure is not considered a building for purposes of this
code.

Conlflicts. In the case of conflict between the duct sealing or insulation requirements of Section 603 or
Section 604 of this code and the duct sealing or insulation requirements of WAC Chapter 51-11C, the
Washington State Energy Code, the provisions of the energy codes shall govern.

(Ord. 21C-01 & 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 3; Ord. 13C-06 § 3; Ord. 10C-03 & 3; Ord. 07C-04 § 4; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

Chapter 17.04 NATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (NFPA 54)

17.04.010 Adoption.

The 20148-2021 Edition of the National Fuel Gas Code (ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54), as adopted by the State
Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-52, as published by NFPA, is adopted by reference. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be applied for the administration of this code. The
codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made
available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 4; Ord. 13C-06 § 4; Ord. 10C-03 § 4; Ord. 07C-04 § 5; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 15

Item 5.




37

Chapter 17.05 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GAS CODE (NFPA 58)

17.05.010 Adoption.

The 26472020 Edition of the Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58), as adopted by the State Building
Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-52, as published by NFPA, is adopted by reference. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be applied for the administration of this code. The
codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made
available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

(Ord. 21C-01 & 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 5; Ord. 13C-06 § 5; Ord. 10C-03 & 5; Ord. 07C-04 § 6; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

Chapter 17.06 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

17.06.010 Adoption.

The 2648-2021 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), as adopted by the State Building Code
Council in WAC Chapter 51-52, as published by the International Code Council, excluding Chapter 1, Part 2,
Administration and Enforcement, is adopted by reference. The Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in
chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be used in place of IFGC Chapter 1, Part 2, Administration and Enforcement. Provided,
that detached and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three
stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the International
Residential Code. Provided, that the standards for liquefied petroleum gas installations shall be the 26472020
Edition of NFPA 58 (Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code) and the 2618-2021 Edition of ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54 (National
Fuel Gas Code). The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and
a copy made available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 6; Ord. 13C-06 § 6; Ord. 10C-03 § 6; Ord. 07C-04 § 7; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

17.06.020 Reserved.

Editor's note(s)—Ord. 21C-01 repealed § 17.06.020 which pertained to amendments and additions.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 16

Item 5.




38

Chapter 17.07 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

17.07.010 Adoption.

The 26182021 Edition of the International Fire Code (IFC), as adopted and amended by the State Building
Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-54, as published by the International Code Council, is adopted by reference,
together with the amendments and additions set forth below. The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in
this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made available for use and examination by the public,
pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

The following appendices of the 26482021 Edition of the International Fire Code are also adopted by
reference: Appendix B — Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings; Appendix C — Fire Hydrant Locations and
Distribution; Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads; and Appendix J — Building Information Sign.

The geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 26182021 International Fire Code are hereby
established as follows:

Section 6104.2 (geographic limits in which the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted for the
protection of heavily populated or congested areas): Zones TC, MF-2, MF-3 and PI as defined in MICC Title
19, Unified Land Development Code.

Exceptions. The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for the
commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits.
"Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and roof covered with polyethylene, polyvinyl,
or similar flexible synthetic material and is used to provide plants with either frost protection or increased heat
retention. A temporary growing structure is not considered a building for purposes of this code.

The provisions of this code do not apply to the construction, alteration, or repair of temporary worker
housing except as provided by rule adopted under RCW Chapter 70.114A or Chapter 37, Laws of 1998 (2SSB 6168).
"Temporary worker housing" means a place, area, or piece of land where sleeping places or housing sites are
provided by an employer for his or her employees or by another person, including a temporary worker housing
operator, who is providing such accommodations for employees, for temporary, seasonal occupancy, and includes
"labor camps" under RCW 70.54.110. The manufacture, storage, handling, sale and use of fireworks shall be
governed by RCW Chapter 70.77 and by WAC Chapter 212-17 and local ordinances consistent with WAC Chapter
212-17.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 18C-05 § 1 (Att. A); Ord. 16C-04 & 7; Ord. 13C-06 & 7; Ord. 10C-03 § 7; Ord. 07C-04 §
8; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

17.07.020 Amendments and additions.

A.  IFC Section 102.7 Amended — Referenced Codes and Standards. Section 102.7 of the International Fire Code
is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be
those that are listed in Chapter 80. Such codes and standards shall be considered part of the requirements of
this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference as determined or modified by the fire code official.
Where differences occur between the provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of
this code shall apply.

B.  IFCSection 104.1.2 Added — Indigent Housing Guidelines.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 17

Item 5.




39

Item 5.

104.1.2 Indigent Housing Guidelines. The fire code official is hereby authorized to develop a policy regarding
application and exemption of construction codes for temporary homeless shelters in accordance with WAC
51-16-030 Exemptions for indigent housing guidelines, now or as hereafter amended.

IFC Section 164-16-12104.11.1 Amended — General Authority and Responsibilities, Assistance from Other
Agencies. Section 104-10-1104.11.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104-10-1104.11.1 Assistance from other agencies. Police and other enforcement agencies shall have
authority to render necessary assistance in the investigation of fires or the enforcement of this code when
requested to do so by the fire code official.

IFC Section 104.11.2 Amended — General Authority and Responsibilities, Obstructing Operations. Section
104.11.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.11.2 Obstructing operations. No person shall obstruct the operations of the fire department in
connection with extinguishment, control, or investigation of any fire, or actions relative to other
emergencies, or disobey any lawful command of the fire chief or officer of the fire department in charge of
the emergency, or any part thereof, or any lawful order of a police officer assisting the fire department.

IFC Section 105.1.74 Added — Permits, Construction Permit Fees. Section 105.1.4 of the International Fire
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 105.1.74 Construction permit fees. Fees will be assessed for each construction permit issued under
this Code. Fees shall be established by resolution of the city council.

IFC Section 105.1.85 Added — Permits, Operational Permit Fees. Section 105.1.5 of the International Fire
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 105.1.85 Operational permit fees. Fees may be charged annually for each type of operational
permit. Fees shall be established by resolution of the city council.

IFC Section 105.6.49 Added — Food Trucks. Section 105.6.49 of the International Fire Code is hereby added
to read as follows:

IFC Section 105.6.30 Amended — Mobile Food Preparation Vehicles. Section 105.6.30 of the International Fire
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Mobile Food Preparation Vehicle. Mobile food preparation vehicles that are equipped with appliances that
produce smoke or grease-laden vapors or utilize LP-gas systems or CNG systems for the purpose of preparing
and serving food to the public. Vehicles intended for private recreation shall not be considered mobile food
preparation vehicles.

104-6-30-1105.3.9. Valid operational permits issued by any other Municipality, County, or Authority Having
Jurisdiction may be considered upon approval of the Fire Marshal and are maintained in accordance with the
conditions of the original permit.

IFC Section 105.6.25726 Added — Emergency Power Supply Systems. Section 105.7.26 of the International
Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 105.6.257-26 Emergency Power Supply Systems. A construction permit is required for the
installation of a required emergency power supply system that provides emergency power for any life safety
device or system. Examples as follows but not limited to elevators, escalators, systems to prevent explosions
or detonations, life maintaining medical systems, etc.

IFC 106.8 Amended — Overcrowding. Section 108.6 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Section 108.6 Overcrowding. Overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the approved capacity of a
building or portion thereof shall not be allowed. The fire code official, upon finding any overcrowding

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 18



Item 5.

conditions or obstruction in aisles passageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any condition
which constitutes a life safety hazard, shall be authorized to direct actions to reduce the overcrowding or to
cause the event to be stopped until such condition or obstruction is corrected.

IFC Section 109.3.1 Added- Timeliness of report filing. Section 109.3.1 of the International Fire Code is
hereby added to read as follows:

Section 109.3.1 Timeliness of report filing. Fire/life safety system confidence testing reports shall be [ Formatted: Font: Bold

submitted within seven business days of the inspection or maintenance completion. Systems with
impairments or "red-tagged" systems must also be reported immediately using the current mandatory
impaired system(s) reporting process established by the Fire Code Official. Reports that are not submitted in
a timely manner are subject to additional staff time recovery fees at the established rate with a one hour
minimum.

{ Formatted: List 1

L. IFC Section 269-1-111.1 Amended — Board of Appeals, Board of Appeals Established. Section 209.1-111.1 of
the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 109.1111.1 General_Hearing Examiner authority over appeals.. The hearing examiner shall hear and
decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the
application and interpretation of the International Fire Code. Appeals shall follow the process described in
MICC 17.14.020 and 19.15.130.

M.  IFC Section 289-2-111.2 Amended — Board of Appeals, Limitations on Authority. Section 169-2-111.2 of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 1089.2-111.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the
true intent of the International Fire Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of the International Fire Code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form
of construction is proposed. The hearing examiner shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the
administrative provisions of the International Fire Code nor shall the hearing examiner have the authority to
waive requirements of either this code or of other codes, appendices and referenced code standards
adopted by or through this code.

IFC Section 111.3 Amended- Qualifications. Section 111.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended
to read as follows:

Section 111.3 Hearing Examiner. Appeals of orders or decisions or determinations made by the fire code [ Formatted: Font: Bold

official shall be made to the hearing examiner. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the
true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder has been incorrectly interpreted, the

[ Formatted: Font: Not Bold

provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equally good or better solution is proposed. The hearing
examiner shall have not authority relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of this code nor
shall the hearing examiner be empowered to waive requirements of either this code or the technical codes

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 19



41

which are the codes, appendices, and referenced code standards adopted by the City. Appeals shall follow
the process described in MICC 17.14.020 and 19.15.130.

IFC Section 112.4 Amended- Violations penalties. Section 112.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

112.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any
of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under
provision of this code shall be subject to the City of Mercer Island Code Enforcement actions and penalties as

prescribed by outlined in title 6, section 6.10.050 of the MICC Ch. 6.10, Code Compliance.

IFC Section 113.4 Amended- Failure to comply. Section 113.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

113.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been serviced with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to preform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be subject to the provisions of MICC Section(s) 6.10.050.

IFC Section 202 Amended — Definitions, High-Rise Building. Section 202 of the International Fire Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor or rooftop located more than 75 feet (22,860 mm)
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

IFC Section 307 Amended — Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces. Section 307
of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

307.1 General. A person shall not kindle or maintain or authorize to be kindled or maintained any open
burning unless conducted and approved in accordance with Sections 307.1.1 through 307.5

307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. Open burning shall be prohibited at all times in compliance with a
permanent ban on open burning established by the Puget Sound Clean Air Agency in September of 1992.

Exceptions:

1.  Bonfires

2. Recreational Fires

3. Portable outdoor fireplaces

4. Fire Department Training Fires

307.2 Permit Required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with Section
105.6 prior to conducting a bonfire, recreational fire or portable outdoor fireplace fire. Application for such
approval shall only be presented by and permits issued to the owner of the land in which the fire is to be
kindled.

307.2.1 Bans on fires due to air quality or fire danger. If the Puget Sound Clean Air Agency issues a ban due

to air quality, or if a fire and life safety burn ban is issued by the City of Mercer Island and/or the King County
Fire Marshal's Office all fires are prohibited. It is the responsibility of the property owner where the fire is to

be constructed to ensure no such ban exists prior to starting any fire.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 20

Item 5.

[ Formatted: Font: Bold

[ Formatted: Font: Bold




42

Item 5.

307.3 Extinguishment authority. When any fire creates or adds to a hazardous situation, permit conditions
are not adhered to, or a required permit has not been obtained, the fire code official is authorized to order
the extinguishment of the fire.

307.4 Location. The location for the fires shall be as follows:

307.4.1 Bonfires. A bonfire shall not be constructed within 50 feet (15240 mm) of a structure or combustible
material unless the fire is contained in a barbeque pit. Conditions which could cause a fire to spread within
50 feet (15244 mm) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition.

307.4.2 Recreational Fires. Recreational fires shall not be constructed within 25 feet (7620 mm) of a
structure or combustible material. Conditions that could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet (7620 mm) of a
structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition.

307.4.3 Portable Outdoor Fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the
manufacturer's instructions and shall not be operated within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a structure or
combustible material.

307.5 Attendance. Bonfires, recreational fires and use of portable fireplaces shall be constantly attended
until the fire is extinguished. Not fewer than one portable fire extinguisher complying with Section 906 with a
minimum of 4-A rating or other approved on-site fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water
barrel, garden hose or water truck, shall be available for immediate utilization.

IFC Section 308.3 Amended — Open Flames, Group A Occupancies. Section 308.3 of the International Fire
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 308.3 Group A occupancies. Open-flame devices shall not be used in a Group A occupancy.
Exceptions:

1. Open-flame devices are allowed to be used in the following situations, provided approved precautions
are taken to prevent ignition of a combustible material or injury to occupants:

1.1. Where necessary for ceremonial or religious purposes in accordance with Section 308.1.7.

1.2. On stages and platforms as a necessary part of a performance in accordance with Section
308.3.2.

1.3. Where candles on tables are securely supported on substantial noncombustible bases and the
candle flames are protected.

2. Heat-producing equipment complying with Chapter 6 and the International Mechanical Code.

3. Gas lights are allowed to be used provided adequate precautions satisfactory to the fire code official
are taken to prevent ignition of combustible materials.

4, Where approved by the fire code official.

IFC Section 314.4 Added — Indoor Displays, Vehicles. Section 314.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Section 314.4 Vehicles. Liquid- or gas-fueled vehicles, fueled equipment, boats or other motor craft shall not
be located indoors except as follows:

1.  Batteries are disconnected.

2. Fuel in fuel tanks does not exceed one-quarter tank or 5 gallons (19 L) (whichever is least).

3. Fuel tanks and fill openings are closed and sealed to prevent tampering.

4. Vehicles, fueled equipment, boats or other motor craft are not fueled or defueled within the building.

IFC Section 401 — Amended Evacuation Required. Section 401.9 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 21



43

Item 5.

Section 401.9 Evacuation required. In the event of activation of a fire, emergency alarm, or at the direction
of the fire code official, occupants of the building or portion of the building in which the alarm is activated
shall make a safe and orderly evacuation out of the building, or as provided in the building's fire safety and
evacuation or high-rise operations plan.

Exceptions:

1. Where the occupant's physical or other disability make the occupant unable to evacuate without
assistance and no assistance is immediately available, or;

2. Where the presence of smoke, fire, structural collapse or other hazard or obstruction in the occupant's
means of egress make evacuation unsafe.

IFC Section 501.1 Amended — General, Scope. Section 501.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Section 501.1 Scope. Fire service features for buildings, structures and premises shall comply with this
chapter. The requirements in this chapter may be modified by the fire code official if other approved fire-
protection features are provided.

IFC Section 503 Amended — Fire Apparatus Access Roads. Section 503 of the International Fire Code is
hereby adopted and amended to read as follows:

Section 503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in accordance
with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3 and/or local street, road and access standards as determined by the
fire code official.

503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for every facility,
building or portion of a building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. The fire
apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements of this section and shall extend to within 150 feet
(45,720 mm) of all portions of the facility and all portions of the exterior walls of the first story of the building
as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the building or facility.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet (45,720 mm) where:

1.  The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Sections 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3 for 1 and 2 family dwellings or Section 903.3.1.1 for all
other buildings.

2. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed because of location on property, topography,
waterways, nonnegotiable grades or other similar conditions, and an approved alternative means of
fire protection is provided.

503.1.2 Additional access. The fire code official is authorized to require more than one fire apparatus access
road based on the potential for impairment of a single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain,
climatic conditions or other factors that could limit access.

503.1.3 High-piled storage. Fire department vehicle access to buildings used for high-piled combustible
storage shall comply with the applicable provisions of Chapter 32.

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance with Sections
503.2.1 through 503.2.2.

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet
(6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with Appendix D Section
D103.5, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm).

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the minimum
access widths where they are inadequate for fire or rescue operations.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 22



44

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed in any
manner, including the parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances established in Section 503.2.1
shall be maintained at all times.

503.4.1 Traffic calming devices. Traffic calming devices shall be prohibited unless approved by the fire code
official.

IFC Section 505.1 Amended — Address Identification. Section 505.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Section 505.1 — Address identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided with approved address
identification. The address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the
street or road fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background.
Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than six (6) inches high with a minimum stroke width of 1/2 inch. Where required
by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in additional approved locations to facilitate
emergency response. Where access is by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from
the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address
identification shall be maintained.

IFC Section 507.3 Amended — Fire Protection Water Supplies, Fire-Flow. Section 507.3 of the International
Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 507.3 Fire-flow. Fire-flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and facilities shall be
determined by an approved method and Appendix B.

Exceptions:

1. Fire-flow is not required for structures under 500 square feet with a B, U or R-1 occupancy where
structures are at least 30 feet from any other structure and are used only for recreation.

2. In rural and suburban areas in which adequate and reliable water supply systems do not exist, the fire
code official is authorized to utilize NFPA 1142 or the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code.

IFC Section 507.5.1 Amended — Fire Hydrant Systems, Where Required. Section 507.5.1 of the International
Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or moved
into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as
measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and
mains shall be provided where required by the fire code official.

Exception:

For buildings, one- and two-family dwellings and Group R-3 and Group U occupancies equipped throughout
with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or
903.3.1.3, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m).

IFC Section 507.5.1.1 Amended — Hydrant for Standpipe Systems. Section 507.5.1.1 of the International Fire
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

507.5.1.1 Hydrant for standpipe and fire sprinkler systems. Buildings equipped with a standpipe System
installed in accordance with Section 905 or a fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903
shall have a fire hydrant within 15 feet of the fire department connections.

Exception: The distance shall be permitted to exceed 15 feet where approved by the fire code official.

IFC Section 510 Amended — Emergency Responder Radio Coverage. Section 510 of the International Fire
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 23

Item 5.




45

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings. Approved radio coverage for emergency
responders within the building meeting any of the following conditions:

1. High rise buildings;

2 The total building area is 50,000 square feet or more;

3. The total basement area is 10,000 square feet or more; or
4

Buildings or structures where the Fire or Police Chief determined that in-building radio coverage is
critical because of its unique design, location, or occupancy.

The radio coverage system shall be installed in accordance with Sections 501.4 through 510.5.5 of this code
and within the provision of NDPA 1221 (2019). This section shall not require the improvement of the existing
public safety communication systems.

When determining if the minimum signal strength referenced 510.4.1.1 exists at a subject building, the signal
strength shall be measured at any point on the exterior of the building up to the highest point of the roof.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings and areas of buildings that have a minimum radio coverage signal strength of the King County
Regional 800 MHz Radio System within the building in accordance with Section 510.4.1 without the use
of a radio coverage system.

2. In facilities where emergency responder radio coverage is required and such systems, components or
equipment required could have a negative impact on the normal operations of that facility, the fire
code official shall have the authority to accept an automatically activated emergency responder radio
coverage system.

3. One- and two-family dwellings and townhouses.

4. Subject to the approval of the fire code official, and upon adoption of the local jurisdiction, buildings
other than high-rise buildings, colleges, universities and buildings used primarily occupied by Group E
or | occupancies that have completed a Mobile Emergency Radio Coverage application and submitted
payment as outlined in the application.

510.4.1 Emergency responder communication enhancement system signal strength. The building shall be
considered to have acceptable emergency responder communications enhancement system coverage when
signal strength measurements in 95 percent of all areas on each floor of the building meet the signal strength
requirements in Sections 510.4.1.1 through 510.4.1.3.

Exception: Critical areas, such as the fire command center(s), the fire pump room(s), interior exit stairways,
exit passageways, elevator lobbies, standpipe cabinets, sprinkler sectional valve locations, and other areas
required by the fire code official, shall be provided with 99 percent floor area radio coverage.

510.4.1.1 Minimum signal strength into the building. The minimum inbound signal strength shall be
sufficient to provide usable voice communications throughout the coverage area as specified by the fire code
official. The inbound signal level shall be a minimum of -95 dBm in 95% of the coverage area and 99% in
critical areas and sufficient to provide not less than a Delivered Audio Quality (DAQ) of 3.0 or an equivalent
Signal-to-Interference-Plus-Noise Ratio (SINR) applicable to the technology for either analog or digital signals.

510.4.1.2 Minimum signal strength out of the building. The minimum outbound signal strength shall be
sufficient to provide usable voice communications throughout the coverage area as specified by the fire code
official. The outbound signal level shall be sufficient to provide not less than a DAQ of 3.0 or an equivalent
SINR applicable to the technology for either analog or digital signals. A minimum signal strength of -95 dBm
shall be received by the King County Regional 800 MHz Radio System when transmitted from within the
building.

510.4.2 System design. The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be designed in accordance
with Sections 510.4.2.1 through 510.4.2.8 and NFPA 1221 (2019).

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 24

Item 5.




46

510.4.2.1 Amplification systems and components. Buildings and structures that cannot support the required
level of radio coverage shall be equipped with systems and components to enhance the public safety radio
signals and achieve the required level of radio coverage specified in Sections 510.4.1 through 510.4.1.3.
Public safety communications enhancement systems utilizing radio-frequency-emitting devices and cabling
shall be allowed by the Public Safety Radio System Operator. Prior to installation, all RF-emitting devices shall
have the certification of the radio licensing authority and be suitable for public safety use.

510.4.2.2 Technical criteria. The Public Safety Radio System Operator shall provide the various frequencies
required, the location of radio sites, the effective radiated power of radio sites, the maximum propagation
delay in microseconds, the applications being used and other supporting technical information necessary for
system design upon request by the building owner or owner's representative.

510.4.2.3 Power supply sources. Emergency responder radio coverage systems shall be provided with
dedicated standby batteries or provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility
generator power system in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of
operating the emergency responder radio coverage system at 100-percent system capacity for a duration of
not less than 12 hours.

510.4.2.4 Signal booster requirements. If used, signal boosters shall meet the following requirements:

1.  Allsignal booster components shall be contained in a National Electrical Manufacturer's
Association (NEMA) 4, IP66-type waterproof cabinet or equivalent.

Exception: Listed battery systems that are contained in integrated battery cabinets.

2. Battery systems used for the emergency power source shall be contained in a NEMA 3R or
higher-rated cabinet, IP65-type waterproof cabinet or equivalent.

3. Equipment shall have FCC or other radio licensing authority certification and be suitable for
public safety use prior to installation.

4, Where a donor antenna exists, isolation shall be maintained between the donor antenna and all
inside antennas to not less than 20 dB greater than the system gain under all operating
conditions.

5. Bi-Directional Amplifiers (BDAs) used in emergency responder radio coverage systems shall be
fitted with anti-oscillation circuitry and per-channel AGC.

6.  The installation of amplification systems or systems that operate on or provide the means to
cause interference on any emergency responder radio coverage networks shall be coordinated
and approved by the Public Safety Radio System Operator.

7. Unless otherwise approved by the Public Safety Radio System Operator, only channelized signal
boosters shall be permitted.

Exception: Broadband BDA's may be utilized when specifically authorized in writing by the Public Safety
Radio System Operator.

510.4.2.5 System monitoring. The emergency responder radio enhancement system shall include automatic
supervisory and trouble signals that are monitored by a supervisory service and are annunciated by the fire alarm
system in accordance with NFPA 72. The following conditions shall be separately annunciated by the fire alarm
system, or, if the status of each of the following conditions is individually displayed on a dedicated panel on the
radio enhancement system, a single automatic supervisory signal may be annunciated on the fire alarm system
indicating deficiencies of the radio enhancement system:

1. Loss of normal AC power supply.
2. System battery charger(s) failure.

3. Malfunction of the donor antenna(s).

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 25

Item 5.




47

Failure of active RF-emitting device(s).
Low-battery capacity at 70-percent reduction of operating capacity.

Active system component malfunction.

N o u

Malfunction of the communications link between the fire alarm system and the emergency
responder radio enhancement system.

510.5 Installation requirements. The installation of the public safety radio coverage system shall be in
accordance with NFPA 1221 and Sections 510.5.1 through 510.5.7.

510.5.1 Approval prior to installation. Amplification systems capable of operating on frequencies licensed to
any public safety agency by the FCC or other radio licensing authority shall not be installed without prior
coordination and approval of the Public Safety Radio System Operator.

510.5.2 Minimum qualifications of personnel. The minimum qualifications of the system designer and lead
installation personnel shall include both of the following:

1.  Avalid FCC-issued general radio telephone operators' license.

2. Certification of in-building system training issued by an approved organization or approved
school, or a certificate issued by the manufacturer of the equipment being installed.

510.5.3 Acceptance test procedure. Where an emergency responder radio coverage system is required, and upon
completion of installation, the building owner shall have the radio system tested to verify that two-way coverage
on each floor of the building is in accordance with Section 510.4.1. The test procedure shall be conducted as
follows:

1. Each floor of the building shall be divided into a grid of 20 approximately equal test areas, with a
maximum test area size of 6,400 square feet. Where the floor area exceeds 128,000 square feet,
the floor shall be divided into as many approximately equal test areas as needed, such that no
test area exceeds the maximum square footage allowed for a test area.

2. Coverage testing of signal strength shall be conducted using a calibrated spectrum analyzer for
each of the test grids. A diagram of this testing shall be created for each floor where coverage is
provided, indicating the testing grid used for the test in Section 510.5.3(1), and including signal
strengths and frequencies for each test area. Indicate all critical areas.

3. Functional talk-back testing shall be conducted using two calibrated portable radios of the latest
brand and model used by the agency's radio communications system or other equipment
approved by the fire code official. Testing shall use Digital Audible Quality (DAQ) metrics, where a
passing result is a DAQ of 3 or higher. Communications between handsets shall be tested and
recorded in the grid square diagram required by section 510.5.3(2): each grid square on each
floor; between each critical area and a radio outside the building; between each critical area and
the fire command center or fire alarm control panel; between each landing in each stairwell and
the fire command center or fire alarm control panel.

4.  Failure of more than 5% of the test areas on any floor shall result in failure of the test.
Exception:
1. Critical areas shall be provided with 99 percent floor area coverage.

5. In the event that two of the test areas fail the test, in order to be more statistically accurate, the floor
shall be permitted to be divided into 40 equal test areas. Failure of not more than two nonadjacent test
areas shall not result in failure of the test. If the system fails the 40-area test, the system shall be
altered to meet the 95-percent coverage requirement.

6.  Atest location approximately in the center of each test area shall be selected for the test, with the
radio enabled to verify two-way communications to and from the outside of the building through the

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 26

Item 5.




48

AA.

public agency's radio communications system. Once the test location has been selected, that location
shall represent the entire test area. Failure in the selected test location shall be considered to be a
failure of that test area. Additional test locations shall not be permitted.

7.  The gain values of all amplifiers shall be measured, and the test measurement results shall be kept on
file with the building owner so that the measurements can be verified during annual tests. In the event
that the measurement results become lost, the building owner shall be required to rerun the
acceptance test to reestablish the gain values.

8.  As part of the installation, a spectrum analyzer or other suitable test equipment shall be utilized to
ensure spurious oscillations are not being generated by the subject signal booster. This test shall be
conducted at the time of installation and at subsequent annual inspections.

9. Systems incorporating Class B signal booster devices or Class B broadband fiber remote devices shall be
tested using two portable radios simultaneously conducting subjective voice quality checks. One
portable radio shall be positioned not greater than 10 feet (3048 mm) from the indoor antenna. The
second portable radio shall be positioned at a distance that represents the farthest distance from any
indoor antenna. With both portable radios simultaneously keyed up on different frequencies within the
same band, subjective audio testing shall be conducted and comply with DAQ levels as specified in
Sections 510.4.1.1 and 510.4.1.2.

10. Documentation maintained on premises. At the conclusion of the testing, and prior to issuance of the
building Certificate of Occupancy, the building owner or owner's representative shall place a copy of
the following records in the DAS enclosure or the building engineer's office. The records shall be
available to the fire code official and maintained by the building owner for the life of the system:

a.  Acertification letter stating that the emergency responder radio coverage system has been
installed and tested in accordance with this code, and that the system is complete and fully
functional.

b.  The grid square diagram created as part of testing in Sections 510.5.3(2) and 510.5.3(3).

c. Data sheets and/or manufacturer specifications for the emergency responder radio coverage
system equipment; back up battery; and charging system (if utilized).

d.  Adiagram showing device locations and wiring schematic.
e.  Acopy of the electrical permit.

11. Acceptance test reporting to fire code official. At the conclusion of the testing, and prior to issuance of
the building Certificate of Occupancy, the building owner or owner's representative shall submit to the
fire code official a report of the acceptance test by way of the department's approved fire records
management procedure.

510.6.4 Identification. Radio Coverage system shall be identified by a sign located on or near the Fire Alarm
Control Panel stating "This building is equipped with an Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System."

IFC Section 602 Amended — Building Services and Systems, Definitions. Section 602.1, Definitions, of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

POWER TAP is a listed device for indoor use consisting of an attachment plug on one end of a flexible cord
and two or more receptacles on the opposite end, and has overcurrent protection.

IFC Section 901.4 Amended — Installation. Section 901.4.7 of the International Fire Code is hereby added to
read as follows:

901.4.7 Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings.

901.4.7:1901.4.3.1 Additions or changes of use. Additions or changes of use to existing buildings which
would result in a nonconforming building shall cause the building to be brought up to current code

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 27

Item 5.




49

BB.

requirements for fire protection systems. Subject to the approval of the fire code official, a phasing plan of
up to five years is permitted on sprinkler systems only.

901.4.3.2901.4.7:2 Alterations and repairs. When the value of all alterations or repairs performed within a
sixty-month period exceeds 50 percent of the value of the building, the fire extinguishing systems and fire
detection systems shall be installed throughout as for new construction. For the purposes of this section, the
value of the building shall be determined by an approved method by the fire code official.

IFC Section 903.2 Amended — Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Where Required. Section 903.2 of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in all newly
constructed buildings and structures with a gross floor area of 5,000 square feet or greater and in the
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.L.

IFC Section 903.2.9{6)903.2.9(5) Amended — Group S-1. Section 903.2.9(6) of the International Fire Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

CC.

DD.

EE.

FF.

903.2.9(6)903.2.9(5)
6. A Group S-1 occupancy used for self-storage where the fire area exceeds 2,500 square feet.

IFC Section 903.3.1.2 Amended — NFPA 13R Sprinkler Systems. Section 903.3.1.2 of the International Fire
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in one and two family dwellings
shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R. One and two family dwellings
10,000 square feet and larger shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 13R or 13. Systems in accordance
with NFPA 13R shall not be installed in R-1 or R-2 Occupancies.

IFC Section 903.4.3 Amended — Sprinkler System Monitoring and Alarms, Floor Control Valves. Section
903.4.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control valves shall be provided at the
point of connection to the riser on each floor.

Exception: When approved by the Fire Code Official in NFPA 13D and NFPA 13R Systems.

IFC Section 905.8 Added — Standpipe Systems, Dry Standpipes. Section 905.8 of the International Fire Code is
hereby added to read as follows:

Section 905.8 Dry standpipes. Dry standpipes shall not be installed.

Exception: Where subject to freezing and in accordance with NFPA 14 when approved by the Fire Code
Official.

IFC Section 907.2 Added — Where Required—New Buildings and Structures. Section 907.2 of the
International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

907.2 Where required—New buildings and structures. An approved fire alarm system installed in
accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings and structures in
accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23. For all newly constructed buildings with a gross floor
area of 3,000 or greater square feet an approved manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be installed.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings, Group R-3, Group R-4, and Group U Occupancies having adequate fire-
flow and approved access. Dwelling units shall have interconnected single station smoke detectors in
accordance with RCW 48.48.140 and WAC Chapter 212-10.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 28

Item 5.




50

GG.

HH.

Item 5.

2. Buildings under 10,000 square feet that are protected throughout by an approved and monitored
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 unless required by other
sections of this code.

The system shall provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements
are provided by another section of this code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a fire alarm
signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or water-flow detection devices. Where
other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a single fire alarm box shall
be installed.

Exceptions:

1.  The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall control
and supervisory service.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless required by the fire code
official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system
impairment event. Where provided, the manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is
accessible to the public.

Remodels and tenant improvements. When undergoing remodel and tenant improvements, existing
occupancies equipped with smoke detectors that are 10 or more years old shall have all such detectors
replaced with modern units. Those occupancies without the protection of smoke detection shall add a
manual and automatic fire alarm system in accordance with the applicable requirements in this section and
other sections that may apply.

Additions. Additions to existing buildings shall meet the requirements of, Remodels and Tenant
improvements, for the whole building and additionally provide the same coverage level to the addition as
the rest of the building unless authorized by the Fire Code Official.

IFC Section 1103.2 Amended — Emergency Responder Radio Coverage in Existing Buildings. Section 1103.2 of
the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Buildings constructed prior to the
implementation of this code shall not be required to comply with the emergency responder radio coverage
provisions except as follows:

1. Whenever an existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is being replaced.

2. Buildings identified in Section 510.1 undergoing substantial alteration as determined by the Fire Code
Official.

3. When buildings, classes of buildings or specific occupancies do not have minimum radio coverage
signal strength as identified in Section 510.4.1 and the Fire or Police Chief determines that lack of
minimum signal strength poses an undue risk to emergency responders or occupants that cannot be
reasonably mitigated by other means.

IFC Section 901.9 Amended — Termination of monitoring service. Section 901.9 of the International Fire Code
is hereby amended to read as follows:

901.9 Termination of monitoring service. For fire alarm systems required to be monitored by this code,
notice shall be required to be made to the fire code official whenever alarm monitoring services are
terminated. Notice shall be made in writing to the fire code official 30 days prior to the service being
terminated.

IFC Section 1103.11 Amended — Building Information Card. Section 1103.11 of the International Fire Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 29



51

KK.

1103.11 Building Information Card. An approved Building Information Card shall be located in each fire
command center, high-rise buildings, hospitals, multiple buildings on common platforms, or other target
hazard building as determined by the fire code official including, but is not limited to, all of the following
information:

1103.11.1 General Building Information. General building information that includes: property name,
address, the number of floors in the building above and below grade, use and occupancy classification (for
mixed uses, identify the different types of occupies on each floor) and the estimated building population
during the day, night and weekend.

1103.11.2 Building Emergency Contact Information. Building emergency contact information that includes: a
list of the building's emergency contacts including but not limited to the building manager, building engineer
and tier respective work phone number, cell phone number and email addresses.

1103.11.3 Building Construction Information. Building construction information that includes: the type of
the building construction including but not limited to the floors, walls, columns and roof assembly.

1103.11.4 Exit Stairway Information. Exit access stairway and exit stairway information that includes:
number of the exit access stairways and exit stairways in building; each exit access stairway and exit stairway
designation and floors served; location where each exit access stairway and exit stairway discharges; interior
exit stairways that are pressurized; exit stairways provided with emergency lighting; each exit stairway that
allows reentry; exit stairways providing roof access; elevator car numbers and respective floors that are
served; location of elevator machine room, control rooms and control spaces; location of sky lobby; and
location of freight elevator banks.

1103.11.5 Building Services and System Information. Building services and system information that includes
location of the mechanical rooms, location of the building management system, location and capacity of all
fuel and oil tanks, location of emergency generator and location of natural gas services.

1103.11.6 Fire Protection Information. Fire protection system information that includes location of
standpipes, location of the fire pump room, location of fire department connections, floors protected by
automatic sprinklers, and location of different types of automatic sprinkler systems installed including but
not limited to dry, wet and pre-action.

1103.11.7 Hazardous Material Information. Hazardous material information that includes the location and
quantity of hazardous material.

IFC Section 3308-93319.1 Amended — Job Shacks and Other Temporary Structures. Section 3308.9 of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

3308.93319.1 Job shacks and other temporary structures. Job shacks and other temporary structures
located within or less than 20' from the permanent building shall be:

1. Constructed of non-combustible materials or 1-hour fire-restive construction.

2 Shall not be equipped with fuel fired heaters.

3. Shall be equipped with monitored fire alarm system when located below grade.
4

Shall not function as non-associated construction offices unless protected with automatic sprinkler
systems.

IFC Section 3308-10-3319 Added —- Additional Requirements. Section 3308.10 of the International Fire Code
is hereby amended to read as follows:

3308.103319.1 Additional Requirements for wood-frame buildings more than 50,000 square feet in area.

3319.13308.10-1 Job Site Security. The job site shall be secured with controlled access once above grade
combustible construction has begun together with off hours guard service, motion-controlled surveillance or
both.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 30

Item 5.




52

LL.

MM.

NN.

0O0.

PP.

IFC Section 5003.9 Amended — General Requirements, General Safety Precautions. Section 5003.9 of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 5003.9 General safety precautions. General precautions for the safe storage, handling or care of
hazardous materials shall be in accordance with Sections 5003.9.1 through 5003.9.11.

IFC Section 5003.9.11 Added — Manufacturer's Limitations. Section 5003.9.11 of the International Fire Code
is hereby added to read as follows:

5003.9.11 Manufacturer's Limitations. The storage and use of hazardous materials shall not exceed the
manufacturer's limitations on shelf life and any other restrictions on use.

IFC Section 5307.5.2 Deleted — Carbon Dioxide (CO2) Systems Used in Beverage Dispensing Applications.
Section 5307.5.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.

IFC Appendix B, Section B104.2 Deleted — Fire-Flow Calculation Area, Area Separation. Appendix B, Section
B104.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.

IFC Appendix B, Table B105.2 Amended — Required Fire-Flow for Buildings Other Than One- and Two-Family
Dwellings, Group R-3 and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses is hereby added to read as follows:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE-FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN
ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3 AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER MINIMUM FIRE-FLOW FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM (gallons per minute) (hours)
(Design Standard)

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table
system B105.1(2) B105.1(2)

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 50% of the value in Duration in Table
International Fire Code Table B105.1(2)2 B105.1(2) at the

reduced flow rate

Section 903.3.1.2 of the 50% of the value in Duration in Table
International Fire Code Table B105.1(2)? B105.1(2) at the

reduced flow rate

QQ.

RR.

SS.

For SI: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m.
2 The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than 1,500 gallons per minute.

IFC Appendix C, Section C102 Amended — Number of Fire Hydrants. Appendix C, Section C102.2 of the
International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section €102.2 Sprinkler support hydrants. One or more fire hydrants shall be designated as sprinkler
support hydrants and are not included in the required fire hydrant calculations as determined by fire-flow.

IFC Appendix D, Section D101.1 Amended — General, Scope. Appendix D, Section D101.1 of the International
Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section D101.1 Scope. Fire apparatus access roads shall be in accordance with this appendix and all other
applicable requirements of the International Fire Code. The requirements in this appendix may be modified
by the fire code official if the building is provided with an approved automatic fire sprinkler system and/or
other approved fire-protection features.

IFC Appendix D, Section D105.1 Amended — Where Required. Appendix D, Section D105.1 of the
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 31

Item 5.




53

D105.1 Where required. Where the vertical distance between the grade plane and the highest roof surface
exceeds 30 feet (9,144 mm), approved aerial fire apparatus access roads shall be provided. For purposes of
this section, the highest roof surface shall be determined by measurement to the eave of a pitched roof, the
intersection of the roof to the exterior wall, or the top of parapet walls, whichever is greater.

Exception: One- and two-family dwellings, Group R-3, and Group U Occupancies.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 17C-12 § 3; Ord. 17C-01 § 3; Ord. 16C-04 § 7; Ord. 13C-06 & 7; Ord. 10C-03 § 7; Ord.

07C-04 § 9; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 32

Item 5.




54

Chapter 17.08 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

17.08.010 Adoption.

The 2618-2021 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC), as adopted and amended by the State Building
Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-56, as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials, is adopted by reference with the following additions, deletions and exceptions. Provided, that Chapter 1,
Administration, is not adopted and the Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall
be used in place of UPC Chapter 1, Administration. Provided, that Chapters 12 and 14 of the Uniform Plumbing
Code are not adopted. Provided, that those requirements of the Uniform Plumbing Code relating to venting and
combustion air of fuel-fired appliances as found in Chapter 5 and those portions of the code addressing building
sewers are not adopted. The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city
clerk and a copy made available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

The following appendices of the 2648-2021 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted and amended
by the State Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-57, as published by the International Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, are also adopted by reference: Appendix A — Recommended Rules for Sizing
the Water Supply System; Appendix B — Explanatory Notes on Combination Waste and Vent Systems; Appendix |
— Installation Standards: Appendix M — Peak Water Demand Calculator. In addition, Appendix C — Alternate
Plumbing Systems, excluding Sections C303.3, C304.0 through C601.9, is adopted by reference.

Conflicts. Where a conflict exists between the provisions of Appendix | and the manufacturer's installation
instructions, the conditions of the listing and the manufacturer's installation instructions shall apply.

(Ord. 21C-01 § 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 8; Ord. 13C-06 § 8; Ord. 10C-03 § 8; Ord. 09C-18 § 1; Ord. 07C-04 § 10;
Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

Chapter 17.09 WASHINGTON STATE ENERGY CODE

17.09.010 Adoption.

The 2021 Washington State Energy Code (WSEC), Commercial Provisions and Residential Provisions, as
adopted by the State Building Code Council in WAC Chapter 51-11C and 51-11R, is-are adopted by reference with
the following additions, deletions and exceptions. Provided, that Administration Sections C104, C106, C107, €107
C109 through €114-C112,and R102 through R107, and R187-R109 through R111-R112 are not adopted and the
Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be used in their place. The codes,
appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy made available for
use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

Exception. The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for the
commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits. A
temporary growing structure is not considered a building for the purposes of this code. However, the installation
of other than listed, portable mechanical equipment or listed, portable lighting fixtures is not allowed.

(Ord. 21C-01 & 1 (Exh. A); Ord. 16C-04 § 9; Ord. 04C-12 § 4)

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 33

Item 5.




55

Chapter 17.12 UNIFORM HOUSING CODE

17.12.010 Adoption.

The 1997 Edition of the Uniform Housing Code (UHC) as published by the International Council of Building
Officials is adopted by reference. References in the Uniform Housing Code to other codes not adopted by MICC
title 17 shall be deemed to refer to the most closely corresponding adopted codes and sections, as provided in
MICC 17.14.010.

17.12.020 Amendments and additions.

A. UHC Section 701 Amended — Heating and Ventilation. Section 701 of the Uniform Housing Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Item 5.

UHC 701.1 Heating. Dwelling units, guest rooms and congregate residences shall be provided with heating [ Formatted: Font: Not Bold

facilities capable of maintaining a room temperature of 682F at a point 3 feet above the floor in all habitable
rooms. Such facilities shall be installed and maintained in a safe condition and in accordance with applicable
sections of the Building Code, Mechanical Code, Energy Code and all other applicable laws. Unvented fuel-
burning heaters are not permitted. All heating devices or appliances shall be of an approved type. The
installation of one or more portable space heaters shall not be used to achieve compliance with this section.

- [ Formatted: Indent: First line: 0"

Chapter 17.13 WASHINGTON CITIES ELECTRICAL CODE*

17.13.010 Short title.

This chapter shall be known as the electrical code of the city of Mercer Island, which is hereinafter referred
to as the "city of Mercer Island Electrical Code," "electrical code" or as "this chapter."

17.13.020 Adoption.

The 2020 Edition of the Washington Cities Electrical Code (WCEC) Part 1 and Part 3, excluding Part 2,
Administration, is adopted by reference, together with the following amendments, additions and exceptions. The
Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in chapter 17.14 MICC, shall be used in place of WCEC Part 2,
Administration. This includes Annexes A, B and C of the National Electrical Code; Commercial Building
Telecommunications Cabling Standard (ANSI/TIA-568-C Series, February 2009); Commercial Building Standard for
Telecommunications Pathway and Spaces (TIA-569-B, October 2004); Commercial Building Grounding and Bonding
Requirements for Telecommunications (ANSI/TIA-607-B, August 2011); Residential Telecommunications Cable
Standard (ANSI/TIA/EIA 570-B-2004); and the National Electrical Safety Code (NESC C2-2012 excluding Appendices
A and B). The codes, appendices, and standards set forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city clerk and a copy
made available for use and examination by the public, pursuant to RCW 35A.12.140.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 34




56

17.13.030 Conflicts.

A.

The requirements of this chapter will be observed where there is any conflict between this chapter and the
National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), centrifugal fire pumps (NFPA 20), the emergency and standby power
systems (NFPA 110), ANSI/TIA/EIA 568-B, ANSI/TIA/EIA 569-A, ANSI/TIA/EIA 607, or ANSI/TIA/EIA 570.

The National Electrical Code will be followed where there is any conflict between the standard for
installation of statienarystationary pumps for fire protection (NFPA 20), the standard for emergency and
standby power systems (NFPA 110), ANSI/TIA/EIA 568-B, ANSI/TIA/EIA 569-A, ANSI/TIA/EIA 607,
ANSI/TIA/EIA 570-B, and the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70).

In accordance with RCW 19.28.010(3), where the State of Washington Department of Labor and Industries
adopts a more current edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), the building official may supplement
use of this code with newly adopted editions of the National Electrical Code. Provisions in the annex chapters
of the National Electrical Code shall not apply unless specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 35

Item 5.




57

Chapter 17.14 CONSTRUCTION ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

17.14.010 Adoption.

The Construction Administrative Code is hereby adopted as follows:
SECTION 101 GENERAL

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Construction Administrative Code of the city of Mercer
Island, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

101.2 Purpose. The purpose of this chapter is to provide for the administration, organization and
enforcement of the construction codes adopted by the city.

101.3 Scope_and General Requirements. The provisions of this Construction Administrative Code shall apply to

wr,

grading, building, plumbing, and mechanical permits and the following ““Construction Codes"”:

2018-2021 International Building Code — WAC Chapter 51-50

2018-2021 International Residential Code — WAC Chapter 51-51R

20618-2021 International Mechanical Code — WAC Chapter 51-52

2018-2021 National Fuel Gas Code (ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54) — WAC Chapter 51-52
20147-2020 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58) — WAC Chapter 51-52
20648-2021 International Fuel Gas Code — WAC Chapter 51-52

2048-2021 Uniform Plumbing Code — WAC Chapter 51-56 and 51-57

2018-2021 Washington State Energy Code, Commercial Provisions and Residential Provisions — WAC
Chapters 51-11C and 51-11R

2020 National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Washington Cities Electrical Code
2018-2021 International Existing Building Code — WAC 51-50-480000

2018-2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code — WAC 51-50-3109 and WAC 51-51-0329
2021 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code — WAC 51-55

101.4 Definitions. For the purpose of this chapter, certain terms, phrases, words and their derivatives shall
have the meanings set forth in this section. Where terms are not defined, they shall have their ordinary
accepted meanings within the context with which they are used. Webster"'s Third New International
Dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged, latest edition, shall be considered as providing ordinary
accepted meanings. Words used in the singular include the plural and the plural the singular. Words used in
the masculine gender include the feminine and the feminine the masculine.

1.  ““Action"” means a specific response complying fully with a specific request by the jurisdiction.

"

2. ““Building service equipment"” means and refers to the plumbing, mechanical and electrical
equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures, and other accessories which provide sanitation, lighting,
heating, ventilation, cooling, refrigeration, firefighting, and transportation facilities essential to the
occupancy of the building or structure for its designated use.

uw

3. ““Complete response” means an adequate response to all requests from city staff in sufficient detail
to allow the application to be processed.

"

4.  “"Occupancy~” means the purpose for which a building, or part thereof, is used or intended to be used.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 36

Item 5.




58

Item 5.

5. ““Shall,*” as used in this chapter, is mandatory.

un

6.  ““Valuation” “value"” as applied to a building or portion thereof, or building service equipment,
means and shall be the estimated cost to replace the building and its building service equipment in
kind, based on current replacement costs. It shall also include the contractor”s overhead and profit.

n na,

““Valuation™” or ““value™” as applied to a specific scope of work associated with a permit shall be the
fair market value of that scope of work including time and materials and the contractor”s overhead

and profit.

gy e

101.5 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adepted-referenced in the
adopting ordinance. An appendix adopted by a local jurisdiction that affects single-family or multifamily
residential buildings as defined in RCW 19.27.015 shall not be effective unless approved by the state building
code council pursuant to RCW 19.27.060 (1)(a).

Exceptions: 1. The state building code council has determined that a local ordinance providing
specifications for light straw-clay or strawbale construction, or requiring a solar-ready zone
or requiring fire sprinklers in accordance with Appendix AR, AS, or V of this chapter may be
adopted by any local government upon notification of the council.

2. Appendix AF, Radon Control Methods, Appendix AQ, Tiny Homes, and Appendix U
Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems, are included in adoption of the International Residential
Code.

101.6 Intent. The purpose of the construction codes and the Construction Administrative Code is to establish
the minimum requirements to provide a reasonable level of safety, public health and general welfare
through affordability, structural strength, means of egress-facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and
ventilation, energy conservation, and for providing a reasonable level of life safety te-life-and property
protection from fire, explosion and etherhazardsor dangerous conditions, and to provide a reasonable level
of safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations.

101.7 Referenced Codes. The codes listed in Sections 101.8 through 164.26101.21 and referenced elsewhere
in the construction codes and the Construction Administrative Code shall be considered part of the
requirements of the construction codes and the Construction Administrative Code to the prescribed extent
of each such reference.

101.8 International Building Code — Scope. The provisions of the International Building Code (IBC) shall
apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, maintenance, removal, and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not
more than three stories above grade plane in height with separate means of egress and their accessory
structures not more than three stories above grade plane in height, shall comply with this code or the
International Residential Code.

101.9 International Residential Code — Scope_and general requirements. The provisions of the
International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings (IRC) shall apply to the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal
and demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses)
not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and their accessory
structures not more than three stories above grade plane in height, including adult family homes, foster
family care homes and family day care homes licensed by the Washington state department of social and
health services.

Exceptions:

1. Live/work units located in townhouses complying with the requirements of Section 419.5508.5 of the
International Building Code shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 37



59

Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings. Fire-suppressionAn automatic sprinkler system
required by Section 449-508.7 of the International Building Code where constructed under the
International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings shall conform to Appendix U.

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with one or two guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in
accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings.

3. Owner-occupied lodging houses with three to five guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in
accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings where
equipped with a fire sprinkler system in accordance with Appendix U.

4. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving custodial care within a dwelling unit shall be
permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings where equipped with an automatic fire sprinkler system in accordance with Appendix
uU.

5. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving medical care within a dwelling unit shall be
permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings where equipped with an automatic fire sprinkler system in accordance with Appendix
u.

6. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving care that are within a single-family dwelling shall be
permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings where equipped with an automatic fire sprinkler system in accordance with Appendix
U.

101.10 Electrical Code — Scope. The provisions of the Mercer Island Electrical Code apply to the installation
of electric conductors, electric equipment, alterations, modifications or repairs to existing electrical
installations for the following:

1. Electrical conductors, electrical equipment, and electrical raceways installed within or on public and
private buildings, property or other structures.

2. Signaling and communications conductors and equipment, telecommunications conductors and
equipment, fiber optic cables, and raceways installed within or on public and private buildings,
property or other structures.

3. Yards, lots, parking lots, and industrial substations.
4.  Temporary electrical installations for use during the construction of buildings.

5. Temporary electrical installations for carnivals, conventions, festivals, fairs, traveling shows, the
holding of religious services, temporary lighting of streets, or other approved uses.

6. Installations of conductors and equipment that connect to a supply of electricity.
7. All other outside electrical conductors on the premises.
8. Optional standby systems derived from portable generators.

Exception: Installations under the exclusive control of electric utilities for the purpose of communication,
transmission, and distribution of electric energy located in buildings used exclusively by utilities for such
purposes or located outdoors on property owned or leased by the utilities or on public highways, streets,
roads, etc., or outdoors by established rights on private property.

It is the intent of this section that this code covers all premises' wiring or wiring other than utility owned
metering equipment, on the load side of the service point of buildings, structures, or any other premises not
owned or leased by the utility. Also, it is the intent that this code covers installations in buildings used by the

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 38

Item 5.




60

Item 5.

utility for purposes other than listed above, such as office buildings, warehouses, garages, machine shops,
and recreational buildings which are not an integral part of a generating plant, substation, or control center.

101.11 Gas Code — Scope. The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) shall apply to the
installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas utilization equipment, gaseous hydrogen systems and related
accessories in accordance with Sections 101.2.1 through 101.2.5, except those regulated by the International
Residential Code (IRC) and those utilizing LPG.

101.12 Mechanical Code — Scope. The provisions of the International Mechanical Code (IMC) shall apply to
the design, installation, maintenance, alteration and inspection of mechanical systems that are permanently
installed and utilized to provide control of environmental conditions and related processes within buildings.
The IMC shall also regulate those mechanical systems, system components, equipment and appliances
specifically addressed herein. The installation of fuel gas distribution piping and equipment, fuel gas-fired
appliances and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems shall be regulated by the International Fuel Gas
Code. References in this code to Group R shall include Group I-1, Condition 2 assisted living facilities licensed
by Washington state under WAC Chapter 388-78A and Group I-1, Condition 2 residential treatment facilities
licensed by Washington state under WAC Chapter 246-337.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more
than three stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply with
the International Residential Code.

2. The standards for liquefied petroleum gas (LPG) installations shall be NFPA 58 (Liquefied Petroleum
Gas Code) and ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54 (National Fuel Gas Code).

101.12.1 Other authorities. In addition to the IMC, provisions of WAC Chapter 480-93 regarding gas pipeline
safety may also apply to single meter installations serving more than one building. The provisions of WAC
Chapter 480-93 are enforced by the Washington Utilities and Transportation Commission.

101.13 Plumbing Code — Scope. The provisions of the Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC) shall apply to the
erection, installation, alteration, repair, relocation, replacement, addition to, use, or maintenance of
plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where
connected to a water or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system.

101.14 Property maintenance. The provisions of the Uniform Housing Code (UHC) shall apply to existing
structures to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property, and public welfare by
regulating and controlling the use and occupancy, location, and maintenance of all residential buildings and
other structures within this jurisdiction.

101.15 Dangerous buildings. The provisions of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
(UCADB) shall apply to all dangerous buildings, as defined in the UCADB, which are now in existence or which
may hereafter become dangerous in this jurisdiction. The purpose of the UCADB is to provide a just,
equitable and practicable method, to be cumulative with and in addition to any other remedy provided by
the International Building Code, International Residential Code, Uniform Housing Code or otherwise available
by law, whereby buildings or structures which from any cause endanger the life, limb, health, morals,
property, safety or welfare of the general public or their occupants and may be required to be repaired,
vacated, abated or demolished.

101.16 Fire prevention. The provisions of the International Fire Code (IFC) shall apply to matters affecting or
relating to structures, processes, premises and safeguards from the hazard of fire and explosion arising from
the storage, handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property
or public welfare in the occupancy or operation of structures or premises; from matters related to the
construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm systems or fire hazards in
the structure or on the premises from occupancy or operation; and from conditions affecting the safety of
fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency procedures.

AB 6262 | Exhibit 1a | Page 39



61

101.17 Energy Code — Scope. The provisions of the Washington State Energy Code (WSEC) shall apply to all
matters governing the design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency. The WSEC Residential WAC
Chapter 51-11R applies to residential buildings, building sites, associated systems and equipment, and the
WSEC Commercial WAC Chapter 51-11C applies to commercial buildings, building sites, associated systems
and equipment. Residential sleeping units, Group I-1, Condition 2 assisted living facilities licensed by

Washington state under chapter 388-78A WAC and Group I-1, Condition 2 residential treatment facilities

licensed-by-Washingteonstate under WAL Chapter246-337- Building areas that contain Group R sleeping
units, regardless of the number of stories in height, are required to comply with the commercial sections of
the energy code. Where a building includes both residential building and commercial building portions, each
portion shall be separately considered and meet the applicable provisions of the WSEC - Commercial or
WSEC - Residential Provisions.

101.18 Ventilation. The pr