
 

 

Agenda 

Mangum Utility Authority Meeting 

November 07, 2023 
6:00 PM, or immediately following City Commission Meeting 
City Administration Building at 130 N Oklahoma Ave. 

In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, persons who need accommodation in order to 
attend or participate in this meeting should contact City Hall at 580-782-2250 no less than 48 hours 

prior to the meeting in order to request such assistance. 

The Trustees of the Mangum Utility Authority will meet in regular session on November 7, 2023, 
immediately following the City of Mangum Commission meeting for such business as shall come before 
said Trustees. 

CALL TO ORDER 

ROLL CALL AND DECLARATION OF QUORUM 

CONSENT AGENDA 
The following items are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion. There will be no 
separate discussion of these items unless a Board member (or a community member through a Board 
member) so requests, in which case the item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and 
considered separately. If any item involves a potential conflict of interest, Board members should so 
note before adoption of the Consent Agenda. 

1. Approve October 3rd, 2023 meeting minutes as presented. 

2. Approve October 30th, 2023 special meeting minutes as presented. 

3. Approve September 2023 financials for all funds. 

4. Approve October 2023 claims 

5. Approve November estimated payroll. 

 

FURTHER DISCUSSION 

REMARKS 
Remarks or inquiries by the audience not pertaining to any item on the agenda. 

 

ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS 

6. Discussion and possible action to approve Resolution No. 2023-1107-03 approving a 3% 
convenience fee for all credit/debit card usage and removing the flat fee rate of $3.00 per 
transaction. 
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7. Discussion and possible action to approve Resolution No. 2023-1107-04 setting new rates 
due to the increase from contractor 'Waste Connections' for trash services provided in 
Mangum. 

 

OTHER ITEMS 

8. Discussion and possible action to purchase a Hydro Excavator for the Wastewater 
Department to paid out of the ARPA fund account. 

9. Discussion and possible action to accept or review the best and most reasonable bid for the 
purchase of a Hydro Excavator for the Wastewater Department.  

10. Discussion and possible action to accept or review the best and most responsible bid for 
the Water Meter Replacement DWSRF Project NO. P40-2002802-02, opened on 
November 2nd, 2023, by Myers Engineering. 

 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

11. Discussion and possible action to enter into executive session in regard to reviewing and 
accepting the Interim City Manager, Erma Moras' contract for the FY2023-2024 with 
possible executive session in accordance with 25 O.S. 307(B)(1). 

OPEN SESSION 

12. Discussion and possible action with regard to the executive session. 

 

STAFF AND BOARD REMARKS 
Remarks or inquiries by the governing body members, City Manager, City Attorney or City Employees 

NEW BUSINESS 
Discussion and possible action on any new business which has arisen since the posting of the Agenda 
that could not have been reasonably foreseen prior to the time of the posting (25 O.S. 311-10) 

ADJOURN 
Motion to Adjourn 

Duly filed and posted at 10:30 a.m. on November 6th, 2023, by City Clerk. 

 

  

Erma Mora, City Clerk  
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Mangum Utility Authority Meeting 
October 03, 2023 at 6:00 PM, or immediately following City Commission 

City Administration Building at 130 N Oklahoma Ave. 
 

Record of Minutes 

The Trustees of the Mangum Utility Authority will meet in regular session on October 3rd, 2023 
immediately following the City of Mangum Commission meeting for such business as shall come before 
said Trustees. 

CALL TO ORDER 

Chairman Menasco called the meeting to order at 6:07pm. 

ROLL CALL AND DECLARATION OF QUORUM 

PRESENT 

Trustee Michelle Huckabay 
Trustee Judith McCaslin 
Chairman Jackie Menasco 
Trustee Mark Chapman 
 
ABSENT 
Trustee Dixie Peterson 
 

CONSENT AGENDA 
The following items are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion. There will be no 
separate discussion of these items unless a Board member (or a community member through a Board 
member) so requests, in which case the item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and 
considered separately. If any item involves a potential conflict of interest, Board members should so 
note before adoption of the Consent Agenda. 

Motion to approve consent agenda items as presented. 

Motion made by Trustee Chapman, Seconded by Trustee McCaslin. 
Voting Yea: Trustee Huckabay, Trustee McCaslin, Chairman Menasco, Trustee Chapman 
 

1. Approve September 5th, 2023 meeting minutes as presented. 

2. Approve September 2023 claims 

3. Approve financials for all departments 

4. Approve October estimated payroll. 
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FURTHER DISCUSSION 

None. 

REMARKS 
Remarks or inquiries by the audience not pertaining to any item on the agenda. 

None. 

STAFF AND BOARD REMARKS 
Remarks or inquiries by the governing body members, City Manager, City Attorney or City Employees 

None. 

NEW BUSINESS 
Discussion and possible action on any new business which has arisen since the posting of the Agenda 
that could not have been reasonably foreseen prior to the time of the posting (25 O.S. 311-10) 

None. 

ADJOURN 
Motion to Adjourn 

Motion 6:08pm. 

Motion made by Trustee Chapman, Seconded by Trustee Huckabay. 
Voting Yea: Trustee Huckabay, Trustee McCaslin, Chairman Menasco, Trustee Chapman 
. 

 

   

Jackie Menasco, Mayor  Erma Mora, City Clerk 
 

4

Item 1.



Special Mangum Utility Authority Meeting October 30, 2023
  Minutes Page 1 of 2 

 

 

Special Mangum Utility Authority Meeting 
October 30, 2023 at 8:30 AM, or immediately following City 

Commission 

City Administration Building at 130 N Oklahoma Ave. 
 

Record of Minutes 

The Trustees of the Mangum Utility Authority will meet in special session on October 30th 2023.  

CALL TO ORDER 

Meeting called to order by Chairman Menasco at 8:30am. 

ROLL CALL AND DECLARATION OF QUORUM 

PRESENT 
Trustee Michelle Huckabay 
Trustee Judith McCaslin 
Chairman Jackie Menasco 
Trustee Dixie Peterson 
Trustee Mark Chapman 

 
ALSO PRESENT: 
CORRY KENDALL, CITY ATTORNEY 
ERMA MORA, CITY CLERK 
 

ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS 

1. CONSIDER AND TAKE ACTION WITH RESPECT TO A RESOLUTION OF THE 
MANGUM UTILITIES AUTHORITY (THE “BORROWER”) AGREEING TO FILE 
APPLICATION WITH THE OKLAHOMA WATER RESOURCES BOARD (THE “OWRB”) 
FOR FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE THROUGH THE DRINKING WATER STATE REVOLVING 
FUND PROGRAM; APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING DRINKING WATER SRF FUNDING 
FROM THE OKLAHOMA WATER RESOURCES BOARD IN THE TOTAL AGGREGATE 
PRINCIPAL AMOUNT OF NOT TO EXCEED $999,999.00; APPROVING THE ISSUANCE 
OF A PROMISSORY NOTE IN THE TOTAL AGGREGATE PRINCIPAL AMOUNT OF NOT 
TO EXCEED $999,999.00, AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION; APPROVING AND 
AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A FUNDING AGREEMENT; APPROVING 
VARIOUS COVENANTS; APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE ESTABLISHMENT OF A 
PROJECT COSTS DISBURSEMENT ACCOUNT AND APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING 
PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES; RATIFYING AND CONFIRMING LEASE(S) 
PERTAINING TO THE LEASING OF THE CITY’S UTILITY SYSTEMS TO THE 
BORROWER AND/OR AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF AN AMENDED LEASE(S) 
BETWEEN THE CITY AND THE BORROWER PERTAINING TO SAID UTILITY 
SYSTEMS; APPROVING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AGREEMENTS; AND 
CONTAINING OTHER PROVISIONS RELATING THERETO 
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Allen Brooks speaks on the financing of the OWRB loan for the water meter replacement 
project. He explains if approved the money will be available early January 2024. 

City Superintendent Chris Halford also speaks to the board with his concerns in the system 
working with the current billing system the city has. He does explain that if all works 
together as it should, that it will save so much time and less employees needed during 
meter reading time. 

Motion to approve. 

Motion made by Trustee Peterson, Seconded by Trustee McCaslin. 
Voting Yea: Trustee Huckabay, Trustee McCaslin, Chairman Menasco, Trustee Peterson, 
Trustee Chapman 
 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

2. DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION TO ENTER INTO EXECUTIVE SESSION TO 
DISCUSS THE EMPLOYMENT, HIRING, APPOINT, PROMOTION, DEMOTION, 
DISCIPLING OR RESIGNATION OF ANY INDIVIDUAL SALARIED PUBLIC OFFICER OR 
EMPLOYEE. SPECIFICALLY, TO DISCUSS DETAILS REGARDING THE HIRING OF A 
CITY MANAGER IN ACCORDANCE WITH 25 O.S. 307(B)(1). 

Motion to enter into executive session at 9:14am. 

Motion made by Trustee Peterson, Seconded by Trustee McCaslin. 
Voting Yea: Trustee Huckabay, Trustee McCaslin, Chairman Menasco, Trustee Peterson, 
Trustee Chapman                                                                                                                     

                   Chairman Menasco declares out of executive session at 10:40am. 
 

OPEN SESSION 

3. DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION WITH REGARD TO EXECUTIVE SESSION. 

Motion to approve Erma Mora as Interim City Manager effective Nov. 7th, 2023, contingent 
on contract. 

Motion made by Trustee Peterson, Seconded by Trustee Chapman. 
Voting Yea: Trustee Huckabay, Trustee McCaslin, Chairman Menasco, Trustee Peterson, 
Trustee Chapman 
 

ADJOURN 
Motion to Adjourn 

Motion to adjourn at 10:41am. 

 

   

Jackie Menasco, Chairman  Erma Mora, City Clerk 
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PAYROLL ESTIMATE FOR  

NOVEMBER 2023 

 

 CITY: 

Regular Time                  $72,021.52 

Overtime                         $1,008.90 

 

MUA: 

Regular Time                  $23,033.17 

Overtime                         $829.40 

 

Approved on: 11-07-2023 

________________________________ 

________________________________ 

________________________________ 

________________________________ 

________________________________ 
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  BID TABULATION   

City of Mangum
 Water Meter System Replacement Project

 November 2nd, 2023 @ 1:00 p.m.
MECE 223138

A1 1565 EA 5/8"  MACH 10 R900 METER $310.00 $485,150.00 $265.00 $414,725.00

A2 2 EA 3"  MACH 10 R900 METER $2,650.00 $5,300.00 $2,650.00 $5,300.00

A3 2 EA 6" Mach 10 R900 Meter $5,350.00 $10,700.00 $5,350.00 $10,700.00

A4 1 LS Drive By System $15,800.00 $15,800.00 $15,800.00 $15,800.00

TOTAL BID SECTION A $516,950.00 $446,525.00 NO BID

A5 1565 EA 5/8"  Meter Installation $72.00 $112,680.00 $72.00 $112,680.00

2 EA 3"  Meter Installation $410.00 $820.00 $410.00 $820.00

2 EA 6" Meter Installation $1,060.00 $2,120.00 $1,060.00 $2,120.00

TOTAL BID SECTION A INSTALLATION $115,620.00 $115,620.00 NO BID

B1 1565 EA 5/8"  x 3/8" iPerl $120.00 $187,800.00

B2 2 EA 3" iPerl Meter $1,000.00 $2,000.00

B3 2 EA 6" iPerl Meter $3,500.00 $7,000.00

B4 1569 EA Smart Points-520M- Single Port $140.00 $219,660.00

B5 1 LS Drive By System $31,000.00 $31,000.00

TOTAL BID SECTION B NO BID NO BID $447,460.00

Sec B Sensus Meters

UNIT

A7

Sec A Neptune Meters

Sec A Installation

Sec B Installation

UTS                              

OKC,OK

Core & Main (Bid 1)              

Owasso, OK

Core & Main (Bid 2)              

Owasso, OK                   (Not 

Accepted)

A6

DESCRIPTIONITEM QUANTITY
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B6 1565 EA 5/8"  Meter Installation $65.00 $101,725.00

B7 2 EA 3"  Meter Installation $550.00 $1,100.00

B8 2 EA 6" Meter Installation $1,000.00 $2,000.00

TOTAL BID SECTION B INSTALLATION NO BID NO BID $104,825.00

 

C1 1565 EA 5/8" Sonata Ultrasonic Meter

C2 2 LF 3"  Octave Ultrasonic Meter

C3 2 EA 6" Octave Ultrasonic Meter

C4 1 LS Drive By System

TOTAL BID SECTION C NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sec C Installation

C5 1565 EA 5/8" Meter Installation

C6 2 EA 3" Meter Installation

C7 2 EA 6" Meter Installation

TOTAL BID SECTION C INSTALLATION NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sec D Alternate 1

D1 1 EA Meter Pit Cleanout NO BID NO BID NO BID

D2 1 EA Service Line Repair - Customer Side NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sec C Master Meter
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Project Budget - Post Bids

City of Mangum

Water System Improvements -Remote Read Water Meter System
DWSRF PROJECT
11/3/2023

MECE 223138

ITEM QUANTITY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Sec B - Meters

1 1565 EA 5/8" X 3/4" Meter 120.00$                         187,800.00$          

2 2 EA 3" Meter 1,000.00$                      2,000.00$               
3 2 EA 6" Meter 3,500.00$                      7,000.00$               
4 1569 EA Smart Points - 520M - Single Port 140.00$                         219,660.00$          
5 1 EA Drive By System 31,000.00$                   31,000.00$             

TOTAL BID SECTION  WATER METERS MATERIALS 447,460.00$          

Section B - Installation

1 1565 EA 5/8" Meter Installation 65.00$                            101,725.00$          

2 2 EA 3" Meter Installation 550.00$                         1,100.00$               

3 2 Ea 6" Meter Installation 1,000.00$                      2,000.00$               

TOTAL BID SECTION A INSTALLATION 104,825.00$          

Total Construction Cost AMR System 552,285.00$        

Engineering 47,900.00$             

Bond Counsel 30,000.00$             

Local Counsel 2,500.00$               

Trustee Bank 500.00$                   

Total Project Cost Option B - Sensus Meters 633,185.00$        
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