
 

PLANNING COMMISSION MEETING AGENDA 

Thursday, April 24, 2025 at 6:30 PM 

Municipal Council Chambers, 4303 Lawrenceville Road 

1. CALL MEETING TO ORDER 

2. INVOCATION 

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

4. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

A. Approval of Minutes from 3.27.25 

5. NEW BUSINESS 

A. Case #R25-003 – The Revive Land Group, LLC c/o Mahaffey Pickens Tucker, LLP filed an 
application requesting to rezone approximately 27.85+/- acres located at Twin Lakes Road 
Loganville, GA 30052, Map/Parcel #LG140020, Walton County, GA.  The property owner is Twin 
Lakes Road LLC. The current zoning is CH and the requested zoning is RM-6 with the proposed 
development of 149 residential units. 

B. Case #R25-004 – Chris Barber, filed an application to rezone 1.07+/- acres located at 220 CS 
Floyd Road, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel #LG050094, Walton County, GA. The property 
owner is Chris Barber. The current zoning is O&I. The requested zoning is R-44 with no proposed 
development.   

C. Case #A25-005– Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, requests annexation of property 
located at 4159 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel #C0220011A00, Walton 
County, GA. 2.00+/- acres.  

D. Case #R25-006 – Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, filed an application to rezone 
2.00+/- acres located at 4159 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0220011A00, Walton County, GA. The property owner is Diane Atha Clay. The current zoning is 
A-1. The requested zoning is R-44 with no proposed development.   

E. Case #A25-007 – Eddie H Atha and Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, requests 
annexation of property located at 4139 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0220011, Walton County, GA. 2.00+/- acres.  

F. Case #R25-008 – Eddie H Atha and Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, filed an 
application to rezone 2.00+/- acres located at 4139 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. 
Map/Parcel #C0220011, Walton County, GA. The property owner is Eddie H Atha and Diane Atha 
Clay. The current zoning is A-1. The requested zoning is R-44 with no proposed development.   

G. Case #A25-009 – Eddie H Atha and Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, requests 
annexation of property located at 0 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0220011B00, Walton County, GA. 17.57+/- acres.  

H. Case #R25-010 – Eddie H Atha and Diane Atha Clay c/o Prater Consulting LLC, filed an 
application to rezone 17.57+/- acres located at 0 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. 
Map/Parcel #C0220011B00, Walton County, GA. The property owner is Eddie H Atha and Diane 
Atha Clay. The current zoning is R-16 / A-1. The requested zoning is RM-4 for a multi-family 
development.    

I. Case #A25-011 – Eddie H Atha and Regina M. Atha c/o Prater Consulting LLC, requests 
annexation of property located at 4109 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0220010, Walton County, GA. 4.103+/- acres.  



J. Case #R25-012 – Eddie H Atha and Regina M. Atha c/o Prater Consulting LLC, filed an application 
to rezone 4.103+/- acres located at 4109 Chandler Haulk Rd, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0220010, Walton County, GA. The property owner is Eddie H Atha and Regina M. Atha. The 
current zoning is A-1. The requested zoning is R-44 with no proposed development.   

K. Case #A25-016 – The Revive Land Group LLC c/o Mahaffey Pickens Tucker, LLP, requests 
annexation of property located at 3215 & 0 Tig Knight Road, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel 
#C0470003 & Map/Parcel #C0470003A00, Walton County, GA. 26.883+/- acres. 

L. Case #R25-015 - The Revive Land Group LLC c/o Mahaffey Pickens Tucker LLP, filed an 
application to rezone 26.883+/- acres located at 3215 & 0 Tig Knight Road, Loganville, GA 30052. 
Map/Parcel #C0470003 & Map/Parcel #C0470003A00, Walton County, GA. The property owner is 
CTX Funding SPE, LLC. The current zoning is A-1. The requested zoning is RM-4 with a proposed 
development of single-family detached residential neighborhood.    

M. Case #V25-013 – The Revive Land Group LLC c/o Mahaffey Pickens Tucker, LLP requested a 
Major Variance for the property located 3215 & 0 Tig Knight Road, Loganville, GA 30052. 
Map/Parcel #C0470003 & Map/Parcel #C0470003A00, Walton County, GA. Present zoning is A-1. 
Ordinance and Section from which relief is sought is Zoning Ordinance 119-221(b)(2). Request for 
variance to allow single-family detached units in RM-4 zoning on parcels more than 2,640 feet 
from the center line of Main Street and Covington Street.  

N. Case #V25-014 – The Revive Land Group LLC c/o Mahaffey Pickens Tucker, LLP requested a 
Major Variance for the property located 3215 & 0 Tig Knight Road, Loganville, GA 30052. 
Map/Parcel #C0470003 & Map/Parcel #C0470003A00, Walton County, GA. Present zoning is A-1. 
Ordinance and Section from which relief is sought is Zoning Ordinance 119-221(b)(2)(e). Request 
for variance to allow front entry garages in RM-4.  

O. Case #V25-017 – Kevin Hornbuckle, requested a Major Variance for the property Fuller Station 
located Tommy Lee Fuller Drive, Loganville, GA 30052. Map/Parcel #LG060129B00, Walton 
County, GA. Present zoning is R3-8. Ordinance and Section from which relief is sought is Roadway 
Design and Construction Stand Specifications 15.2.1 (ii)(a) Roadway Construction Criteria 
Setback.  Request for variance to remove the requirement for a beauty strip on the interior roads 
within the Fuller Station community. The beauty stirp will not be removed from the entrance road 
frontage along Tommy Lee Fuller Dr 

6. ADJOURN 

 

Public is welcomed to attend. 


