



# **PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE**

**Lincoln Parish Police Jury**

**Tuesday, December 09, 2025 at 5:40 PM**

**Police Jury Conference Room | 100 West Texas Avenue, Floor Three,  
Ruston, LA 71270**

## **AGENDA**

In compliance with the Americans With Disabilities Act, individuals needing special accommodations during this meeting should notify the Lincoln Parish Police Jury at 318-513-6200 at least three working days before the meeting.

---

### **COMMITTEE MEMBERS**

Greg Williams, Chair; Dan Lord, TJ Cranford, Milton Melton, Diane Richards

#### **Call to Order**

#### **Invocation**

#### **Approval of Agenda**

#### **Public Comments on Agenda Items**

#### **New Business**

1. Capital Improvement Program (2026-2027-2028)
2. Authorize Advertisement For Bids- LCDBG Make-A-Difference Projects

#### **Action on Bids**

- [3.](#) Gasoline and Diesel Fuel
- [4.](#) Gravel Materials
- [5.](#) Maintenance Hot Mix
- [6.](#) Landfill Tipping Fees
- [7.](#) New Generator Installations

#### **Other Business**

#### **Public Comments**

#### **Adjournment**

P.O. Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979  
 PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209



## BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #: Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Bid Date: Friday, November 14, 2025

Budgeted Amount: TBD

Notes: 1 Year Bid 2026

	Sun Coast Resources, LLC (Reladyne)	Mansfield Oil Company (Georgia)	Previous Year Bid
Unleaded Plus (89 Octane)	\$ 0.1790	1.05% discount	\$ 0.1790
Regular Unleaded (87 Octane)	\$ 0.1790	1.05% discount	\$ 0.1790
Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel	\$ 0.1790	1.05% discount	\$ 0.1790
Regular No. 2 Diesel Fuel (Off Road Use)	\$ 0.1790	1.05% discount	\$ 0.1790

**\*\*Doesn't Meet  
Bid Specs\*\***

P.O. Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979  
 PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209



## BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #: Gravel Materials

Bid Date: Friday, November 14, 2025

Budgeted Amount: TBD

Notes: 1 Year Bid 2026

Description	Ruston Rock It	Granite Mountain Quarries	PREV YEAR
<b>DELIVERED</b>			
C-1	\$ 82.00	\$ -	\$ 81.75
C-2	\$ 82.00	\$ -	\$ 81.75
C-3	\$ 82.00	\$ -	\$ 81.75
WASHED MAINTENANCE	\$ 45.00	\$ -	\$ 44.60
LA-SB2	\$ 62.00	\$ -	\$ 61.75
Crushed Concrete / CY	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 62.00
<b>PICKED UP AT BIDDERS PLANT</b>			
C-1		\$ -	\$ -
C-2		\$ 42.50	\$ 40.00
C-3		\$ 44.00	\$ 42.00
WASHED MAINTENANCE		\$ -	\$ -
LA-SB2		\$ 15.25	\$ 14.50
Crushed Concrete / CY		\$ -	\$ -

P.O. Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979  
 PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209



## BID TABULATION SHEET

**Item #: Bituminous Hot Mix**

**Bid Date: Friday, November 14, 2025**

**Budgeted Amount: TBD**

**Notes: 6 Month Bid 2026**

Description	Bidder: Amethyst	Previous 6 Month Bid
BASE PRICE PER TON F.O.B BIDDER'S PLANT	\$110.00	\$110.00



# LINCOLN Parish Police Jury



P.O. Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979  
 PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

	Cost Per Ton	Cost per Ton Mile	Total Miles to Landfill	Fuel Costs Round Trip	Appx. Tons per Load	Total Costs per Load
Bidder						
Union Parish	\$36.00	\$0.23	42.80	\$9.72	20	\$729.72
Waste Connections	\$31.12	\$0.23	85.80	\$19.50	20	\$641.90

	Per Ton Total based on 20 Tons	Waste Connections	Per Ton Total based on 20 Tons
Year 1	\$36.00	\$31.12	\$32.10
Year 2	\$37.00	\$32.05	\$33.03
Year 3	\$38.00	\$33.00	\$33.98
Year 4	\$39.00	\$34.00	\$34.98
Year 5	\$40.00	\$35.00	\$35.98

We currently haul appx. 3-4 loads per day to Union, per driver. Hauling to Monroe would only allow appx. 2  
 Factors: loads per day.

## Liability

Hauling on interstate is subject to DOTD weight standards vs. State highways.

# BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Date: December 2, 2025 @ 10:00 A.M.

PROJECT NAME:	New Generator Installations (DR-4611-0157-LA)	DESIGNER:	Shuler Consulting Company
ENTITY:	Lincoln Parish Police Jury	DESIGNER PROJECT NO.:	3500

BIDDER	License No.	Addenda	Bond	Base Bid	Alt.No.1	Alt.No.2	Remarks
Rosco Resources, LLC 2675 Phillips Way Port Allen, LA 70767	73456	—	—	<u>NO BID</u>	—	—	—
Hendry Electrical Services, LLC 149 Sugar Cane Road Jena, LA 71342	72239	—	—	<u>NO BID</u>	—	—	—
Central Electric of Monroe, West Monroe, LA, Inc. 300 Downing Pines Road West Monroe, LA 71292	02101	1,2	✓	<u>\$1,263,577.63</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>
Streeter Construction, LLC 1354 Old State Road Ruston, LA 71270	74519	—	—	<u>NO BID</u>	—	—	—
Reynolds Industrial Contractors, Inc. 142 Old Shreveport Road Minden, LA 71055	21224	—	—	<u>NO BID</u>	—	—	—
Bayou Jacques Electric, LLC 2711 Highway 1179 Plaucheville, LA 71362	71553	1,2	✓	<u>\$1,336,160.00</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>
Albrittons Service Co., LLC 3303 McDonald Avenue Ruston, LA 71270	45279	1,2	✓	<u>\$1,096,500.00</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>	<u>N/A</u>
(Continued next page)							

**A TRUE COPY**

Date: 12-27-25

Lincoln Parish Police Jury

Liquidated Damages: \$200.00 per day