
 

 

CITY COUNCIL REGULAR SESSION 

CITY OF LAKE CITY 

December 02, 2024 at 6:00 PM 
Venue: City Hall 

AGENDA 

REVISED 

Revised: 12/2/2024: Item #11 supporting documentation added 

This meeting will be held in the City Council Chambers on the second floor of City Hall 
located at 205 North Marion Avenue, Lake City, FL 32055. Members of the public may 
also view the meeting on our YouTube channel. YouTube channel information is located 
at the end of this agenda. 

Events Prior to Meeting - 5:00 PM - Council Workshop - Council Photo Session 

Pledge of Allegiance 

Invocation - Mayor Noah Walker 

Roll Call 

Ladies and Gentlemen; The Lake City Council has opened its public meeting. 
Since 1968, the City Code has prohibited any person from making personal, 
impertinent, or slanderous remarks or becoming boisterous while addressing 
the City Council. Yelling or making audible comments from the audience 
constitutes boisterous conduct. Such conduct will not be tolerated. There is 
only one approved manner of addressing the City Council. That is, to be 
recognized and then speak from the podium. 

As a reminder, persons are not to openly carry a handgun or carry a 
concealed weapon or firearm while the governing body is meeting.  

Failure to abide by the rules of decorum will result in removal from the 
meeting.  

Approval of Agenda 

Proclamations - None 

Public Participation - Persons Wishing to Address Council 

1



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
Citizens are encouraged to participate in City of Lake City meetings. The City of Lake City 
encourages civility in public discourse and requests that speakers direct their comments 
to the Chair. Those attendees wishing to share a document and or comments in writing 
for inclusion into the public record must email the item to submissions@lcfla.com no later 
than noon on the day of the meeting.  Citizens may also provide input to individual council 
members via office visits, phone calls, letters and e-mail that will become public record. 

Approval of Consent Agenda 

1. Minutes - November 18, 2024 Regular Session 

2. City Council Resolution No. 2024-137 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, 
Florida, nominating Ricky Jernigan to serve on the Columbia County Tourism 
Development Council; making findings of fact in support thereof; directing the 
City Clerk to communicate such nomination to the Columbia County Board of 
Commissioners; repealing all prior resolutions in conflict; and providing an 
effective date. 

3. City Council Resolution No. 2024-138 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, 
Florida, appointing James Carter to serve on the North Central Florida Regional 
Planning Council; making findings of fact in support thereof; directing the City 
Clerk to reflect said appointment in such records of the City as are necessary 
and prudent; directing the City Clerk to communicate such appointment to the 
North Central Florida Regional Planning Council; repealing all prior resolutions 
in conflict; and providing an effective date. 

4. City Council Resolution No. 2024-139 - A resolution of the City Council of the 
City of Lake City, Florida, authorizing the renewal of the Third Judicial Circuit 
Mutual Aid Agreement between the Police Departments located in the Third 
Judicial Circuit of Florida; making certain findings of fact in support of the City 
renewing said agreement; recognizing the authority of the Mayor to execute and 
bind the City to said renewal agreement; recognizing the authority of the Chief 
of Police to execute and bind the City to said renewal agreement; directing the 
Mayor to execute and bind the City to said renewal agreement; directing the 
Chief of Police to execute the City to said renewal agreement; repealing all prior 
resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date. 

Presentations 

5. IEMO Certificate of Completion from the Florida League of Cities to Council 
Member Chevella Young and Council Member Tammy Harris (Mayor Noah 
Walker)  

6. John Cole - Kids Feeding Kids PowerPoint Presentation 

Old Business 

2



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
Ordinances 

Open Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

7. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2294 (final reading) - An ordinance of the City 
of Lake City, Florida, amending the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of 
Lake City Comprehensive Plan, as amended; relating to an amendment of 50 or 
less acres of land, pursuant to an application, CPA 24-03, by Lance Jones as 
agent for the Law Offices of Travis Koon, the property owner of said acreage, 
under the amendment procedures established in Sections 163.3161 through 
163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended; providing for changing the Future 
Land Use Classification from Residential, Moderate Density (allowing up to 4 
dwelling unites per acre) and/or (Residential Medium, allowing up to eight 
dwelling units per acre) to Commercial of certain lands within the Corporate 
Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all 
ordinances in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This property is located 
at the corner of Baya Avenue and Main Boulevard) 

Passed on first reading 11/18/24 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this 
includes site visits), if any.  

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by 
City Attorney. 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred 
to during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be 
marked for identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. 

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. 

E.  Public comments. 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. 

H.  Closing comments by parties. 

3



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. 

Close Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

Adopt City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2294 on final reading 

Open Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

8. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2295 (final reading) - An ordinance of the City 
of Lake City, Florida, amending the Official Zoning Atlas of the City of Lake City 
Land Development Regulations, as amended; relating to the rezoning of ten or 
less contiguous acres of land, pursuant to an application, Z 24-04, by Lance 
Jones as agent for the Law Offices of Travis Koon, the property owner of said 
acreage; providing for rezoning from Residential Single Family-2 (RSF-2) 
and/or Residential Office (RO) to Commercial General (CG) of certain lands 
within the Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing 
severability; repealing all ordinances in conflict; and providing an effective date. 
(This property is located at the corner of Baya Avenue and Main Boulevard) 

Passed on first reading 11/18/24 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this 
includes site visits), if any.  

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by 
City Attorney. 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred 
to during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be 
marked for identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. 

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. 

E.  Public comments. 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. 

4



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
H.  Closing comments by parties. 

I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. 

Close Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

Adopt City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2295 on final reading 

New Business 

Ordinances 

Open Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

9. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2298 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City 
of Lake City, Florida, amending the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of 
Lake City Comprehensive Plan, as amended; relating to an amendment of 50 or 
less acres of land, pursuant to an application, CPA 24-04, by Charles Millar as 
agent for VYP, LLC, a Florida Limited Liability Company, property owner of said 
acreage, under the amendment procedures established in Sections 163.3161 
through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended; providing for changing the 
Future Land Use Classification from Commercial County to Commercial City of 
certain lands within the Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; 
providing severability; repealing all ordinances in conflict; and providing an 
effective date. (This property is located next to Advance Auto Parts at the SW 
corner of Highway 90 and Branford Highway) 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this 
includes site visits), if any.  

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by 
City Attorney. 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred 
to during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be 
marked for identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. 

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. 

5



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
E.  Public comments. 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. 

H.  Closing comments by parties. 

I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. 

Close Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

Adopt City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2298 on first reading 

Open Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

10. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2299 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City 
of Lake City, Florida, amending the Official Zoning Atlas of the City of Lake City 
Land Development Regulations, as amended; relating to the rezoning of ten or 
less contiguous acres of land, pursuant to an application, Z 24-05, submitted by 
Charles Millar as agent for VYP, LLC, a Florida Limited Liability Company, the 
property owner of said acreage; providing for rezoning from Commercial 
Intensive County (CI Co) to Commercial Intensive (CI) of certain lands within 
the Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; 
repealing all ordinances in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This 
property is located next to Advanced Auto Parts at the SW corner of Highway 
90 and Branford Highway) 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this 
includes site visits), if any.  

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by 
City Attorney. 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred 
to during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be 
marked for identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. 

6



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. 

E.  Public comments. 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. 

H.  Closing comments by parties. 

I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. 

Close Quasi - Judicial Hearing 

Adopt City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2299 on first reading 

Resolutions - None 

Other Items 

11. Discussion and Possible Action: Request for Code Enforcement Lien 
Forgiveness for Daniel Ochs, buyer, or property at 301 NW Jefferson Street, 
located in District 12 (sponsored by Mayor Noah Walker) 

12. Discussion and Possible Action: Request for Code Enforcement Lien 
Forgiveness for Avery Bass, of property at 714 NW Alma Avenue, located in 
District 12 (sponsored by Council Member Tammy Harris) 

13. Discussion and Possible Action: Council to elect Vice-Mayor to serve the 
remainder of 2024 and for 2025 (Mayor Noah Walker) 

14. Don Rosenthal, City Manager, Six-Month Evaluation 

Departmental Administration 

15. Four Day Work Week Proposal - PowerPoint Presentation (Human Resources 
Director BillieJo Bible and City Manager Don Rosenthal) 

Comments by Council Members 

Council Member Chevella Young  

Council Member Ricky Jernigan  

Council Member James Carter  

7



 
 
City Council Regular Session Agenda  December 02, 2024 

 
Council Member Tammy Harris 

Mayor Noah Walker 

Adjournment 

UPCOMING DATES OF INTEREST 

December 7, 2024 at 8:00 AM Farm Share: Free Food Drive at Lake City Police 
Department 

December 8, 2024 at 4:00 PM until 7:00 PM - Christmas Tree Celebration (Lighting of 
the Christmas Tree) - Olustee Park 

December 14, 2024 at 9:00 AM until 4:00 PM - Christmas in Columbia Holiday Market – 
Darby Pavilion/Wilson Park/Olustee Park 

December 14, 2024 at 6:00 p.m. Christmas Parade 

YouTube Information 

Members of the public may also view the meeting on our YouTube channel at: 
https://www.youtube.com/c/CityofLakeCity 
 

Pursuant to 286.0105, Florida Statutes, the City hereby advises the public if a person 
decides to appeal any decision made by the City with respect to any matter considered 
at its meetings or hearings, he or she will need a record of the proceedings, and that, 
for such purpose, he or she may need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 
proceedings is made, which record includes the testimony and evidence upon which 
the appeal is to be based.  

SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS:  Pursuant to 286.26, Florida Statutes, persons needing 
special accommodations to participate in these meetings should contact the City 
Manager’s Office at (386) 719-5768.   

8



File Attachments for Item:

1. Minutes - November 18, 2024 Regular Session

9



1 
 

REGULAR SESSION   MINUTES                CITY COUNCIL 
 
The City Council in and for the citizens of the City of Lake City, Florida, met in Regular Session, on 
November 18, 2024 beginning at 6:00 PM, in the City Council Chambers, located at City Hall 205 North 
Marion Avenue, Lake City, Florida. Members of the public also viewed the meeting on our YouTube 
Channel. 
 
EVENTS PRIOR TO MEETING – 4:30 PM to 5:30 PM - Reception to recognize outgoing Mayor 
Stephen Witt and Council Member Jake Hill, Jr. and to welcome new Mayor, Noah Walker, new 
Council District 12 Member Tammy Harris and Council District 13 Member James Carter. 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE  
 
INVOCATION – Council Member Ricky Jernigan 
 
ROLL CALL  
        

Mayor/Council Member   Stephen M. Witt 
City Council     Jake Hill, Jr. 

        Chevella Young 
        Ricky Jernigan 
        James Carter 
  City Attorney     Clay Martin  

  City Manager     Don Rosenthal  
Sergeant-at-Arms   Chief Gerald Butler 
City Clerk    Audrey Sikes 

 

APPRECIATION AWARD AND PROCLAMATION 

 

At this time Mayor Witt read aloud a proclamation for Jake Hill, Jr. and recognized his years of service 

as council member. Mayor Witt provided Mr. Hill with an appreciation plaque and key to the City. 

 

SWEARING IN CEREMONY 

 

At this time City Clerk Audrey Sikes swore in the following members to their respective roles: Noah 

Walker, Mayor; Tammy Harris, Council Member District 12; James Carter, Council Member District 

13. 

 

APPRECIATION AWARD AND PROCLAMATION 

 

At this time Mayor Walker read aloud a proclamation for Stephen Witt and recognized his years of 

service as Mayor and council member. Mayor Walker provided Mayor Witt with an appreciation 

plaque and a key to the City. Mayor Witt officially passed the gavel to Mayor Walker. 

 

Mayor Walker read the following into the record from a prepared statement: 

 

Good evening, everyone, it is with great honor and humility that I stand before you tonight as your 

Mayor of Lake City. This moment marks not just the beginning of my term but the continuation of our 

10



2 
 

collective commitment to serve our citizens, support our community, and shape the future of this great 

city together.  

 

I take this responsibility seriously and am committed to working within the boundaries of our city 

charter, alongside and through our City Manager, Mr. Don Rosenthal, to ensure that we achieve 

remarkable milestones for Lake City. To my fellow council members, I am excited to be among you, 

and I also encourage you to embrace this collaborative spirit as we express our vision and allow it to 

flow through administration to departments and employees so that we may all work together as one 

unified team. 

 

Our strength as a city lies in our unity. Each of us, elected officials, staff members, and citizens has a 

role to play in identifying and addressing the needs of our community. I encourage and welcome 

public participation, because I firmly believe that all of us working together are better than any one of 

us alone. 

 

As we embark on this journey, I want to make clear my commitment to dignity, professionalism and 

decorum in our council meetings. To ensure efficient and respectful proceedings, I ask that all 

communication to and from the dais be addressed through me, as Chair. This practice will help 

maintain order, transparency, and the highest standards of conduct as we conduct the public’s 

business. 

 

My focus remains steadfast on serving the interests of the citizens of Lake City, and I am committed 

to ensuring that every decision we make is in their best interest. Together, we have the opportunity to 

do great things. Let’s seize this moment to move forward as one community, united in purpose, and 

committed to quality of life. I am excited about the work ahead and the future we will build together. 

Thank you for your trust, your support, and your dedication to Lake City. 

 

After Mayor Walker read his statement, a short break was taken from 6:21 – 6:31 PM. 

 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

 

Mr. Jernigan made a motion to approve the agenda as presented. Mr. Carter seconded the 

motion and the motion carried unanimously on a voice vote. 

 

PUBLIC PARTICIPATION – PERSONS WISHING TO ADDRESS COUNCIL  

 

 Glenel Bowden 

 

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA 

 

1. Minutes - November 4, 2024 Regular Session 

 

2. City Council Resolution No. 2024-128 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

approving that certain amended and restated contract for Collection & Disposal 

Services for Solid Waste & Recycling between the City and Waste Pro of Florida, Inc., a 

Florida Corporation; making certain findings of fact in support of the City approving said 

amended and restated contract; recognizing the authority of the Mayor to execute and 

11



3 
 

bind the City to said amended and restated contract; directing the Mayor to execute and 

bind the City to said amended and restated contract; repealing all prior resolutions in 

conflict; and providing an effective date. 

 

3. City Council Resolution No. 2024-130 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

approving that certain agreement between the City and NUE Urban Concepts, LLC, a 

Florida Limited Liability Company, for Mobility Fee Consulting Services; making certain 

findings of fact in support of the City approving said agreement; recognizing the 

authority of the Mayor to execute and bind the City to said agreement; directing the 

Mayor to execute and bind the City to said agreement; repealing all prior resolutions in 

conflict; and providing an effective date. 

 

4. City Council Resolution No. 2024-133 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

approving that certain amendment to the Public Transportation Grant Agreement 

between the City and State of Florida Department of Transportation for additional funds 

in the amount of $430,833.00 for the design and construction of a hangar building at 

Lake City Gateway Airport; finding the City is eligible for and requested a Rural 

Economic Development Initiative Waiver pursuant to Florida Statute 288.0656; making 

certain findings of fact in support of the City approving said amended agreement; 

recognizing the authority of the Mayor to execute and bind the City to said amended 

agreement; directing the Mayor to execute and bind the City to said amended 

agreement; repealing all prior resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date. 

 

5. City Council Resolution No. 2024-134 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

approving that certain Public Transportation Grant Agreement between the City and the 

Florida Department of Transportation relating to Project No. 411574-8-94-01; providing 

for the design and construction of the North Hangar Development Taxiway at the Lake 

City Gateway Airport; finding the City is eligible for and has requested a Rural Economic 

Development Initiative Waiver pursuant to Florida Statute 288.0656; making certain 

findings of fact in support of the City approving said agreement; recognizing the 

authority of the Mayor to execute and bind the City to said agreement; directing the 

Mayor, as appropriate, to execute and bind the City to said agreement; repealing all 

prior resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date. 

 

6. City Council Resolution No. 2024-135 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

accepting the donation of a vehicle from the State's Attorney's Office of the Third 

Judicial Circuit for use by the Lake City Police Department; making certain findings of 

fact in support of the City accepting said donation; recognizing the authority of the 

Mayor to execute such documents as are necessary to transfer ownership of said 

vehicle to the City of Lake City for use by the Lake City Police Department; directing the 

Mayor to execute such documents as are necessary to transfer ownership of said 

vehicle to the City of Lake City for the use by the Lake City Police Department; 

repealing all prior resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date. 

 

 Mr. Carter made a motion to approve the consent agenda as presented. Ms. 

Young seconded the motion and the motion carried unanimously on a voice vote. 

 

12



4 
 

PRESENTATIONS – None  

 

OLD BUSINESS – None  

 

NEW BUSINESS 

 

 Ordinances 

 

 Open Quasi – Judicial Proceeding 

  

 At this time Attorney Clay Martin read from a prepared script. 

  

 Preliminary Matters (Attorney Clay Martin): 

 

 The City Attorney shall read the ordinance by title. 

 

7. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2294 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake 

City, Florida, amending the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of Lake City 

Comprehensive Plan, as amended; relating to an amendment of 50 or less acres of 

land, pursuant to an application, CPA 23-03, by Lance Jones as agent for the Law 

Offices of Travis Koon, the property owner of said acreage, under the Amendment 

Procedures established in Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as 

amended; providing for changing the Future Land Use Classification from Residential, 

Moderate Density (allowing up to 4 dwelling units per acre) and/or (Residential Medium, 

allowing up to eight dwelling units per acre) to Commercial of certain lands within the 

Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all 

ordinances in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This property is located at the 

corner of Baya Avenue and Main Boulevard) 

 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site 

visits), if any.  

 

Note: This disclosure applies to this ordinance and the next. 

 

Ms. Young  No 

Mr. Carter  No 

Mr. Jernigan  No 

Ms. Harris  No 

Mayor Walker No 

 

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City 

Attorney.  

 

Mr. Martin swore in Bryan Thomas of the Growth Management Department and Lance 

Jones as the representative of the applicant. 

 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

13



5 
 

  

 Growth Management entered the report attached as Exhibit A. 

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to 

during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for 

identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. Bryan Thomas provided a 

PowerPoint presentation. 

 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. Mr. Jones entered the application into 

the record. 

 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. Bryan Thomas and Executive Director of 

Utilities, Steve Brown. 

 

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. N/A 

 

E.  Public comments. None 

 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. N/A 

 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. N/A 

 

H.  Closing comments by parties. N/A 

 

I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. N/A 

 

Mr. Carter made a motion to approve City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2294 on 

first reading. Ms. Young seconded the motion. A roll call vote was taken and the 

motion carried. 

Mr. Carter  Aye 

Ms. Young  Aye 

Mr. Jernigan  Aye 

Ms. Harris  Aye 

Mayor Walker Aye 

 

8. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2295 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake 

City, Florida, amending the Official Zoning Atlas of the City of Lake City Land 

Development Regulations, as amended; relating to the rezoning of ten or less 

contiguous acres of land, pursuant to an application, Z 24-04, by Lance Jones as agent 

for the Law Offices of Travis Koon, the property owner of said acreage; providing for 

rezoning from Residential Single Family-2 (RSF-2) and/or Residential Office (RO) to 

Commercial General (CG) of certain lands within the Corporate Limits of the City of 

Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all ordinances in conflict; and 

14



6 
 

providing an effective date. (This property is located at the corner of Baya Avenue and 

Main Boulevard) 

 

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site 

visits), if any.  

 

Members answered this question with the previous ordinance. 

 

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City 

Attorney.  

 

Bryan Thomas and Lance Jones were still sworn in from the previous ordinance. 

 

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.  

 

Staff’s Exhibit A applies to this ordinance. 

 

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to 

during the testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for 

identification and kept by the Clerk for 30 days. 

 

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff. Bryan Thomas 

 

B.  Presentation of application by applicant. 

 

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff. 

 

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any. 

 

E.  Public comments. None 

 

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants. N/A 

 

G.  Questions of parties by City Council. N/A 

 

H.  Closing comments by parties. N/A 

 

I.   Instruction on law by attorney. 

 

J.  Discussion and action by City Council. 

 

Mr. Carter made a motion to approve City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2295 on 

first reading. Ms. Young seconded the motion. A roll call vote was taken and the 

motion carried. 

 

 

 

15



7 
 

Mr. Carter  Aye 

Ms. Young  Aye 

Mr. Jernigan  Aye 

Ms. Harris  Aye 

Mayor Walker Aye 

 

At this time, City Clerk, Audrey Sikes, announced the results from the November 5, 2024 

election relating to the referendum question on the ballot:  
 

The results of the November 5, 2024 election as submitted by the Columbia County Supervisor of 

Elections Office, are as follows: City of Lake City Referendum Question Relating to Mayoral and City 

Council Compensation: Yes for Approval 1,814 votes; No for Rejection 2,100 votes. 

 

 Resolutions 

 

9. City Council Resolution No. 2024-136 - A resolution of the City Council of the City of 

Lake City, Florida, accepting the November 5, 2024 election results from the 

referendum established by Ordinance No. 2024-2288 concerning City Council salaries; 

making certain findings of fact in support thereof; recognizing referendum question was 

not adopted; directing the City Clerk to reflect said election results in the records of the 

City as is necessary and prudent; making certain findings of fact in support of the City 

Clerk reflecting such election results in the records of the City; repealing all prior 

resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date. Mr. Jernigan made a motion to 

approve City Council Resolution No. 2024-136. Ms. Young seconded the motion. 

A roll call vote was taken and the motion carried. 

 

Mr. Jernigan  Aye 

Ms. Young  Aye 

Mr. Carter  Aye 

Ms. Harris  Aye 

Mayor Walker Aye 

 

 Other Items 

 

10. Discussion and Possible Action - appointment to Columbia County Tourist 

Development Council and appointment to North Central Florida Regional 

Planning Council  

 

Mr. Jernigan reported he would like to continue to serve on the Tourist 

Development Council, members concurred.  

 

Mr. Carter volunteered to serve on the North Central Florida Regional Planning 

Council, members concurred.  

 

DEPARTMENTAL ADMINISTRATION – None  

 

COMMENTS BY COUNCIL MEMBERS 

16



8 
 

 

Council Member Chevella Young – Ms. Young welcomed new members and stated she was looking 

forward to working with everyone. 

 

Council Member Ricky Jernigan – Mr. Jernigan welcomed new members and spoke on the 

importance of growing the City with new business. He commended Community Programs Director 

Terri Phillips on the Downtown BBQ Showdown. 

 

Council Member James Carter – Mr. Carter welcomed new members and thanked the following staff 

for their contributions to the Downtown BBQ Showdown: Public Works Department – Steve Brown; 

Luther Milton; Mike Grisson; Jim Furman; K’Hiry Sirmans; Gerald Minter; Quincy Jones; Scott Ruise 

Jr.; Scott Ruise Sr.; Allen Smedley; Shelby Waldron; Jaquez Reddic; Timmy Harrell; Kim Moore. 

Distribution & Collections – Brian Scott; Austin Mayo; Mark Witt; Austin Polbos; Hayden Johnson; 

Chris Lund. Mr. Carter also thanked Tina Roberts for the flower arrangements she provided. 

 

Council Member Tammy Harris – Ms. Harris thanked the voters, City Clerk Audrey Sikes, and City 

Manager Don Rosenthal for their assistance. She also thanked members for the support of the 

Richardson Community Cheerleaders, spoke to the homeless issue the City is facing, and inquired 

about the railroad crossing repair. Ms. Harris commended Executive Director of Utilities, Steve Brown 

on keeping the City clean. 

 

Mayor Noah Walker – Mayor Walker commended Community Programs Director, Terri Phillips on a 

successful Downtown BBQ Showdown, as well as Public Works on hurricane storm cleanup, and the 

Lake City Police Department. Mayor Walker also announced there would be a free Farm Share Event 

on December 7, 2024, and reminded members there would be a council photo session on December 

2, 2024 at 5:00 PM. 

 

ADJOURNMENT 

 

Mr. Jernigan made a motion to adjourn at 7:16 PM. Ms. Young seconded the motion. 

 

 

________________________________               

 Noah E. Walker, Mayor/Council Member 

 

____________________________ 

Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 

 

 

 

 

 

 

17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65



66



67



68



69



70



71



72



73



74



75



76



77



78



79



80



81



82



83



84



85



86



87



88



89



90



91



92



93



94



95



96



97



98



99



100



101



102



103



104



105



106



107



108



109



110



111



112



113



114



115



116



117



118



119



120



121



122



123



124



125



126



127



128



129



130



131



132



133



134



135



136



137



138



139



140



141



142



143



144



145



146



147



148



149



150



151



152



153



154



155



156



157



158



159



160



161



162



163



164



165



166



167



168



169



170



171



172



173



174



175



176



177



178



179



180



File Attachments for Item:

2. City Council Resolution No. 2024-137 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

nominating Ricky Jernigan to serve on the Columbia County Tourism Development Council; 

making findings of fact in support thereof; directing the City Clerk to communicate such 

nomination to the Columbia County Board of Commissioners; repealing all prior resolutions in 

conflict; and providing an effective date.

181



 
 
 
CM/rrp 
11/20/2024 

Page 1 of 2 

RESOLUTION NO 2024-137 
CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA NOMINATING 
RICKY JERNIGAN TO SERVE ON THE COLUMBIA COUNTY TOURISM 
DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL; MAKING FINDINGS OF FACT IN SUPPORT 
THEREOF; DIRECTING THE CITY CLERK TO COMMUNICATE SUCH 
NOMINATION TO THE COLUMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF 
COMMISSIONERS; REPEALING ALL PRIOR RESOLUTIONS IN CONFLICT; 
AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

WHEREAS, the Columbia County Tourist Development Council (the "Council") was established 
by the Board of County Commissioners of Columbia County, Florida, in accordance with 
Chapter 125, Florida Statutes, to promote tourism and the development of the county's 
tourism industry; and  

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners (the “BOCC”) is imbued with the authority to 
appoint members to the Council as established under applicable state law and local 
ordinances, and 

WHEREAS, the City of Lake City (the ”City”) has nominated City Councilmember Ricky Jernigan 
to serve on the Council; and 

WHEREAS, recognizing the nomination of the foregoing individual to the Council is in the 
public interest and in the interests of the City; now therefore 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Lake City, Florida: 

1. Recognizing the nomination of City Councilmember Ricky Jernigan for appointment to the 
Council by the Columbia County Board of Commissioners is in the public or community 
interest and for public welfare; and 

2. The City Clerk is directed to reflect such nomination to the Columbia County Board of 
Commissioners in the official records of the City; and  

3. The City Clerk is further directed to communicate such nomination to the appropriate 
party at the Columbia County Board of Commissioners; and 

4. All prior resolutions of the City Council of the City of Lake City in conflict with this 
resolution are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict; and 

182



 
    
City of Lake City, Florida  Columbia County Tourist Development Council 
Resolution 2024-137  Nomination of Ricky Jernigan 
 

 

Page 2 of 2 

5. This resolution shall become effective and enforceable upon final passage by the City 
Council of the City of Lake City. 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED, by an affirmative vote of a majority of a quorum present of the 
City Council of the City of Lake City, Florida, at a regular meeting, this ___ day of December, 
2024. 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

183



File Attachments for Item:

3. City Council Resolution No. 2024-138 - A resolution of the City of Lake City, Florida, 

appointing James Carter to serve on the North Central Florida Regional Planning Council; 

making findings of fact in support thereof; directing the City Clerk to reflect said appointment in

such records of the City as are necessary and prudent; directing the City Clerk to communicate 

such appointment to the North Central Florida Regional Planning Council; repealing all prior 

resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective date.

184



CM/rrp 
11/20/2024 

Page 1 of 2 

RESOLUTION NO 2024-138 
CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA APPOINTING JAMES 
CARTER TO SERVE ON THE NORTH CENTRAL FLORIDA REGIONAL PLANNING 
COUNCIL; MAKING FINDINGS OF FACT IN SUPPORT THEREOF; DIRECTING 
THE CITY CLERK TO REFLECT SAID APPOINTMENT IN SUCH RECORDS OF THE 
CITY AS ARE NECESSARY AND PRUDENT; DIRECTING THE CITY CLERK TO 
COMMUNICATE SUCH APPOINTMENT TO THE NORTH CENTRAL FLORIDA 
REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCIL; REPEALING ALL PRIOR RESOLUTIONS IN 
CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

WHEREAS, the North Central Florida Regional Planning Council (the “NCFRPC”) in partnership 
with economic development organizations and local governments, promotes regional 
strategies, partnerships and solutions to strengthen the economic competitiveness and 
quality of life of the 12 counties and 40 incorporated municipalities in the north central Florida 
region; and  

WHEREAS, the NCFRPC is comprised of members from local governments and gubernatorial 
appointees; and 

WHEREAS, the seat on the NCFRPC representing the City of Lake City (the “City”) is now vacant 
as a result of the retirement of former Mayor Stephen Witt; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council is imbued with the authority to appoint a new member to 
represent the City on the NCFRPC; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to appoint Councilman James Carter to represent the City 
on the NCFRPC; and 

WHEREAS, appointing the foregoing individual to the NCFRPC is in the public interest and in 
the interests of the City; now therefore 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Lake City, Florida: 

1. Appointing Councilman James Carter to the NCFRPC is in the public or community interest 
and for public welfare; and 

2. The City Clerk is directed to reflect such appointment to the NCFRPC in the official records 
of the City; and 

3. The City Clerk if further directed to communicate such appointment to the appropriate 
party at the NCFRPC; and 

4. All prior resolutions of the City Council of the City of Lake City in conflict with this 
resolution are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict; and 

5. This resolution shall become effective and enforceable upon final passage by the City 
Council of the City of Lake City. 

185



 
  North Central Florida Regional  
City of Lake City, Florida  Planning Council (NCFRPC) 
Resolution 2024-138  Appointment of James Carter 
 

 

Page 2 of 2 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED, by an affirmative vote of a majority of a quorum present of the 
City Council of the City of Lake City, Florida, at a regular meeting, this ___ day of December, 
2024. 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

186



File Attachments for Item:

4. City Council Resolution No. 2024-139 - A resolution of the City Council of the City of Lake City,

Florida, authorizing the renewal of the Third Judicial Circuit Mutual Aid Agreement between the

Police Departments located in the Third Judicial Circuit of Florida; making certain findings of 

fact in support of the City renewing said agreement; recognizing the authority of the Mayor to 

execute and bind the City to said renewal agreement; recognizing the authority of the Chief of 

Police to execute and bind the City to said renewal agreement; directing the Mayor to execute 

and bind the City to said renewal agreement; directing the Chief of Police to execute the City to 

said renewal agreement; repealing all prior resolutions in conflict; and providing an effective 

date.

187



 
 
CM/rrp 
11/19/2024 

Page 1 of 2 
 

 

RESOLUTION NO 2024 – 139 
 CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA  

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, 
AUTHORIZING THE RENEWAL OF THE THIRD JUDICIAL CIRCUIT MUTUAL AID 
AGREEMENT BETWEEN POLICE DEPARTMENTS LOCATED IN THE THIRD 
JUDICIAL CIRCUIT OF FLORIDA; MAKING CERTAIN FINDINGS OF FACT IN 
SUPPORT OF THE CITY RENEWING SAID AGREEMENT; RECOGNIZING THE 
AUTHORITY OF THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE AND BIND TO SAID RENEWAL 
AGREEMENT; RECOGNIZING THE AUTHORITY OF THE CHIEF OF POLICE TO 
EXECUTE TO SAID RENEWAL AGREEMENT; DIRECTING THE MAYOR TO 
EXECUTE AND BIND THE CITY TO SAID RENEWAL AGREEMENT; DIRECTING 
THE CHIEF OF POLICE TO EXECUTE THE CITY TO SAID RENEWAL AGREEMENT; 
REPEALING ALL PRIOR RESOLUTIONS IN CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN 
EFFECTIVE DATE. 

WHEREAS, the City of Lake City, Florida (the “City”) and the municipalities located in the Third 
Judicial Circuit and the Sheriffs of the counties within the Third Judicial Circuit (the “Law 
Enforcement Agencies”) are parties to that certain Third Judicial Circuit Mutual Aid Agreement 
(the “Agreement”); and  

WHEREAS, the Agreement is set to expire on December 31, 2024, as specified in Resolution 2024-
003; and  

WHEREAS, the City and the Law Enforcement Agencies have mutually agreed to extend and 
renew the Agreement in order to continue its terms and conditions through December 31, 2025; 

WHEREAS, the Law Enforcement Agencies are so located in relation to each other that it is to the 
advantage of each to receive and extend mutual aid in the form of law enforcement services and 
resources to adequately respond to continuing, multi-jurisdictional law enforcement problems 
so as to protect the public peace and safety, and preserve the lives and property of the people, 
and intensive situations, including but not limited to, emergencies as defined under Section 
252.34, Florida Statutes; and 

WHEREAS, the Law Enforcement Agencies have the authority under Section 23.12, Florida 
Statutes, et seq, The Florida Mutual Aid Act, to enter into a combined mutual aid agreement for 
law enforcement service which permits voluntary cooperation and assistance of a routine law 
enforcement nature across jurisdictional lines, and provides for the rendering of assistance in law 
enforcement emergencies as defined in Section 252.34, Florida Statutes; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds renewing and extending the Agreement is in the public or 
community interest and for public welfare pursuant to and in accordance with the terms and 
conditions of the Agreement, a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part of this 
resolution; now therefore 

 

188



 
 
City of Lake City, Florida  Third Judicial Circuit  
Resolution 2024-139  Mutual Aid Agreement Renewal 
   

 

Page 2 of 2 
 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Lake City, Florida: 

1. Renewing and extending the Agreement in order to continue its terms and conditions through 
December 31, 2025 is in the public or community interest and for public welfare; and 

2. In furtherance thereof, the Agreement in the form of the Exhibit attached hereto should be 
and is approved by the City Council of the City of Lake City; and 

3. The Mayor of the City of Lake City and the Chief of Police are authorized and directed to 
execute on behalf of and bind the City to the terms of the Agreement; and 

4. All prior resolutions of the City Council of the City of Lake City in conflict with this resolution 
are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict; and 

5. This resolution shall become effective and enforceable upon final passage by the City Council 
of the City of Lake City. 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED, by an affirmative vote of a majority of a quorum present of the City 
Council of the City of Lake City, Florida, at a regular meeting, this ___ day of December, 2024. 

 
 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
____________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
____________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

 

189



190



191



192



193



194



195



196



197



198



199



200

robyn
Typewritten Text
EXHIBIT-NOT FOR EXECUTION

robyn
Typewritten Text
EXHIBIT-NOT FOR EXECUTION



File Attachments for Item:

5. IEMO Certificate of Completion from the Florida League of Cities to Council Member Chevella

Young and Council Member Tammy Harris (Mayor Noah Walker) 

201



202



203



File Attachments for Item:

6. John Cole - Kids Feeding Kids PowerPoint Presentation

204



KIDS FEEDING KIDS

205



OUR HISTORY
The program began in 2014 and was
founded by my father John L Cole Jr.
One of his students held up a potato
he had grown at school and said “Hey

Mr Cole I can feed my family with
this!”

So he thought about it and said maybe
every school can do this.

His belief was that hungry kids can’t
learn as well as kids who have food.

206



OUR HISTORY
16 million kids in the us alone do not know where their

next meal is going to come from and the only time
they eat a meal is at school.

He also started the BackPack
program that has been

successful in the schools
even today.

He worked closely with different
organizations like Kiwanis Club, FFA,

4H, and University of Florida
extension offices.

207



“Don’t Mow it,
Grow it.”

THE PROGRAMS MOTO

208



He passed away in 2020 of cancer.
 The last year of his life, we spent a lot of time

together and one of his wishes for me was to continue
his program and build it into something that would

help so many people.

It was big shoes to fill but I took his wishes and have
continued to grow the program to what we are today.

209



His biggest goal was to open an
Agricultural Education Center

That is still our plan as of today and will
always be the goal.

210



OUR ACCOMPLISHMENTS
Since taking it over, we have added new chapters to

the program.
We decided right after he passed away, to start

annual giveaways.
He passed away in November and everyone wanted to
really help me take off with the program so we picked
about 10 families I believe to help for Thanksgiving and

we had 25 kids we gave presents to for Christmas

211



We are now in our 4th year and we will have helped
over 100 families for Thanksgiving and will help about

100 kids for Christmas.
This year will be helping over 200 families for

Thanksgiving and 200 kids for Christmas.

212



213



In 2021 we decided to begin a thrift store to help fund the events
and our plans for the ag center.

It started with a small 1200sq ft building and within a year we had
to move to a much larger location which is 4500sq ft now.

214



The store has not only been a source for our program events but
has been a ministry in helping thousands through the years with

clothing, food, school supplies and we also give away prom dresses
every year to young ladies who you don’t have the ability to buy

expensive dresses.

215



We work with United Way, DCF, Meridian, and Suwannee Valley 4Cs
plus the public schools when families are in need for clothing, food
and more. We also work with Juvenile Justice to help these young
people get their community hours and coach them to find better

ways in life to go.

Our reputation is growing within the justice system
because the kids are doing really well with us.

216



We’ve also recently found a supplier in Jacksonville who brings us
pallets of food to give away which we have done a number of times.

Our newest venture was we brought a U-Haul and two cargo
trailers of supplies to North Carolina after Helene destroyed their

towns.

We spend time in Swannanoa and Asheville helping serve the
community.

We just got back from Siesta Key and Sarasota where we served
food to the local citizens and law enforcement.

217



218



OUR FUTURE
One of our biggest obstacles has been starting the

agriculture. We can only do so much at the thrift store.
I have taught small classes locally to help kids learn

gardening in the past few years.
Our plan has been to begin and sustain a community garden. 

219



OUR FUTURE
We have been consistently looking for a place to begin this and our
heart has always been to have a place that people can come pick
their food off of the plants and also have other things for the

community.
This community garden will be a place for people who can’t afford
food to come and get what they need to feed their families. But

also to have the youth come and learn to grow their own food for
their families.

There’s nothing more amazing than seeing our food come from
just a small seed.

220



The plan as we begin this community garden is to
start right away with using the grant which is up
to $10,000 from Target to supply the garden with

everything needed to begin growing.
Here are the phases for both kinds of gardening.

221



OUR FUTURE
The first one are vertical hydroponic towers which we have

currently.
This will be a way to teach the young people how to grow food

50% faster with 90% less water.
The second one is our youth gardens. This will be more traditional

gardening.

222



OUR FUTURE

223



OUR FUTURE
This area will be where the kids will learn and grow different

vegetables, fruits and edible flowers and herbs.
We will also have areas for landscaping plants and camp like areas

to have classes for their horticulture certifications.
I believe with the land here we’ll also have room for a storage shed
for a food pantry and one for clothing to give away when needed.

The space left will be for more gardens like potatoes and other
vegetables 

224



OUR FUTURE
Our plan is to work with home school kids during the day time and

have after school classes during the week, along with Saturday
classes and events.

Once the food is grown we will start having U Pick it days for
families to come out and gather the food.

The kids that help us will have their own gardens to pick from as
well.

We will also have the food pantry for families when needed as well
as clothing pantry supplied from donations at our thrift store.

225



This is just a small part of our vision and ministry. 
We are asking the City to help us bring some relief to

families in our community and teach these kids
something positive that has proven to help them find

careers in Agriculture and farming.

226



FOR LISTENING!
Thank You

227



File Attachments for Item:

7. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2294 (final reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake City, 

Florida, amending the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of Lake City Comprehensive Plan, 

as amended; relating to an amendment of 50 or less acres of land, pursuant to an application, 

CPA 24-03, by Lance Jones as agent for the Law Offices of Travis Koon, the property owner of 

said acreage, under the amendment procedures established in Sections 163.3161 through 

163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended; providing for changing the Future Land Use 

Classification from Residential, Moderate Density (allowing up to 4 dwelling unites per acre) 

and/or (Residential Medium, allowing up to eight dwelling units per acre) to Commercial of 

certain lands within the Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; 

repealing all ordinances in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This property is located at 

the corner of Baya Avenue and Main Boulevard)

Passed on first reading 11/18/24

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site visits), if any.

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City Attorney.

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to during the 

testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for identification 

and kept by the Clerk for 30 days.

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff.

B.  Presentation of application by applicant.

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff.

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any.

E.  Public comments.

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants.

G.  Questions of parties by City Council.

H.  Closing comments by parties.

I.   Instruction on law by attorney.

J.  Discussion and action by City Council.

228



Page 1 of 6 

1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 
9 

10 
11 
12 
13 
14 
15 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-2294 

CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AMENDING 
THE FUTURE LAND USE PLAN MAP OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY 
COMPREHENSIVE PLAN, AS AMENDED; RELATING TO AN 
AMENDMENT OF 50 OR LESS ACRES OF LAND, PURSUANT TO AN 
APPLICATION, CPA 24-03, BY LANCE JONES AS AGENT FOR THE 
LAW OFFICES OF TRAVIS KOON THE PROPERTY OWNER OF SAID 
ACREAGE, UNDER THE AMENDMENT PROCEDURES ESTABLISHED 
IN SECTIONS 163.3161 THROUGH 163.3248, FLORIDA STATUTES, 
AS AMENDED; PROVIDING FOR CHANGING THE FUTURE LAND 
USE CLASSIFICATION FROM RESIDENTIAL, MODERATE DENSITY 
(ALLOWING UP TO 4 DWELLING UNITS PER ACRE) AND/OR 
(RESIDENTIAL MEDIUM, ALLOWING UP TO EIGHT DWELLING 
UNITS PER ACRE) TO COMMERCIAL OF CERTAIN LANDS WITHIN 
THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA; 
PROVIDING SEVERABILITY; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN 
CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE 16 

WHEREAS, Section 166.021, Florida Statutes, as amended, empowers the City Council of 17 
the City of Lake City, Florida, (the “City Council”), to prepare, adopt and implement a 18 
Comprehensive Plan; and 19 

WHEREAS, Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, the 20 
Community Planning Act, empowers and requires the City Council to prepare, adopt and 21 
implement a Comprehensive Plan; and 22 

WHEREAS, an application, CPA 24-03, for an amendment to the Future Land Use Plan Map 23 
of the City of Lake City’s Comprehensive Plan, as described below, has been filed with the 24 
City of Lake City (the “City”) by Lance Jones as agent for The Law Offices of Travis Koon the 25 
property owner; and 26 

WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Board of the City of Lake City, Florida, (the “Planning 27 
and Zoning Board”) has been designated as the Local Planning Agency of the City of Lake 28 
City, Florida, (the “Local Planning Agency”); and 29 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 163.3174, Florida Statutes, as amended, and the Land 30 
Development Regulations, the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local 31 
Planning Agency, held the required public hearing, with public notice having been provided, 32 
on said application for an amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the 33 
Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, reviewed and 34 

229



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2294  Application CPA-24-03 
  Parcel No. 13898-00,13905-000, 13906-000, and 14072-001 

 

Page 2 of 6 

considered all comments received during said public hearing and the Concurrency 35 
Management Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described 36 
below, to the Future Land Use Map of the City’s Comprehensive Plan and recommended 37 
to the City Council’s approval of said application for amendment, as described below, to 38 
the Future Land Use Map of the City’s Comprehensive Plan; and 39 

WHEREAS, the City Council held the required public hearings, with public notice having 40 
been provided, under the procedures established in Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, 41 
Florida Statutes, as amended, on said application for an amendment, as described below, 42 
and at said public hearings, the City Council reviewed and considered all comments 43 
received during said public hearing, including the recommendation of the Planning and 44 
Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, and the Concurrency Management 45 
Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described below; and 46 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found said application for an amendment, 47 
as described below, to be compatible with the Land Use Element objectives and policies, 48 
and those of other affected elements of the Comprehensive Plan; and 49 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found that approval of said application for 50 
an amendment, as described below, would promote the public health, safety, morals, 51 
order, comfort, convenience, appearance, prosperity or general welfare; now, therefore, 52 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS: 53 

1. Pursuant to an application, CPA 24-03, submitted by Lance Jones of Jones Engineering 54 
and Consulting, LLC, as agent for The Law Offices of Travis Koon, PLLC, to amend the 55 
Future Land Use Plan Map of the Comprehensive Plan by changing the future land use 56 
classification of certain lands, the area of such lands being 50 acres or less, such future 57 
land use classification on such lands is hereby changed from RESIDENTIAL, MODERATE 58 
DENSITY (ALLOWING UP TO 4 DWELLING UNITS PER ACRE) AND/OR (RESIDENTIAL MEDIUM, 59 
ALLOWING UP TO EIGHT DWELLING UNITS PER ACRE) TO COMMERCIAL on property 60 
described, as follows: 61 

PARCEL 13898-000 (FROM DEED): 62 
 
LOTS 1 AND 2, BLOCK 2, BAKER HEIGHTS SUBDIVISION, A SUBDIVISION 63 
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2 PAGE 64 
104 OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA. 65 
 
PARCELS 13905-000, 13906-000, AND 14072-001 (FROM SURVEYOR): 66 

230



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2294  Application CPA-24-03 
  Parcel No. 13898-00,13905-000, 13906-000, and 14072-001 

 

Page 3 of 6 

 
LOTS 1 AND 2, BLOCK 3, BAKER HEIGHTS, A SUBDIVISION OF PART OF THE 67 
NORTHWEST 1/4 OF THE SOUTHWEST 1/4 OF SECTION 32, TOWNSHIP 3 68 
SOUTH, RANGE 17 EAST, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED 69 
IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 104, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA 70 
COUNTY, FLORIDA, LESS AND EXCEPT THE RIGHT OF WAY FOR STATE ROAD 71 
NO. 25 (SOUTH FIRST STREET). 72 
 
ALSO  73 
 
BEGIN AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SAID LOT 2 AND RUN S 26°12'12" 74 
E, 150.00 FEET ALONG THE WEST LINE OF SAID LOT 2; THENCE N 63°47'48" 75 
E, 88.28 FEET ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOT 2 TO THE WEST RIGHT 76 
OF WAY LINE OF STATE ROAD 25; THENCE S 01°08'30" E, 25.50 FEET TO ITS 77 
INTERSECTION WITH THE NORTHERLY EDGE OF A CONCRETE PAVED 78 
DITCH; THENCE S 79°58'48" W ALONG SAID NORTHERLY EDGE OF SAID 79 
CONCRETE PAVED DITCH 152.23 FEET; THENCE S 89°55'41" W STILL ALONG 80 
SAID NORTHERLY EDGE OF A CONCRETE DITCH 97.11 FEET TO ITS 81 
INTERSECTION WITH THE EASTERLY LINE OF LAKE VILLA ADDITION NO. 3; 82 
THENCE N 00°29'44" W ALONG SAID EASTERLY LINE OF LAKE VILLA 83 
ADDITION NO. 3 A DISTANCE OF 97.31 FEET TO THE SOUTH LINE OF EL 84 
PRADO STREET; THENCE N 63°47'48" E ALONG SAID SOUTH LINE OF EL 85 
PRADO STREET 113.58 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. 86 
 
PARCEL 2: 87 
 
COMMENCE AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF LOT 2, BLOCK 3, BAKER 88 
HEIGHTS, IN SECTION 32, TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 17 EAST, AS 89 
RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 104, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF 90 
COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND RUN S 63°47'48" W ALONG SOUTH 91 
LINE OF EL PRADO STREET 113.58 FEET TO A CONCRETE MONUMENT; 92 
THENCE S 00°29'44" E, 112.96 FEET TO THE SOUTH EDGE OF A CONCRETE 93 
PAVED DITCH AND THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE N 89°39'15" E, 94 
88.62 FEET ALONG SAID SOUTH EDGE OF A CONCRETE DITCH; THENCE N 95 
77°48'44" E, 162.14 FEET STILL ALONG SAID CONCRETE DITCH, POINT ALSO 96 
BEING ON THE WEST RIGHT OF WAY LINE OF STATE ROAD #25 (FIRST 97 
STREET); THENCE S 01°08'30" E ALONG WEST LINE OF SAID STATE ROAD 98 
#25 A DISTANCE OF 9.06 FEET; THENCE S 16°11'04" E ALONG SAID WEST 99 
RIGHT OF WAY LINE 165.68 FEET TO A CONCRETE MONUMENT; THENCE N 100 

231



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2294  Application CPA-24-03 
  Parcel No. 13898-00,13905-000, 13906-000, and 14072-001 

 

Page 4 of 6 

88°51'26" E, 3 FEET ALONG SAID RIGHT OF WAY TO A CONCRETE 101 
MONUMENT; THENCE S 01°08'30" E STILL ALONG SAID RIGHT OF WAY LINE 102 
A DISTANCE OF 100.87 FEET TO A CONCRETE MONUMENT AND TO THE 103 
NORTH LINE OF LAKE VILLA SUBDIVISION, BLOCK 1, THENCE S 89°39'15" 104 
W, 296.43 FEET ALONG SAID NORTH LINE OF LAKE VILLA, BLOCK 1 TO A 105 
CONCRETE MONUMENT BEING ON THE EAST LINE OF LAKE VILLA 106 
ADDITION NO. 3; THENCE N 00°29'64" W ALONG SAID EAST LINE OF LAKE 107 
VILLA ADDITION NO. 3 A DISTANCE OF 236.00 FEET TO THE SOUTH EDGE 108 
OF A CONCRETE PAVED DITCH AND TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. 109 
 
LESS AND EXCEPT ANY PORTIONS OF PARCELS 1 AND 2 LYING IN RIGHT OF 110 
WAY RECORDED IN DEED BOOK 64, PAGE 65; OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 111 
352, PAGE 69 AND OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 896, PAGE 2053, OF THE 112 
PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA. 113 
 
PARCEL 3: 114 
 
LOT NO. 2, BLOCK NO. 10, LAKE VILLAS ADDITION NO. 3, A SUBDIVISION 115 
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 116 
108-E, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA. 117 
 
LESS AND EXCEPT THAT PARCEL CONVEYED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 118 
1139, PAGE 2248 AND BEING MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AS 119 
FOLLOWS: COMMENCE AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF LOT 2, BLOCK 10, 120 
LAKE VILLAS ADDITION #3, A SUBDIVISION ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 121 
THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 108-E OF THE PUBLIC 122 
RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA AND RUN THENCE N 49°13'59" 123 
W, ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOT 2, 1.43 FEET TO THE POINT OF 124 
BEGINNING; THENCE CONTINUE N 49°13'59" W, ALONG SAID SOUTH 125 
LINE,150.97 FEET TO THE WEST LINE OF SAID LOT 2; THENCE N 40°24'17" 126 
E, ALONG SAID WEST LINE 148.50 FEET; THENCE S 49°11'49" E, 70.65 FEET; 127 
THENCE S 56°21'25" E, 34.05 FEET TO A POINT ON A CURVE; THENCE RUN 128 
SOUTHERLY ALONG THE ARC OF SAID CURVE CONCAVE TO THE EAST 129 
HAVING A RADIUS OF 165.00 FEET, A CENTRAL ANGLE OF 24°47'13", A 130 
CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE OF S 17°44'37" W, 70.83 FEET, AN ARC 131 
DISTANCE OF 71.38 FEET TO A POINT OF REVERSE CURVE; THENCE RUN 132 
SOUTHERLY ALONG THE ARC OF SAID CURVE CONCAVE TO THE WEST 133 
HAVING A RADIUS OF 115.00 FEET, A CENTRAL ANGLE OF 45°51'37", A 134 
CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE OF S 28°16'49" W, 89.61 FEET, AN ARC 135 

232



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2294  Application CPA-24-03 
  Parcel No. 13898-00,13905-000, 13906-000, and 14072-001 

 

Page 5 of 6 

DISTANCE OF 92.05 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. 136 
 

2. If any provision or portion of this ordinance is declared by any court of competent 137 
jurisdiction to be void, unconstitutional or unenforceable, then all remaining provisions 138 
and portions of this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect. 139 

3. All ordinances or portions of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby 140 
repealed to the extent of such conflict. 141 

4. This ordinance shall be effective upon adoption, subject to the following: 142 

The effective date of this plan amendment shall be thirty-one (31) days 143 
following the date of adoption of this plan amendment.  However, if any 144 
affected person files a petition with the Florida Division of Administrative 145 
Hearings pursuant to Section 120.57, Florida Statutes, as amended, to 146 
request a hearing to challenge the compliance of this plan amendment 147 
with Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, 148 
within thirty (30) days following the date of adoption of this plan 149 
amendment, this plan amendment shall not become effective until 150 
Florida Commerce or the Florida Administration Commission, 151 
respectively, issues a final order determining this plan amendment is in 152 
compliance.  No development orders, development permits or land uses 153 
dependent on this plan amendment may be issued or commence before 154 
it has become effective.  If a final order of noncompliance is issued, this 155 
plan amendment may nevertheless be made effective by adoption of a 156 
resolution affirming its effective status, a copy of which resolution shall 157 
be sent to Florida Commerce, Division of Community Development, 107 158 
East Madison Street, Caldwell Building, First Floor, Tallahassee, Florida 159 
32399-4120. 160 

5. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by Section 166.021, Florida 161 
Statutes, as amended, and Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as 162 
amended.  163 

APPROVED, UPON THE FIRST READING, by the City Council of the City of Lake City at a 164 
regular meeting, on the 18th day of November, 2024. 165 

PUBLICLY NOTICED, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of Lake City, Florida, 166 
by the City Clerk of the City of Lake City, Florida on the ____ day of _________________, 167 
2024. 168 

233



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2294  Application CPA-24-03 
  Parcel No. 13898-00,13905-000, 13906-000, and 14072-001 

 

Page 6 of 6 

APPROVED UPON THE SECOND READING, AND ADOPTED ON FINAL PASSAGE, by an 169 
affirmative vote of a majority of a quorum present of the Lake City City Council, at a regular 170 
meeting this ____ day of ___________________, 2024. 171 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 
 

234



235



236



237



238



239



240



241



242



243



244



245



246



247



248



249



250



251



1 
 

Business Impact Estimate 

Proposed ordinance’s title/reference: 
 
Ordinance 2024-2294- Amending the Future Land Use Map of The City of Lake City 
 

 
This Business Impact Estimate is provided in accordance with section 166.041(4), Florida 
Statutes. If one or more boxes are checked below, this means the City is of the view that 
a business impact estimate is not required by state law1 for the proposed ordinance. This 
Business Impact Estimate may be revised following its initial posting. 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required for compliance with Federal or State law or 

regulation; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the issuance or refinancing of debt; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the adoption of budgets or budget 

amendments, including revenue sources necessary to fund the budget; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required to implement a contract or an agreement, 

including, but not limited to, any Federal, State, local, or private grant or other 
financial assistance accepted by the municipal government; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is an emergency ordinance; 

☐  The ordinance relates to procurement; or 

☒  The proposed ordinance is enacted to implement the following: 

a. Part II of Chapter 163, Florida Statutes, relating to growth policy, county and 
municipal planning, and land development regulation, including zoning, 
development orders, development agreements and development permits; 

b. Sections 190.005 and 190.046, Florida Statutes, regarding community 
development districts; 

c. Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Building Code; or 
d. Section 633.202, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

 
  

                                                           
1 See Section 166.041(4)(c), Florida Statutes. 

252



File Attachments for Item:

8. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2295 (final reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake City, 

Florida, amending the Official Zoning Atlas of the City of Lake City Land Development 

Regulations, as amended; relating to the rezoning of ten or less contiguous acres of land, 

pursuant to an application, Z 24-04, by Lance Jones as agent for the Law Offices of Travis Koon, 

the property owner of said acreage; providing for rezoning from Residential Single Family-2 

(RSF-2) and/or Residential Office (RO) to Commercial General (CG) of certain lands within the 

Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all ordinances 

in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This property is located at the corner of Baya 

Avenue and Main Boulevard)

Passed on first reading 11/18/24

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site visits), if any.

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City Attorney.

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to during the 

testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for identification 

and kept by the Clerk for 30 days.

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff.

B.  Presentation of application by applicant.

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff.

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any.

E.  Public comments.

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants.

G.  Questions of parties by City Council.

H.  Closing comments by parties.

I.   Instruction on law by attorney.

J.  Discussion and action by City Council.

253



Page 1 of 6 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-2295 

CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AMENDING THE 1 
OFFICIAL ZONING ATLAS OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY LAND 2 
DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS, AS AMENDED; RELATING TO THE 3 
REZONING OF TEN OR LESS CONTIGUOUS ACRES OF LAND, PURSUANT 4 
TO AN APPLICATION, Z 24-04, BY LANCE JONES AS AGENT FOR THE LAW 5 
OFFICES OF TRAVIS KOON THE PROPERTY OWNER OF SAID ACREAGE; 6 
PROVIDING FOR REZONING FROM RESIDENTIAL SINGLE FAMILY-2 (RSF-7 
2) AND/OR RESIDENTIAL OFFICE (RO) TO COMMERCIAL GENERAL (CG) 8 
OF CERTAIN LANDS WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF 9 
LAKE CITY, FLORIDA; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY; REPEALING ALL 10 
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE 11 

WHEREAS, Section 166.021, Florida Statutes, as amended, empowers the City Council of the City 12 
of Lake City, Florida, (the ”City Council”), to prepare, adopt and enforce land development 13 
regulations; and 14 

WHEREAS, Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, the Community 15 
Planning Act, requires the City Council to prepare and adopt regulations concerning the use of 16 
land and water to implement the comprehensive plan; and 17 

WHEREAS, an application for an amendment, as described below, has been filed with the City of 18 
Lake City, Florida(the “City”) by Lance Jones as agent for The Law Offices of Travis Koon the 19 
property owner; and 20 

WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Board of City of Lake City, Florida, (“the Planning and Zoning 21 
Board”), has been designated as the Local Planning Agency of the City of Lake City, Florida,(the 22 
“Local Planning Agency”); and 23 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 163.3174, Florida Statutes, as amended, and the Land 24 
Development Regulations, the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning 25 
Agency, held the required public hearing, with public notice having been provided, on said 26 
application for an amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the Planning and 27 
Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, reviewed and considered all comments 28 
received during said public hearing and the Concurrency Management Assessment concerning 29 
said application for an amendment, as described below, and recommended to the City Council 30 
approval of said application for an amendment, as described below; and 31 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 166.041, Florida Statutes, as amended, the City Council held the 32 
required public hearings, with public notice having been provided, on said application for an 33 
amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the City Council reviewed and 34 
considered all comments received during said public hearing, including the recommendation of 35 

254



 
 
 
 
   Rezoning of Parcels  
   32-3S-17-13898-000, 32-3S-17-17072-001 
City of Lake City   32-3S-17-13906-000, and 13905-000 
Ordinance 2024-2295  Application Z-24-04 
 

 

Page 2 of 6 

the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, and the Concurrency 36 
Management Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described below; 37 
and 38 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found approval of said application for an 39 
amendment, as described below, would promote the public health, safety, morals, order, 40 
comfort, convenience, appearance, prosperity, or general welfare; now, therefore 41 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS: 42 

1. Pursuant to an application, Z 24-04, submitted by Lance Jones, agent for The Law Offices of 43 
Travis Koon, PLLC, owner, to amend the Official Zoning Atlas of the Land Development 44 
Regulations by changing the zoning district of certain lands, the zoning district is hereby 45 
changed RESIDENTIAL SINGLE FAMILY-2 (RSF-2) AND/OR RESIDENTIAL OFFICE (RO) TO 46 
COMMERCIAL GENERAL (CG) on property described, as follows: 47 

PARCEL 13898-000 (FROM DEED): 48 
 
LOTS 1 AND 2, BLOCK 2, BAKER HEIGHTS SUBDIVISION, A 49 
SUBDIVISION ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN 50 
PLAT BOOK 2 PAGE 104 OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA 51 
COUNTY, FLORIDA. 52 

 
PARCELS 13905-000, 13906-000, AND 14072-001 (FROM 53 
SURVEYOR): 54 
 
LOTS 1 AND 2, BLOCK 3, BAKER HEIGHTS, A SUBDIVISION OF PART 55 
OF THE NORTHWEST 1/4 OF THE SOUTHWEST 1/4 OF SECTION 32, 56 
TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 17 EAST, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 57 
THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 104, OF THE PUBLIC 58 
RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, LESS AND EXCEPT THE 59 
RIGHT OF WAY FOR STATE ROAD NO. 25 (SOUTH FIRST STREET). 60 
 
ALSO  61 
 
BEGIN AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SAID LOT 2 AND RUN S 62 
26°12'12" E, 150.00 FEET ALONG THE WEST LINE OF SAID LOT 2; 63 
THENCE N 63°47'48" E, 88.28 FEET ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID 64 
LOT 2 TO THE WEST RIGHT OF WAY LINE OF STATE ROAD 25; 65 

255



 
 
 
 
   Rezoning of Parcels  
   32-3S-17-13898-000, 32-3S-17-17072-001 
City of Lake City   32-3S-17-13906-000, and 13905-000 
Ordinance 2024-2295  Application Z-24-04 
 

 

Page 3 of 6 

THENCE S 01°08'30" E, 25.50 FEET TO ITS INTERSECTION WITH THE 66 
NORTHERLY EDGE OF A CONCRETE PAVED DITCH; THENCE S 67 
79°58'48" W ALONG SAID NORTHERLY EDGE OF SAID CONCRETE 68 
PAVED DITCH 152.23 FEET; THENCE S 89°55'41" W STILL ALONG 69 
SAID NORTHERLY EDGE OF A CONCRETE DITCH 97.11 FEET TO ITS 70 
INTERSECTION WITH THE EASTERLY LINE OF LAKE VILLA ADDITION 71 
NO. 3; THENCE N 00°29'44" W ALONG SAID EASTERLY LINE OF LAKE 72 
VILLA ADDITION NO. 3 A DISTANCE OF 97.31 FEET TO THE SOUTH 73 
LINE OF EL PRADO STREET; THENCE N 63°47'48" E ALONG SAID 74 
SOUTH LINE OF EL PRADO STREET 113.58 FEET TO THE POINT OF 75 
BEGINNING. 76 
 
PARCEL 2: 77 

 
COMMENCE AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF LOT 2, BLOCK 3, 78 
BAKER HEIGHTS, IN SECTION 32, TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 17 79 
EAST, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 104, OF THE PUBLIC 80 
RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND RUN S 63°47'48" 81 
W ALONG SOUTH LINE OF EL PRADO STREET 113.58 FEET TO A 82 
CONCRETE MONUMENT; THENCE S 00°29'44" E, 112.96 FEET TO THE 83 
SOUTH EDGE OF A CONCRETE PAVED DITCH AND THE POINT OF 84 
BEGINNING; THENCE N 89°39'15" E, 88.62 FEET ALONG SAID SOUTH 85 
EDGE OF A CONCRETE DITCH; THENCE N 77°48'44" E, 162.14 FEET 86 
STILL ALONG SAID CONCRETE DITCH, POINT ALSO BEING ON THE 87 
WEST RIGHT OF WAY LINE OF STATE ROAD #25 (FIRST STREET); 88 
THENCE S 01°08'30" E ALONG WEST LINE OF SAID STATE ROAD #25 89 
A DISTANCE OF 9.06 FEET; THENCE S 16°11'04" E ALONG SAID WEST 90 
RIGHT OF WAY LINE 165.68 FEET TO A CONCRETE MONUMENT; 91 
THENCE N 88°51'26" E, 3 FEET ALONG SAID RIGHT OF WAY TO A 92 
CONCRETE MONUMENT; THENCE S 01°08'30" E STILL ALONG SAID 93 
RIGHT OF WAY LINE A DISTANCE OF 100.87 FEET TO A CONCRETE 94 
MONUMENT AND TO THE NORTH LINE OF LAKE VILLA SUBDIVISION, 95 
BLOCK 1, THENCE S 89°39'15" W, 296.43 FEET ALONG SAID NORTH 96 
LINE OF LAKE VILLA, BLOCK 1 TO A CONCRETE MONUMENT BEING 97 
ON THE EAST LINE OF LAKE VILLA ADDITION NO. 3; THENCE N 98 
00°29'64" W ALONG SAID EAST LINE OF LAKE VILLA ADDITION NO. 99 
3 A DISTANCE OF 236.00 FEET TO THE SOUTH EDGE OF A CONCRETE 100 
PAVED DITCH AND TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. 101 

256



 
 
 
 
   Rezoning of Parcels  
   32-3S-17-13898-000, 32-3S-17-17072-001 
City of Lake City   32-3S-17-13906-000, and 13905-000 
Ordinance 2024-2295  Application Z-24-04 
 

 

Page 4 of 6 

 
LESS AND EXCEPT ANY PORTIONS OF PARCELS 1 AND 2 LYING IN 102 
RIGHT OF WAY RECORDED IN DEED BOOK 64, PAGE 65; OFFICIAL 103 
RECORDS BOOK 352, PAGE 69 AND OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 896, 104 
PAGE 2053, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, 105 
FLORIDA. 106 
 
PARCEL 3: 107 
 
LOT NO. 2, BLOCK NO. 10, LAKE VILLAS ADDITION NO. 3, A 108 
SUBDIVISION ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN 109 
PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 108-E, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA 110 
COUNTY, FLORIDA. 111 
 
LESS AND EXCEPT THAT PARCEL CONVEYED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS 112 
BOOK 1139, PAGE 2248 AND BEING MORE PARTICULARLY 113 
DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: COMMENCE AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER 114 
OF LOT 2, BLOCK 10, LAKE VILLAS ADDITION #3, A SUBDIVISION 115 
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, 116 
PAGE 108-E OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF COLUMBIA COUNTY, 117 
FLORIDA AND RUN THENCE N 49°13'59" W, ALONG THE SOUTH LINE 118 
OF SAID LOT 2, 1.43 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE 119 
CONTINUE N 49°13'59" W, ALONG SAID SOUTH LINE,150.97 FEET TO 120 
THE WEST LINE OF SAID LOT 2; THENCE N 40°24'17" E, ALONG SAID 121 
WEST LINE 148.50 FEET; THENCE S 49°11'49" E, 70.65 FEET; THENCE 122 
S 56°21'25" E, 34.05 FEET TO A POINT ON A CURVE; THENCE RUN 123 
SOUTHERLY ALONG THE ARC OF SAID CURVE CONCAVE TO THE 124 
EAST HAVING A RADIUS OF 165.00 FEET, A CENTRAL ANGLE OF 125 
24°47'13", A CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE OF S 17°44'37" W, 126 
70.83 FEET, AN ARC DISTANCE OF 71.38 FEET TO A POINT OF 127 
REVERSE CURVE; THENCE RUN SOUTHERLY ALONG THE ARC OF 128 
SAID CURVE CONCAVE TO THE WEST HAVING A RADIUS OF 115.00 129 
FEET, A CENTRAL ANGLE OF 45°51'37", A CHORD BEARING AND 130 
DISTANCE OF S 28°16'49" W, 89.61 FEET, AN ARC DISTANCE OF 131 
92.05 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. 132 
 

2. If any provision or portion of this ordinance is declared by any court of competent jurisdiction 133 
to be void, unconstitutional or unenforceable, then all remaining provisions and portions of 134 

257



 
 
 
 
   Rezoning of Parcels  
   32-3S-17-13898-000, 32-3S-17-17072-001 
City of Lake City   32-3S-17-13906-000, and 13905-000 
Ordinance 2024-2295  Application Z-24-04 
 

 

Page 5 of 6 

this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect. 135 

3. All ordinances or portions of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed 136 
to the extent of such conflict. 137 

4. This ordinance shall become effective upon adoption, subject to the following: 138 

The effective date of this amendment, Z 24-04, to the Official Zoning Atlas shall 139 
be the same date as the effective date of Future Land Use Plan Map 140 
Amendment, CPA 24-03.  If Future Land Use Plan Map Amendment, CPA 24-141 
03, does not become effective, this amendment, Z 24-04, to the Official Zoning 142 
Atlas shall not become effective.  No development orders, development 143 
permits or land uses dependent on this amendment, Z 24-04, to the Official 144 
Zoning Atlas may be issued or commence before it has become effective. 145 

5. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by Section 166.021, Florida 146 
Statutes, as amended, and Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as 147 
amended. 148 

APPROVED, UPON THE FIRST READING, by the City Council of the City of Lake City at a regular 149 
meeting, on the 18th day of November, 2024. 150 

PUBLICLY NOTICED, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of Lake City, Florida, by the 151 
City Clerk of the City of Lake City, Florida on the ____ day of _________________, 2024. 152 

APPROVED UPON THE SECOND READING, AND ADOPTED ON FINAL PASSAGE, by an affirmative 153 
vote of a majority of a quorum present of the Lake City City Council, at a regular meeting this 154 
____ day of ___________________, 2024. 155 

 

 

 

 

 

 

258



 
 
 
 
   Rezoning of Parcels  
   32-3S-17-13898-000, 32-3S-17-17072-001 
City of Lake City   32-3S-17-13906-000, and 13905-000 
Ordinance 2024-2295  Application Z-24-04 
 

 

Page 6 of 6 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

259



260



261



262



263



264



265



266



267



268



269



270



271



272



273



274



275



276



1 
 

Business Impact Estimate 

Proposed ordinance’s title/reference: 
 
Ordinance 2024-2295- Amending the Official Zoning Atlas of The City of Lake City 
 

 
This Business Impact Estimate is provided in accordance with section 166.041(4), Florida 
Statutes. If one or more boxes are checked below, this means the City is of the view that 
a business impact estimate is not required by state law1 for the proposed ordinance. This 
Business Impact Estimate may be revised following its initial posting. 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required for compliance with Federal or State law or 

regulation; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the issuance or refinancing of debt; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the adoption of budgets or budget 

amendments, including revenue sources necessary to fund the budget; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required to implement a contract or an agreement, 

including, but not limited to, any Federal, State, local, or private grant or other 
financial assistance accepted by the municipal government; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is an emergency ordinance; 

☐  The ordinance relates to procurement; or 

☒  The proposed ordinance is enacted to implement the following: 

a. Part II of Chapter 163, Florida Statutes, relating to growth policy, county and 
municipal planning, and land development regulation, including zoning, 
development orders, development agreements and development permits; 

b. Sections 190.005 and 190.046, Florida Statutes, regarding community 
development districts; 

c. Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Building Code; or 
d. Section 633.202, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

 
  

                                                           
1 See Section 166.041(4)(c), Florida Statutes. 

277



File Attachments for Item:

9. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2298 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake City, 

Florida, amending the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of Lake City Comprehensive Plan, 

as amended; relating to an amendment of 50 or less acres of land, pursuant to an application, 

CPA 24-04, by Charles Millar as agent for VYP, LLC, a Florida Limited Liability Company, property

owner of said acreage, under the amendment procedures established in Sections 163.3161 

through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended; providing for changing the Future Land Use 

Classification from Commercial County to Commercial City of certain lands within the Corporate

Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all ordinances in conflict;

and providing an effective date. (This property is located next to Advance Auto Parts at the SW 

corner of Highway 90 and Branford Highway)

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site visits), if any.

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City Attorney.

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to during the 

testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for identification 

and kept by the Clerk for 30 days.

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff.

B.  Presentation of application by applicant.

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff.

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any.

E.  Public comments.

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants.

G.  Questions of parties by City Council.

H.  Closing comments by parties.

I.   Instruction on law by attorney.

J.  Discussion and action by City Council.

278



Page 1 of 4 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-2298 

CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AMENDING 1 
THE FUTURE LAND USE PLAN MAP OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY 2 
COMPREHENSIVE PLAN, AS AMENDED; RELATING TO AN 3 
AMENDMENT OF 50 OR LESS ACRES OF LAND, PURSUANT TO AN 4 
APPLICATION, CPA 24-04, BY CHARLES MILLAR AS AGENT FOR 5 
VYP, LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY, PROPERTY 6 
OWNER OF SAID ACREAGE, UNDER THE AMENDMENT 7 
PROCEDURES ESTABLISHED IN SECTIONS 163.3161 THROUGH 8 
163.3248, FLORIDA STATUTES, AS AMENDED; PROVIDING FOR 9 
CHANGING THE FUTURE LAND USE CLASSIFICATION FROM 10 
COMMERCIAL COUNTY TO COMMERCIAL CITY OF CERTAIN LANDS 11 
WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 12 
FLORIDA; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY; REPEALING ALL 13 
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE 14 

WHEREAS, Section 166.021, Florida Statutes, as amended, empowers the City Council of 15 
the City of Lake City, Florida, (the “City Council”), to prepare, adopt and implement a 16 
Comprehensive Plan; and 17 

WHEREAS, Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, the 18 
Community Planning Act, empowers and requires the City Council to prepare, adopt and 19 
implement a Comprehensive Plan; and 20 

WHEREAS, an application CPA 24-04, was submitted by Charles Millar, as agent for VYP, 21 
LLC, a Florida limited liability company, the property owner, for an amendment, as 22 
described below, to the Future Land Use Plan Map of the City of Lake City’s Comprehensive 23 
Plan has been filed with the City; and 24 

WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Board of the City of Lake City, Florida, (the “Planning 25 
and Zoning Board”) has been designated as the Local Planning Agency of the City of Lake 26 
City, Florida, (the “Local Planning Agency”); and 27 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 163.3174, Florida Statutes, as amended, and the Land 28 
Development Regulations, the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local 29 
Planning Agency, held the required public hearing, with public notice having been provided, 30 
on said application for an amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the 31 
Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, reviewed and 32 
considered all comments received during said public hearing and the Concurrency 33 
Management Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described 34 

279



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2298  Application CPA-24-04 
 

 

Page 2 of 4 

below, to the Future Land Use Map of the City’s Comprehensive Plan and recommended 35 
the City Council approve said application for amendment, as described below, to the Future 36 
Land Use Map of the City’s Comprehensive Plan; and 37 

WHEREAS, the City Council held the required public hearings, with public notice having 38 
been provided, under the procedures established in Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, 39 
Florida Statutes, as amended, on said application for an amendment, as described below, 40 
and at said public hearings, the City Council reviewed and considered all comments 41 
received during said public hearing, including the recommendation of the Planning and 42 
Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, and the Concurrency Management 43 
Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described below; and 44 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found said application for an amendment, 45 
as described below, to be compatible with the Land Use Element objectives and policies, 46 
and those of other affected elements of the Comprehensive Plan; and 47 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found that approval of said application for 48 
an amendment, as described below, would promote the public health, safety, morals, 49 
order, comfort, convenience, appearance, prosperity or general welfare; now, therefore, 50 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 51 

1. Pursuant to an application, CPA 24-04, submitted by Charles Millar, as agent for VYP, 52 
LLC, a Florida limited liability company, to amend the Future Land Use Plan Map of the 53 
Comprehensive Plan by changing the future land use classification of certain lands, the 54 
area of such lands being 50 acres or less, such future land use classification on such 55 
lands is hereby changed from COMMERCIAL COUNTY TO COMMERCIAL CITY on property 56 
containing 0.583 acres, more or less and described, as follows: 57 

A parcel of land lying in Section 36, Township 3 South, Range 16 58 
East, Columbia County, Florida, being more particularly described 59 
as follows: 60 

Lots 2, 3, 4 and 5, Block A, Westwood Park, Section A, according to 61 
the map or plat thereof, as recorded in Plat Book 1, Page 45 of the 62 
Public Records of Columbia County, Florida, a subdivision 63 
embracing a part of the SW 1/4 of the SE 1/4 of Section 36, 64 
Township 3 South, Range 16 East, Columbia County, Florida, 65 
according to map of same prepared by C.W. Brown and W.W. 66 
Nihiser, Surveyors, dated June 8, 1926, and filed in the Official 67 

280



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2298  Application CPA-24-04 
 

 

Page 3 of 4 

Records of the Columbia County Clerk of Circuit Courts on July 6, 68 
1926; less and except that portion heretofore acquired by the state 69 
of Florida for road Right-of-Ways. 70 

2. If any provision or portion of this ordinance is declared by any court of competent 71 
jurisdiction to be void, unconstitutional or unenforceable, then all remaining provisions 72 
and portions of this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect. 73 
 

3. All ordinances or portions of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby 74 
repealed to the extent of such conflict. 75 

4. This ordinance shall be effective upon adoption, subject to the following: 76 

The effective date of this plan amendment shall be thirty-one (31) days 77 
following the date of adoption of this plan amendment.  However, if any 78 
affected person files a petition with the Florida Division of Administrative 79 
Hearings pursuant to Section 120.57, Florida Statutes, as amended, to 80 
request a hearing to challenge the compliance of this plan amendment 81 
with Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, 82 
within thirty (30) days following the date of adoption of this plan 83 
amendment, this plan amendment shall not become effective until 84 
Florida Commerce or the Florida Administration Commission, 85 
respectively, issues a final order determining this plan amendment is in 86 
compliance.  No development orders, development permits or land uses 87 
dependent on this plan amendment may be issued or commence before 88 
it has become effective.  If a final order of noncompliance is issued, this 89 
plan amendment may nevertheless be made effective by adoption of a 90 
resolution affirming its effective status, a copy of which resolution shall 91 
be sent to Florida Department of Commerce, Division of Community 92 
Development, 107 East Madison Street, Caldwell Building, First Floor, 93 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4120. 94 

5. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by Section 166.021, Florida 95 
Statutes, as amended, and Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as 96 
amended.  97 

APPROVED, UPON THE FIRST READING, by a majority of a quorum of the City Council of 98 
the City of Lake City at a regular meeting, on the 2nd day of December, 2024. 99 

281



 
 
 
 
 
City of Lake City  Future Land Use Amendment 
Ordinance 2024-2298  Application CPA-24-04 
 

 

Page 4 of 4 

PUBLICLY NOTICED, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of Lake City, Florida, 100 
by the City Clerk of the City of Lake City, Florida on the ____ day of _________________, 101 
2024. 102 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED UPON THE SECOND READING, by an affirmative vote of a 103 
majority of a quorum present of the Lake City City Council, at a regular meeting this ____ 104 
day of ___________________, 2024. 105 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

282



283



284



285



286



287



288



289



290



291



292



293



294



295



296



1 
 

Business Impact Estimate 

Proposed ordinance’s title/reference: 
 
Ordinance 2024-2298- Amending the Future Land Use Map of The City of Lake City 
 

 
This Business Impact Estimate is provided in accordance with section 166.041(4), Florida 
Statutes. If one or more boxes are checked below, this means the City is of the view that 
a business impact estimate is not required by state law1 for the proposed ordinance. This 
Business Impact Estimate may be revised following its initial posting. 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required for compliance with Federal or State law or 

regulation; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the issuance or refinancing of debt; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the adoption of budgets or budget 

amendments, including revenue sources necessary to fund the budget; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required to implement a contract or an agreement, 

including, but not limited to, any Federal, State, local, or private grant or other 
financial assistance accepted by the municipal government; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is an emergency ordinance; 

☐  The ordinance relates to procurement; or 

☒  The proposed ordinance is enacted to implement the following: 

a. Part II of Chapter 163, Florida Statutes, relating to growth policy, county and 
municipal planning, and land development regulation, including zoning, 
development orders, development agreements and development permits; 

b. Sections 190.005 and 190.046, Florida Statutes, regarding community 
development districts; 

c. Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Building Code; or 
d. Section 633.202, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

 
  

                                                           
1 See Section 166.041(4)(c), Florida Statutes. 

297



File Attachments for Item:

10. City Council Ordinance No. 2024-2299 (first reading) - An ordinance of the City of Lake City, 

Florida, amending the Official Zoning Atlas of the City of Lake City Land Development 

Regulations, as amended; relating to the rezoning of ten or less contiguous acres of land, 

pursuant to an application, Z 24-05, submitted by Charles Millar as agent for VYP, LLC, a Florida 

Limited Liability Company, the property owner of said acreage; providing for rezoning from 

Commercial Intensive County (CI Co) to Commercial Intensive (CI) of certain lands within the 

Corporate Limits of the City of Lake City, Florida; providing severability; repealing all ordinances 

in conflict; and providing an effective date. (This property is located next to Advanced Auto 

Parts at the SW corner of Highway 90 and Branford Highway)

Disclosure by Council members of ex-parte communications (this includes site visits), if any.

Swearing in of applicant/appellant, staff and all witnesses collectively by City Attorney.

Clerk should take custody of exhibits.

Note: All exhibits, diagrams, photographs and similar physical evidence referred to during the 

testimony or which you would like the Council to consider must be marked for identification 

and kept by the Clerk for 30 days.

A.  Brief introduction of ordinance by city staff.

B.  Presentation of application by applicant.

C.  Presentation of evidence by city staff.

D.  Presentation of case by third party intervenors, if any.

E.  Public comments.

F.  Cross examination of parties by party participants.

G.  Questions of parties by City Council.

H.  Closing comments by parties.

I.   Instruction on law by attorney.

J.  Discussion and action by City Council.

298



Page 1 of 3 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-2299 

CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA, AMENDING THE 1 
OFFICIAL ZONING ATLAS OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY LAND 2 
DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS, AS AMENDED; RELATING TO THE 3 
REZONING OF TEN OR LESS CONTIGUOUS ACRES OF LAND, PURSUANT 4 
TO AN APPLICATION, Z 24-05, SUBMITTED BY CHARLES MILLAR AS 5 
AGENT FOR VYP, LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY, THE 6 
PROPERTY OWNER OF SAID ACREAGE; PROVIDING FOR REZONING 7 
FROM COMMERCIAL INTENSIVE COUNTY (CI Co)TO COMMERCIAL 8 
INTENSIVE (CI) OF CERTAIN LANDS WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF 9 
THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY; 10 
REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN 11 
EFFECTIVE DATE 12 

WHEREAS, Section 166.021, Florida Statutes, as amended, empowers the City Council of the City 13 
of Lake City, Florida, (the “City Council”), to prepare, adopt and enforce land development 14 
regulations; and 15 

WHEREAS, Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as amended, the Community 16 
Planning Act, requires the City Council to prepare and adopt regulations concerning the use of 17 
land and water to implement the comprehensive plan; and 18 

WHEREAS, an application for an amendment, as described below, has been filed with the City by 19 
Charles Millar as agent for VYP, LLC, a Florida limited liability company, the property owner; and 20 

WHEREAS, the Planning and Zoning Board of City of Lake City, Florida, (the “Planning and Zoning 21 
Board”), has been designated as the Local Planning Agency of the City of Lake City, Florida, (the 22 
“Local Planning Agency”); and 23 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 163.3174, Florida Statutes, as amended, and the Land 24 
Development Regulations, the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning 25 
Agency, held the required public hearing, with public notice having been provided, on said 26 
application for an amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the Planning and 27 
Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, reviewed and considered all comments 28 
received during said public hearing and the Concurrency Management Assessment concerning 29 
said application for an amendment, as described below, and recommended the City Council 30 
approve said application for an amendment, as described below; and 31 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 166.041, Florida Statutes, as amended, the City Council held the 32 
required public hearings, with public notice having been provided, on said application for an 33 
amendment, as described below, and at said public hearing, the City Council reviewed and 34 
considered all comments received during said public hearing, including the recommendation of 35 

299



 
 
 
 
City of Lake City                                           Rezoning of Parcel 36-3S-16-02631-000 
Ordinance 2024-2299  Application Z-24-05 
 

 

Page 2 of 3 

the Planning and Zoning Board, serving also as the Local Planning Agency, and the Concurrency 36 
Management Assessment concerning said application for an amendment, as described below; 37 
and 38 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined and found approval of said application for an 39 
amendment, as described below, would promote the public health, safety, morals, order, 40 
comfort, convenience, appearance, prosperity, or general welfare; now, therefore 41 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 42 

Pursuant to an application, Z 24-05, submitted by Charles Millar, agent for 43 
VYP, LLC, a Florida limited liability company, the property owner, to amend 44 
the Official Zoning Atlas of the Land Development Regulations by changing 45 
the zoning district of certain lands, the zoning district is hereby changed 46 
COMMERCIAL INTENSIVE COUNTY (CI CO) TO COMMERCIAL INTENSIVE 47 
(CI) on property containing 0.583 acres, more or less and described, as 48 
follows: 49 

A parcel of land lying in Section 36, Township 3 South, Range 16 East, 50 
Columbia County, Florida, being more particularly described as follows: 51 

Lots 2, 3, 4 and 5, Block A, Westwood Park, Section A, according to the 52 
map or plat thereof, as recorded in Plat Book 1, Page 45 of the Public 53 
Records of Columbia County, Florida, a subdivision embracing a part of 54 
the SW 1/4 of the SE 1/4 of Section 36, Township 3 South, Range 16 East, 55 
Columbia County, Florida, according to map of same prepared by C.W. 56 
Brown and W.W. Nihiser, Surveyors, dated June 8, 1926, and filed in the 57 
Official Records of the Columbia County Clerk of Circuit Courts on July 6, 58 
1926; less and except that portion heretofore acquired by the state of 59 
Florida for road Right-of-Ways. 60 

 

1. If any provision or portion of this ordinance is declared by any court of competent jurisdiction 61 
to be void, unconstitutional or unenforceable, then all remaining provisions and portions of 62 
this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect. 63 

2. All ordinances or portions of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed 64 
to the extent of such conflict. 65 

3. This ordinance shall become effective upon adoption, subject to the following: 66 

The effective date of this amendment, Z 24-05, to the Official Zoning Atlas shall 67 
be the same date as the effective date of Future Land Use Plan Map 68 

300



 
 
 
 
City of Lake City                                           Rezoning of Parcel 36-3S-16-02631-000 
Ordinance 2024-2299  Application Z-24-05 
 

 

Page 3 of 3 

Amendment, CPA 24-04.  If Future Land Use Plan Map Amendment, CPA 24-69 
04, does not become effective, this amendment, Z 24-05, to the Official Zoning 70 
Atlas shall not become effective.  No development orders, development 71 
permits or land uses dependent on this amendment, Z 24-05, to the Official 72 
Zoning Atlas may be issued or commence before it has become effective. 73 

4. This ordinance is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by Section 166.021, Florida 74 
Statutes, as amended, and Sections 163.3161 through 163.3248, Florida Statutes, as 75 
amended. 76 

APPROVED, UPON THE FIRST READING, by a majority of a quorum of the City Council of the City of Lake 77 
City at a regular meeting, on the 2nd day of December, 2024. 78 

PUBLICLY NOTICED, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City of Lake City, Florida, by the City Clerk 79 
of the City of Lake City, Florida on the ____ day of _________________, 2024. 80 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED UPON THE SECOND READING, by an affirmative vote of a majority of a quorum 81 
present of the Lake City City Council, at a regular meeting this ____ day of ___________________, 2024. 82 

  BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, 
FLORIDA 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Noah E. Walker, Mayor 

 
ATTEST, BY THE CLERK OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF LAKE CITY, FLORIDA: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Audrey Sikes, City Clerk 
 

  

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY: 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Clay Martin, City Attorney  

  

 

301



302



303



304



305



306



307



308



309



310



311



312



313



314



315



1 
 

Business Impact Estimate 

Proposed ordinance’s title/reference: 
 
Ordinance 2024-2299- Amending the Official Zoning Atlas of The City of Lake City 
 

 
This Business Impact Estimate is provided in accordance with section 166.041(4), Florida 
Statutes. If one or more boxes are checked below, this means the City is of the view that 
a business impact estimate is not required by state law1 for the proposed ordinance. This 
Business Impact Estimate may be revised following its initial posting. 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required for compliance with Federal or State law or 

regulation; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the issuance or refinancing of debt; 

☐  The proposed ordinance relates to the adoption of budgets or budget 

amendments, including revenue sources necessary to fund the budget; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is required to implement a contract or an agreement, 

including, but not limited to, any Federal, State, local, or private grant or other 
financial assistance accepted by the municipal government; 

☐  The proposed ordinance is an emergency ordinance; 

☐  The ordinance relates to procurement; or 

☒  The proposed ordinance is enacted to implement the following: 

a. Part II of Chapter 163, Florida Statutes, relating to growth policy, county and 
municipal planning, and land development regulation, including zoning, 
development orders, development agreements and development permits; 

b. Sections 190.005 and 190.046, Florida Statutes, regarding community 
development districts; 

c. Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Building Code; or 
d. Section 633.202, Florida Statutes, relating to the Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

 
  

                                                           
1 See Section 166.041(4)(c), Florida Statutes. 

316



File Attachments for Item:

11. Discussion and Possible Action: Request for Code Enforcement Lien Forgiveness for Daniel 

Ochs, buyer, or property at 301 NW Jefferson Street, located in District 12 (sponsored by Mayor

Noah Walker)

317



Dear Mayor Noah Walker and Esteemed Members of the City Council,

I hope this letter finds you well. My name is Daniel Ochs, and I am writing to respectfully request your
assistance in addressing a substantial code violation lien attached to the property located at 301 NW
Jefferson Street, Lake City, FL 32055. This lien, totaling $66,750.00, has created a significant obstacle to
revitalizing this property and restoring it as a valuable part of our community.

To provide context, the lien originated under case #21-00000097 and was ordered by Special Magistrate
Stephanie Marchman on September 14, 2021, due to non-compliance within the allotted 60-day period.
The $50.00 daily fine accrued over time, culminating in the current amount. The current owner purchased
the property as a tax deed on March 14, 2023, unaware of the full extent of the pre-existing violations.
This code violation has now made it nearly impossible to move forward with much-needed renovations
and improvements.

My goal is to purchase this property for $31,000 and invest in remodeling it to create a safe, beautiful, and
functional home for someone who can become a contributing member of our community. The $31,000
purchase price represents essentially a breakeven point for the current owner, who is unable to finish the
project due to health issues. There is minimal margin to absorb additional expenses for this house, as it
still requires major renovations to be livable and usable.

Unfortunately, the magnitude of the lien far exceeds the value of the property, rendering the project
financially unfeasible without intervention. Unless this lien can be significantly reduced—ideally to
zero—this property will likely remain in its current state for years to come, further diminishing its potential
and prolonging its negative impact on the neighborhood. By removing or significantly reducing this lien,
you would enable us to take immediate action to transform this property into a livable home. This
transformation would improve the property’s aesthetics, enhance local property values, and add a viable
home to Lake City’s housing stock. Moreover, this would eliminate an ongoing blight and demonstrate the
city’s commitment to fostering progress and renewal in our community.

I am confident that with your support, we can turn this property into a positive asset for Lake City. I kindly
ask for your consideration in reducing or removing this code violation in its entirety to allow this renovation
project to move forward. I would be happy to provide further details or attend a meeting virtually to
discuss this matter.

Thank you for your time and attention to this important issue. I am grateful for your leadership and
dedication to improving Lake City for all its residents. Please feel free to contact me directly at
305-315-6843 if you have any questions or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Daniel Ochs
Founder of Slam Dunk Offers
Email: danielochs@slamdunkoffers.com
Phone: 305-315-6843

318

mailto:danielochs@slamdunkoffers.com


319



320



321



322



323



324



325



326



327



328



329



330



331



332



333



334



335



336



337



338



339



340



341



342



343



344



345



346



347



348



349



350



351



352



353



354



355



356



357



358



359



360



361



362



363



364



365



366



367



368



369



370



371



372



373



374



375



376



377



378



379



380



381



382



383



384



385



386



File Attachments for Item:

12. Discussion and Possible Action: Request for Code Enforcement Lien Forgiveness for Avery 

Bass, of property at 714 NW Alma Avenue, located in District 12 (sponsored by Council Member

Tammy Harris)

387



388



389



390



391



392



393



394



395



396



397



398



399



400



401



402



403



404



405



406



407



408



409



410



411



412



413



414



415



416



417



418



419



420



421



422



423



424



425



426



427



428



429



430



431



432



433



434



File Attachments for Item:

15. Four Day Work Week Proposal - PowerPoint Presentation (Human Resources Director 

BillieJo Bible and City Manager Don Rosenthal)

435



MEETING DATE 

 

COUNCIL  AGENDA 

SECTION 

ITEM 
NO. 

SUBJECT:     

DEPT / OFFICE:  

Originator:       

City Manager Department Director Date 

  
Recommended Action:     
 

 Summary Explanation & Background:    
 

 Alternatives:  
 

Source of Funds: 

Financial Impact:  

Exhibits Attached:  
 

CITY OF LAKE CITY 
Report to Council 

Four Day Work Week Proposal

HR and City Manager

BillieJo Bible and Don Rosenthal

Don Rosenthal BillieJo Bible

12-02-2024

Council to review option for a 4-day work week.

Studies have shown municipalities who have a four day work week save money, have less employee
turnover, increased morale, and have higher recruitment rates. In addtion, citizens have availability
to City offices earlier in the AM and later in the PM hours.

Other municipalities who have gone to a four day work week have had great success.

1. 4-day work week for employees only
2. 4-day work week, City closed on Fridays
3. No change

Could save thousands of dollars

Power Point

11-15-2024

Recommend a trial period for one year beginning in January 2025.

436



CITY OF LAKE CITY

4 Day Employee Work Week

437



OVERVIEW

• A measure to assist in employee retention and lessen 

turnover

• City would remain open 5 days per week

• Business hours would be extended by 2 hours (1 hour 

am / 1 hour pm)

• Some employees off Mondays and some off Fridays to 

allow for 4 - 10 hour days

• Increased employee efficiency and less absenteeism

• Could make COLC more marketable to applicants and 

decrease turnover

Open 5 days – employees 4 Open 4 days

• A measure to assist in employee recruitment, retention 

and lessen turnover.

• City would close 1 day per week (Fridays)

• Business hours would be extended by 2 hours (1 hour 

am / 1 hour pm)

• All employees would be off Fridays (except Fire/PD and 

in the case of emergencies)

• Increased employee efficiency and less absenteeism

• Could make COLC more marketable to applicants and 

decrease turnover

438



COLC EMPLOYEE TURNOVER RATES

• Bad turnover (those who left for negative reasons) 21.67% for 2024 Fiscal Year

• Good turnover (those who left for higher paying or promotional jobs) 2%

• U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics reports the average employee turnover rate across all 

industries is 3.5%

• COLC is over 18% higher than the national average. 

439



ADVANTAGES FOR THE CITY

4 day week – Open 5 days

• Extended business hours = extra time for citizen access before and after normal work hours.

• Projects completed in a compressed time frame.

• Increase in productivity.

• Reduced employee turnover: Employees may be less likely to leave the company; therefore reducing 

costs.

• Competitive advantage for hiring: can advertise as leaders in work-life balance and flexible scheduling. 

• Lower health care costs of employees helps keep premiums from increasing.

• Could reduce employee absenteeism.

440



ADVANTAGES FOR THE CITY

4 day week – Open 4 days (Closed on Fridays)
• Extended business hours = extra time for citizen access before and after normal work hours.

• Projects completed in a compressed time frame.

• Increase in productivity.

• Reduced employee turnover: Employees may be less likely to leave the company; therefore reducing costs.

• Competitive advantage for hiring: can advertise as leaders in work-life balance and flexible scheduling. 

• Lower health care costs of employees helps keep premiums from increasing.

• Energy savings from climate control of unoccupied buildings

• Reduction in fuel costs

• Less wear and tear on City vehicles

• Less cleaning

• Less garbage production

441



ADVANTAGES FOR EMPLOYEES

• Improved work-life balance: Employees can 

spend more time with family and on personal 

projects. 

• Increased productivity: Employees may be more 

focused and motivated to complete tasks 

efficiently. 

• Better mental health: Employees may 

experience less stress and better mental health. 

• Reduced commute times: Employees may 

commute 20% less, which can help reduce 

traffic congestion and pollution. 

• Employees may have lower healthcare costs. 

442



ADVANTAGES FOR EMPLOYEES 

continued

• Reduction in personal expenses

According to www.ridetowork.org, the average American would 

save approximately $708.00 per year in fuel cost.

• Other considerations include wear and tear on vehicles.

Reducing weekly commute by 1 day.

• More Family Time

Time to schedule medical and other appointments.

443

http://www.ridetowork.org/


With a 4-day work week staff will experience an increase in 

productivity, as they only lose that “Staging and Commuting“ time 

four times a week instead of five. 

Increasing efficiency by reducing employee inefficiencies 

associated with start/end work days, breaks, and lunch periods. 

Increase employee moral.

444



Special Projects

445



Disadvantages

Open 5 days / Employees 4 days

• Over time pay likely to increase

• Employees on call 3 days

• Directors not working same days as 

staff.

• Departments not fully staffed 2 days

Open 4 days / Closed on Fridays

• City offices not staffed on Fridays

• Employees on call 3 days

446



Hours of Operations

Current Hours of Operations

Monday – Friday

8:00 am - 5:00 pm 

8:00 am – 4:30 pm Customer Service

Advantage

Open outside regular business hours. 

The citizens would be able to receive city services at a time convenient to them.

Proposed Hours of Operations

Monday – Friday

7:00 am – 6:00 pm

Monday – Thursday

7:00 am – 6:00 pm

447



In Closing:

• Extended public hours for citizen accessibility

• Reduction in employees expenditures

• Reduce employee absenteeism

• Reduce employee turnover and costs associated with hiring

• Increase in productivity

• Increase employer marketability

• Increase employee moral

• Savings to City

448


	Top
	Item 1.	11-18-24 Minutes
	Regular Session Minutes 11-18-2024
	Exhibit A  11-18  Meeting

	Item 2.	Res 24-137
	RES 2024-137 -- Nominating Ricky Jernigan to CCTDC

	Item 3.	Res 24-138
	RES 2024-138 -- Nominating James Carter

	Item 4.	Res 24-139
	RES. 2024-139 -  RENEW MUTUAL AID AGRMNT THIRD JUDICIAL CIRCUIT

	Item 5.	IEMO Young & Harris
	IEMO II YOUNG
	IEMO  Harris

	Item 6.	Kids Feeding Kids
	Kids Feeding Kids Presentation

	Item 7.	Ord 24-2294
	ORDINANCE NO 2024-2294 (CPA24-03) First Read (002)
	Vote sheet 2294
	CPA 24-03 Concurrency Management Assessement
	Business Impact Estimate - Ordinance 2024-2294

	Item 8.	Ord 24-2295
	ORDINANCE NO 2024-2295 (Z24-04)
	2295
	Z 24-04 Concurrency Management Assessement
	Business Impact Estimate - Ordinance 2024-2295

	Item 9.	Ord 24-2298
	ORDINANCE NO 2024-2298 (CPA24-04) First Read (v.2)
	CPA 24-04 Concurrency Mangement Assessment.
	Resolution No 2024-PZ-CPA-24-04 Signed
	Business Impact Estimate - Ordinance 2024-2298

	Item 10.	Ord 24-2299
	ORDINANCE NO 2024-2299 (Z24-05) First Read (v.2)
	Resolution No 2024-PZ-Z-24-05 Signed
	Z 24-05 Concurrency Mangement Assessment.
	Business Impact Estimate - Ordinance 2024-2299

	Item 11.	Code Enforcement Lien - Daniel Ochs
	City Council Letter- 301 NW Jefferson St
	CE Case 21-00000097 (2)
	21-00000097 Lien
	CE Case 21-00000097

	Item 12.	Lien Forgiveness
	SKM_C250i24112614560

	Item 13.	Vice-Mayor Discussion
	Item 14.	City manager Review
	Item 15.	4 Day Work Week Proposal
	4-Day work week Report to Council
	4 day work week

	Bottom



