HUERFANO COUNTY BUILDING AUTHORITY BOARD AGENDA

October 03, 2024 at 3:00 PM
Commissioners Meeting Room - 401 Main Street, Suite 309, Walsenburg, CO 81089

Office: 719-738-3000 ex 200 | Fax: 719-738-3996

Join via Google Meet: meet.google.com/jtn-scsu-ecp | Meeting ID: jtn-scsu-ecp
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
ROLL CALL
MINUTES REVIEW
a. Meeting Minutes 9-5-2024
APPOINTMENTS
NEW BUSINESS
OLD BUSINESS
a. Spanish Peaks Inn Demolition
DISCUSSION
a. Changes to 2021 Adopted Building Codes
b. Possible Future Projects
ADJOURNMENT



meet.google.com/jtn-scsu-ecp

Item 3a.

HUERFANO COUNTY BUILDING AUTHORITY BOARD
MINUTES

September 05, 2024 at 3:00 PM
Commissioners Meeting Room - 401 Main Street, Suite 309, Walsenburg, CO 81089

Office: 719-738-3000 ex 200 | Fax: 719-738-3996

Join via Google Meet: meet.google.com/jtn-scsu-ecp | Meeting ID: jtn-scsu-ecp

Join via Google Meet: https://meet.google.com/ | Meeting ID: jtn-scsu-ecp

1.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Meeting started at 3:02pm.

ROLL CALL

HCBA members present- Mary Norby, Jacque Sikes, Ryan Gies and Frank Kirkpatrick.
Staff Members present Cheri Chamberlain and Ryan Sablich via Googkle Meet.

Guests on Google Meet-Luke Hanson and Best Western Rambler (Heather and Manesh)
MINUTES REVIEW

a. Minutes August 1, 2024

Motion made by Ryan Gies and second by Frank Kirkpatrick to accept the minutes as
presented. Motion passes unanimously.

APPOINTMENTS
NEW BUSINESS
a. Smith Noordik Construction BP 24-111

Motion made by Frank Kirkpatrick to refund the amount of the building permit fee minus the
plan review fee which the refund would come to $3104.85. (Total 3415.34-
310.49=3104.85) Seconded by Ryan Gies. Motion passes unanimously.

OLD BUSINESS
a. Timberline Custom Builders-Update

Staff update on Timberline Custom Builders/Shawn Moyers. A certified letter was sent to
Timberline Custom Builders/Shawn Moyers, it has been held up at the post office. A lost letter
request was sent to the post master.

Also Timberline has requested a third party inspection on two of the properties in question. Still
waiting to hear from the third party inspector.



meet.google.com/jtn-scsu-ecp

Item 3a.

b. Spanish Peaks Inn-Update

Motion made by Jacque Sikes and second by Ryan Gies to keep the HCBA updated on the
progress of the demolition permit to the State from the demolition contractor. Once the permit
is submitted to the State by the demolition contractor it can take up to 11 business days for the
State to approve the permit. If the demolition contractor does NOT have the demolition permit
back from the State by the week of September 23rd, 2024, then the HCBA will have a "special
meeting"” September 26th, 2024 at 3:00pm. Motion passes unanimously.

c. J&O Roofing-Update

Motion made by Jacque Sikes and second by Ryan Gies to send a letter to Mr. Worley on J&O
Roofing and Exteriors to either file a formal complaint against J&O Roofing and Exteriors, or
to continue to allow them to be his contractor and not have the HCBA have any further
involvement. Motion passes unanimously.

DISCUSSION-Information requested by the Board on Plumbing and Gas
a. Discussion information requested by the Board

Discussion on information on the difference of what someone with an HVAC Contractor can
do vs. what a licensed plumber can do on job sites, and when a permit needs to be applied for
and by whom.

ADJOURNMENT

Motion made by Ryan Gies and second by Frank Kirkpatrick to adjourn the meeting at 3:57pm.
Motion passes unanimously.

UPCOMING MEETINGS




C}"w.xﬁ,f

JAZE M) SubrLIgT 0.

m‘i’ gw.; \3’3 , ; ) | Permit wmm?mfmp“&

w\m‘{ 5L !.f DEMOLITION ROTIFICATION APPLICATION FORM | coordobay: u purse

NN APPLICATION EEE MUST ACCOMPANY THIS FORM | APCOIER)
g INGOMPLETE APPLICATIONS WILL BE RETURNED L

Colosado | ‘)up;umwm (Notice will be mailed 1o the demolition contractor untess specihed otherwise)  Desver, GO 852481530

Phone 3056825100

Item 6a.

A

©ty i nonfiable ACM that will Be or has heen s.umww m %amiﬁg p i , ot amding or (cu i mmmk ACH that hes o tugh

o4 uaémmy wof bmmm,g or higs booome ciumbled, pulvartzed o eedused ts powdm iw !hc- forens expocted o aet on &fa matseial in the courss ot

it OF et snon GReeiong tequiated by this seqguiation Note Astestos contalning shest vinyt aud Hnoloum must bo propedy

mstmhmfmvw prime 1 dematition

APPROVED

By Sam Kloser at 8:31 am, Sep 24, 2024

of Public Health N Far 3057000078
and Environment Fea: 360 « §6 per 1000 #t* of area to be demolished = § 7‘2,_ Q&WW | Asbwssostsmein oo
{Soo instruction #1 on roverse side} L I
¥ w"' *W"‘f smivie x»m&d ) M
eson Pa , P i S
n. s, a3 n C('m ﬂ L& M ;»o:w;s lae Tootpnes of Tacs vy 4t pomyen of Eaenity 10 59 GGMOSHEY
5 5&7‘1 e i South .~ . 3,300 ...
© \ B 1TIA
: Alamosa 00 8ol | £ 22808 Huy lo wesk
= | s ¢ Vg
5 (Hia)Se-toau  (1(4)S84S310 | bm Hgg:gm,.%% erfane  8ioRq
:: By - Ul Fhong 8 :i: e W o 48 L"
& Seoff VanGriesen, 1100589 0% | 5 Qo H™, ~Oct 18™ 902
oo ¢ ety thart ther el Aot g ey e £ . Wrtz"é‘{t"n
'8 ahow BNy temainng astestos rf:m»:mm; n«alm e iy e Lgnatieg e e ;}4;
g dwtioistied ! g L Ve g LD Bunsng 1) gk gz woving 0 Oties apacity
Frrvng M v 4
(] / o 4s : .
Lot 11 (/3 Lot YanGaieson foow dowon & Haul ofé
«» ' " .I,’ o 'y b auwi &xmr y ‘M_ Gibrnng toduiies ool suthonzation - Pleess valt (205 8923100 ang guk
1 { N d C&dy 1“(’1 g o B (a1 Burnieg Ve Cotramaior
i
Corvers Anatement g (GAG Z ?( 3 G o v”«xf* w ) b
o b6 A ~L~g¥;,;xmg<. oAt Litadnl £ e > Nvalnint m EEURE %Y
B oo 0 ) Ty Yt o Agsmestnyg Bemoved g Baeet . ; 2 s
oo CAMHE Ashinging Dot & muwmm L &_ & \ pyé & {y
z ég ‘&!M-h; wuu&; & Ve g » i; ) }”),) k{‘«‘ﬁ;}; gx£ ' “N_L"j{\fﬁ
L 8% L v Cognpbisted Fetapngo & _ by ! Statey, i%b‘lf»""
‘ ;2 ‘?}? (g tl’f? DY M;!{ ”"?3:}««%{{ RS T &.s 4 LA ggy ,“U;. 3h\§ ) 1L ; g |
9 PE e 0 mr'p 3 :3, i 0 R i, i i : : Ly N 3 Veshppiinarey
) e dcan” g e« AT MJLH <N Patel 44 390 CHXG
i With imy signature betow | certify that | posSSess current AHERA accreditation and state of Colorado certificabon as
5 ar Asbestos Budding Inspeston | also certly that | have thoroughly nspected the facility W be demolished, as listed
14 W the Demolition Site biock above . sampled alt suspect matenals, bad sl ssmples analyzed for the presence of ;
-4 asbesios by a NVLAP-accredited laboratory, and have determined Inatl no Regulated AUM exists anywhere in the
2 o facility * 1 also certify that | have informed the owneroparator of the facility or the demolition contractor that any
@ £ ashesios-containing material allowed to stay in the faciiity must remain non-friable dunng demolition. Specify type(s)
28 of ACM remaining. below {check appropriate box{es))
@ s
& .
& 3"’5, :ww‘ asbestos floor e (VAT T VAT mmm ] Tar/asphalt impregnated roofing | ] Asphaltic pie coatings
, & | S ay-appied @y coatiogs . Cauliing - Glazing | | Other specify
.g Signature. (1n Dlue ki i Printnd M -
= } / /o w s aall
E 4 P / v * Py ...«
o ?‘“’%f*ﬁ”w o (CeTo VG @
O ,.‘Lv: O Vine rapecnon (8w ( w Tk L‘s«?:» T s »’21} b 8 Gt f*hww #
- £5-24 Qli’ L7~ dA s 4,425
i vonfy that all refngerants fm{rs air wnd;zmmumwfngarwsurv appliwnces bavs been wam:ﬁ: recoverad In accordance wﬁh AGGE Regulation No
% {for wlormation on CFC requirements cafl B52.31003 1 furtner varify thist a8 fummous axit signs (comtaining radionactive matenal) have bean
o B § rm;mwd of i wecoutenes with 8 COR 10079 subpart 18 4.9 (for infarmating on luminoas sl sign reailmmants sl 30383004300
=
5 @ CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX-
fg 3 g w Hapking e { "3 sty netey E wd | RHDT e q ,2- 0 - 2‘L'
9 sguatgre W 'wm dan
T;w» Box s Fo
APPROVED - :
Posymark or Hana Dalvery Bate 9/19/24 ApBIOVSs | B sam Kioser at 8:31 am, Sep 24, 2024| 999 *@N‘fx‘zfa‘y:‘ﬁ?‘ [ vansfar.380
Fom o Payment & 4 236056758- $70 Paromt # Raecorg # Date lsgued:
Rm;usmw 6 DBRLOS-CONLANING Mstedals menns (@) oo agg csiregen s, iy i dnaadn s b van © et s Dosorse el (0}



Sam Kloser
Approved

Sam Kloser
Approved


DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Item 7a.

RESOLUTION NO. 23 - 25

THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF HUERFANO COUNTY, COLORADO

A RESOLUTION ALTERING AND AMENDING HUERFANO COUNTY CODES
PERTAINING TO BUILDING CONSTRUCTION FOR ALL
UNINCORPORATED AREAS OF HUERFANO COUNTY, COLORADO.

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners in Resolution 21-22 created the
Huerfano County Board of Review, under authority granted the Board of County Commissioners
in C.R.S. §30-28-206; and,

WHEREAS, Huerfano County Board of Review was granted in Resolution 21-22 certain
powers and duties including the duty to formulate suggested amendments to the building code
and to recommend for adoption substantive rules and regulations based on the provisions of the
adopted building codes after a public hearing of the Board of Review; and,

WHEREAS, the Huerfano County Board of Review held a public meeting on May 31,
2023, and unanimously recommended the 2021 International Building Codes to go to a Public
Hearing with the Huerfano Board of County Commissioners on June 13, 2023 and recommended
the Board of Commissioners adopt and with any necessary amendments the 2021 edition of the
building codes published by the International Code Council, Inc.; and,

WHEREAS, pursuant to C.R.S. § 30-28-201 the Huerfano County Board County
Commissioners by Resolution 86-12 adopted Uniformed Codes on April 16, 1986 and, amended
said code to codes created by the International Code Council, Inc., by Resolution 05-10 on June
29, 2005; by Resolution 08-10 on June 8, 2008; and by Resolution 17-12 on January 31, 2017;
and,

WHEREAS, pursuant to C.R.S. § 30-28-204 the Huerfano County Board of County
Commissioners desire to amend said codes, and a public hearing was held on June 13, 2023 after
being publicized in the World Journal on May 25, 2023.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of
Huerfano County, Colorado that the following is hereby adopted:

Section 1. Amended Codes Adopted.
The Huerfano County Building Code is hereby amended and that said code shall continue apply
to all areas of unincorporated Huerfano County, and building standards adopted within
Resolution 17-12 are rescinded in their entirety and the following codes are here by adopted,
with the additions, insertions, attachments, deletions and changes as described herein to have the
same force, and effect as set forth herein in every particular, for the purpose of protecting the
general public health, safety and welfare:

1. International Building Code "IBC" 2021 edition, including appendix chapters C & F;

2. International Residential Code "IRC" 2021 edition, including appendix chapters F, J, R,

&S;
3. International Mechanical Code "IMC" 2021 edition;

1




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Item 7a.

4. International Energy Conservation Code "IECC" 2021 edition;

5. International Fuel Gas Code "IFGC" 2021 edition;

6. American National Standard on the design and Construction of Log Structures "ICC 400-
2022"

7. International Existing Building Code “IEBC” 2021 edition

Section 2. Conflict Between Codes

In the event there shall be a conflict between the provision of the Huerfano County Building
Code and Huerfano County's specific Land-use Regulations, Huerfano County's Land-use
Regulations shall prevail.

Section 3. Savings Clause

If any part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Resolution or of the code
adopted hereby is for any reason held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining sections of this Resolution or of the referenced code in any part, section,
subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, and the Huerfano County Board of County
Commissioners hereby declares that it would have passed this Resolution and adopted said code
in each part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that
any one or more parts, sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared invalid.

Section 4. References in other Resolutions

All references to the building codes in the various Resolutions of Huerfano County, or in any
other Huerfano County Regulation whatsoever, shall be interpreted to refer to the Huerfano
County Building Code as amended and adopted by this Resolution.

Section S. Repeal

Any or all resolutions or parts of resolutions of Huerfano County, Colorado, in conflict or
inconsistent herewith are hereby repealed, provided however, that the repeal of any resolution or
parts of resolutions of Huerfano County shall not revive any other section of any resolution or
resolutions here before repealed or superseded.

Section 6. Matters Not Affected by Repeal

The repeal of resolutions and parts of resolutions of a permanent or general nature shall not
affect any offense committed or act done, any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any contracts
right or obligation, established prior to the time when said resolution and parts of resolutions are
repealed.

Section 7. Amendments / Deletions

References in all Codes to electrical requirements: change to read: All installation and
repairs must comply with the adopted Rules and Regulations of the Colorado State
Electrical Board, pursuant to C.R.S. §12-34-104 (2) (a).

References in all Codes to plumbing and fuel gas piping requirements: change to
read: All installation and repairs must comply with the State of Colorado Model

Plumbing and Fuel Gas Code of Standards, determined by the Colorado State
Examining Board of Plumbers.

References in all Codes to Building Official: change to read: Huerfano County Code
Enforcement Officer.




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Construction of agricultural structures on lands without a one-or-two family dwelling
shall only be allow within an agricultural zoning district, and must meet the
requirement of the IBC Appendix "C”.

IBC,IRC, IMC, & IECC 101.1 Title. Change to read: These Regulations shall be known as
the Huerfano County Building Code, hereinafter referred to as "the code".

IBC, IRC, IMC, & IECC 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. Change to read:
Administration and enforcement of this Code and all related and secondary codes are hereby
delegated to the Huerfano County Land-Use Department. Wherever in this code the phrase
"building official" appears, it shall be construed to refer to the Huerfano County Code
Enforcement Officer.

IBC 105.1.1 Annual Permit. Delete;
IBC 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Delete Number ten (10);
IRC R106.1 Submittal documents. Add:

106.1.5  Applications. An application for building permits shall be made to
the County Building Inspector on forms provided by Huerfano
County.

106.1.6  Sanitation. Pursuant to C.R.S. §25-10-112 (1) and section 6.05 of the
Huerfano County Building Regulations adopted with Resolution 21-
22, the applicant must show proof of an approved sanitation system.

106.1.7  Water. Show proofof adequate water pursuant to Huerfano County
Board of County Commissioners Resolution No:21-22.

106.1.8 Right to develop. Applicant must show proof of property
ownership. [fthe applicant is different than the property owner,
they must hold a Huerfano County Contractor license that is
appropriate for the type of construction being permitted and have
written authorization to act as the owner' s agent. Proof of
ownership must include a complete property description, unless
otherwise approved by the building inspector.

106.1.9  Exterior elevations. Show each view. Show vertical dimensions
and heights. Show openings and identify materials and show lateral
bracing system, where applicable. Show dimensions andschedules.

106.1.10 Foundation plan. Show all foundations and footings. Indicate
size, locations, thickness, materials and strengths, and reinforcing.
Show all imbedded anchoring such as anchor bolts, hold-downs,
post bases, etc. Show dimensions for the location and size of all
components delineated on the foundation plan. Each set of
foundation plans shall meet the requirements of Huerfano County
Board of County Commissioner Resolution No: 09-16.

106.1.11 Floor plan. Show all floors including basements. Show all rooms,
with their use. Overall dimensions and location of all structural

3

Item 7a.




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

elements and openings. Show all doors and windows. Provide door
and window schedules. All fire resistance rated assemblies, areas of
refuge, occupancy separations, fire blocking and draft stopping shall
be shown. Show dimensions for the size of all rooms and the
locations of other components delineated on the floor plans.

106.1.12 Framing plan. Show all structural and non-structural members,

their size, methods and details of attachment, connections, location
and materials for floor, roof, and wall section. When required by
this code show all fire rated assemblies and fireresistant
penetrations.

IRCR106.2 & IBC107.2.5 Site Plan. Change to read:

The site plan shall include the following items:

1.

In all zoning districts (with the exception of agricultural) a site
improvement survey with a seal by a Colorado Registered Land Surveyor
is required in addition to items two through ten. At the discretion of the
Land Use Director, this requirement may be waived.

A legible sheet or map, drawn to an appropriate scale, as accepted by the
Building Inspector, showing the location, height and approximate
dimensions or envelope location of each existing and proposed structure,
and the uses to be contained within the existing and/or proposed
structures.

The existing and proposed building setbacks and the building area with
reference to property lines, highway, street or road rights-of-way,
watercourses, and other natural and historic features of the site.

The location, size, number of spaces and surfacing of any existing or
proposed parking and loading areas.

The location of any existing and proposed roads, streets, footpaths, traffic
devices, and driveways.

The location, if any, and pertinent characteristics of any existing or
proposed signs, lighting fixtures, and landscaping.

The location of any easements on the property.

The anticipated location of all water, sewage disposal, electrical,
telephone, and other utilities.

All finished grading and storm water runoff.

. A vicinity map locating the proposed site in relationship to the

surrounding area within 500 feet of the property boundaries.

IBC 108 & IRC R107.1 Temporary Structures. Change to read.: Permits for temporary
structures and uses shall be issued in accordance with Section 1.12 of the Huerfano County
Zoning Regulations.

IBC109.2, IRC R108.2 and IMC 106.5.2 Schedule of Permit Fees. Change toread: On
buildings, structures, or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as
required in accordance with Resolution 19-15. Fee schedules are established by the Huerfano
County Board of County Commissioners, and are subject to change by resolution.

Item 7a.




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

IBC 109.3 & IRC R108.3 Building Permit valuations. Change to read: Building valuation
will be set in accordance with Resolution 19-15. Building valuations are established by the
Huerfano County Board of County Commissioners, and are subject to change by Resolution.

IBC & IRC R108.6 Fee Refunds. Change to read. The Building Official shall not authorize
refunding of any building permit fee, except upon written request by the property owner, within
30 days of the day the permit was issued.

IBC 113.3 & IRC R112.3 Board of Appeals Qualifications. Change to read: The board of

appeals shall consist of members of the Huerfano County Regional Building Authority.

IRC R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria. Add the following criteria to Table

Item 7a.

R301.2 (1)
WIND DESIGN
GROUND SEISMIC DESIGN
SNOW LOAD SPEED TOPOGRAPHIC |  SPECIAL WIND | WIND-BORNE DEBRIS CATEGORY
MPH EFFECTS REGION ZONE
See Attachment 130 NO YES NO B
1
SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
WEATHERING FROST TERMITE WINTER ICE BARRIER FLOOD AIR MEAN ANNUAL
LINE DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT HAZARDS FREEZING TEMP.
DEPTH TEMP. REQUIRED INDEX
Severe See Moderate 0°F YES (apply to See Section 2000 Walsenburg 51.3°F
Attachmen to Heavy elevations above 1612.3 Rye 46.6°F
t1 6200 ft.) amended Westcliffe 42.2°F

IBC 1608.2 Ground snow loads. Change to read: reference IRC R301.2, as amended.

IBC 1609.1.1 Determination of wind loads. Change to read: reference IRC R301.2, as
amended.

IBC Table 602.1 H Fire-resistance rating requirements. Add footnote h: Where the
distance between aircraft hangers is five feet or greater, construction is of non-
combustible materials, and there are no penetrations in the structures adjacent wall the
fire-resistance rating for the exterior walls is zero hours.

IRC R302.13 Fire protection of floors. Delete.
IRC R313.2 One-and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. Delete.

IRC 608.1 General ICF construction. Change the last sentence to read: When ACI 318' or the
provisions of this section are used to design insulation concrete form walls, project drawings,
typical details and specification are not required to bear the seal of the architect or engineer
responsible for design, unless otherwise required by the Colorado State law, Huerfano County-
Resolution, or the Huerfano County Code Enforcement Officer.

IBC 705.3 Building on the same lot. Add exception #3 to read: This section shall not apply
to S- 1 Aircraft Hangers installed at the Huerfano County Airport.

5




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

IRC Table N1102.1.2, IECC Table R402.1.2, & ICC 400-2012 table 305.3.1.2 Insulation
and Fenestration Requirements by Component. Change by amending climate zone 5 as
follows:

e Ceiling R-value: from R-49to R-38.
Wood framed walls cavity insulation: from R-20 to R19.
Basement wall R-value: from 15/19 to 10/13.
Crawl space wall R-Value: from 15/19 to 10/13.

IRC N1102.4.1.2 & IECC R402.4.1.2 Testing. Delete.

IRCN1103.3.5 &£ IECC 403.3.5 Building Cavities. Change to read: Building framing
cavities shall not be used as supply ducts.

IRC M1901.2.1 Cooking Appliances Add: Commercial gas cooking appliances are
allowed as long as the entire kitchen follows the 2021 IBC Codes for commercial
kitchens.

IECC C401.3 Thermal Envelope Certificate. Change to read: shall be completed by the
Building Official or their designee to be included on the Certificate of Occupancy.

IECC R402.2.1 Ceilings with attics. Delete

IECC 2021 Table R402.1.2 Maximum Assembly U-Factors and Fenestration Requirements.

Change to IECC 2018 Table R402.1.2. See Attachment 2.

IECC 2021 Table R402.1.3 Insulation Minimum R-Values and Fenestration Requirements
by Component. Change to IECC 2018 Section R402.1.3, referencing Table R402.1.2. See
Attachment 2.

IECC R 402.2.3 Eave Baffle. Delete

IECC R 402.2.4 Access Hatches and Doors. Delete

IECC R 402.2.7 Floors. Delete

IECC R 402.2.8 Basement Walls. Delete

IECC R 402.2.9 Slab-on-grade floors. Delete everything but the first sentence

IECC R 402.2.10 Crawl Space Walls. Delete

IECC R 402.3.5 Sunroom and Heated Garage fenestration. Delete

IECC R 402.4.1 Building Thermal Envelope. Delete

IECC R 403.1.1 Programmable Thermostat. Delete

IECC R 403.3.2 Ducts Located in Conditioned Spaces. Change to IECC 2018 Code Section R
403.3.2. See Attachment 3.

Item 7a.

10




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Item 7a.

IECC R 403.6.3 Mechanical Ventilation Testing. Delete

Section 8. Effective Date.

This resolution is effective upon adoption. The 2021 Codes shall be adopted immediately and
the 2015 codes shall be repealed effective at the end of the day on December 31, 2023. The
Land Use and Building Department will offer permit applicants the choice of which code to be
permitted under until the end of the day on December 31, 2023.

Section 9. Public Welfare Statement

This resolution is deemed by the Board of County Commissioners for Huerfano County to be in
the best interest of the general public, their health, safety, morals, and welfare, including the
safety, protection, and sanitation of such dwellings, buildings and structures as affected there-by.

INTRODUCED, READ, APPROVED AND ADOPTED ON THIS 13™ day of JUNE

2023.
<OUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
j-o _:_ OF HUE&E&I&IQ COUNTY, COLORADO
&' £ '

IIII.":“L'. L ::I:L_?:]h _. BY <\_;lm éa/&.}l\a

[ 3 John Gajusha, Chairman

II & | ]] ¥ DocuSigned by?

| # \ """!r/ Orica Andreitia

‘1:"' ili-_‘I.I_lgi ——5F25A4B7F6TATT P

ATTEST: ol Ar1caDAg§11§@‘;ta, Commissioner

(B Xl barl St dur

BBUEARBUCHADAES CEFFEGEH26447-

County Clerk and Recorder and Karl Sporleder;Commissioner
Ex-Officio Clerk to said Board

[SH

L

11




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

HUERFANO SNOW AND FROST DEPTH CHART

Place Reference Elevation [Snow Load (Frost Depth
Apache Creek Ranch 6000 30 33
Walsenburg (courthouse) 6200 30 33
Lascar Rd (at 660) 6310 30 33
Silver Spurs (310 and 312) 6470 32 34
Rio Cucharas 6500 34 34
Gardner 6980 38 37
Blackhawk Ranch 7000 38 38
La Veta 7050 38 38
Navajo (510 and Navajo Rd) 7080 38 38
CL&G Unit CC-1 7500 42 41
Raspberry Mountain Ranch 8000 44 43
Cuchara (downtown) 8500 46 47
Panadero (at bottom of Panadero Loop) 9000 48 49
Panadero (at the mercantile) 9260 50 52
9500 52 55

Attachment 1

Item 7a.

12




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Iltem 7a.

Huerfano County Frost Depth Attachment 1

70
60
50
40
Depth (inches)

30

20

Disclaimer:
Huerfano County, its officials and employees, by setting forth this
Attachment and the information contained herein, make no

10 representation or guarantees of any nature or kind whatsoever
regarding the accuracy or reliability of any information herein.

5200 6500 6800 7100 7400 7700 8100 8300 8600 9000 10000 Plus
Elevation (feet)




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789

Huerfano County Snow Loading Attachment 1

Based on study done for Fremont County by Ketchum,
Ryan, and Fleming, Consulting Engineers, Denver
Colorado.

70
60
50
40

Snow Load (PSF)

30

20

Disclaimer:

Huerfano County, its officials and employees, by setting forth
10 this Attachment and the information contained herein, make no

representation or guarantees of any nature or kind whatsoever
regarding the accuracy or reliability of any information herein.

5300 6300 7300 8300 9300 10300 11300
Elevation (feet)
Basis: Average WT of snow = 14 Pounds per cubic foot.

Iltem 7a.




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7C0OBF98A1789 Attachment 2
Item 7a.
TABLE R402.1.2 INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT?
MASS SLABY CRAWL
CLIMATE| FENESTRATION| SKYLIGHT® FEN%I;\I'ZR'IERION CEILING | o AVI‘\’A%C",E’ALL WALL | FLOOR BAS‘;\'IEP'YI'_'IE_NT': R-VALUE| SPACE®
ZONE U-FACTOR® | U-FACTOR il rvaLUg| FREVE WA R- | RVALUE| SAML & WALL
VALUE! DEPTH | R-VALUE
1 NR 0.75 0.25 30 13 3/4 13 0 0 0
2 0.40 0.65 0.25 38 13 4/6 13 0 0 0
3 0.32 0.55 0.25 38 20 or 13+5" 8/13 19 5/13° 0 513
R‘Ae"."ept 0.32 0.55 0.40 49 20 or 13+5N 8/13 19 10/13 10, 2 ft 10/13
arine
5 and h g
. 0.30 0.55 NR 49 20 or 13+5 13117 30 15/19 10, 2 ft 15/19
h
6 0.30 0.55 NR 49 v 15/20 309 15/19 10, 4 ft 15/19
h
7and 8 0.30 0.55 NR 49 oy | 1021 389 15/19 10,41 | 1519

NR = Not Required.
For St: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a.

b.

—_ T -4 O

R-values are minimums. U-factors and SHGC are maximums. Where insulation is installed in a cavity that is less than the label or design thickness of the insulation, the installed R-value of the insulation
shail be not less than the R-value specified in the table.
The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.

Exception: In Climate Zones 1 through 3, skylights shall be permitted to be excluded from glazed fenestration SHGC requirements provided that the SHGC for such skylights does not exceed 0.30.

. “10/13" means R-10 continuous insulation on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall. “15/19" means R-15 continuous insulation on the interior or

exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. Alternatively, compliance with *15/19" shall be R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous
insulation on the interior or exterior of the home.

. R-5 insulation shall be provided under the full slab area of a heated slab in addition to the required slab edge insulation R-value for slabs. as indicated in the table. The slab edge insulation for heated slabs

shall not be required to extend below the slab.

. There are no SHGC requirements in the Marine Zone.

. Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations as defined by Figure R301.1 and Table R301.1.

. Alternatively, insulation sufficient to fill the framing cavity and providing not less than an R-value of R-19.

. The first value is cavity insulation, the second value is continuous insulation. Therefore, as an example, *13+5" means R-13 cavity insulation plus R-5 continuous insulation.
. Mass walls shall be in accordance with Section R402.2.5. The second R-value applies where more than half of the insulation is on the interior of the mass wall.

15




DocuSign Envelope ID: C646F525-06DA-45D8-8D04-7COBF98A1789 Attachment 3

Item 7a.

air and filter be and seams shall with
the or

Air h shall have a S for an air of not than 2

16




BEIETS
Fase 1 of 1
Judy Beniner Clerk & Recorder

Huerfano Countys CO RF* $0.000
04-17-2009 02:11 PN Recording Fee $0,00

HUERFANO COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
RESOLUTION NO: (9 -/(

A RESOLUTION MANDATING CERTAIN FOUNDATIONS CONSTRUCTED IN THE
UNINCORPORATED AREAS OF HUERFANO COUNTY, COLORADO BE PROFESSIONALLY
DESIGNED.

WHEREAS, pursuant to C.R.S. § 30-28-201 the Board of County Commissioners for
Huerfano County, Colorado by Resolution 86-12 adopted Uniformed Codes on April 16,
1986 and, amended the Uniformed Codes by Resolution 05-10 and 08-10 on June 29, 2005
and June 4, 2008 respectively; and

Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners have determined the unincorporated areas
of the County has ninety-four (94) different types of soils, of which approximately sixty
percent (60%) of these soil types have expansive characteristics; and

Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners have deemed it necessary to have a
professional pursuant to C.R.S.§ Title 12, Article 25 design the above mentioned
foundations in order to safeguard Huerfano Counties Citizens from property damage
stemming from foundation failure.

NoOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT; all building permit application with foundation
designs encompassing two hundred and fifty square feet (250 ft?) or larger are required to
be based on a site specific geotechnical evaluation and sealed by a Colorado Certified
Engineer or Architect; in lieu of a complete geotechnical evaluation for residential
structures, the professional can assume the load-bearing values in Table R401.4.1 of the
International Residential Code 2006 edition.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED; that in no way is this resolution to prevent the Building
Official from requiring a Engineer seal on foundation less than the above mentioned
dimension.

THIS RESOLUTION WAS INTRODUCED, READ, AND ADOPTED ON THIS _/ 7 ??fw OF JUNE,
2009.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF HUERFANO COUNTY, COLORADO

T S./BOBIAN, CHARR

By ?oﬂ-zf‘ N~

ROGER A‘éAIN

~-J,\Hft“l ‘W”L’,ﬂ,
R IY, CG"‘“M

coTTD.

EX-OFFICIO CLERK TO SAID BOARD

Item 7a.

17




	Top
	Item 3a.	Meeting Minutes 9-5-2024
	MeetingMinutes-HCBA 9-5-2024

	Item 6a.	Spanish Peaks Inn Demolition
	22808 Hwy 160 W Walsenburg 81089

	Item 7a.	Changes to 2021 Adopted Building Codes
	23-25 Adopting Amended Building Codes - Signed
	09-16 Foundation Requirements

	Bottom

