
  

CALL TO ORDER 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

ROLL CALL 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

GUESTS 

PUBLIC COMMENT 

COMMUNICATIONS 

1. VBCD - June 2023 Program Updates 

2. Notice of Public Hearing - I & M August 16, 2023 10am 

3. Hartford Chamber Summer Newsletter  

4. HPS - 2023 July 10 Minutes 

5. HRC - 2023 June Minutes 

REPORT OF OFFICERS BOARDS & COMMITTEES 

Police & Ordinance 

6. HPD - 2023 June 

7. HPD - 2023 May 

Fire Department 

8. HFD - Board Representative Report 

9. HFD - Board Reports 

10. HFD - Chief 2023 June 

Ambulance 

11. AMB - Pride 2023 June 

Van Buren County 

12. VBC - Board Report 2023 June 

 

City of Hartford 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan 

Commission Business Meeting Agenda 
Monday, July 24, 2023 at 7:30 PM 

 

1



 
 

Public Works 

Wastewater Treatment Plant 

Treasurers, Investment & List of Bills 

13. List of Bills - July 24, 2023 $157,250.84 

14. June 2023 Investment Report 

City Manager 

APPROVAL OF COMMISSION MINUTES 

15. 2023 June 19 Special 

16. 2023June 26 Business 

17. 2023 June 26 Closed Session 

18. 2023 July 11 Business 

19. 2023 July 11 Closed Session 

20. 2023 July 13 Special 

21. 2023 July 19 Special 

APPROVAL OF REPORTS 

GOALS/OBJECTIVES 

OLD BUSINESS 

NEW BUSINESS 

22. Building Inspector Appointment 

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS OR AMENDMENTS 

23. Proposed Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.01 Regulating Garage, Yard, Basement and Private 

Sale Regulations 

24. Proposed Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.03 Peddler & Solicitor Regulations Section 4.1 

25. Discuss - Codification Ordinance 

26. Discuss & Consider Proposed Building Regulation Ordinance 

ADJOURNMENT 

2



3

Item 1.



4

Item 1.



5

Item 2.



6

Item 2.



Summer Newsletter 

This year the Strawberry Festival 
was a great success. We had 
three wonderful days. Hartford 
citizens and others from sur-
rounding communities enjoyed 
the food, rides and entertain-
ment. What did you think of 
our festival this year? We would 
love to hear from you. Email us 
at:  

hartfordmichaber@gmail.com. 
If you would like to be involved 
with the Hartford Strawberry 
Festival please attend our next 
Committee meeting on July 
26th@ 6pm at the Hartford 
Public Library.  

The Chamber of Commerce 
would like to thank our 
sponsors for making this 
community event possible: 

Diamond Level  
City of Hartford 
Corewell Health 
Hartford Township 
Honor Credit Union 
Lounsbury Excavating Inc.  
Med Leaf Provisioning 
Stone Soup Lab 
Taqueria y Mariscos El Primo 
Platinum Level  
A&B Packing 
Biggby Coffee Of Coloma & 
 Watervliet 
Charlie Weeden Inc. 
Kellogg Hardware 
Mann Metal Finishing 
Panel Room 
Pro Slot 
Red Arrow Dairy 
S&A Automotive 
Wightman 

 The Hartford Area Cham-
ber of Commerce will be 
sponsoring several “After 
Hour Events” throughout 
the year. If your business 
would like to host an event 
please contact us. Call Patty 
Schroeder at (269)588-5103 
ex 2 

The next “After Hours 
Event” will be announced 
soon. So keep an eye out for 
the announcement. 

 

 

 

“After Hours Events” are a 
great way to network with 
other businesses and to meet 
other people in our commu-
nity. 

Reminder 

Hartford Area 
Chamber of 
Commerce meetings 
are held the first 
Wednesday of the 
month at 5:30pm at 
the Hartford Public 
Library 

2023 Meeting Dates: 

August 2nd 

September 6th 

October 4th 

November 1st 

December 6th 

Coming Soon! 

Strawberry Festival Wrap Up! 

Gold Level  
B.M.D.  
Bachman's Welding 
Best Way Disposal 
City Commissioner 
 Jane Danger 
Crown Trophy 
Harding's Market West 
Hartford Fire Department 
Johnson's Heating and Air 
Learn and Grow Childcare 
Miller Thermometer 
Rabbit Hole Comics 
Senator Aric Nesbitt 
State Rep. Pauline  
 Wendzel 
Stephanie Daniels 
Van Buren County Com-
missioner Mike Chappell 
Vibrant Healing LLC 

 

JULY  2023 

About HACOC 
· · · 

Hartford Area Chamber of 
Commerce is organized to 
advance the general welfare 
and prosperity of the 
Hartford area so its’ citizens 
and all areas of the business 
community shall prosper. All 
necessary means of promo-
tion shall be provided and 
particular attention and 
emphasis shall be given to 
the economic, commercial, 
cultural, industrial, 
educational and civic  
interests of the area. 

 

Chamber Board Members 

President 

Judy Kieffer-Phillips 

Vice President/Secretary 

Stephanie Daniels 

Treasurer 
(Business Secretary) 

Patty Schroeder 

Trustee 

Pat Vawter 

Trustee 

Mike Chappell 

Trustee 

Matt Nilson 

Trustee 

Nancy Spoula 

After 
Chamber 

Hours 

7

Item 3.



Being a member of the Hartford Area Chamber of Commerce ensures your business is 

recognized as having a key role in our community. 

 HACOC sponsors the Hartford Strawberry Festival on the second weekend in June each year. 

The festival is the chambers biggest fundraiser and provides business advertising promotions; 

which helps make a visible difference for your business in the community. Please consider being a 

sponsor of the festival for a bigger and better visibility for your business. 

What other benefits are there for your business: 

 Business listing on our chamber website: www.hartfordmichamber.org 

 Membership sticker for your business to show you are a chamber member. 

 Networking with business members at meetings and special events. 

 Genesis Web Design offers to our Chamber Members $200.00 off on a 5 page website. 

Contact John Ruder at (269)429-7014 or designer@genesiswebd.com for more information.  

 Vibrant Healing LLC. offers 15% off a Reiki session for any chamber member. Call (269)

674-1335 for more information.  

 

Please consider offering a member to membership discount for your business to help build a 

better chamber. 

Business Opportunity: 

Would you like this news-
letter to showcase your 
business? Please email 
your information to:       

Facebook: 

Facebook is a great way to 
reach customers for free. 
The Chamber would like 
to help “share” your busi-
ness and any promotions 
you may have going on. 
Please let us know when 
you would like us to 
“share” your Facebook 
posts and we would be 
happy to oblige.  

hartfordmichamber 
@gmail.com and you will 
be considered for our next 
newsletter. 

Promote Your Business 

Membership Benefits 

View our website: 

www.hartfordmichamber.org 

8

Item 3.



1

Roxann Isbrecht

From: Bradley Geesaman <geesamanb@hpsmi.org>
Sent: Tuesday, July 11, 2023 6:23 PM
To: Roxann Isbrecht; Hartford Chamber of Commerce; Rick Hall; Board of Education; All HPS 

Mail; Ronald Sefcik; Sanya Vitale; Hartford Foundation; Jason May
Subject: Unofficial Board Meeting Minutes

Unofficial Board Meeting Minutes 
2022-2023 

 
Special Meeting 
Central Office 
07/10/2023 
7:00pm 
 
Mission Statement: Hartford Public Schools is dedicated to fostering a love of learning in an innovative, 
cooperative, and safe climate which empowers students to be productive, caring, and respectful citizens that 
are prepared for their future endeavors. 
 
Vision Statement: Create an appealing school district that produces measurable gains in student 
achievement and helps make a more prideful and pleasant community to live and work. 
 
 V. PUBLIC WISHING TO ADDRESS THE BOARD OF EDUCATION 
None 
 

VI.   OFFICIAL BUSINESS 
1. Preliminary Qualification of Bonds 

 The Board of Education approved the Application for Preliminary Qualification of Bonds 
as presented. 

 
 

The information above does not represent official minutes from the Hartford Board of Education.  
 
 
--  
Brad Geesaman 
Superintendent of Schools 
115 School Street 
Hartford, MI  49057 
geesamanb@hpsmi.org 
Office # (269) 621-7001 
 
"Every Student Matters, Every Moment Counts" 

9

Item 4.



 HARTFORD     COUNCIL     FOR     RECREATION 
 PO     BOX     332,     HARTFORD,     MI     49057 
 www.hartfordrecreation.org 

 INTERLOCAL     BOARD     OF     COMMISSIONERS     &     HARTFORD     COUNCIL     FOR     RECREATION  
 Thursday,     June     22,     2023 

 7:30     PM 
 Ball     Park     Pavilion 

 THE     BOARD     MEETS     THE     3RD     THURSDAY     OF     THE     MONTH 

 7:30     Meeting     called     to     order 

 Present:     Jason     May,     Megan     Mireles,     Rick     Hall,Bianca     Deckard,     Andy     Bachman,     Joe     Morsaw 

 Absent: 

 Public     present:     America     May,     Amber     and     Jesus     Guajardo,     Lindsy     Morsaw,     Mike     Burtchett,     Neil     Friday,     Sandy 
 Burtchett 

 Approved     May     Minutes: 
 Motion:     Bianca     Deckard 
 Second:     Megan     Mireles 
 4-0 

 Financials: 
 Budget: 
 Honor     accounts 
 Concession     account:     $11,721.26 
 League     of     Miracles:     $2,665.91 
 General     Fund:     $3,657.40 

 Bills     to     pay:     softball,     Baseball     and     Tball     uniforms, 

 To     add:     Concession     profit     and     sign     up     money 

 Status     of     New     Organization     Paperwork-     Official     new     name-     Hartford     Council     for     Recreation     Sports     League 
 New     Gmail     account. 

 Baseball/Softball: 
 Regular     season     is     wrapped     up. 
 Softball     tournament:     June     30-July     2 
 7     8u     teams,     8     10u     teams,     5     12u     teams     and     3     14u     teams 
 Baseball     tournament:     July     7-9 
 Umpire     pay     for     tournaments:     45     behind     the     plate,     40     on     machine,     35     field     ump 
 Football/cheer: 
 Check     prices     on     flag     jerseys 
 Check     insurance 
 Prices     set     for     fall     2023 
 Flag:     ?     Waiting     on     shirt     prices 
 Cheer:     45 
 Rocket:     100 
 Sibling     discounts 

10

Item 5.



 First     practice     for     football     August     7 
 Hosting     Jamboree     on     August     26 
 Taylor     and     Bianca     Deckard-     Football     Directors 
 Amber     Beltran-     Cheer     Director 
 Cheer     Coaches- 
 Angel     Bowling:     Flag 
 Amber     Beltran:     juniors     and     seniors 
 In     person     sign     ups-     June     28     and     29.     5-8 

 Basketball: 
 Out     of     season. 
 Get     all     uniforms     together     and     cleaned. 
 Get     Tote     for     storage 

 League     of     Miracles     update: 
 Had     special     meeting     on     6/7     to     hold     discussions     and     resolve     issues. 
 Bank     Card     given     for     league. 
 Fundraisers     coming     up:     corn     hole     and     softball     tournaments     at     Coloma     FOP     July     22. 

 Old     Business- 
 AED 
 501(c)3-     progress,     America     working     on     steps     to     get     everything     on     track. 

 New     Business: 
 Big     C     donation,     put     sign     back     up 
 Background     check     issues,     once     paperwork     is     complete     we     can     apply     to     run     them     for     free. 

 Public     comments:     Allstar     tournament     discussion. 

 Next     meeting-     July     20,     2023     7:30     at     Ball     Park     Pavilion 

 Meeting     Adjourned-     8:37     5-0 

11

Item 5.



12

Item 6.



13

Item 7.



1

Roxann Isbrecht

From: Helen Sullivan <hsulli.2012@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 19, 2023 10:28 AM
To: Roxann Isbrecht
Subject: Fire Board Report

The meeting started at 7.  Although, I was unable to attend, I wanted to share highlights as shared by 
Ron Sefcik. 

  

Bills of $39,008.37 were approved. 

As you may know, the Fire Board received a letter from the Michigan Department of 
Treasury concerning the state of our books. 

We have hired Peter Stanislawski to take care of our books.  There were too many categories and 
entries. 

He has been working on the books and has written a letter to the Michigan Department of Treasury.in 
response. 

We have also contacted Siegfried Crandall to build a new program that will better conform to the 
proper accounting program.  Due to the state of the books, we will start completely over as of July ¹st. 

There was also a required organizational meeting.  All board positions stayed the same and embers 
were placed in committees as provided for in the interlocal agreement. 

There has also been a short discussion of the board rewriting the interlocal agreement.  With the 
deletion of the secretary position and the addition of a bookkeeper, it has changed the job 
descriptions for some of the board members. 

We ask for your patience as we make these changes. 

Respectfully submitted. 

Helen Sullivan 

City of Hartford  

 

14

Item 8.



15

Item 9.



16

Item 9.



17

Item 9.



18

Item 9.



19

Item 9.



20

Item 9.



21

Item 9.



22

Item 9.



23

Item 9.



24

Item 9.



25

Item 9.



26

Item 9.



27

Item 9.



28

Item 9.



29

Item 9.



30

Item 9.



31

Item 9.



32

Item 9.



33

Item 9.



34

Item 9.



35

Item 9.



36

Item 9.



37

Item 10.



38

Item 10.



39

Item 10.



40

Item 10.



41

Item 10.



42

Item 10.



43

Item 10.



44

Item 10.



45

Item 10.



Proudly Serving Southwest Michigan – Berrien, Cass, Kalamazoo, Van Buren Counties 
5088 Meredith 

Kalamazoo, MI 49002 
Business Office (269) 343.2224     Fax (269) 343.6503 

www.pridecare.com 

 
 
 
 
 
July 5, 2023 
 
Mr. Yemi Akinwale, City Manager 
Hartford City 
19 West Main Street 
Hartford, MI 49057 
 
Dear Mr. Akinwale, 
 
It is with a heavy heart to provide you with Pride Care’s last average response time report for the month 
of June 2023. There were eight (8) priority one calls in June with the response time of 7:44 minutes.  
 
There were twelve (12) priority two calls in June with an average response time of 9:25 minutes.  
 
There were two (2) priority three calls in June with an average response time of 11:17 minutes. 
 
A total of twenty-two (22) calls were run by Pride Care in June with an average response time of 8:53 
minutes. 
 
If you have any questions, comments, and/or concerns, please feel free to contact me at the office. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Jimmy Wills 
Pride Care Ambulance 
O: 269.343.3267 
F: 269.343.6503 
 

46

Item 11.



 

June 2023 BOC Activity Report  Page 1 of 2 

 

June 2023 Board of Commissioners Activity Report 

Administration Address  Telephone No. 
219 E Paw Paw Street - Suite 305, Paw Paw, MI 49079 (269) 657-8253 
Website:  www.vanburencountymi.gov Email:  Admin@vanburencountymi.gov 

 
HIGHLIGHTS 

 
1. Public Defender 2023 Annual Report - Chad Catalino presented the 2023 Annual Report for 

the Public Defender’s Office. To view the full report, visit the County’s minutes and agenda’s 
page.  
 

2. Van Buren County Road Commission Monthly Update - Bret Witkowski presented the 
Road Commission Monthly Update. To view the full report, visit the County’s minutes and 
agenda’s page.  
 
 

3. VBEMS Contract Amendment - The Board of Commissioners approved the amendment of 
the VBEMS Ambulance Services contract to expand the geographical service effective June 
16, 2023, and include all of Arlington Township, Bangor City, Bangor Township, Hartford City, 
and Hartford Township and to terminate the Pride Care Ambulance Services effective June 15, 
2023.  
 

4. Use of County Property – Paw Paw Days 2023 – The Board of Commissioners approved the 
request to use County property for the 2023 Paw Paw Days event from July 21st – July 22nd. 
 
 

5. HSW-USDA Lease - The USDA is slightly reducing the area necessary to lease at the Human 
Services West Building, which requires us to submit Amendment #6. This Amendment 
includes updated drawings and cost estimates. To submit the requested Amendment, they are 
also asking for proof of authority to show that the Administrator is authorized to act on behalf of 
the County for the purposes of this proposal. This authorization will apply to the submission of 
the lease proposal only. If it is accepted, the actual lease will be brought to the Board for 
formal approval. The ten-year lease will require building improvements, which will be 
reimbursed over the first 5 years of the lease. This reimbursement will be in addition to the 
rent. For the first five years, we will receive approximately, $270,000. For the remaining five 
years we will receive approximately $170,000. The Van Buren County Board of 
Commissioners approves the authorization of John Faul, County Administrator, to act on 
behalf of the County for the submission of USDA Request for Lease Proposals No. 57- 26159-
20-FA Paw Paw, MI. 
 

6. May 2023 Claims – Claims in the amount of $2,134,334.30 for May 2023 were submitted, 
reviewed, and approved by the Board during the June 27th Board of Commissioners meeting.  
 

7. County Administrator Contract – John Faul – The Board of Commissioners approved the 
contract with John Faul to serve as the Van Buren County Administrator and for the Board 
Chair to sign on the Board’s behalf. 

 
 
 

47

Item 12.

mailto:Admin@vanburencountymi.gov


 

June 2023 BOC Activity Report  Page 2 of 2 

 
 

Appointment/Re-appointment Requests 
 

1. Palisades Community Advisory Panel – John Lewandowski - The Board of 
Commissioners approved the appointment of John Lewandowski to the Palisades Community 
Advisory Panel. 

2. Parks Commission – Daywi Cook – The Board of Commissioners approved the appointment 
of Daywi Cook to the Parks Commission for a three-year term set to expire on December 31, 
2026.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
Facebook:  https://www.facebook.com/VanBurenCountyMI/         

LinkedIn:  https://www.linkedin.com/company/van-buren-county-government   

Twitter:  https://twitter.com/VanBurenCoMI   

Watch us on our YouTube page.   

 

All board meeting agendas and minutes can be found on the county website: 

https://www.vanburencountymi.gov/129/Agendas-Minutes  

48

Item 12.

https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCA-YlUJPurcVKPj6xTaoePg
https://twitter.com/VanBurenCoMI
https://www.linkedin.com/company/van-buren-county-government
https://www.facebook.com/VanBurenCountyMI/
https://www.facebook.com/VanBurenCountyMI/
https://www.linkedin.com/company/van-buren-county-government
https://twitter.com/VanBurenCoMI
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCA-YlUJPurcVKPj6xTaoePg
https://www.vanburencountymi.gov/129/Agendas-Minutes


 
JULY 24, 2023

LIST OF BILLS 
FOR FISCAL 2022-2023

PAY TO DESCRIPTION SUBTOTAL CHECK TOTAL

FLEMING BROTHERS OIL CO GASOLINE FOR MAY 2023 2,377.01           

     DIESEL FOR MAY 2023 921.69              3,298.70                     

PC SERVICES I.T. LABOR HOURS 5/9-6/16/2023 525.00                        

VAN BUREN COUNTY CENTRAL DISPATCH VERIZON MODEMS 5/24-6/23/2023 87.00                          

VILLAGE OF PAW PAW LABORATORY LAB ANALYSIS FOR MAY 2023 120.00              

     LAB ANALYSIS FOR JUNE 2023 120.00              240.00                        

WIGHTMAN & ASSOCIATES PROJECT 212081 - E LINDEN & CLARK STREETS 19,633.16         

     PROJECT 212081 - E LINDEN & CLARK STREETS 45,754.71         

     PROJECT 222250 - S MUNICIPAL PARKING LOT RESURFACING 1,178.48           

     PROJECT 222324 - LEAD SERVICE LINE REPLACEMENT PROJECT 4,781.25           

     PROJECT 190496 - HARTFORD TWP PFAS WATER MAIN EXTENSION 3,562.50           74,910.10                   

ZIP CANNABIS/JOE TRUMAN REFUND SPECIAL LAND USE APPLICATION FEE LESS $25 ZONING PERMIT 475.00                        

FISCAL 2023 TOTAL OF CHECKS TO BE WRITTEN 7/25/2023 79,535.80$           

 
JULY 24, 2023

LIST OF BILLS 
FOR FISCAL 2023-2024

PAY TO DESCRIPTION SUBTOTAL CHECK TOTAL

BAKERTILLY WATER RATE STUDY SERVICES 9,500.00                     

MIKE BANIC OCCUPANCY INSPECTIONS 7/12/2023 525.00                        

BLOOMINGDALE COMMUNICATIONS PHONE & INTERNET SERVICES FOR JULY 2023 377.34                        

BLUE CARE NETWORK AUGUST 2023 HEALTH INSURANCE 13,724.87                   

CINTAS CORPORATION FIRST AID SUPPLIES - CITY HALL 63.01                

     FIRST AID SUPPLIES - POLICE 96.08                

     FIRST AID SUPPLIES - DPW 91.28                250.37                        

DELTA DENTAL AUGUST 2023 DENTAL INSURANCE 853.89                        

ENTERPRISE ENVELOPE 250 BOND RECEIPTS FOR POLICE DEPT 150.00              

     5000 ENVELOPES WITH CITY RETURN ADDRESS 274.80              

     UPDATE SHUT OFF DOOR HANGERS 408.50              833.30                        

EPS SECURITY ALARM SYSTEM MONITORING SERVICE AGREEMENT 8/1-10/31/2023 375.00                        

FRONTIER COMMUNICATIONS LIFT STATION PHONE 7/7-8/6/2023 49.75                          

GAGE MOTORS OIL CHANGE FOR 2022 FORD EXPLORER 49.99                          

HARTFORD BUILDING AUTHORITY CITY HALL LEASE PAYMENT FOR AUGUST 2023 4,166.67                     

HARTFORD FIRE BOARD AUGUST 2023 CONTRACTUAL PAYMENT 10,589.57                   

J.S. BUXTON BULK LIME SLURRY FOR WWTP 1,625.00                     

ANGELA STORY ASSESSING SERVICES FOR JULY 2023 1,283.33                     

SHAUN SWEET REIMBURSEMENT FOR WORK BOOTS AND 2 PAIRS OF WORK PANTS (DPW) 195.94                        

UNUM LIFE INSURANCE CO OF AMERICA AUGUST 2023 LIFE & DISABILITY INSURANCE 609.02                        

VISION SERVICE PLAN AUGUST 2023 VISION INSURANCE 123.48                        

WATER SOLUTIONS UNLIMITED 300 GALLONS SODIUM BISULFITE + 52 GALLONS SODIUM HYPOSHLORITE (WWTP) 1,977.80                     

FISCAL 2024 TOTAL OF CHECKS TO BE WRITTEN 7/25/2023 47,110.32$           

DEBIT CARD TRANSACTIONS

7/5/2023 LUMEN LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE AUTOMATIC WITHDRAWAL (DPW & WWTP) 3.29                             

7/6/2023 UNITED STATES POSTAL SERVICE POSTAGE FOR UTILITY BILLING PLUS MAIL LARGE ENVELOPE FOR 

     PLANNING COMMISSION 481.50                          
7/12/2023 AMAZON.COM LAWN MOWER BLADE & ADAPTER FOR DPW 58.39                             
7/14/2023 CHEAPER THAN DIRT.COM AMMO FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT 206.84                          

               TOTAL DEBIT CARD/AUTO DEDUCTION TRANSACTIONS 750.02$                      

               TOTAL GROSS PAYROLL JUNE 26, 2023 THROUGH JULY 14, 2023 (2 WEEKS) 29,854.70$                 

          FISCAL 2024 TOTAL FOR JULY 24, 2023 77,715.04$           

GRAND TOTAL OF FISCAL 2023 + FISCAL 2024 157,250.84$  

49

Item 13.



BONDS

AMT OF INVEST INST INVEST LENGTH INTEREST MATURITY DIST. CURRENT
INVESTMENT TYPE NAME DATE OF INV. RATE DATE OF INT VALUE

CD'S
166,746.74$         CD STURGIS BANK 9/3/2020 18 MONTHS 0.40% 3/3/2022

STURGIS BANK 1/25/2023 9 MONTHS 4.00% 10/25/2023 168,200$               

200,000.00$         CD CONSUMERS CU 6/23/2023 12 MONTHS 5.00% 6/23/2024 200,000$               

MUTUAL FUNDS   
250,000.00$         MF TCF FA 8/11/12 L-T VARIABLE
103,000.00$         MF TCF FA 2/15/11 L-T VARIABLE

50,000.00$            MF TCF FA 6/15/11 L-T VARIABLE
105,000.00$         MF TCF FA 10/28/11 L-T VARIABLE

53,896.00$            MF TCF FA 2/27/11 L-T VARIABLE
74,154.00$            MP TCF FA 5/26/12 L-T VARIABLE
76,493.11$            MF TCF FA 11/6/12 S-T VARIABLE

114,476.00$         MF TCF FA 12/21/13 S-T VARIABLE
100,000.00$         MF TCF FA 2/20/13 S-T VARIABLE

AT MARKET TCF SHORT-TERM MUTUAL FUND TRANSFER OUT 333,528.43$       -$                            
TCF LONG-TERM MUTUAL FUND TRANSFER OUT 1,062,200.17$    -$                            

1,397,648.70$      TRANSFER IN 12/14/2021 L-T VARIABLE
(775,000.00)$        TRANSFER OUT 6/23/2023 L-T VARIABLE

STURGIS BANK/OAKLEAF FINANCIAL (RAYMOND JAMES) 501,707$               
  
TOTAL INVESTMENT AT MARKET VALUE
AS OF JUNE 30, 2023 869,907$               

*THIS IS A DECREASE OF $577,711.00 FROM LAST QUARTER*
          $300,000.00 WAS DEPOSITED INTO CONSUMERS CU MONEY MARKET ACCOUNT
          AND THE OTHER $277,711.00 WAS DEPOSITED TO HONOR CU TO ELIMINATE NEGATIVE CASH BALANCE IN SEWER FUND

CITY OF HARTFORD
INVESTMENT REPORT AS OF JUNE 30, 2023

50

Item 14.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JUNE 19, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 
Commissioners Present: Ramon Beltran; Jane Danger; Frank Dockter; John Miller; Helen Sullivan; Terry 
Tibbs; Mayor Richard A. Hall; 
Members Absent:    
Staff Present:         Rodney-Isbrecht; Vitale 
 

 
Mayor Richard A. Hall called the special meeting to order at 6:30pm. 

 
 

Motion by Tibbs, supported by Dockter, to suspend the special meeting & go into closed session for the 
purpose of discussing the City Managers review at 6:31pm.    

Motion carried 7 – 0 
 
 

Motion by Tibbs, supported by Docker, to return to open session and resume the special meeting at 
7:14pm.    

Motion carried 7 – 0 
 
Adjournment: 

 
Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adjourn the meeting at 7:15pm. 
  Motion carried 7 – 0  

 
 
Respectfully Submitted,         
 
 
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

51

Item 15.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JUNE 26, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 
Commissioners Present: Jane Danger; Frank Dockter; Ramon Beltran; Helen Sullivan; Mayor Richard A. Hall 
Commissions Absent: John Miller; Terry Tibbs; 
  
Staff Present:         Rodney-Isbrecht, Shultz; Vitale 
 

Pledge of Allegiance was said.   
 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Dockter to approve the agenda as 
amended to include discussion & consideration of Marihuana RFP under old business. 

Motion carried 5 – 0  
 
Guests: None 

 
Public Comment:   

 Bruce Plyer, 211 Church St – Concerns about his flat rate sewer bill  & wanting to connect to water but 
is not available at the end of Church St. Extension to the Church St & Reynolds St  area was included in 
the water capital improvement plan.    
 

Communications: 
 Comcast Communication June 2023 Notice of Programing Price Change  
 VBC Friend of the Court Notice of New Location 
 VBC Road Commission 2022 Annual Report 
 DDA June 28, 2023 Cancelled, Next Meeting July 26, 2023 9:00am 
 City Hall will be closed July 4, 2023 in observance of Independence Day 
 Special Council Meeting July 11, 2023 at 7:30pm 
 Holy Family Healthcare will be closing their facilities on June 30, 2023 after 11 years of service to the 

community. 
 Strawberry Festival Committee sent a Thank You for the City’s cooperation in making the 2023 festival 

a success. 
 Commissioner Beltran introduced Gage Gardner who is seeking to get involved in the community and 

has filed to run as a City Commissioner in the 2023 November 7, 2023 Election.   
 

Reports of Officers, Boards & Committees; Routine Monthly Reports from Departments: 
 Hartford Public Library Board Minutes 2023 March & April 
 Hartford Public Schools Meeting Minutes, Communications & 2023-2024 Academic Calendar 
 Planning Commission Meeting Minutes 2023 June 
 VB Conservation District – 2023 May 
 VB Senior Services Meeting Minutes & Communications 2023 May 
A. Police & Ordinance – Chief Prince – Commissioners requested information on status of Ordinance 

Officer – Chief Prince has been out of the office on bereavement & personal leave; the Manager is 
waiting on results of a background check for the most recent applicant.   

B. Fire Department – Chief Harting – $1,200 raised during Strawberry Festival; Participated in end of 
school year events; Smoke detectors  are available; Hose Testing Complete; Pump Testing Complete; 
Preparing for VBY Fair; State Fire Marshal is investigating a fire at 105 Engle Way; Fire at 7 West 
Main St; VBMES has been using the station as needed.  

C. Ambulance – Pride Report on file – VBMES took over providing service on June 16, 2023   
D. Van Buren County – Mike Chappell – Animal Control building on County Road 681 is in serious need 

of repair, the County is looking at cost options to meet State requirements to operate.    

52

Item 16.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JUNE 26, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

E. Public Works – Report on file, 2022 Water Quality Report Available 
F. Wastewater Treatment Plant – Report on file  
G. Treasurers, Investment & List of Bills – $114,842.54 
H. City Manager – Weekly Update 6/19/2023; Staffing Update; City Attorney working on several City 

agreements and ordinance updates; Current Litigation update on agenda; VBEMS Agreement; 7 West 
Fire update, review by Building Inspector; 215 Shepard St Demolition update; Planning Commission 
approved Car Wash Site Plan and reviewed ordinance changes; Summer newsletter available; WWTP 
UV Racks under review by Wightman’s.  
 

Approval of Commission Minutes: 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the 
May 18, 2023 special business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place them 
on file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0  
 

Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the 
May 22, 2023 business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place them on file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0 
 

Motion by Commissioner Sullivan, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the, 
June 7, 2023 special business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place them on 
file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0  
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the, 
June 7, 2023 special closed business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place 
them on file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0 
 

Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the, 
June 13, 2023 special business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place them 
on file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0  
 
Motion by Commissioner Sullivan, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the minutes of the, 
June 19, 2023 special closed business meeting of the Hartford City Commission, as presented and place 
them on file.  

                               Motion carried 5 – 0 
 
Approval of Reports:  

Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to accept the May 2023 reports 
of Officers, Boards & Committees and place them on file.    

   Motion carried 5 –   0 
 

Motion by Commissioner Sullivan, supported by Commissioner Dockter, to approve the June 26, 2023 
list of bills in the amount of $965,031.70. 

   Motion carried 5 –   0 
 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Dockter, to approve the July, 2023 list of 
bills in the amount of $33,170.16. 

53

Item 16.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JUNE 26, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

   Motion carried 5 –   0 
 
Goals/Objectives: None 
 
Old Business: 

 Discussion & Consider Re-Releasing Recreational Marihuana RFP  
 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Dockter, to re-release the Recreational 
Marihuana RFP for two weeks.   
  Motion carried 4 – 1 (Danger)   
 
Discussion:  The City Manager is requesting to re-open the Recreational Marihuana RFP for two weeks 
to accept applications by interested parties.  
 

New Business:  
 Discuss & Consider – Closed Session to Discuss & Review Pending Legal Litigation 

 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Danger, to suspend the regular business 
meeting to go into closed session for the purpose of discussing pending legal litigation at 7:59pm.  
  Motion carried 5 – 0 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Danger to return to open session and 
resume the regular meeting at 8:18pm.  
  Motion carried 5 – 0 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Danger to approve the settlement of 
pending legal litigation that was discussed in closed session.  
  Motion carried 5 – 0 

 
 Discuss & Consider – EPS Access Control Equipment Proposal $2,137.81 + Monthly Service 

 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Dockter to approve the Access Control 
Equipment & monthly service as proposed by EPS in the amount of $2,137.81 and authorize the City 
Manager to sign the agreement. 
  Motion carried 5 – 0 
 

 Discuss & Consider – RFP Demolition 106 South Center Street 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Danger to approve the issuance of 
request for Demolition proposal for 106 South Center Street as presented. 
  Motion carried 5 – 0 
 

 Discuss & Consider – Ely Park Rules – The City Manager provided her recommendations and the 
Commission provided their input on the rules and application. The Manager will bring back a policy & 
rules for the park.         

 
 Discuss & Consider – 2022 Fire Board Audit 

 
Motion by Commissioner Beltran, supported by Commissioner Dockter to accept the 2022 Fire Board 
Audit. 

54

Item 16.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JUNE 26, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

  Motion carried 5 – 0 
 
Resolutions, Ordinance, Proclamation’s:  

 Resolution 2023 – 017  Amending Sewer Rates 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adopt Resolution 2023 – 017 
amending the City of Hartford sewer rates.    
   Motion carried 4 – 1 (Danger)  

 
 Resolution 2023 – 018 Amending Water Rates 

 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Sullivan, to adopt Resolution 2023 – 
018 amending the City of Hartford water rates 

Motion carried 4 – 1 (Danger) 
 

 Resolution 2023 – 019 2023/2024 4th Quarter Budget Adjustments 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Sullivan, to adopt Resolution 2023 – 
019 approving the 2023/2024 4th Quarter Budget adjustments.    

Motion carried 5 – 0 
 

 Discuss & Consider Regulation of Garage, Yard, Basement & Private Sales Ordinance 
 
Discussion: Council provided their input and changes to the proposed ordinance.  This ordinance will be 
brought back for a first reading at a future meeting to Include Sunday’s and Monday Holiday’s allowing 
five sales per/year.         
 

Adjournment: 
 
Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adjourn the meeting at 
9:00pm. 
  Motion carried 5 – 0 

 
Respectfully Submitted,         
 
 
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

55

Item 16.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 11, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 
Commissioners Present: Ramon Beltran; Jane Danger; Frank Dockter; John Miller; Helen Sullivan; Terry 
Tibbs; Mayor Richard A. Hall 
Commissions Absent: None 
  
Staff Present:        Rodney-Isbrecht; Shultz; Vitale;  
 

Mayor Richard A. Hall called the business meeting to order at 7:30pm. 
 

Pledge of Allegiance was said.   
 
Motion by Commissioner Sullivan, supported by Commissioner Danger, to change amend the agenda to 
make a motion to terminate Ms. Vitale due to her unsatisfactory performance pursuant section 4 of her 
contract and to pay her severance pay as provided for in her contract section 4 and that this be brought to 
an immediate vote.     

Motion carried 5 – 2 (Dockter, Hall)  
 

Motion by Commissioner Sullivan, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to terminate Ms. Vitale due to 
unsatisfactory performance pursuant to section 4 of her contract and to pay her severance pay as 
provided for in her contract section 4 and that this be voted on immediately.  

Motion carried 5 – 2 (Dockter, Hall) 
 
Guests: None 

 
Public Comment:   

 
Communications: 

 Notice of Hearing Consumers Energy July 12 
 Area Agency on Aging free event Fuel to Learn August 30  
 AllPaid.com credit card payment services program used by the City sent notice in changes to service fee 

charges regardless of  
 Hartford Area Chamber of Commerce sent invitation of 2024 Strawberry Festival Committee Meeting 

July 26 at 6pm.    
 
Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to recess the Commission 
Meeting at 7:42pm. 

Motion carried 7 – 0 
 

Ms. Vitale left the meeting and premises.    
 

Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to resume open session at 7:50pm 
Motion carried 7 – 0 

 
 VB Conservation District Annual Meeting at Fly Wheelers Museum on July 26 RSVP due July 19 
 Summer Tax bills have been mailed which included a copy of the Ordinance regarding Mowing 
 Commissioner Danger attended an event provided by Market Van Buren accepting an award on behalf 

of the City and provided a summary of what makes a good community, investing in your people, 
vibrant updated spaces and keep the community walkable and accessible by non-motorized means. 

56

Item 18.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 11, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 Commissioner Beltran asked for a special meeting to discuss the City Manager position - Thursday July 
13, 2023 at 5:30pm 

 
Reports of Officers, Boards & Committees; Routine Monthly Reports from Departments: 

A. Police & Ordinance – Commissioner Dockter would like to have a Police vehicle parked on Main 
Street that shows police presence.  Reserve Officers will be participating in training soon.  

B. Fire Department – Assistant Chief Kevin McGrew, available for questions on the Audit 
C. Ambulance – City Council asked for monthly reports when they are settled into the community.     
D. Van Buren County –  
E. Public Works –  
F. Wastewater Treatment Plant –  
G. Treasurers, Investment & List of Bills –List of Bills in the amount of $79,086.10 
H. City Manager – Not Discussed 

 
Approval of Commission Minutes: None 
 
Approval of Reports:  

Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Miller, to approve the July 11, 2023 list of 
bills in the amount of $79,086.10  
                               Motion carried 7 – 0                                 

 
Goals/Objectives: Set Goals & Special Meeting Date - Not Discussed 
 
Old Business:   

 Closed Session – Pursuant to MCL 15.268(d) and (h) to discuss the Potential Purchase of Real Property 
& to Discuss a Confidential Attorney – Client Memo 

 
Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Danger, to suspend the special business 
meeting to go into closed session for the purpose of discussing potential purchase of real property & 
discuss a confidential attorney client memo @ 8:03pm.    

  Motion carried 7 – 0 
  
Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Miller, to return to open session and 
resume the regular meeting @ 8:23pm.    
   Motion carried 7 – 0 

 
 Discussion – Ambulance Service/VBEMS Agreement – Van Buren County amended their agreement 

with VBEMS to include the City and other municipalities that wished to participate.   
 

 Discuss & Consider – Brush Pile, Pick-up & Permits -  
 
Discussion:  Options to pick up or dispose of brush beginning August 1, 2023.     

 
Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Tibbs, to allow DPW staff to pick up 
brush monthly, residents will pile brush in the ROW beginning the Saturday before the 4th Tuesday of 
each month, brush must be located in the property’s ROW in neat piles containing no limbs larger than 
4’ long & 6” in diameter, no grass, trash, rubbish or large items will be picked up and leaves will be 
picked up only during designated time in the fall and early spring.    

   Motion carried 7 - 0 
 

57

Item 18.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 11, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 Discuss & Consider – Economic Incentives for Development Update –  
 
Discussion: The City Attorney provided guidance to use sparingly and on a case by case base’s. The 
area of South Center Street extension to I-94 has a separate formula based on the type of business to be 
built as the City took loans to provide the infrastructure improvements.  

 
 Discus & Consider – Event Application & Rules  

 
Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to approve the Ely Park rules 
and application as presented.  
  Motion carried 6 – 1 (Danger) 
 
Discussion:  Change the word fee to Deposit under electric.        

 
 Hartford Fire Department Audit Update -  No Discussion 

 
New Business:  

 Discuss & Consider – Liquor License 40/42 West Main Street – property has been sold and transferring 
liquor license to new owner.  The City can offer the State of Michigan input regarding the transfer.    
 

 Discuss & Consider  - Voluntary Well Metering 
 
Discussion:   A possible option for those who are being charged for sewer only.   This would be an 
option for those who are not within the City’s mandatory connection area. The question was raised about 
Township flat fee customers would they also be allowed to participate in a voluntary well metering 
program? The information will be sent to the City Attorney for his guidance.       
 

 Discuss & Consider – Lawn Meter Program 
  
Discussion:  The Clerk will review & check with the City Attorney for enforceability and bring back to 
Council at a future meeting.       

 
Resolutions, Ordinance, Proclamation’s:  

 Proposed Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.01 Regulating Garage, Yard, Basement & Private Sale 
Regulations -  
 
Discussion:  extend the times for sales, the number days and the number of sales allowed per/year.  
 

 Discuss Amendment to Ordinance 110.03 Peddler & Solicitor Regulations Section 4.1 
 
Discussion:  Include the requirement the peddler must have identification/badge who they are 
representing. 
 

 Discuss Codification Ordinance 
 
Discussion:  Goal to bring ordinances current with updates & codification.   

 
Adjournment: 

58

Item 18.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 11, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Danger, to adjourn the meeting at 
8:57pm. 
  Motion carried 7 – 0  

 
 
 
Respectfully Submitted,         
 
 
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

59

Item 18.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 13, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 
Commissioners Present: Ramon Beltran; Jane Danger; Frank Dockter; John Miller; Helen Sullivan; Terry 
Tibbs; and Mayor Richard A. Hall; 
Commissioners Absent:   None 
Staff Present:          Rodney-Isbrecht; Shultz 
 

 
Mayor Richard A. Hall called the special meeting to order at 5:30pm. 

 
The Pledge of Allegiance was said.   
 

 Discussion & Consider the City Manager Position – Council discussed the need for an Interim Manager.  
Council received a recommendation & the Mayor has reached out to the individual but does not have 
enough information to share with the rest of the Council at the time of this meeting.  Council will set a 
special meeting next week if the individual is interested based on their availability.     

 
 Consider Resolution 2023 – 020 – Designating Signatory’s on City of Hartford Financial Accounts 

 
Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adopt Resolution 2023 – 020 
Designating Signatory’s City of Hartford Financial Accounts. 
  Motion carried 7 – 0  

 
Adjournment: 

 
Motion by Commissioner Tibbs, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adjourn the meeting at 5:47pm. 
  Motion carried 7 – 0  

 
 
Respectfully Submitted,         
 
 
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

60

Item 20.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
PROPOSED SPECIAL BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES 

JULY 19, 2023 

County of Van Buren, State of Michigan, 19 West Main St, Hartford, MI 49057 

 
Commissioners Present: Ramon Beltran; Jane Danger; Frank Dockter; John Miller; Helen Sullivan; Mayor 
Richard A. Hall; 
Commissioners Absent:   Terry Tibbs 
Staff Present:          Rodney-Isbrecht; Shultz; Staunton 
 

 
Mayor Richard A. Hall called the special meeting to order at 6:00pm. 

 
The Pledge of Allegiance was said.   
 

 Discussion & Consider the Interim City Manager Position – Council discussed if they wanted a full time 
or part time Interim Manager.  Council received a recommendation & a letter of interest from 
Christopher Tapper to act as Interim Manager.  Council interviewed Christopher Tapper who is working 
as Village Manager of Decatur full time but willing to explore options to help out part time depending 
on the number of hours the Council needed or what would be required.      

 
Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to authorize the Mayor to negotiate 
with Christopher Tapper to act as interim manager and work with the City Attorney on a 
contract/agreement..    

Motion carried 6 – 0 
 

Motion by Commissioner Dockter, supported by Commissioner Beltran, authorize a Request for 
Proposals for contractual services to search for City Manager candidates.    

Motion carried 6 – 0 
 

 Discuss & Consider Staff Updates - Department of Public Works Superintendent Dan Staunton gave 
updates on current Construction Projects 
 

 Discuss & Consider Staff Updates – Staff are currently operating under the Executive Organization Act 
of 1965 (Excerpt) Act 380 of 1965, 16.106 Deputy Department heads; powers and duties in the absence 
of a City Manager.    
 

Adjournment: 
 
Motion by Commissioner Miller, supported by Commissioner Beltran, to adjourn the meeting at 
7:03pm. 
  Motion carried 6 – 0  

 
 
Respectfully Submitted,         
 
 
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

61

Item 21.



CITY OF HARTFORD 

COUNTY OF VAN BUREN 

STATE OF MICHIGAN 

PROPOSED AMENDMENT 

SECOND READING 

 

THE CITY OF HARTFORD ORDAINS: 

Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.01 REGULATING GARAGE, YARD, BASEMENT, AND PRIVATE 

SALE REGULATIONS 

Section  3.54  Conditions and Limitations 

Garage, yard, basement, or other similar or private sales shall be subject to the following conditions and 

limitations: 

 

A. Such sales may be held on a Thursday, Friday, Saturday and Sunday during the hours of 8:00 a.m. 

through 6:00 p.m. A permit must be obtained on the Wednesday the week prior to the sale date. The fee 

for said permit shall be set by Council from time to time five ($5.00) for a three four-day sale. 

 

B. No sale shall be commenced if the proposed sale would in any manner constitute an unreasonable 

nuisance to the neighborhood from noise, traffic, lighting, hours of operation, or the nature of the 

merchandise offered for sale. The garage and or yard where the sale is taking place shall be kept in a 

neat and orderly manner. 

 

C. No sale shall continue for a period of more than three (3) five (5) days, including Memorial Day and/or 

Labor Day. 

 

D. No more than three (3) five (5) such sales per calendar year shall be conducted on the same premises, 

including the two (2) one (1) free City-wide sale each year during the Memorial Day weekend and 

Labor Day weekend. 

 

E. Advertising signs concerning such sale shall be self-supporting only and shall be set up only during the 

hours the sale is being conducted. Such signs shall be removed immediately after 

the sale is finished. 

 

Section 3.55 Advertising Sign Requirements  

 

A. In any area, signs for advertising on site home occupations, sale of products derived from the land or 

premises upon which the sign is located, or sale of the premises shall be permitted without permit 

provided it meets the following criteria: 

1. It does not exceed nine (9) square feet. 

2. It shall be no closer to the street right-of-way than ten (10) feet. 

3. It does not interfere with public safety. 

4. Signs must be fifteen (15) feet from side lot lines. 

5. No sign shall be more than ten (10) feet high. 

6. No illuminated signs. 

 

B. A. All advertising signs located on other than the sale premises will indicate that permission has been 

received from the owner of the sign site property. 

 

C. B. All advertising signs will indicate the hours and dates of the sale. 

62

Item 23.



 

D. No advertising signs will be posted in the city for sales on premises located in another governmental 

unit. 

 

Section 3.56 Storage of Merchandise  
 

All merchandise offered for sale shall be stored inside the buildings located upon the premises except during the 

period of the sale. 

 

Section 3.57 Penalty for Violation  
 

A violation of the provisions of Section 3.54 through 3.56 is a municipal civil infraction violation. 

 

 

Ordinance amendment declared adopted upon publication.   

 

The City of Hartford 

 

_______________________________   

RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, Clerk  

 

First Reading:  July 11, 2023 

Second Reading:  July 24, 2023  

Adopted:     

Published:    

63

Item 23.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
COUNTY OF VAN BUREN 
STATE OF MICHIGAN 
PROPOSED AMENDMENT 
SECOND READING 
 

THE CITY OF HARTFORD ORDAINS: 
Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.03 REGULATING PRIVATE PLACES; ACTIVITIES AND 
CONDUCT COMMERCIAL AREAS ARTICLE 1 PEDDLERS; SOLICITORS; TRANSIENT 
MERCHANTS AND PHOTOGRAPHERS DIVISION 1: PEDDLERS; SOLICITORS 

Section  4.1 General Provisions Relating to Licenses Required By Article.  

A. Application of Section: The provisions of this section shall apply to licenses required by and issued 
under this chapter; provided; however, that, if any provision of this section is in conflict with any 
provision of this chapter relating to a specific license, the latter provision shall govern. 

 
B. License: Any person, firm or corporation that sells items from a walking, movable or stationary 

location in a public place, upon commercial property, or door to door, shall be required to obtain a 
license from the City of Hartford for each location or vehicle from which such sales takes place. The 
license fee shall be as follows: 

1. Annual License: An annual license hundred in an amount as set  by Council  f rom time 
to t ime shall be charged. A year is defined as being one (1) year from issuance of said license. 

2. Special Event License: A special event license fee of twenty ($20.00) dollars per twenty-four 
(24) hour day shall be charged. 

C. Exceptions: Excluded from this Article are service organizations and civic organizations, churches, as 
commercial/retail stores selling on their own property. 

 
Section 4. 2 Use of Specific Portions of Streets by Peddlers and Special License Therefor.  
 

A. It shall be unlawful for any person, either directly or by his agents or employees, to sell, keep for sale 
or offer for sale any foodstuffs, fruits, vegetables, nuts, candies, rent to own furniture and equipment, 
computers, cellphones, internet service, utility service or utility carrier services or any other 
merchandise or goods whatsoever, except newspapers, from any stand, stall, cart, wagon, pack, basket, 
box from the hand or in any other manner, including door to door sales, on any public street, alley, 
sidewalk, curb or curb lawn in the city, provided that if application therefore, stating the goods or 
merchandise to be sold and the place and manner of selling the same, shall be made by any person, the 
city commission may, if it shall determine that such selling of goods and merchandise at the place and 
in the manner specified in the application will not cause congestion and interference with traffic, and 
will not cause accidents or be a nuisance and annoyance to the public, and will not be dangerous to 
the public or a detriment to the public welfare, set apart, permit and authorize the issuance of a license 
for the use and occupation of any part or portion of any public street, alley, sidewalk, curb or curb lawn 
in the city for any of the purposes herein before in this section prohibited. 

B. No license shall be granted or issued under this section, except upon payment to the city of a license 
fee to be fixed by the city commission from time-to-time. Such license, when granted and issued, shall 
not be transferable and shall contain a definite description, by metes and bounds, of the part or portion 
of any public street, alley, sidewalk, curb or curb lawn therein and thereby permitted and licensed to be 
used and occupied. 

C. This section shall not prevent a peddler regularly licensed under section 4.2A of this article from 
selling his goods, wares or merchandise, from house to house or for asking sales from his cart or other 
vehicle to householders along the route such peddler or huckster is traveling, provided he complies 
with all applicable provisions of this article and other ordinances and, provided further, that he shall 
not stop or make any sales in any public area not set aside under a license issued pursuant to this 
section. 

64

Item 24.



D. This section is intended to prevent congestion and interference with traffic by persons soliciting, 
offering for sale and selling, peanuts, popcorn, and other merchandise in and from stands, carts, and 
other containers located on the curbs, streets, and sidewalks, and to prevent accidents and the nuisance, 
annoyance, and danger to the public resulting from such practices. 

 
Section 4.20 Penalty for Violation  

A person, firm or corporation convicted of violating this section is guilty of a misdemeanor punishable as 
set forth in Chapter 1 Section 1.4 (C). Chapter 10.99 of this Code of Ordinances. 

 
Ordinance amendment declared adopted upon publication.   
 
The City of Hartford 

 
_______________________________   
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, Clerk  
 
First Reading:  July 11, 2023 
Second Reading:  July 24, 2023  
Adopted:     
Published:    

65

Item 24.



CITY OF HARTFORD 
COUNTY OF VAN BUREN 
STATE OF MICHIGAN 
PROPOSED AMENDMENT 
SECOND READING 
 

THE CITY OF HARTFORD ORDAINS: 
Amendment to Code of Ordinance Chapter 10 General Provisions Section 10.17 Ordinances which amend or 
supplement code 

Section 10.17 Ordinances Which Amend or Supplement Code Codification of Ordinances 

(A) If the legislative body shall desire to amend any existing chapter or section of this code, the chapter or 
section shall be specifically repealed and a new chapter or section, containing the desired amendment, 
substituted in its place.  

(B) Any ordinance which is proposed to add to the existing code a new chapter or section shall indicate, 
with reference to the arrangement of this code, the proper number of the chapter or section.  In addition 
to the indication thereof as may appear in the text of the proposed ordinance, a caption or title shall be 
shown in concise form above the ordinance.  

 
(a) The City Clerk shall be responsible for codifying this Code and making it available for inspection by the 

general public. Ordinances which are of a general and permanent nature shall be included within such 
codification. 

(b) In preparing a codification of this Code, all portions of the Code which have been repealed shall be 
excluded from the Code by the omission thereof.  

(c) When preparing a codification to this Code, the Clerk may make formal, nonsubstantive changes in 
ordinances and parts of ordinances included insofar as it is necessary to do so to embody them into a 
unified code. For example, the codifier may:  

(1) Organize the ordinance material into appropriate subdivisions; 

(2) Provide appropriate captions, headings and titles, for sections and other subdivisions of the Code 
printed in the supplement, and make changes in such captions, headings, and titles;  

(3) Assign appropriate numbers to sections and other subdivisions to be inserted in the Code and, where 
necessary to accommodate new material, change existing section or other subdivision numbers;  

(4) Change the words “this ordinance” or words of the same meaning to “this chapter,” “this article,” 
“this division,” etc., as the case may be, or to “sections __________ to __________” (inserting 
section numbers to indicate the sections of the Code which embody the substantive sections of the 
ordinance incorporated into the Code); and  

(5) Make other nonsubstantive changes or correct typographical errors as necessary to preserve the 
original meaning of ordinance sections inserted into the Code; but in no case shall the codifier 
otherwise make any change in the meaning or effect of ordinance material.  

Publication and Effective Date:  The City Clerk shall cause this ordinance or a notice of adoption of this 
ordinance to be published.  This ordinance shall take effect upon such publication. 
The City of Hartford 

 
 
 
 
 

66

Item 25.



 
 
_____________________________   
RoxAnn Rodney-Isbrecht, Clerk  
 
First Reading:  July 11, 2023 
Second Reading:  July 24, 2023  
Adopted:     
Published:    
 

 

CERTIFICATION 

 

This true and complete copy of Ordinance No. ____ was declared adopted at a regular meeting of the Hartford 
City Commission held on ____________, 2023. 

 

       
                     Richard A. Hall, Mayor 

 
       

                      RoxAn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 
 

67

Item 25.



 
 
 

CITY OF HARTFORD 
COUNTY OF VAN BUREN 
STATE OF MICHIGAN 
PROPOSED 
FIRST READING 
 

ORDINANCE NO. ______ 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE FIRST TWO DIVISIONS OF CHAPTER 150 OF THE 
HARTFORD CITY CODE TO PROVIDE UPDATED BUILDING REGULATIONS TO 
ADDRESS NEW CONSTRUCTION, PROPERTY MAINTENANCE, AND 
DANGEROUS BUILDINGS 

The City of Hartford ordains: 

Section 1. Amendment. The first division of Chapter 15 of the Hartford City Code is amended to read in its 
entirety as follows: 

ADOPTION OF REGULATORY CODES BY REFERENCE 

Sec. 150.1. Administration and enforcement of Michigan Construction Code.  

The City has assumed responsibility for the administration and enforcement of the Michigan Construction 
Code, including the building, electrical, plumbing and mechanical codes, throughout its corporate limits. The 
City’s building official is principally charged with the administration and enforcement of the codes. Any fees 
provided for in the codes shall be as prescribed by resolution of the City Commission.  

Sec. 150.2. Enforcement of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition. 

(a) Adoption of code. The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition, including Appendix A, as 
promulgated and published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted by reference as the Property 
Maintenance Code of the City of Hartford, subject to the modifications provided herein and subject to 
such further modifications as the City shall adopt from time to time.  

(b) Definitions. Whenever the words "city," "jurisdiction" or "governmental unit" are used in the International 
Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition, they shall mean the City of Hartford. Whenever the word 
"state" is used in the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition, it shall mean the State of 
Michigan.  

(c) Amendments to the Property Maintenance Code. The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 
Edition, including Appendix A, is amended as follows:  

(1) Section 101.1 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known and may be cited as the "Property Maintenance Code 
of the City of Hartford," and will be referred to in this article as this "Code."  

(2) Section 102.3 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

102.3. Application of other codes. Repairs, additions, or alterations to a structure, or changes of 
occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and provisions of the Michigan Building 
Code, the Michigan Residential Code, the Michigan Mechanical Code, the Michigan Plumbing Code, 
the Michigan Electrical Code and any applicable fire codes. Nothing in this Code shall be construed 
to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of the City of Hartford Zoning Ordinance.  

(3) Section 102.3.1 is added to read in its entirety:  

68

Item 26.



 
 
 

102.3.1. Reference to other codes. Whenever the "International Building Code" or "building code" is 
referenced in this Code it shall mean the Michigan Building Code. Whenever the "International 
Mechanical Code" is referenced in this Code it shall mean the Michigan Mechanical Code. Whenever 
the "International Plumbing Code" is referenced in this Code it shall mean the Michigan Plumbing 
Code. Whenever the "International Electrical Code" or "NFPA 70" is referenced in this Code it shall 
mean the Michigan Electrical Code. Whenever the "International Zoning Code" is referenced in this 
Code it shall mean the City of Hartford Zoning Ordinance.  

(4) Section 103.1 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

103.1. General. Whenever the terms "code official" or "building official" are used in this Code it 
shall mean the designated building official of the City.  

(5) Section 103.4 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

103.4. Liability. The code official, member of the City of Hartford Construction Board of Appeals or 
City employee charged with the enforcement of this Code, while acting for the City, in good faith 
and without malice in the discharge of the duties required by this Code or other pertinent law or 
ordinance, shall not be rendered liable personally, and is relieved from all personal liability for any 
damage accruing to persons or property as a result of an act or by reason of an act or omission in the 
discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted against any officer or employee because of an act 
performed by that officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and under the provisions of 
this Code shall be defended by legal representative of the City until the final termination of the 
proceedings. The code official or any subordinate shall not be liable for costs in an action, suit or 
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this Code.  

(6) Section 103.5 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

 103.5. Fees. The City Commission shall by resolution from time to time, establish a fee schedule for 
permits under this Code.  

(7) Section 106.3 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

 106.3. Prosecution of violation. Any person failing to comply with a notice of violation or order 
served in accordance with Section 107 shall be deemed responsible for a municipal civil infraction, 
and the violation shall be deemed a strict liability offense. If the notice of violation is not complied 
with, the code official shall institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct 
or abate such violation, or to require the removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the 
structure in violation of the provisions of this Code or of the order or direction made pursuant to this 
Code. Any action taken by the City on such premises shall be charged against the real estate upon 
which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon such real estate.  

(8) Section 106.4 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

 106.4. Violation penalties. Any violation of this Code shall be punishable as a municipal civil 
infraction as provided in and subject to the fines and penalties provided under Code of Ordinances of 
the City of Hartford.  

(9) Section 111.1 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

 111.1. Construction Board of Appeals. All appeals under this Code shall be brought before the City 
of Hartford Construction Board of Appeals which board is authorized and has jurisdiction to hear and 
decide appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the code official relative to the 
application and interpretation of this Code, using the rules of procedures adopted by the Construction 
Board of Appeals.  

(10) Section 111.2 is deleted in its entirety.  

69

Item 26.



 
 
 

(11) Section 111.2.1 is deleted in its entirety.  

(12) Section 111.2.2 is deleted in its entirety.  

(13) Section 111.2.3 is deleted in its entirety.  

(14) Section 111.2.4 is deleted in its entirety.  

(15) Section 111.2.5 is deleted in its entirety.  

(16) Section 111.3 is deleted in its entirety.  

(17) Section 111.4 is deleted in its entirety.  

(18) Section 111.4.1 is deleted in its entirety.  

(19) Section 111.5 is deleted in its entirety.  

(20) Section 111.6 is deleted in its entirety.  

(21) Section 111.6.1 is deleted in its entirety.  

(22) Section 111.6.2 is deleted in its entirety.  

(23) Section 111.7 is deleted in its entirety.  

(24) Section 111.8 is deleted in its entirety.  

(25) Section 112.4 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

112.4. Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a 
stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition, shall be in violation of this Code.  

(26) Section 201.3 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

201.3. Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in this Code and are defined in the 
Michigan Building Code, the Michigan Residential Code, the Michigan Mechanical Code, the 
Michigan Plumbing Code, the Michigan Electrical Code, any applicable fire code, or the City of 
Hartford Zoning Ordinance, such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them as stated in those 
codes or ordinances.  

(27) Section 302.4 insert "eight (8) inches in height."  

(28) Section 304.14 insert "May 1 to October 31."  

(29) Section 602.2 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

602.2. Residential occupancies. Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities capable of 
maintaining a room temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms 
based on the winter outdoor design temperature as provided within the Michigan Plumbing Code. 
Cooking appliances shall not be used to provide space heating to meet the requirements of this 
section.  

(30) Section 602.3 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

602.3. Heat supply. Every owner or operator of any building who rents, leases, or lets one or more 
dwelling unit, rooming unit, dormitory or guestroom on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish 
a heating system to the occupants thereof shall supply heat during the period from October 1 to May 
1 to maintain a temperature of not less than 65 degrees F. (18 degrees C.) in all habitable rooms, 
bathrooms, and toilet rooms.  

70

Item 26.



 
 
 

Exception: When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for the 
locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be required provided that the 
heating system is operating at its full design capacity. The winter outdoor design temperature for the 
City shall be 6 degrees F.  

(31) Section 602.4 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:  

 602.4. Occupiable work spaces. Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat during 
the period from October 1 to May 1 to maintain a temperature of not less than 65 degrees F during 
the period the spaces are occupied.  

 Exceptions: Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special temperature 
conditions or areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.  

(d) Copies of code. A complete copy of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition, including 
Appendix A, is available for public use, inspection and purchase at the offices of the City Clerk.  

Section 2. Amendment. The second division of Chapter 150 of the Hartford City Code, which is currently named 
“Certificate of Occupancy,” is hereby renamed “Dangerous Buildings” and is amended to read in its entirety as 
follows: 

Dangerous Buildings 

Sec. 150.20. Dangerous building and structures ordinance. 

This ordinance is specifically authorized by the housing law, 1917 PA 167, as amended, and shall be known 
and cited as the City of Hartford Dangerous Buildings Ordinance. 

Sec. 150.21. Dangerous building unlawful. 

It shall be unlawful for any owner, agent, lessee or party in interest to keep or maintain any building or part 
thereof which is a dangerous building or structure as defined in this ordinance. 

Sec. 150.22. Dangerous building defined. 

As used in this ordinance, the term “dangerous building” means any building or structure, residential or 
otherwise, which has any of the following defects or is in any of the following conditions: 

(a) A door, aisle, passageway, stairway, or other means of exit does not conform to the requirements of 
applicable fire codes. 

(b) A portion of the building or structure is damaged by fire, wind, flood, deterioration, neglect, abandonment, 
vandalism, or other cause so that the structural strength or stability of the building or structure is 
significantly impaired and the structure does not meet the minimum requirements of the housing law or 
the Michigan Building Code for a new building or structure, purpose, or location. 

(c) A part of the building or structure is likely to fall, become detached or dislodged, or collapse and injure 
persons or damage property. 

(d) A portion of the building or structure has settled to an extent that walls or other structural portions of the 
building or structure have materially less resistance to wind than is required in the case of new construction 
by the housing law or the Michigan Building Code. 

(e) The building or structure, or a part of the building or structure, because of dilapidation, deterioration, 
decay, faulty construction, the removal or movement of some portion of the ground necessary for the 
support, or for other reason, is likely to partially or completely collapse, or some portion of the foundation 
or underpinning of the building or structure is likely to fall or give way. 

(f) The building, structure, or a part of the building or structure is manifestly unsafe for the purpose for which 
it is used. 

71

Item 26.



 
 
 

(g) The building or structure is damaged by fire, wind, or flood, is dilapidated or deteriorated and becomes 
an attractive nuisance to children who might play in the building or structure to their danger, becomes a 
harbor for vagrants, criminals, or immoral persons, or enables persons to resort to the building or structure 
for committing a nuisance or an unlawful act. 

(h) A building or structure used or intended to be used for dwelling purposes, including the adjoining grounds, 
because of dilapidation, decay, damage, faulty construction or arrangement, or for other reason, is 
unsanitary or unfit for human habitation, is in a condition likely to cause sickness or disease, or is likely 
to injure the health, safety, or general welfare of people living in the dwelling. 

(i) A building or structure is vacant, dilapidated, and open at door or window, leaving the interior of the 
building exposed to the elements or accessible to entrance by trespassers. 

Sec. 150.23. Notice of dangerous building. 

(a) The City’s building official may issue a notice pursuant to this section upon finding that a building or 
structure is a dangerous building. The notice shall be served on the owner, agent, or lessee registered with 
the City. If an owner, agent, or lessee is not registered with the City, the notice shall be served on each 
owner of or party in interest in the building or structure in whose name the property appears on the last 
local tax assessment records. 

(b) The notice shall specify the time and place of a hearing on whether the building or structure is a dangerous 
building. The person to whom the notice is directed shall have the opportunity to show cause at the hearing 
why the hearing officer should not order the building or structure to be demolished, otherwise made safe, 
or properly maintained. 

(c) The hearing officer shall be appointed by the mayor to serve at his or her pleasure. The hearing officer 
shall be a person who has expertise in housing matters including, but not limited to, an engineer, architect, 
building contractor, building inspector, or member of a community housing organization. An employee 
of the City shall not be appointed as hearing officer. The City shall file a copy of the notice that the 
building or structure is a dangerous building with the hearing officer. 

(d) The notice shall be in writing and shall be served upon the person to whom the notice is directed either 
personally or by certified mail, return receipt requested, addressed to the owner or party in interest at the 
address shown on the tax records. If a notice is served on a person by certified mail, a copy of the notice 
shall also be posted upon a conspicuous part of the building or structure. The notice shall be served upon 
the owner or party in interest at least 10 days before the date of the hearing included in the notice. 

Sec. 150.24. Hearings and other proceedings. 

(a) At the hearing, the hearing officer shall take testimony of the City, the owner of the property, and any 
interested party. Not more than 5 days after completion of the hearing, the hearing officer shall render a 
decision either closing the proceedings or ordering the building or structure demolished, otherwise made 
safe, or properly maintained. 

(b) If the hearing officer determines that the building or structure should be demolished, otherwise made safe, 
or properly maintained, the hearing officer shall enter an order that specifies what action the owner, agent, 
or lessee shall take and sets a date by which the owner, agent, or lessee shall comply with the order. If the 
building is a dangerous building under the provisions of this ordinance, the order may require the owner 
or agent, to bring and maintain the exterior of the building and adjoining grounds into compliance 
including, but not limited to, the maintenance of lawns, trees, and shrubs. 

(c) If the owner, agent, or lessee fails to appear or neglects or refuses to comply with the order issued under 
subsection (b), the hearing officer shall file a report of the findings and a copy of the order with the City’s 
construction board of appeals not more than 5 days after the date for compliance set in the order and 

72

Item 26.



 
 
 

request that necessary action be taken to enforce the order. A copy of the findings and order of the hearing 
officer shall be served on the owner, agent, or lessee in the manner prescribed in Section 150.23. 

(d) The construction board of appeals shall set a date not less than 30 days after the hearing prescribed in 
subsection (a) for an appellate hearing on the findings and order of the hearing officer. The construction 
board of appeals shall give notice to the owner, agent, or lessee in the manner prescribed in Section 150.23 
of the time and place of the hearing. At the hearing, the owner, agent, or lessee shall be given the 
opportunity to show cause why the order should not be enforced. The construction board of appeals shall 
either approve, disapprove, or modify the order. If the construction board of appeals approves or modifies 
the order, the City shall take all necessary action to enforce the order. If the order is approved or modified, 
the owner, agent, or lessee shall comply with the order within 60 days after the date of the hearing under 
this subsection. For an order of demolition, if the construction board of appeals of the City determines that 
the building or structure has been substantially destroyed by fire, wind, flood, deterioration, neglect, 
abandonment, vandalism, or other cause, and the cost of repair of the building or structure will be greater 
than the state equalized value of the building or structure, the owner, agent, or lessee shall comply with 
the order of demolition within 21 days after the date of the hearing under this subsection. If the estimated 
cost of repair exceeds the state equalized value of the building or structure to be repaired, a rebuttable 
presumption that the building or structure requires expedited demolition exists. 

(e) The cost of demolition includes, but is not limited to, fees paid to hearing officers, costs of title searches 
or commitments used to determine the parties in interest, recording fees for notices and liens filed with 
the county register of deeds, demolition and dumping charges, court reporter attendance fees, and costs of 
the collection of the charges authorized under this ordinance. The cost of the demolition, of making the 
building safe, or of maintaining the exterior of the building or structure or grounds adjoining the building 
or structure incurred by the City to bring the property into conformance with this ordinance shall be 
reimbursed to the City by the owner or party in interest in whose name the property appears. 

(f) The owner or party in interest in whose name the property appears upon the last local tax assessment 
records shall be notified by the assessor of the amount of the cost of the demolition, of making the building 
safe, or of maintaining the exterior of the building or structure or grounds adjoining the building or 
structure by first class mail at the address shown on the records. If the owner or party in interest fails to 
pay the cost within 30 days after mailing by the assessor of the notice of the amount of the cost, the City 
shall have a lien for the cost incurred by the City to bring the property into conformance with this 
ordinance. The lien shall not take effect until notice of the lien has been filed or recorded as provided by 
law. A lien provided for in this subsection does not have priority over previously filed or recorded liens 
and encumbrances. The lien for the cost shall be collected and treated in the same manner as provided for 
property tax liens under the general property tax act, 1893 PA 206, as amended. 

(g) In addition to the other remedies provided under this ordinance, the City may bring an action against the 
owner of a dangerous building or structure for the full cost of demolition, of making the building safe, or 
of maintaining the exterior or grounds adjoining a dangerous building or structure. The City shall have a 
lien on the property for the amount of a judgment obtained under this subsection. The lien provided for in 
this subsection shall not take effect until notice of the lien is filed or recorded as provided by law. The lien 
does not have priority over prior filed or recorded liens and encumbrances. 

Sec. 150.25. Enforcement of judgment against other assets. 

(a) A judgment in an action brought pursuant to subsection 150.24(g) may be enforced against assets of the 
owner other than the building or structure. 

(b) The City shall have a lien for the amount of a judgment obtained pursuant to subsection 150.24(g) against 
the owner’s interest in all real property located in this state that is owned in whole or in part by the owner 
of the building or structure against whom the judgment is obtained. A lien provided for in this section 

73

Item 26.



 
 
 

does not take effect until notice of the lien is filed or recorded as provided by law, and the lien does not 
have priority over prior filed or recorded liens or encumbrances. 

Sec. 150.26. Penalties. 

(a) A person who violates any provision of this dangerous building ordinance shall be responsible for a 
municipal civil infraction. 

(b) A person who fails or refuses to comply with an order approved or modified by the construction board of 
appeals is guilty of misdemeanor punishable by imprisonment for not more than 120 days or a fine of not 
more than $1,000 or both. 

Sec. 150.27. Appeal of circuit court. 

An owner or party in interest aggrieved by any final decision of the construction board of appeals may appeal 
the decision or order to the Van Buren County Circuit Court by filing an appeal within 20 days from the date 
of such decision. 

Section 3. Publication and Effective Date.  The City Clerk shall cause this ordinance or a notice of adoption of 
this ordinance to be published.  This ordinance shall take effect upon such publication. 

 
First Reading:  July 24, 2023 
Second Reading:   
Adopted:     
Published:   

CERTIFICATION 
 
This true and complete copy of Ordinance No. ____ was declared adopted at a regular meeting of the Hartford 
City Commission held on ____________, 2023. 

 
       

                     Richard A. Hall, Mayor 
 

       
                      RoxAn Rodney-Isbrecht, City Clerk 

74

Item 26.


	Top
	Item 1.	VBCD - June 2023 Program Updates
	VBCD_2023JuneProgramReport

	Item 2.	Notice of Public Hearing - I & M August 16, 2023 10am
	Xerox Scan_07202023101109

	Item 3.	Hartford Chamber Summer Newsletter
	2023 Summer Newsletter

	Item 4.	HPS - 2023 July 10 Minutes
	hps_2023july10

	Item 5.	HRC - 2023 June Minutes
	June 2023 Minutes

	Item 6.	HPD - 2023 June
	Xerox Scan_07172023163655

	Item 7.	HPD - 2023 May
	Xerox Scan_07202023170702

	Item 8.	HFD - Board Representative Report
	HFD_RepresentativeReport

	Item 9.	HFD - Board Reports
	July 10, 2023 Hartford Fire Board Organizational Meeting
	July 10, 2023 Hartford Fire Board Meeting

	Item 10.	HFD - Chief 2023 June
	Xerox Scan_07102023093836

	Item 11.	AMB - Pride 2023 June
	hartford city 06-23

	Item 12.	VBC - Board Report 2023 June
	2023-6 Monthly BOC Activity Report

	Item 13.	List of Bills - July 24, 2023 $157,250.84
	ListofBills2023July24

	Item 14.	June 2023 Investment Report
	2023juneInvestmentReport

	Item 15.	2023 June 19 Special
	2023june19specialmeeting

	Item 16.	2023June 26 Business
	2023june26meetingmin

	Item 18.	2023 July 11 Business
	2023julybusiness

	Item 20.	2023 July 13 Special
	2023july13specialmeeting

	Item 21.	2023 July 19 Special
	2023july19specialmeeting

	Item 23.	Proposed Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.01 Regulating Garage, Yard, Basement and Private Sale Regulations
	AmendmenttoOrdinanceRegulstinggarageyardbasementprivatesalechapter 110_01_2023july24_12ndreadRRI

	Item 24.	Proposed Amendment to Code of Ordinance 110.03 Peddler & Solicitor Regulations Section 4.1
	amendmenttoordinanceRegulatingPeddlerschapter110_03_2023july24_2ndreadRRI

	Item 25.	Discuss - Codification Ordinance
	amendmentordinancecodificationofordinancechapter10_17_2023july24_2ndreadRRI

	Item 26.	Discuss & Consider Proposed Building Regulation Ordinance
	PROPOSEDBUILDINGANDDANGEROUSORDINANCE2023JULY24

	Bottom

