
 

 

BOARD OF ALDERMAN REGULAR MEETING 

1 GOVERNMENT CTR, BALLWIN, MO 63011 
MONDAY, FEBRUARY 28, 2022 at 7:00 PM 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Roll Call 

3. Pledge of Allegiance 

4. Approval of Minutes 

a. February 14, 2022 Board of Aldermen Meeting Minutes 

5. Citizen Comments 

6. Legislation 

a. Bill 4118 - MSD Easement 

b. Bill 4119 - Clayton Ridge Parking 

7. Consent Items 

a. Administration - 2022 Salary Increases 

b. Parks - Turf Management Equipment 

c. Police - PD Building Lockers & Shelving 

d. Public Works - Cement 

e. Public Works - Cold Milling 

f. Public Works - Striping 

8. Mayor’s Report 

9. City Administrator’s Report 

10. City Attorney’s Report 

11. Staff Reports 

a. Parks - Apparel 

b. Parks - Median Maintenance 

c. Parks - Treadmill Purchase 2022 

d. Public Works - Crushed Rock 

e. Public Works - Ready Mix Concrete 

f. Public Works - Ready Mix Sand 

g. Public Works - Sweeping 

h. Public Works - Two-Ton Truck 

12. Aldermanic Comments 

13. Closed Session 

14. Adjourn 
 

NOTE: Due to ongoing City business, all meeting agendas should be considered tentative. Additional issues may be introduced 

during the course of the meeting. 

CLOSED SESSION: Pursuant to Section 610.022 RSMo., The Board of Aldermen could, at any time during the meeting, vote 

to close the public meeting and move to closed session to discuss legal matters, personnel/employee matters, and/or real estate, 

as provided under Sections 610.021(1) RSMo., 610.021(2) RSMo., 610.021(3) RSMo. 
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ADA NOTICE: Residents of Ballwin are afforded an equal opportunity to participate in the programs and services of the City 

of Ballwin regardless of race, color, religion, sex, age, disability, familial status, national origin or political affiliation.  If one 

requires an accommodation, please call (636) 227-8580 V or (636) 527-9200 TDD or 1-800-735-2466 (Relay Missouri) no 

later than 5:00 p.m. on the third business day preceding the hearing.  Offices are open between 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday 

through Friday. 
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THE MINUTES ARE PREPARED IN SUMMARY TO REFLECT THE OVERALL DISCUSSIONS, NOT VERBATIM QUOTES. 

 

The meeting was called to order by Mayor Pogue at 7:00 p.m. 

 

ROLL CALL 

 

Present       Absent 

Mayor Tim Pogue  

Alderman Mike Utt  

Alderman Michael Finley 

Alderman Kevin M. Roach 

Alderman Mark Stallmann 

Alderman Frank Fleming 

Alderman Jim Leahy  

Alderman Ross Bullington 

Alderman Raymond Kerlagon 

City Administrator Eric Sterman 

City Attorney Robert Jones 

 

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited. 

 

MINUTES___________________________________________________________________ 

The minutes from the January 24, 2022 Board of Aldermen meeting were submitted for approval. A motion was 

made by Alderman Fleming and seconded by Alderman Finley to approve the minutes from the January 24, 2022 

Board of Aldermen meeting as submitted. A voice vote was taken with unanimous affirmative result and the 

motion passed. 
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PRESENTATION____________________________________________________________ 

Police Chief Doug Schaeffler introduced police officers recently hired by the City: 

 

Officer Steve Downs started on October 11, 2021. He has 14 years’ experience with the Normandy and St. Ann 

Police Departments. He attended Columbia College where he earned an associate’s degree in criminal justice. 

 

Officer Steve Cox started on December 20, 2021. He came to us from Berkeley Police Department. He graduated 

from the Eastern Missouri Police Academy and also holds an EMT Certificate from Florissant Valley Community 

College. 

 

Officer Jordan Lee started on December 27, 2021. He formerly worked with security services at Six Flags and 

was named their Rookie of the Year in 2020. He attended the Missouri Sheriff’s Academy in Franklin County. 

 

Officer Ceriana Davis started on January 25, 2022. She attended the Jefferson County Law Enforcement Academy 

where she earned high praise from her instructors. 

 

CITIZEN COMMENTS_______________________________________________________ 

Mike Scott, 643 Kehrs Mill Rd, addressed the Board regarding how board packets and information is presented 

on the City’s website. He asked that an appendix be added and all recent documents approved by the Board be 

added to it so it would be easier and quicker for the public to locate information. City Administrator Sterman 

stated that we rolled out the new portal for board packets and it is more user friendly. He further explained how 

the search function works. 

 

Steve Moore, 402 Far Hill Dr, addressed the Board regarding the cul-de-sac he lives on. He stated there is a large 

island in the middle and when there are cars parked in the circle, it is very difficult to get through. He stated trash 

trucks have a difficult time and is concerned for first responders who would have to get through in an emergency. 

He asked the Board to consider adding a sign for no parking in the circle. Mayor Pogue directed Chief Schaeffler 

to look into the matter and report back. 

 

Melissa Murphy, 910 Claybend, addressed the Board regarding Clayton Ridge parking. She stated she and the 

other trustees oppose any parking on Clayton Ridge. She states she has attended meetings to create a compromise. 

She also presented a picture further clarifying an issue she discussed at a previous meeting. 
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OLD BUSINESS______________________________________________________________ 

BILL 4111 - AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ERECTION OF TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS 

AND AMENDING THE ORDINANCES PROVIDING FOR THE LOCATIONS THEREOF.  

 

Discussion: 

A motion was made by Alderman Stallmann and seconded by Alderman Bullington to untable Bill 4111. A voice 

vote was taken with unanimous affirmative result and the motion passed. 

 

There was discussion regarding Bill 4111 and the amendment made to the bill to include the time restrictions, 

number of spaces which would be available and which side of the street parking would be permitted on. It was 

also noted by several aldermen that this is a public street. Much of the discussion took place at the dais and 

included Ms. Murphy, Mr. Biribin as well as Board members. It was noted by Alderman Fleming that there has 

been a sincere attempt to compromise, but no one seems to be happy. Alderman Utt also noted that if everyone 

in the subdivision is opposed to this parking, he would like to see more of them attend a meeting. A motion was 

made by Alderman Roach and seconded by Alderman Stallmann to amend Bill 4111 as to allow parking only 

between the hours of 6 a.m. and 4 p.m. and from a distance between 25 and 140 feet from the stop sign at 

Clayheath and Claybend. A voice vote was taken with six aye votes and two nay votes and the motion passed. A 

motion was made by Alderman Roach and seconded by Alderman Stallmann for a second reading of Bill 4111 

as amended. After discussion that it may be cleaner to defeat Bill 4111 and have the City Attorney draft new 

legislation with the amendments suggested, the Alderman withdrew their motions and a motion was made by 

Alderman Stallmann and seconded by Alderman Roach for a second reading of Bill 4111. The roll call vote is 

listed below. A motion was made by Alderman Stallmann and seconded by Alderman Roach to have the City 

Attorney draft legislation to include the amendments offered earlier. A voice vote was taken with unanimous 

affirmative result and the motion passed. 

 

A roll call vote was taken for passage and approval of Bill 4111 with the following results: 

Ayes – none 

Nays -- Aldermen Utt, Finley, Roach, Stallmann, Leahy, Fleming, Bullington, Kerlagon  

Bill No. 4111 was defeated. 

 

 

BILL 4117 -  AN ORDINANCE GRANTING AN AMENDED SPECIAL USE EXCEPTION TO ROBERT 

BIRIBIN D/B/A THE WOLF CAFE FOR SALE OF ALCOHOL IN THE LOWER LEVEL BY THE DRINK 

FOR CONSUMPTION ON THE PREMISES AND BY PACKAGE FOR CARRYOUT AT 15480 CLAYTON 

ROAD. 

 

Discussion: 

Alderman Fleming read aloud the amendment to item 12 which includes the hours of operation for the lower 

level.  
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A motion was made by Alderman Fleming and seconded by Alderman Bullington for a second reading of Bill 

4117 as amended, title only. A voice vote was taken with unanimous affirmative result and Bill 4117 was read 

for the second time. 

 

A roll call vote was taken for passage and approval of Bill 4117 with the following results: 

Ayes – Aldermen Utt, Finley, Roach, Stallmann, Leahy, Fleming, Bullington, Kerlagon  

Nays -- None.  

Bill No. 4117 was approved and became Ordinance No. 22-04 

 

MAYOR’S REPORT__________________________________________________________ 

Nothing to report. 

 

CITYADMINISTRATOR’S REPORT___________________________________________________ 

City Administrator Sterman reported that we have received notice that we have received GFOA’s Certificate of 

Achievement for Excellence in Financial Reporting award; we have received this award for our annual financial 

report for several years running. We also received their Distinguished Budget Presentation Award for our budget. 

Receiving both these awards is something most cities do not accomplish, so he wanted to acknowledge all the 

hard work done by Finance Officer Denise Keller and her staff. Mayor Pogue also thanked Ms. Keller given that 

the criteria for this is ever changing. 

 

Mr. Sterman shared that we are working on an informational campaign to educate the City’s voters on the Prop 

U (Use Tax). The most recent issue of Ballwin Life contained information on the Use Tax and we would like to 

do informational mailings to voters in the city. These would not advocate one way or the other, but simply educate. 

He stated we would like to spend around $5000 for these mailings. Alderman Stallmann stated this is an excellent 

idea. Alderman Roach added that he feels the City Attorney should review the mailings before they go out. A 

motion was made by Alderman Stallman and seconded by Alderman Kerlagon to approve the expenditure for the 

mailings. A voice vote was taken with unanimous affirmative result and the motion passed.  

 

Lastly, Mr. Sterman stated there was a meeting with the contractors for the new police station and as soon as next 

week possibly, they will start moving dirt. 

 

CITY ATTORNEY’S REPORT_________________________________________________ 

Nothing to report. 
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ALDERMANIC COMMENTS_________________________________________________ 

Alderman Bullington thanked City Administrator Sterman, Public Works Director Jim Link and Police Chief 

Doug Schaeffler for always being available to answer any questions the Board may have and noted that Mr. 

Sterman goes above and beyond to prepare for Board meetings, addressing any possible issues ahead of time. 

 

Alderman Roach thanked Finance Officer Denise Keller on the awards received and also thanked Mr. Link and 

Public Works for their efforts during the snowstorm, noting they did an excellent job.  

 

Alderman Stallmann echoed Alderman Roach’s comments regarding Public Works and also thanked Parks 

Director Chris Conway and his staff for the great job they did getting everything opened up again. Alderman 

Stallmann also asked about putting a “how to” on the website for the public regarding the new packets.  

 

Alderman Finley asked Mr. Link how much salt is left after the storm; Mr. Link replied that the salt dome is about 

95% full. Alderman Finley also acknowledged that the Webelos from Pack 357 at Woerther Elementary had 

visited earlier in the evening and that he and Alderman Bullington met with them for a tour and answered 

questions. 

 

 

 

A motion was made by Alderman Fleming and seconded by Alderman Finley to adjourn. The motion was passed 

by unanimous affirmative voice vote and the meeting adjourned at 8:41 p.m. 

 

 

 

______________________________ TIM POGUE, MAYOR 

 

ATTEST: 

 

____________________________________ POLLY MOORE, CITY CLERK 
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Bill No. 4119                    

Ordinance No.____ 

 

City of Ballwin, 1 Government Ctr., Ballwin, Missouri 63011 

 

INTRODUCED BY 

ALDERMEN UTT, FINLEY, STALLMANN, ROACH, FLEMING, LEAHY, KERLAGON, BULLINGTON 
 

 

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ERECTION OF TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS AND 

AMENDING THE ORDINANCES PROVIDING FOR THE LOCATIONS THEREOF  

 

 

WHERAS, the Board of Aldermen, with the assistance of the Police Department, has determined 

that it is in the public interest to provide for new traffic control signs on Clayton Ridge Drive. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE 

CITY OF BALLWIN, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

 Section 1. Sec. 15-483. – Schedule H of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Ballwin 

shall be amended by removing all existing references to Clayton Ridge Drive and replacing them 

with the following:  

  

 Sec. 15-483. - Schedule H – Limited Parking.  

 

In accordance with the provisions of section 15-275 and when signs are erected giving notice 

thereof, no person shall park a vehicle during the times or for a longer period than indicated upon 

any of the streets or parts thereof described in this schedule:  

Street or Parts Thereof Where  

Parking Is Regulated  

Clayton Ridge Drive, no parking on the North side except between the hours of 6:00 a.m. 

and 4:00 p.m. and then only in the area between the “no parking here to corner” sign and a 

point 160 feet East of Clayheath Court.  

 

 Section 2.  Section 15-482, Schedule G of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Ballwin 

shall be amended as follows: 

 

 Sec. 15-482, Schedule G Parking Prohibited at all times. 

 

 In accordance with the provisions of Section 15-268 and when signs are erected giving 

notice thereof, no person shall park a vehicle at any time upon any of the streets or parts thereof 

described in this Schedule: 

 

Street or Part Thereof Where  

Parking is Prohibited.   

 

Clayton Ridge Drive, on the South side, along its entire length.  
 

Section 3.  This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after its passage 

and approval. 
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Bill No.4119        

 

 

 

City of Ballwin, 1 Government Ctr, Ballwin, Missouri 63011 

 

PASSED this ____ day of _________________,2022.   ______________________________  

        TIM POGUE, MAYOR 

 

 

APPROVED this ____ day of _______________, 2022. ______________________________  

        TIM POGUE, MAYOR 

 

 

ATTEST:   _________________________________  

    ERIC STERMAN, CITY ADMINISTRATOR 
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Consent Item 

 

RE:  2022 Merit Increases 

Department/Program:  Administration/Finance 

 

Recommendation:   Staff recommends that the Board approve a salary increase of 3% for all full-

time staff effective April 1, 2022.   

 

Explanation:   Historically the award of merit increases for staff is made after receipt of final 

year-end sales taxes as a gauge of economic conditions. Sales tax revenues for 2021 totaled 

$10,629,594, exceeding a conservatively amended budget by $633,594 or 6.3%.  

Sales tax revenues for 2020 totaled $9,350,311, which was a half million lower than 2019 due to 

the economic impact of the pandemic in 2020. 2021 sales taxes are up 7.9% over 2019 numbers. 

Receipts in the fourth quarter of 2021 surpassed those of the same quarter in both 2020 and 2019 

by 14%. High inflation at the end of 2021 is a significant factor in the increase for 2021.  

A merit raise of 3% was budgeted for 2022.  

 

 

Submitted By:   Denise Keller, Finance Officer 

Date:   February 17, 2022 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Ballwin Government Center 

1 Government Ctr, Ballwin, Missouri 63011 

(p) 636-227-9000 (w) www.ballwin.mo.us        
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Consent Item 

 

Subject: Portland Cement 

Department/Program: Public Works- Slab & Sidewalk Replacement 

RECOMMENDATION: We recommend awarding this contract at the unit bid price to the low bidder, 

Lafarge Holcim. 

 

EXPLANATION:    Cement is one of the materials needed for concrete production. For the past few 

years we have received favorable bids for the contractual slab replacements, but have seen the cost rise for 

sidewalk replacements due to ADA requirements. We plan to focus on sidewalk work orders and ADA 

ramps as we are required to replace ADA ramps on any street we do construction on in the 2022 budget 

year.  

 

Requests for bids were sent to three suppliers. Also, we advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal and 

on the City’s website. Bid specifications are on file at the Public Works Department.  On Feb 11th, 2022 

three bids were opened. The summary of bids received is as follows.   

 

 

 

Bidder 
 

Price/Ton 

Buzzi Unicem Usa $162.00 /Ton 

Larfarge-Holcim Inc. $156.50/Ton 

Continental Cement Co. $200.00 /Ton 

Budget                                               $85,000.00 

 

                        The concrete budget is $85,000, but we only plan to use around $12,000 for the cement portion. 

 

 

 

 

 

Submitted By: Jim Link 

Date: 2/15/2022 
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Consent Item 

 

RE: Asphalt Milling 

Department/Program: Public Works- Streets and Sidewalks 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION: We recommend awarding this Unit Price contract to the low bidder NB West 

Contracting. 

 

 

EXPLANATION: Ballwin continues to contract for the asphalt milling of streets.  With the purchase of 

an asphalt paver in 2017, Public Works has continued to pave and or overlay streets within the 

department. The asphalt paving budget in 2022 is scheduled to be completed in-house.  

 

Request for bid notices were sent to several contractors and advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal, 

Construction Market Data, Dodge Data & Analytics, and on the City’s website.   

 

The table below summarizes the bids received on February 11th, 2022. 

 

ASPHALT MILLING TOTAL BID 

NB. West Contracting $58,210.00 

Pace Construction $65,953.90 

GS Grinding Services $59,103.90 

BUDGET $60,000.00 

 

 

           NB West Contracting has successfully completed similar work for other cities in the area.    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Submitted By: Jim Link 

Date:  2/15/2022 
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Consent Item 

 

RE:  Striping 

Department/Program:  Public Works / Pavement 

Recommendation:  We recommend awarding the unit price contract to Traffic Control Company. 

 

 

Explanation: We have solicited bids for re-striping yellow street centerlines and white lane lines. Request 

for bids were sent to several contractors, advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal, City’s website, 

ePlan, Construction Data, and Dodge Data & Analytics. On February 11th, 2022, three bids were received 

and opened.  A summary of the bids are as follows. 

 

 

    

 

 

2022 Bids Total Cost 

America’s Parking Remarking $28,352.06 

TraMar Contracting, Inc. $34,826.40 

Traffic Control Company $22,537.82 

BUDGET $30,000.00 

 

Traffic Control Company has 1 OSHA violation in 2018. 

America’s Parking Remarking has 1 OSHA violation in 2019. 

TraMar has no violations in the last 5 years.  

 

 

 

 

Submitted By:  Jim Link 

Date:  2/15/2022 
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Staff Report 

 

Subject:     Contractual Median Maintenance RFP# 22-14 

Department/Program: Parks and Recreation 

Explanation:  

The 2022 budget includes $20,000 for contractual median maintenance.  Bids were solicited for 

Contractual Median Maintenance on landscaped medians on Manchester Road, Ballpark Drive, 

Jefferson Avenue, Clayton Road, and Big Bend Road.  The RFP #22-14 was advertised on ePLan, 

ISQFT, Dodge Reports and bid packages sent to six local contractors.  One bid was received on 

February 22, 2022. Several contractors were contacted to inquire as to why they did not submit a 

bid.  Replies included short staffed and too busy. 

 

Recommendation:  

Award Landesign Plus Contractual Median Maintenance Bid for 2022 for $14,007.11.  Landesign has 

serviced our medians for the last three years and has contracts with Schnucks, Dierbergs as well as 

several other commercial accounts in the area.  All references were checked and were favorable.  

Landesign Plus has had no OSHA violations within the past five years. 

 

 

 

 

 

Submitted By: Chris Conway, CPRP, Director of Parks and Recreation 

Date: February 28, 2022 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 

Ballwin 

Government Center 
1 Government Ctr, 

Ballwin, Missouri 63011 
(p) 636-227-9000 
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Staff Report 

 

Subject:   Crushed Rock/Stone 

Department/Program: Public Works- Pavement-Slabs-Sidewalks 

RECOMMENDATION: We recommend awarding this unit price contract to Simpson Materials 

including all the alternate bids. 

 

EXPLANATION: Crushed rock/stone is used in-house as a base for concrete pavement slabs, curbs, 

gutters, and sidewalk replacements. Commercial stone is used in concrete production. 

 

We advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal, and solicited bids from several suppliers, and posted on 

the City’s website. Bid specifications are on file at the Public Works Department.   On February 11th, 2022, 

two (2) bids were received and opened. The summary of bids received is as follows. 

 

Bidder 
Type 5 

Rock 

Commercial 

Stone 

State 

Concrete 

Stone 

Alt. Bid #1  Alt. Bid #2  Alt. Bid #3  

 

Alt. Bid #4 

  

Simpson Materials $4.70/ton $9.85 /ton $9.85/ton $1.35 /ton No Charge $5.75 /ton $5.50 /ton 

Central Stone $6.55/ton $14.70/ton $14.70/ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Budget  $10,000 for crushed rock and $20,000 for concrete stone    

 

 

 

Base bid - Type 5 Aggregate material only 

Commercial Stone-Rock used in the production of concrete 

State Concrete Stone-Rock used in the production of concrete.  

Alternate bid item #1 – Non-Reinforced Concrete Debris Disposal 

Alternate bid item #2 – Asphalt Debris Disposal 

Alternate bid item #3 – Aggregate Delivery Cost 

Alternate bid item #4 – Recycled Type 5 Aggregate 

 
 

 

 

 

 

Submitted By: Jim Link 

Date:  2/17/2022 
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Staff Report 

RE: Concrete Ready Mix 

Department/Program:  Public Works/ Pavement 

Recommendation: We recommend awarding this contract at the Unit bid price for the two types of 

concrete, including the alternate bids, to the only bidder, Valley Material Company. 

 

Explanation:  Requests for bids were sent to several suppliers. Also, we advertised in the St. Louis 

Business Journal and on the City’s website. Bid specifications are on file at the Public Works Department.  

On February 11th, 2022, one bid was received and opened. The summary of bid received is as follows.   

 

Bidder 

High Early Strength 

Concrete (Slabs) 

Bid Quantity: 1,000 cy 

Class B Concrete 

(Sidewalks)  

Bid Quantity: 600 cy 

Valley Material Company $111.50 /cy $106.50 /cy 

Budget                                                                                             $85,000 

 

In addition to the cubic yard unit price, the following alternate bid prices were received. 

 

Item 

No. 
Description Unit 

Valley 

Material 

A 

Demurrage (in excess of 5 

minutes per cy)  (unloading 

time) 

Per 

Minute 

$2.00/min 

B 
1% Calcium Chloride (cold 

weather) 
Per CY 

$2.94/cy 

C 
Retarder (3 oz/cwt) (hot 

weather) 
Per CY 

$5.00/cy 

D Winter Service (hot water) Per CY $5.00/cy 

E 

Short Haul Charge  

(delivery of less than 5 cy per 

load)* 

Per CY 

 

$170.00: 1-175 cy 

$140.00: 2-2.75 cy 

$120.00: 3-3.75 cy 

$100.00: 4-4.75 cy 

 

The concrete budget is $85,000, but we only plan to use around $10,000 as a backup to our own 

production.  

 
Submitted By:  Jim Link 

Date:  2/15/2022 
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Staff Report 

 

Subject: Ready Mix Sand 

Department/Program:  Public Works- Slab and Sidewalk Replacement 

Recommendation: We recommend awarding this contract at the unit bid price to the low bidder, 

Simpson Materials. In addition we would like to also recommend awarding the Low Lignite River sand to 

Central stone.  

  

Explanation:  Sand is one of the materials needed for concrete production. For the past few years we 

have received favorable bids for the contractual slab replacements, but have seen the cost rise for sidewalk 

replacements due to ADA requirements. We plan to focus on sidewalks work orders and ADA ramps in 

house as we are required to replace any ADA ramps on any street we do construction on.  

 

 

Requests for bids were sent to three suppliers. Also, we advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal and 

on the City’s website.  Bid specifications are on file at the Public Works Department. On February 11th, 

2022, two bids was received and opened. The summary of bids received is as follows.   

 

 

Bidder Mississippi River Sand 
Low Lignite River 

Sand 
Delivery charge 

Central Stone $8.65 /ton $10.10/ton $5.55 /ton 

Simpson Materials $7.65/ton No Bid $5.75/ton 

Budget  (1600 lbs. of Sand in 1 cubic yard of concrete)          $85,000  

 
 

                    The concrete budget is $85,000, but we only plan to use around $10,000 for the Sand. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Submitted By: Jim Link 

 

Date:  2/17/2022 
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Staff Report 

 

Subject:  Street Sweeping  

Department/Program:  Public Works/ Pavement 

Recommendation: We recommend rejecting the bid received on February 11th, 2022.  We also 

recommend the Board waive the purchasing procedure and accept the late bid from STL Contractor 

services for $26,040.00 

 

 

Explanation: Since 2006 we have contracted for street sweeping.   As in the past, the 2022 budget 

includes funds for quarterly contractual sweeping in compliance with our State Storm water Permit.   

 

Invitations to bid were sent to several contractors. We advertised in the St. Louis Business Journal, ePlan, 

Dodge Data & Analytics and on the City’s website.  The bid specifications are on file in the Public Works 

Department.  On February 11th, 2022, one bid was received and opened.  The results are as follows: 

 

Bidders 4 times/year 
Additional  

Sweepings/hour 

SCA of Missouri $55,901.87 $150.00 

Budget $35,000.00  

 

The bid specifications includes sweepings in March, May, July, and September, but does not include 

disposal of the sweeper debris.  Republic Waste will dispose of the sweeping debris at no cost to the City. 

 

The additional sweeping hourly rate is for special sweeping such as cleanup after a major storm or before 

special events.   

 

 

STL Contractors Services turned in a bid after the 10 am deadline on 2/11/2022. Below are the results, 

 

Late Bidders 4 times/year 
Additional  

Sweepings/hour 

STL Contractor Services $26,040.00 $124.00 

Budget $35,000.00  

 
 

Submitted By:  Jim Link 

Date: 2/22/2022 
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