ALPINE

PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION

August 12, 2025, at 7:00 PM
250 River Circle - Alpine, WY 83128

AGENDA

1. CALL TO ORDER:
2. ROLL CALL & ESTABLISH QUORUM:
3. TONIGHT'S APPOINTMENTS/ NEW BUSINESS:

a. PANTONE, ANNA Lot #40 of Forest Meadow. 504 Three Rivers Dr. (G-0725-0001)- New
detached garage/accessory building

b. NORTH LINCOLN COUNTY HOSPITAL, DBA STAR VALLEY HEALTH- 37 WINTERGREEN
DRIVE, LOT #189 OF ALPINE MEADOWS-Installation of a Helipad

c. BENNETT, BRETT, AND META Lot #27 Greys River Village, 368 Wooden Spur Dr. (REM-
0625-0001)- Remodel and addition to existing home and addition of an accessory building

4. TABLED ITEMS:

5. UNFINISHED/ONGOING BUSINESS:

6. PLANNING/ZONING CORRESPONDENCE:
PLANNING AND ZONING DISCUSSION ITEMS:

a. ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION- Proposed Lot #15 of the Alpine West Third Edition-
Review site plan for compliance and suggestions.

b. Updating to the 2024 International Code Council Codes.
7. APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

a. Approval of July 8, 2025, meeting minutes
8. TOWN COUNCIL ASSIGNMENT:

9. ADJOURN MEETING:



appISfb53d9a30a39421cae5fb7c5f5e68697

AS{?%& H‘ $ J‘Ilﬂ'j I@S

Vingl
‘lLo i%&

u-{—.-

v
b

C

NG
EﬁguSe

3( ﬁ!{

Ho

/V@f‘"}'h

l6

Section 3, ltema.




Ho”

South




41
o
- (rusS
7 [ EQ:
Wl
(4
30
Fast

[6

Section 3, ltema.




Section 3, ltema.

West




N

Garage Permit Application
PROJECT:

Section 3, Itema.

INFORMATION TO BE PROVIDED BY APPLICANT ~ ALL BLANKS MUST BE “ [.LED IN

Physical Address:
Pt 04 Three Ruers Rd.

Legal Descnptlor;’_%ot # and Subdnvn ion):
[eS ows

Square Footage of Proposed Structure

|00

Does this Structure Include Habitable Living Space: {Circle Answer}

YES

RS

Description (Intent of Permit):

Garage /Shop

Estimated Valuation of Work: #1{0 BO0 .

APPLICANT/CONTRACTOR/CONSULTANTS:

(0] r.
" Aua Pantone

Phone:

307-234-294S

Mailing Address;

b Rox 336 Jackson, W/} ¢3¢

Contractor Phone:
CO’NS‘}N{C{L on, Ro Eeﬂt Shec keq 3072 752-1€39
Mailing Address
Up Bon 3377 M@r \*/Y %’3/.’12'
Electrical Contractor: v Phone: }
eu/nel
Mailing Address: \
Plumbing Contractor: Phone: \
none
Mailing Address: J
Mechanical Contractor: Phone:

Mailing Address:

phene
Authorized Representative:

(If different from Owner): /(/Z W@{ é 9‘:{ QF(Vh 3

Signature ofO er: ,\,(,/U /ﬁ
7

Date:

072/7/[7 5

“FOR USE Bﬁowu
Date Received:

Permit #:

Permit Fees:

Paid Fees: (Check#/Cash)

Use Zone:

Date Paid:




Section 3, Itema.

Town of Alpine
Garage Permit
CHECKLIST

ALPI Né
WYONMING

There will be NO guarantees of being on the P & Z Agenda if...

o Your application is turned in after the deadline date/day; o,
o If your garage permit packet (application, checklist, fee paymenits, all required information, etc.,) is

not completed and/or submitted; or,

© Your review is found to be incomplete and/or not approved by the Town Building Official.

Owner: M Payl‘l‘(M& Phone #'s: 307‘ /3942943
Lot#/Subdiv.#élO 5&+/{§0_4&L Physical Address: 50?75/‘&2 Ryeys IQJ

You may submit your Building Application Packet by mail to: PO Box 3070, Alpine, WY 83128
Or deliver in person to: 250 River Circle, Alpine, WY 83128

#1 - REVIEW AND COMPLETE ALL APPROPRIATE AREAS; PLACE A CHECK MARK ONCE COMPLETED:

- ALL information is filled out and submitted as requested by the Town of Alpine;
- ALL Contractors/Subcontractors obtained a Town of Alpine Business License:

- Requested Water Main Locate prior to ANY digging (Owner’s Responsibility);
Requested all other utility(electrical, phone, etc) lines located prior to ANY digging (Owner’s Responsibility)

Must have written approval from Homeowner’s Association on Building Plans (if Applicable)

#2 - GETTING A BUILDING PERMIT:
Garage Permit Application Completed and Signed;
Garage Permit Checklist Completed and Signed;

Owner must read and sign Garage Permit Instructions;
Payment of Permit Fees, which MUST be paid when submitting the Building Permit Application;

*¥**See Fee Schedule ** ALL FEES ARE NON REFUNDABLE

SUBMITTAL REQUIREMENTS: SITE PLAN TO BE PUT ON 2’ BY 3’ PAPER SIZE AND MUST CONTAIN:
Setback distances;

All Property Line & measurements according to surveyor’s dimensions;
Location & Dimensions of ALL buildings (home, garage, yard hydrants, propane tanks etc.) Dimensions must

include exact perimeter of the new proposed garage building — include any recessed areas when documenting;

Location of utility connections;

Location of all recorded easements;
Proposed Snow Storage/Removal Areas as stated in Land Use and Development Code;

Proposed Vehicular Parking Requirement as stated in Land Use and Development Code;

2’ x 3" IN SIZE} (MUST BE ST. B Y

THREE (3) FULL SETS OF STRUCTURAL PLAN

Detailed Building Elevations;
Detailed Floor Plan;
Detailed Wall Sections;

Property Owner
Page 1

Initials: a/ﬁ\




Section 3, Itema.

Detailed Roof Plan and Building Material to be Used;

Detailed Insulation Schedule {Energy Code, Rescheck or Comcheck tize<iy;
Detailed Window and Door Schedules/Identifications;

Detailed Radon Mitigation System Identified;

:AD?ITIQNAL SUBMITTALS NEEDED:;
Any Additional information and/or attachments as stipulated by the 'Wyoming Licensed Engineer associated with

\/ the project;
Read Propane Tank Regulations (if applicable) Refer to Chapter 38 of IFC;
iz Application for State of Wyoming Department of Fire Prevention & Electrical Safety (if applicable);

%‘/ Detailed Footing/Foundation Plan and Building Material to be Used;

Please note that the Town of Alpine has adopted the 2021 International Building Codes; refer to the adopted codes

for additional information; in addition, please review the Town Adopted Building Code Ordinances located on our website
for any exceptions granted by the Town of Alpine to the Adopted Building Codes.

#3 - TOWN RESPONSIBILITIES:

Town Building Official approves plans, by conducting a plan review;
Planning & Zoning Board approves the prepared site plan for the Garage Building Permit.

BUILDING/PROJECT INSPECTIONS:
Refer to the inspection schedule for the complete list of scheduled inspections for your project. IT IS THE

RESPONSIBILITY OF THE PERMIT HOLDER TO CALL FOR INSPECTIONS; a minimum of 48 hours notice is
required. FAILURE TO NOTIFY THE TOWN OFFICE OF SCHEDULED INSPECTIONS MAY RESULT IN
ADDITIONAL INSPECTION CHARGES, FINES, PENALITIES AND/OR REMOVAL OF THE WORK
THAT WAS INSTALLED BUT NOT BEEN INSPECTED.

CERTIFICATE OF COMPLETION/COMPLIANCE:

Upon final completion of all of the remodel/addition building requirements; a final inspection will be completed; it is the
applicant’s responsibility to contact the Town Office to schedule the final inspection to receive your Certificate of
Completion/Compliance. A Certificate of Completion/Compliance represents the building can be permanently occupied.

*For more thorough information and instructions: Refer to the current version of the adopted
Town Ordinance of the International Building Code {IBC} and/or International Residential
Code {IRC} in addition refer to the Alpine Land Use and Development Code Ordinance.

Information can be found on our website at: www.alpinewy.gov/planningandzoning.

Yes, I received, completed and understand the Garage Permit Checklist.
//%/uw/gzjz/‘/ 01/21/25

Property Owner Signature Date
%// / 721-95
Contractor Signature (if applicable) Date

Property Owne
Initials;




FOR USE BY TOWN:

Section 3, Itema.

Received By:

All Ttems have been Completed & Application Accepted:

Incomplete Application Returned:

Submitted to Building Official:

Building Official Review Status:

Building Official Approval or Return:

Scheduled Meeting Date for Site Plan Review:

Notes:

Property Qwne
Initials:

Page 3




Section 3, Itema.

BMP'950g2d v3s

WNN 3114 advd

S133HS TvANLONYLS

€ 40 |

HIENNN 193HS

tA8 G3INOIHO
1 WL A9 NMvad
G20c 131va

d31ON SY 3IV0S

. 960¢2d :¥3gnnN gor

NOILJIYOS3a | Ad dlva | "ON

'SNOISIAY \/

‘s3Nssl O

WCD8.188U| BUSIUPUBACD ‘gom

G169-c98-L0¢/cL6/-958- 96 Ud
JHES UM iojpeg
@9k Xog O

WJCNL@@CNWJCM

,\.Emcw\,o_u

‘SINVLIINSNOD

> O Q
o
vr3 Z
Z M —
._.:W.u.u
$ney O
BMqu L
w
N D 2 ®,
vz U
o =
D O
r 4
m

'dd SH3IAId dddHL 0§

103royd

'dNVLS

Rem A B)NpsYog  PEUDG
poam  Em  |eankg-dlg o meg O
olGes B4 PILIBN AN 5] Buong uosdug  (g)

Bl m painkbas  pbsy
maug poa am WBUDDI U2
W yom om Buppicjuyss sy
sbuel4 s = snipey  peal
wogym  om wnd  and
i /m Uo|5us
|B21148A WBA 180 PBIPD.] BIN65Bf 1
185100 Gem usalD Mo wou elenbe ded spunos 5d
RioseL p@2i0 uaLp LI 1004
SEIMIBYIO PEION 558Ul ONN s.enbg 1ad sounc sed
dics sy n) BISBUy 558
jez1ahy chy poomhl< ks
F5I5A5URL  ASUB] P T4

WoysuEd] SURI JBUBIEES UBACT JBIPMC e

JO el ol gnoipusdiss  died

U 15107- 54 i [3)j8E s8]
(8B PBUSUB I ) (68018 B soddn 50
sbue do| 4 susoddo  ddp
BAC0IE ¢ anbBuo) ) /B wede o)
wonog ¢ doj gl BI3UeId SLISIND ae
s.pnbg bg BB YD o0

jeimonag  19n4ag  81840UcD 1BIEN jPweN NN

2235 g 5/e95 0L 1N GIN
BUBIE IS spIG 83N 6N
(peiebbrg  ibig BUNN  4"ON
pirpiels  pig mN N
(5236 ssTUIEIS 68 [EZEWE e,
cejoneso8ds  o8ds NN
SPRIUO-GYE D05 B ML e
MBJIG |18 1BFUG GG UBIMDEIEL Al

jeoeA Bat rows AT wnuxeLy xeL
g g Hog sugRe Bl

Buipaye  Bug e1eioucs wbiem 17 ami

weue g o7 7

meiog Buidde, ‘dicD oljioe pueisncT o7
486 Bujia 158 1648 jeaniep Bo Buor  ATT

Bbuer
dic pesH b

4moE
dio
Upss [PREL

m

E
B

JBWED 1IEBH
S

ok

Buyien soeq i

™

3]
9
H

]

-
Q
9

SO

5

- =

7 Y
S 30 .
(1 A E— o

Q

PAODES 7 de
JO

(D3 )

Buyren pug 1o
uor,

o

SNOILVIASSSGEYT TVSNLONELS

STVLIT ¢ NV DNV 200 118
SIVLIIO ¢ NV T TraFivT ¢ NOUYANIOL &18
SHONTFXTLTFN # SHION TraloNsls &as

XJAN| [F3He Tranionale

HOToNISUS D
poan 1o uoies)joads ublesy [PUCIEN SIPZ-6AN Vt47/IENY ¥

(@2i0u00) Riesuuos puy spoo Buping #j-81f (27 €

ga.monng
BYIO e sDUpNG Joj SpPoT Wbied unuL 9j-L 3087 7

spos Buping jpuoneway 8a7

[SBWOUBUE PUE SswSidans
sjgesdde fue pup sspoo siqreodde Bunojjc) a4y 01 wiojues
eys sugid 108/ old 58y IDpUN PRWICLIBT BG O) YoM I rere

03000 FONF=F=3 Tranionais

198004d uononnsiuos sy o) Adde hew jeui siuBuBINbS. YHEE

1€ yum Riduoo pue sieme 8g o3 hijiqisuodea. | s1o1081u00

Byl 51 3 UBWMEW BJPS P U] Yiom Buuucisd pup WewWIoLAUS

yiom a6 p Buienew Bupiebal suoiiginbs. s161s pup
|pizpa; 1o yym Fiduoo o1 Fyygisuodsss sicroenuos aqy sy 1

STLON ALTIVE

BUCIYPUCT [j11¥28T
1o/puE |08 [pEopduoun 1o S1enbepey O PRIEIa SYNSS. |PMBUINSE BYIC o
2Bsupe sio345 20110050 Fup Joy B1qieucdeal 2q 10U |pys BuussuBug WeuBAS D

450 goor syenburiez/pun + 417 + PEET -
Q_m.a Q%m.\ m\ﬂ.llm * \G%%Q _:‘

0g) glgr Jod sainsssid 108 sjqemoye wnwl

STLON NOILVANNOH

FEIE = ome _ﬁdxm.uu m.Q = \‘Sm.gxm
@zl = ° 2a! = 3
g = g Ered = '8
oes7 = *% g = %
=g J = §68/0 BUS

M. GECEQDY| “BUeT N .,GreegIcr 197 DWsISE PR
az! = M a2a] = "y
o You Bujjieo
) sunsodxd

N yau o pseds ojsEd pum tF

i 180 yeiN F

sed g doliExT :5118M

UOIIDYPEINT Bt

J5d gg 400N wioju) moug

xmh\ a7 a7
s5d g peed Joo It

=) Wxﬁm& ubisag ¥

ONf 818.10u02 Jo 5084
18 SPME JO B28) WOl 8 O} LBUNSEE 5J8 SUEId [BJNIDSIYDIE
uo Jo supid sssuy) Uo paipsipul se suoisuBuD Weld [y ¢

U IDNI8UO2 3m Buinuiwoz o1 Joiid uonos.ioo

JO/OUE WOINBDIIIIEI2 JD) Pio2ay jo kmm&m:m 4O 10214247

B4 10PUOD 810102 UoIsUBUIL &) mtm\g\ 83U Wm
DBIBADIS|D $2|2UPGRIDSID SO Slous ‘suoissuo Rup 51 suBYl 7

UC[10BIB p UOIIENIGES
o1 Jojid suoisusue iy 1o Rijiea jjeys Joiopaucs sy

STLION Tranionais TreaNse

g7 spri
g9 Pk

GBS

580,
SEOC!
sz

Y} [PUE Sk
SWBUBINEB YN

wBZ 4O wndx
paACIEdr i

e
:m.\_ﬁ,\\
T4
WGl
:N\M\
wl
:N\\_\_

WE  ABEEm o
" m

i
10§ 1 31BIUoz
JOYSUR PR GE

sug)c 58U L L
By 1odahs

WO 4O Wb B

ou 18 paopds
geL(D 26N [18Ye ¢

N

P1

JO 8By pup ups

Buiojnss &5
YUM 82UBLOI3F

CER

Kl FLF
188U 1Y SPxi B

0 jjos .

PBIoUCD MY
BoLLING Bt O foz
[oUR (1804) USi1RE)

|PWDZIIOY 18
pRpRegl
jjeye sel o

‘s1904 JzpUn

,w. i h.b)_,.,..,.,_ wm.
Busicjz punc
$DUNYD (£211BA IO,

Jo wbisy jinj e .

B13.0U
1eys sbuics) pug

io1id 1eAcuside i
pue OG0 3yt jo ¢
j1eys ubisap X,
SoUELIEE08 Ul

10




Section 3, Itema.

STAMP:

ROCE DIAPHRAGM SCHEDULE

li
MARK |MATERIAL|  TYPE | FASTENERS| EN | AN NOTES
B0 o -] EAL i Use Flyud &htg Clips Or Blkg @
. V' C-C C-D| duwl 7" (é"oc| ., use miyud ootg Clip g
FO) | WP | & 088 sthg | Min Renetr | Max | X 9| Unsupported Fanei Edges PROJECT:

STRAP SCHEDLLE BOCE ERAMING SCHEDLULE

| M, ELM SI7F UFPORT TYF) IOTES
STRAP |CAPACITY|  FASTENERS | NOTES s B4 AIFFET TYFe e
Coie 1054 (28} 2148 Or |EL = 3"Ea End - K To Stgr B! 4x8 Or Sistered Dbl Ix8 Sing ”;tfgfg?mﬁg n/a
- ’ (220213 x 2V, | Nails Btun 8 8" oc Max '
: bl Crivole/Kin
sy | anpe | (86/0MEx2liOr | EL = 32" To dx Fost B7 )| 4x0 Or Sistered Dol 2x12 poi 5‘:: gf&f”g i
i <! (14) 2162 x 2 1 Nails | Or Sistered Dbl Siuds (M) f A
\ =1 i
NOTES: B3 | éxiz cr 5/5 : 7-2%{: v Feost ¢ Cap FPer Flan na
by 5 . GLBVLAM Equiv !
L Al stréps dre req'd mininums.  Lérger sirdps andior more [dstensrs OK wio prior spprovél
— Blax 12 24F-v4 Erct 4 o Ber Ol
B4 GLE/VLAM Equﬂ/ st 4 uéf‘a. er ~ian n'a

NOTES:
L All sizes and grades are req'd minimums, Sse shest S22 for materlal specifications.

| Rf Framing Not Shoun For Clarirty ' :
| Rf Framing Net Shoun For Clarirty Cont o/2x Blkg @ Har ¢

504 THREE RIVERS DR.

s

RSN, W N RS N Gl W, VIR N N, R TN )

Uragp Around Cont Har — irap of ¢ Nail Strap — ] | %
To vert C5 Fer Flan ‘: To 1O Har Fer Plan \ L , i )
; ' R [ s  Reof Sht'g Fer r No Roof Shig Joint Here To Gable End l | | O g
| ° ‘ . F" Flan ¢ ‘ i | ‘
{ < . [ lan pNafes / 2x Outriggers - N~ [=—Per Arch—= L | \ Q- E
\ | = . \ © F,F ...’V —\ / {Def P’a’i \\ \ F’;— 1/ < (j) w
T \ BN |-, ! 5/ _ \ 0 A ‘ o N
N . £ = ) Mo O Qo v
Y \ el ; 4 N Y % << = ™
A F L A || H ' 2x Qutriggers € 24" N/ = fan o
- Garage Bn i 4 e Truss — | | 2 Top Bkg Or Netched -/ // L / I oc Max, Tyo @ Gables NS pr
Per Plan | / . Per Plan Truss Tep Chord o 4 SRR VAN < H §
Vert Strap Per Pian _/ RN, e 2x 8 24" oc Max k. (5)LTP4 If Top Bikg J lejs'fj - H \ A 1 U) 0
£4 libher y R ! A : ; ) wieesled I / / L - o
£S bhere Gecirs | 4|, . wi'2) led Es Endl Reqa, @ £ Bkg N £2 Contact [} / |,4 % L L
led & 2' Stga, ik . A EAE \ Gable Truss H ./ / \ i AZ 4 k= Z
Top £ To Bm g -, ] whropped Top ¥ | \/ / i l g g 5
S L3 il — | . Chord Per Pl L1 VA 4 I
Shtg ¢ :N‘a ling F’?f Lo Shear Transfer Per - / _aﬁa_ er Flan g i A B e O D <
Plan ¢ &l Schedile ) . EN I} I
Fastensr Sched  1op H FARRY b
¥ Gtud Sl B I ' ‘ /; Sl Per FPlan A | / \ A
Zx Stud Sl Fier \\l\ Ix Stucls FPer Plan — \ ¢ Srhed E} i __:/:_ - - __\\i. i:
y 7\ " ¥ ' / \ ¥ CONSULTANTS:
/,/;\\ VERTICAL STRAP @ CONT HDR \_\ eV SeALE N = " :: | / : } |
\\ { / | A | A I —4
N SCAENe 10" i | i ira
Covenant
¥ H
11 l'| ” ”,
11 1
i i | Engmccrmg
¥ !
I
l I
| 5 % PO Box 4262
| T i Bediford, Wr 83112
i \““—’/ | ph: 9le-838-/973/307-883-655
i web: covenantengineers.com

TRUES UFLIFT NOTE: (8/ 254 (Shown. For Uplift Losds Up To 622 lbs,
HigA Up To 14 ibs, Hie o To 1470 lbs, Or Al (S) 8D5 TIMBERLOK Or Sim

O ISSUES: /\  REVISIONS:

NO. | DATE BY | DESCRIPTION |

Screws Through Dbl Top £ For Uplift Runs Up To 150 lbs - Uhere Uplift Rxn
Less Than 342 lbs, OK To Use (3) &d - See Truss Designs For Uplift Demand

/-~ Truss Frefile Fer Truss Mir
~ Véulted Cing, If ¢ Ubhers Ocurrs
~ Roof Shtg ¢ Nailing

per Fer Flan ¢ Notes
Blan

EN

~ Truse Frofile Fer Truss Mir

Per Arch

oy

< Truss Bﬁkg =

Panels ™ ~ Ripped 2x Bikg wiNailing

~ Roof &ht'g ¢ Nailing | \\‘ /' or spear Clip Per

ST, S e e e i e e e ey et e S e e ey

@ Cont Hor

/
i

|

I

|

g f " I

NG SCALE.I" - -0 |
|'

|

\

/. Per Plan ¢ Notes l :* / Fastener Sched ,'/é\ \ 5
- vaulied C/ng,\%ere Ocurrs /- | ] / ¥ .
f ' /. WAV | |
/ Shear Clip Fer pian ' ol : ote - L1 [l |
o Uplift Comnector Fer Note - - i .
 Flan ¢ S0 Sched T &hear Clie Per Coord w/Truss Mir Uplift Rans b § 5
Plan ¢ 8l Sched Pbl T / ¥ i ‘
| Dil Tap ¥ irap CHSTIZ of ¢ Nail To Top £~ ‘
. P Q Bl Per Plan i Frior To Truss Placement (2 Loc/ | ‘
| -
¢ Bched \ : :
Uolift Ea coe Note LT h ‘ o _@ ' Har Per Plan, here Occurs / \ : AT L {
Uplift Fastener - See Note 7 — EN Uplift Fastener . & fatl, wrere . e Ix Fascia ey  Wrap CMETIZ 4round Har To Engage Both | |
Dol Tgp 2 ) S Per Flan - See Note | 7 /9 )";Djﬁf XC . :‘:‘; . : - f,f Sides Frior To Truss Flacement (4 Loc) | ;
~er ~i - , L, w ed Za i / | -~ .
Har Per Fian, lhere Occurs —~{__| ¢ Sched Ext B Per Plan Cpening Trinmer, lihere Req'd v A , ‘ T i G vert Siraps
: T 4x Studts Per Flan rh ! | ‘

@

Cpening Trinmer, Uhere Req'd —

\ V'

[

Fost ¢ Cap
Fer Flan

S N ; 3 - ™ x -
S N N, W N P NP W S s . N S N P N N G WO O . N, V- N s NPV N W WY o RIS Wy V-V S By R SO

Ripped 2x Fascia -
w2} led Ea Contact

2x Studs Per Flan —

— g
{/ & \! v

\ [ 11 /)
@5&’ SCALE: " = I-2"

' i it

ROOF FRAMING PLAN

BCALE: " = I-@"

JOB NUMBER: P22056
SCALE: AS NOTED
DATE: 2025
DRAWN BY: T™MM
CHECKED BY:

SHEET NUMBER:

2 OF 83 STRUCTURAL SHEETS
CADD FILE NUMBER: P22056.dwg

11




Section 3, Itema.

=OLD-DOUN SCH=EDULE

{

HOLD- | o jarene IROD/ANCHOR! | WOOD | ) ot mie | i

Doy | FASTENERS | orous g | ymer |SATACTT | NOTES
1By % 2V SEE w4 Dbl Ix s

Hos 803 Screws To Conc Or 4x 4565 r/é

NOTES:

| UNO, orlent ail concrete anchor embed endls dpprox. centered within concrete walls, stemualls | feotings.
2 Prier approval by Enginser-of-Record Is required for sny substitutions for or alteratlons to this table.

SHEARWALL SCHEDULE
MARK | SHEATHING \iﬁf@ Nﬂ%ﬁc_ lzﬁ‘vD:\f 2 jﬁ{c Eﬁ; e * suEAR CLIP | CAPACIT NOTES
NOTES:

Wb R T

Pest ¢ Base — |
Per Flan

Fier, Ftg &
Reinf Fer FPlan

Exi Slab, Reinf & -

e |
Underiay Fer Flan |

~

Min
.

\
i
: i

S P R

|

I
<

|

Frost Depth As Reg'd —
Per Jurisdiction (32" Min)

|

ftg Depih
Fer Plan

|

SCALE:]" = I'-@"

HD Vert Per Flan ¢ 8ched — |
HD ¢ AE Per Plan —|

NOTE: See Other Typ Details |
For ltams Not Shoun Or Neoted

| ! Sl Per Pian
/ ¢ Sched

f Slab here Occurs

R " Y

|
“.
|

|

™,

[ = A, ]

3 Per Flan

——

TYR HOLD-DOUN 2 GARAGE STEMUALL

Garage Stemuall

sl /sl

SCALE: " = ['-

2"

Alf exterior walls shall be sheathed ¢ ralled to match minimum shearwall requirements NG,
Founciaiion [E (Gill B in contact with concrete or masonry/ shall be pressure-treated

Anchor bolts shall have 3" 5q x " washers, Tyo UND.
Fastener and spacing s based on shearuall Gemana] anel Is only required to bs installed for the shesruell design lengths and locations as indicated per plan.
Fastansr and spacing ls based en dldphragn demand and conlinous plaies, and shail be installed for hill length of continious wsll ling with dverage spacing no more than that Inalcdted,

M Dowels @ 24" oc Max w/4" Min -
. - N 8 \
Embed - Post-install OK w/3" Min

Embed (No Epoxy Reqd/ |

~ OK To Frovide Ix Dropped
// Edge If ¢ ds Desired

2 Cold Joint, Provide Either Zx2
/,’F Key OR Roughened Surféce w/
| 15" Min Ampiitudie (Both Shoun)

/
/
/
/
/
/
/
/

@'&"595 Slab, Reinl ¢ — "\ ’
Urcieriay Per Plan .\
Compacted Fill — \ \
— 1S i A\
Ay
] \ "

Ext FG (Shoun) Or Ext 8lib —
\

Wall Dowel Per —
Fian - Alt Hk Dir

\\ . : ‘ﬁu/wmcm @

|

B

7O Stemuall

~ Stemwa I3
/ Reinf Fer Flan

Ripped Zx Key

r Cont Fig ¢
/ Reinf Fer Flan

Per Plan

s
<4
<

[

=

L

%

| \e———Ftg Width Per Plan——|

/\\ ~———WWidened Ftg Per Pian ———
3

Frost Depth As Reqd
Per Jurisdiction (32" Min)

Zx Biuds Per Plan, Post
c/Sil B Uhere Occurs
4 Dowels @ 24" oc Max w4 Min -

5CALE' ,Fl” - .’”'@“

AN

e : il M\ = EN
Embed - Fost-nstall OK w/3" Min re EN
Embed (No Epoxy Reg'd/ \ =N
Garage Slab, Reinf ¢ -, \| g |- PTSHE ¢ AB Per
Underlay Per Plan  \ \oOE - Plan & 8l Sched <
\\\ W I8 =
Compacted Fill - \\ - . L
T : : \:3 FG
v &
- it > AR __[ |1
\\ ) ,
Stemuall
7 \ e fi- - /— Rpe ~ P P’n.,
= = A einf Par Flan

el Dowel Per —
Flan - 4lt Hx Dir

K] 4 // \

Ve Ripped ix Key

/ — Cont Fi g ¢
,-/ Reinf Per Flan

Frost Deplh As Req'd
Per Jurisdiction (32" Min)

Ftg Depth
Fer Flan

~—Ftg Width Per Plan——]
L

Widened Ftg Fer Plan

A

(6
{
i~

E: "= -2

@ == /= [ EE
] @é 5@%’%3@_&5%
MARK FosT cAP NOTES
/:F744 i : ,
JIZZNN ﬁ"fj (6) ACE Or LCE /s
= EOUNDATION SCHEDULE
/ [ / =
= - AN, /e FIEL ==
/i U i c m Fref: ; ;
/Féé Ueod (’5)‘ CC? 0; Sim Dri errgd PT 8 Ext Loc
N\ooo/ | éxé Alt (5/ ACE O LCE CK MARK | TYFE SIZE REINFORCING NOTES
NOTES: boxoxil Ga WF Or #3 | Underlay: 2" Crushed Gravel
| Al sizes and gracies are req'd minimums. -m s A EY Th &X_ ' ' d ‘
2 Solid posts .wgy ke raplaced with bulli-yp stud posts. Gee shest SDO for requirenents. SLAB 5" T & 8" oc, Centered vert o/Compacted Pad
3 Ses shest 580 for wood spacifications. ' ol 2 Py j
Jl-4" il x Cont w/
NT o g n/a
Gat 212" Thk | *3 Transv @ 32" oc Max
= § j —jf = GO /-8 5Q x
= é § / _,ﬁ - F; Vs £, / ;
MARK Type BAsE | Anchorage NOTES — 2'-4 5@ x )| I !
| I g {FR2-4 > | PAD 2" The (34 El n/d
N | lUpod ood ) Set FPost In Stua Wall Framing NOTES: _
N ) —ary n/a L -~y L Al sizes ¢ quantitles are req'd minimms. UNQ, It s acceptable to subsiliuie larger sizes andror more reinfercing without prior approval.
\ B/ sl E 2 tun Dol TOF ¢Sl Es 2 See shest SO0 for concréte and relnforcing specifications. a Y i dal
L “-- | Slandoff | (5) ABA lWeage AB | wp £, To Fit Timber Post OK
\&T Base Or Sim | Per Mir Kit
NOTES: i

(Al speciiied sizes snd gracles are req'd mininums. See sheet S2.0 for materis| specifications.

STUD

WALL SCHEDULE

STAMP:

MARK | MATERIAL DESCRIPTION | NOTES
oop | 2xd Stucs 8 16" oc |
X4 SLUas 6" ec | o
Tup Struct Stud Wall
@ TL'D l'kf"dx W/Dbl‘ TO‘}_‘? E ‘ g -
NOTES:

I Gee sheet D0 for concrete, relnfercing | wood specifications.

"

2. 1t s permissible to use larger sizes, better grades or recliced stud spaciig without pricr approval.

CONCRETE WALL SCHEDULE

MARK | MATERIAL

DESCRIFTION NOTES

&' Thk w4 & 18" ElY

Ty Stemuwall
£02)9 8 TO Wal ¥ ’

@ CoNE
NOTES:

I Gee shest 582 icr concrets, reinforcing § wcod specifications. Ses latersl plans for shearuall requirsments.
2 It Is permissible to use larger sizes, betier grades or reduced stud spacihng without prier approval

35'-0"——

5"

[P §

e e e e e T L T e T e o o o e o ' 5 o o e e e e e e e e e

e e T e L e o e ot o i i o o o 7 7 7 1 o e o e o e o e,

FOUNDATION + LATERAL PLAN

SCALE: }‘Qn: J-2"

PROJECT:

504 THREE RIVERS DR.

L
5 &
6 kg
N ©
<C
O iy
<< =
I 2c?
L
L
de B
OC T i
Z Zq—E
=3 5
e O 0 <
CONSULTANTS:

|
Covenant
Engfneering

PO Box 4262
Bedfora, Wy &3I12
ph: dle -838-1973/307-883-65[5
web: covenantengineers.com

/\ REVISIONS:

O ISSUES:

DESCRIPTION

NO. | DATE BY

JOB NUMBER: P22056

SCALE: AS NOTED
DATE: 2025
DRAWN BY: T™MM

CHECKED BY:

SHEET NUMBER:

2 oF 3 STRUCTURAL SHEETS

CADD FILE NUMBER: P22056.dwg

12




Section 3, Itema.

FASTENER SCHEDULE

Jst to sill bm or girder, T

Bridging te jst, TN Ea end

z
3. Ixé cr less subfir to Ea jst, FN
4

Wider than ix& suflr to Ea jst, FN
5. Zx subflr to jst, bm or girder, blind ¢ FN...

&. Sill £ to jst or bikg, FN.

Sill B to jst or blkg at braced wall panals.....

T Tep £ to stud EN

& Stud to sill B TN

Stud to sill B EN
S Dbl studs FN

@, Dbl top E's, FN.

Dol top B's, lap splice

Rim jst to tep B, TN
b !

L Blkg otun jsts or rafters to top £, TNureweeweane

Top E's, laps ¢ intarsections, FN,

Clng jst io [E, TN.

12
13
4. Cont har, (2 pleces
I
&

Cont fhar to stud, TN,

17 C/ﬂg Jat, laps ofpartitions, FN.

8. Clng jet to parallel rafters, FN.
18 Rafter to B TN

22. Ix diag prace to Ed stud 4 fE FN

P . ,
2l ix8 shtg to Es brng. FN

Wider than Ixg shtg t© E& BrNg, FN. s

22 Buili-up corner siude

24. Zx planks @ Ea brng

23. Buili-yp girders ¢ oms, N TéB, stgd, O8...n....

25. Collar tie to rafter, FN

26, Jack rafter to nip, TN.

Jack rafter to hig, FN.

27 RFf rafter to 2x ridge Bm, TN OF FN s
28. Jst to band jst, FN.

23, Ledger strip, FN

3& Wd struct panels & par:‘fc/ebc:ard‘, subfir rf &
wall shtg to framing

Yo thk ¢ less

BRi to ¥ thk

Tg to " thk

The following are minimum Fastener requirements for the conditicne specified, Cther nailing anci/or fastening conditions may
overn (l.e top plate splices for shearwdlls) See plans and other notes for conditions iocations and/or reguirements which
ol / ) g ‘ ol jurensn
may exceed the minimums provided by this taole. For fastening of marufactured proaucts, refer te mfr recommendations.

(3)8d (3)2I3!" x 3" nails, (314 Ga x 3" staples
(2)&d, (2 212" x 2" nails, (2) 14 Ga x 3" staples
2) 84
(3) &

. (2 led

led @ le" 231" x 3" nalle & 8" 14 Ga x 37 stdpies @ [27
(3/led @ 16" (4)2(3]" x 3" nails @ j&" (4) 14 Ga x 3" staples @ lg”
(2)led (3) 212" x 3" nails, (3) /4 G& x 3" staples
(4)&d, (4) 231" x 3" nails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" staples

(27 led, (3)2.131" x 3" nalls, (3) 14 G& x 3" staples

led @ 24" 23" x 3" nalls & 8" 4 Ga x 3" staples @ &"
led @ 5" 213" x 3" nails @ 12" 14 Ga x 37 staples @ [27
(8l led, (12)2131" x 3" rnalls, (1214 Ga x 2" staples
3)8d 73 2.13]" x 3" nails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" staples

&d @ &', 2I3]" x 3" nalls 2 &' 14 Ga x 3" staples # &
(2)1eq (3) 231" x 3" nalls, (3) 14 G& x 3" staples

led @ lg" aleng edge

3)8a (5) 213" x 3" nails, (B) 14 Ga x 37 staples

4)&d

(2 led (4) 231" x 3" nalls, (4) 14 Ga x 3" staples
(3)l6d, (4) 2.13]" x 3" nalls, (4. 14 Ga x 3" staples

(3 8d, (3) 213" x 3" nails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" stapies

(2)8d (3) 221" x 3" ngils, (3. 14 Ga x 3" stdples

(3)&d

(3) 24

led @ 24" D/3]" x 3" najls @ l&7 |4 Ga x 3" staples @ (6"
204 @ 32", @I31" x 3" nails @ 24" 14 Ga x 3" staples © 24"
(22284, (3) 213" x 3" pails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" staples

led

(3)12d (4) 131" x 3" nails, (4) 14 Ga x 3" staples

(3 180a (4) 23" x 3" nails, (4} 14 Ga x 3" staples

(27 led, (3)@.I2!" x 3" nails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" staples

. (27 led, (32 213]" x 3" nails, (3) 14 Ga x 3" staples

3} led (4)213/" x 3" paills, (4) 14 Ga x 3" staples
(3l led (4) 2.131" x 3" naile, (4. 14 G& x 3" staples

G2 23" x 2 " nail, 16 Go x | 3" stapled
8d or &d def, 13" x 2 25" nail @ 478" 6 Ga x 2" staple # 4'/8"
Bd common or def

g to 1Yy thk led or &d
Wd struct panels ¢ particleboard, single fir

4 thk ¢ less &d def

Vs to " thk &d def

I te IVt
| 3L Pans/ siding to framing
¥ ihk or jess

124 common or 84 def

&d corresion-resistant siding or casing nail

Nalls spaced 6" EN/2" FN except &' FN where FN supports span 48" or more.

Common or deformed shank.

&d nalls req'd min for wood struct panel rf shig.

Fasteners spaced & 4" EN, 8" FN, for rf shig.

Fasteners spaced ® 4" EN/BY PN, for subflr ¢ wall shig, @ 3" EN/E" FN for rf shig
Corrosion-resistant roofing nalis u/l ¢ head

Corrosion-resistant staples u/lfe croun. FN supports & /6"

LTI TR

Fasteners spaced & 3" EN/&" FN, when used s structural shig. Spacing shall be  &" EN/Z" FN for non-struct application.

S5 thk &d corrosion-resistant siding or casing rail

32. Fleerboard shig to framing
o thkd i1 Ga x 114" rocfing raif, ed common, 16 Ga x | Vs" staple’
Bl bk I Ga x | 94" roofing nail’. 8d common, 16 Ga x | 12" staple’

32 Interior paneling to framing
Ya thk 4d casing or finish nails @ &' EN/I2" AN
7 thk &d Fanel supports @ 24, casing or finish nails ® &' EN/2" FN
NOTES:

Lhere EN 4 FN dre noted, such may be deslgnaisd as &'/7" (EN § &', FN @ [2"Liniess otheruise noted, comnon or box nalls permitted for all conditions. 4l stapies shall have Y min croun wldth
Uniess otherwise noied, commen or box néils permitted for all condltions, Al slaples shall have Ve min crown width

TYPICAL EYMECLE

Direction OF View For
I/ SectionDetall A

#
P
Detall Number Callout @’I
Sheet Uhere Detdll ls Located

/ Detail Callout

W Spe.:{f:" ic Location Of
\ Detall

Detail Number Callout /‘@
Eneet Uhere Detail s Located

LUMBER LEGEND

=

ROUGH-S4UN ¢ DIMENSION
LUMBER CONTINUOUS

(SECTION/
LAMINATED
E4AM CONTINJOUS
=
BLOZKING BLOCKING
(SECTION/ (END OR SIDE)

3 Section Callout Section Number
Callout
# #
\ ]
w Sheet Uhere S#.#
Detail Is Located
, stdil/Section Label . )
4 D hid ! etall Number _— Detail Title
) If Utilized)
) g () s=ies) p=
[ # \&E TAIL TITLE
.\\5»9;#/‘5## SCALE 1 = | i
" N (= =20 = "@ { 3 = P = } f
h / ﬁ‘:g 7R @ ! } /
/ CONCRETE Mix DESIGN
‘-\ \ Referenced / = : : - '
\ From Sheet  petai) -/ TYRE o USE {s-pmf’ rdx ;’TTAX
‘o Sheet Number Gcale - STRENGTH | AGGREGATE | SLUMP
‘ Garége Slabs, Stemuéalls, )
5 Held-Doun Callout HD# . — Hold-Down Per g,’ers Fooiings 32000 psi %" &"
Scheclule — ; i
x ___— Approxinate Location Concrete Not Otheruise 7500 psi i &t
OFf Hold-Doun Specified
&.  Sirdp Callout 84— Strap Fer
Schedule
Approximate Location
Of Strap

TYPiC4L CONSTRUCTION NOTES

All manufaciured hardware snd framing materials
identified In these plans may ce substituted for
similar materials manufactured ey others, provicded alf
such supstitutions dre with materials of at least egual
capacity as those specified in these plans, All such
substituiions shall be submitted to the EOR prior to
their use andior installation:.

Hardware menufaciured by USF Siructural Comectors
may be used without prior dpproval of the Enginser-
Of-Record, provided the strength requirements ds
previously described are met,

As a minimum, the following shall be used, unless
otherwise noted within these pléns:

21 Sill Flates

2.1 All sill plates in contact with corcrete shall
oe FT DF % (Min/ with a bolt betueen &"
and 9" from the end of each plece of siil
plate with twe (2) bolts (Min/ per sill plste,
Sill plates of other wood products are
prohioited.

212 Sill plates shall be anchored to concrete
w/ %"t (min) anchor bolis embedded at least
2" and spaced at no more than 48" oc.

22 Double top plates shall be spliced with 4

minimum of (8) 184 nalls at sach side of each
top- and botiom-piece joint splice. Concurrent
splice joints shall be no closer ihan 4&°

23 Shearwalls: All exterior wallis shall be sheathed

and nailed to match the minimum shearwai! type
per the shearwall schedule or plan notes, as
dpplicable.

4, Fost dlternate - Unless otherwise noted, it fs

dcceptable to use built-uo 2x studs in place of
solid-sdun posts not exposed to weather,
provided the follouing criteris are met:

241 The built-up section members are of the
same material ¢ grade as the post, including
pressure-iredted where specified (see
TIMBER SFECIFICATIONS,' this shest .

242 The bullt-up section is at least ds large as
the identified post section.

2.4.3. The built-uz section members are sistered
together with l6d naile spéced at no more
than 2" oc, staggered, and driven at varying
angles to tie' esch ix ply to adjacent plys.

244 The ends of the bullt-up memecer sre cut
Flush for full and uniform bearing.

245, Uhere a mechanical base or cap is required,
the built-up section shall be either reuted
or shaved for proper fit-upAnother suitable
base or cap may be used, provided
capdcities meet or exceed those of the
base or cap specified.

246, Construction achesive is qpplied between
plys in addition to the sistering rails.

LN

w

W

TIMBER EFECIEICATIONS

All timber gradies as specified in theses notes are
minimum gradies. It is acceptable to use grades of
better quslity (ie higher strength) without first
obtaining approval from the EOR for any such
variance.

Timbers of neminal width equal te or larger than 4"
shall not contain boxed hesrt (e free-of-heart-
center,' or FOHC.)! unless noted No FOHC OK' in
tnese plans.

Al Douglas-Fir (DF) Products shall be graded by
the Western Wood Frocducts Asscciation Grading
Rules and any applicable ASTM siandards (ie. A8TM
Dz45)

Al load-bearing and shearuall framing shall be

Douglas-Fir 2. Al siuds [2'-@" andl lenger shall be
Douglas-Fir #

All saun beams ¢ headers less than 12'-2" shall be
Douglas-Fir %2 or Douglas-Fir ¥ for spans 12'-2" or
longer, uniess noted otheruise.

All glug-laminated beams shall be 24F-v4d DF/DF Al
multi-span ¢ cantilever GLB's shall be 24F-v& DF/DF.

All posts shall be Douglias-Fir ¥ or Better.

Neo rnotching of timber products is allowed, unless
otheruise noted in these plans or subsequently-
lesued via spproved addendums or sketches. Any
such acidendums or sketches shall be accompanied
by the wet stamp and signature of the EOR

Fasteners in preservative-iredied and fire-
retardant -ireated wood shall be of hot dipped
zinc-codted galvanized sieel siainiess stee! silicon
bronze or copper.

Steel washers shall be provided under heads and
nuts of ail lag screws and bolts which bear on woed.
The following minimum requirements shall be followed
for sizing of washers to be used in siil plate
applications:

Malleable Iron
25" Dig x V"
274" Dia x %"
3" Dia x Yg"

Bc!t//_ag Stee! FL

Diameter Washer Size
by 2" 5q x U
.-3/éu 2}&1; 50‘, x }'/"if'
" 3" &g x %"
‘,-"/é” 3.%,‘; 36,{)(3/3”
" 3 %" 8g x %" 4" Dia x It

For structures classified as 'Sefsmic De=sign
Category' D, £ or F (See General Notes' this pége)
or for shearwalls where the design load excesds
492 pounds per linear foot (pif) uashers shall not

be smaller than 3" 8g x %" FL

*Standard cut washers may be used for all other
applications, unless noted otherwise in these plans.

MFR WOOPD ROOF TRUSEES

Contractor/Fabricator shall fleld verify all structural
cimensions pricr to fabrication of any structural
elements as required by these plans.

Trusses shall be designed in dccordance with the
latest IBC and all other applicsble reference
documerts.

Design Load

321 Tow Chords: Dead 12 pst

Live 22 psf
Snow 122 psf

3.2 Bottom Chords: Desd 12 psf

Live 2 psf

321 Dead Loads may be dssumed o include the
weight of the trusses.

SV
ha
28]

Live ¢ Mechanical Loads may be consiclered
to act independently (le. not concurrantly.

All top ¢ botiom chords skall meet a minimum specific
gravity G' = 252 (Dougles-Fir Larch)

Truss calculaiicns shall include calculations for
bedring stress to ensure that the allowable bearing
stresses dre not exceeded, Truss plans ¢
calculations shall be prepared under the direction
of and stamped by & professional or structural
engineer regisiered in the Siate

The trusses shall be designed as a compleie system,
Including ali bracing snd conmsciions not shown or
noted on these plans. Truss framing shall be similar
to the framing ds indicdted in these plans. Alternate
framing layouts may be submitted for approval (which
may result in delays.).

3 Z;H D"‘E v -;f/)‘é“

_Q\

~d

T&

-

(=}
R

g/
32

932

2.

21
122 Ties or stirruos

CONCRETE NOTES

Corcrete fixing, plécing and pouring shall be in accordance
with ACI 318 and the project specifications. Mix design shall
oe in sccordance with the dpplicable sections of the CEC and
these plans, Mix designs must be suomitied for dpproval prior
to placement of concrete,

All pipes and condluits passing through walls and footings shall’
utilize sleeves affixed pricr to placing of concrete.

Corncrete shall not be permitted to drep frem & full helght of
more then six (&7 vertical feet. Hoppers andior vertical chutes
snall be used o sveid segregation in and around reinforcing
steel (le. In formed cast-in-place concrete walls)

Footings (spread ¢ continuous/ are centered under posts,
colums and walls, UNC.

The finished surface of all horizonial constr shall
be removed so &5 to expose clean, solidly @n.

dggregate,| All reinforcing steel dowels used at he.  .ontal
construction joints shall be free of flaking oxidation (rust.) and
any cured doncrete (e hard concrete adhered to the surface
of the reinforcing dewels) prior to placenent of new concrete
at the construction joint.

Footings shall bear on firm undlisturbad native soil or
compacted enginaered fill.

Unless otherwise noted in these plans, concrete mixes shall meet
the criterid ds listed n the table titled CONCRETE Mix
REQUIREMENTS' elseuhere within these plans.,

REINFORCING STEEL NOTES

Reinforcing placement and splicing skall be in dccordance with
the Manus! of Standard Fractice' by the Concrete Reinforcing
Steel Instiilie

Non-cogied reinforcing steel shall be kept clean and free of
corrosion ar rust prior to pldcement of concrete.

Splices of centinuous steel reinforcement bars shall use Class
B'lap splices (I-&' min) with adjjacent splices spsced at no
less then 5-2"

Welaed wire fabric lap splices shall be lapped a minimum of 12"

Froviae any énd all accesscries necessary to sypport the
reinfereing steel and parduare in place as shoun in these plans.

we:-szabbf'ng of reinforcing steel dowels or embedded anchor
bolts shall not be permitted,

Frotection (clesrance from edge or face of concrete) for
reinforeing steel shall conform to the f. ollowing:

Coneréte poured dgslnst earth 3"
Concrete formed but exposed to earth or weather 2"
S & smalier Pt
% ¢ larger ar
Columns ¢ beams 175"
Interior walls ¢ slabs [ 15"
Siab-on-Grade - frem botton &
Structyrél - from top 15"
Non-struciural - from top 2"

Edch bdr shall be wire-tied or atisched by other spproved
methed to tes, stirrups or cross-bars at @ maximun of 74"

1
w'e.fdmg of steel reinforeing bars shail comely with requirements
of The American Welding Society (AWs) DL 2888 and the
following:

Rebadr to 45T 436 EToxx electrodss
Rebar to 452 or stronger E92xX elecirocies
Rebar to Rebar E9CXX elecirodies

Relnforcing steel shall mest the following recuiremsnts:

Welded Wire Fabric ASTMIE
AETM Lel5 Grace 62

123 Ciher bars (not welded)  A8TM 4s15 Grade 62

24, Uelded bars

AsTM Al2e

i Desd + Live
[z Dead + Live + Wind/Earthquake

GENERAL STRUCTURAL NOTES

The Coniractor shall verify all field dimensions perior to
faprication & erection,

If there are any emissions, errors or discrepancies discovered
within these plans (ie. dimension conflicts) contact the
Architect or Engineer of Record for clarification éndior
correction prior to continuing with construction.

All plan dimensions ds indicated on these plans or on
drehitectura! pidns dre sssumed to be from face of studs or
face of concrete NG

Design Loading Criteris

4/ Reof: Desd 12 psf
Live 22 pst
Snow (Uniform Roof X 122 psr
'Per Jurisdiction
Ualte: Exterior: e psf
42 Risk Cat /!
43 Wind Basic Speed: 125 men (Uit
Exposure c’
Celling Fitch 4:[2
K zi < f’@@ ,"w = F‘:Z’g
44. Seismic: Lat: 43/59945° N Long: oD3935° U

Site Class = D Des. Cat. = D

35 ERVE: 595 = 2850

8 = 0343 8y = na

fe = OO le = 02
F‘DWQ‘S&’;‘ =65 -Cg./w au) < 22754

EFOUNDATION NOTES

Minimum allowable soil pressures, per 2218 IBC:

522 psf
2000 pst

Covenant Enginsering shall not be responsible for dny negative effects, damége
or otber dstrinenial results related to nadequate or uncompécted soil andior
backfill conditions.

SLAFETY NOTE!

it Is the Centractors' responsiviliiy to comply with 81/ federal
and state regulations regarding maintaining & safe work
enviromment and performing work in & safe mamer. it is the

Contractors' responsibility to be suare and comply with all

~

COSHA requirements that may dpply to this consiruction project.

STAMP:

STRUCTURAL REFERENCE CODES

e Al work to be performed under these project plans shail
conform to the following dpplicable codes and any applicable
supplements and amencinents:

4 2018 International Bullding Code

2 ASCE -1 Minimum Design Loadls for Buildings and Other
Siructures

3 Ac! 3lg-14 Building Code 4nd Commentdry (Concrete/

4. ANSIZAFERPA NDS-22/5 Nations! Des Ign Specification for Wood
Construction

STRUCTURAL SHEET INDEX

S@D STRUCTURAL NOTES ¢ REFERENCES
812 FOUNDATION ¢ LATERAL FLAN ¢ DETAILS

Sli ROOF FRAMING FLAN ¢ DETAILS

TYPICAL STRUCTURAL ABBREVIATIONS

PROJECT:

504 THREE RIVERS DR.

(N) SHOP

OWNER

ANNA PANTONE

504 THREE RIVERS DR.
ALPINE, WY 83128

CONSULTANTS:

|
Covenant

Engincerfqg

PO Box 4262
Bedford, WYy 83/12
ph: 9l6-838-1973/307-883-65/5
web: covenantengineers.com

O ISSUES:

A REVISIONS:

NO. | DATE

BY | DESCRIPTION

AE Anchor Bolt Duwl Dowel

Aev Above (E/ Existing

Aah Adhesive Ea Each

Adlj Adjacent, Adjust Eley  Elevation

Lad't Additional EN Edge or End Nailing
AFF Above Finlsh Fir Engr Engineer(ed)

Arch Arehitectiural) EOQ Eage Of

BC/ Boise Cascide inc. ECR Enginser OF Record
Bldg  Building E Equal

Bk Block ES Edch Sice

Bkg  Blocking El Edch Way

Bilu Below Exp Expansion

BFF Below Finist Fir Ext Exterior

Bm Beam FF Finish Flecr

EN Beundiany Neiling = Finish Gradie

BO Bottom Of Fir Floor

Eoit Bottom N Fleld or Face Nailing
Brg Bedring Frgcls Foungation

Btuwn Eetween Fo Face OF

Bynd  Beyond FOHC  Free CF Heart Center
c Camber Frm Frame, Framing

cJ Consiruction Joint F& Fsr Side

¢ oL Center Line Fig Feoting

Chg Ceiling &d Gage

Cir Clear GalLB Glu-Leminsted Beam
CMi Concrete Masonry Unit - (H) Hitl Core

Col Column D Hold-Down

Conc  Concrete Heir Hedder

Conn Connecl, Comection Hgr ."-:‘Ef':g&*

Cont Continuous Rk Hook

Clenk  Couniersink Horiz  Horizental

¢ Disg  Dismeter Hi Height

Diag  Diagonal o Insicie Diameter

Del Double inel Incluged

Deme  Demolition It Inierior

Det Detail Iy T Red Head Corp.
DF Deuglas Fir JH Jolst Hanger

Disg  Diagenal it Joint

Dimis/) Dimansion's) Jot Jolst

LLv Long Leg Vertical spsT  Belf Drilling Seif

LF Lousizns Facific Corp. Tapping Ecrew

Lt Light Ehi Sheet

L Lt UWeight Concrete Shig Sheathing

ME Machine Bolt Eim Simitar

Max Maximum LY Short Leg Vertical

Mer Marufscivrer, ] Sheet Metal Scraw
Manufactured 500G Slab-On-Grade

Min Minimum Spec  Specification’s/

Ml Metal 55 Stalnless Siee!

N/ New Sid Standard

Ne.#* Number Stgr Staggeried,

NG Nedr Sids Stifr Stiffener

NTE Not To Scale Stl Stee!

N Nermal! lizight Concrete Struct  Structura!

oc On Center Sg Square

op Cutside Dismeter TéB Top ¢ Bottom

Cen Qpenling/ TéG Tengue ¢ Groove

Cer Oppeosite F Tc:fm Fr’a“ngs

08 Opposite Sice(s/ The Thick(enenediness,)

Par Parallel T Trus-Joist Inc. .

Pero  Perpendicular o Tep OF ’

FDF FPowder Driven Fastenar Trans Transition

£ FL  Plaie Transv  Transverse

Plyad  Plywood Ty Typical

Frese  Fressure o Unistrut Corp.

psf Pounds per Square UNO Unless Noted Otherwise
Foot UM Unreinforced :"fasanrg

psi Feunds per Squire Inch O Open lew Joisi

FT Fressure Tresied, Fost  Vert Vertical
Tension ' Witk

Fur Furlin Wi Without

Rad Radiuvs UF itide Flange

Reinf  Reinfercing, e Werk FPoint
Reinforcement e Weod Screw

Regd  Required W Ueight

8/ Simpson Strong Tie WiF lelded Uire Fabric

sC Saw Cut, Slip-Critical et ood

Sched  Schedule Wy way

JOB NUMBER: P22056
SCALE: AS NOTED
DATE: 2025
DRAWN BY:  TMM

CHECKED BY:

SHEET NUMBER:

1 o©F

3

STRUCTURAL SHEETS

CADD FILE NUMBER: P22056.dwg

13




30| 25| 20| A 4 15|

10]

5]

Bl

=]

T

cl

o
o —
s

WQO
99° 76 PROPOSED CONCRETE DEN S
\,\32\,0"14,\ OR ASPHALT DRIVE X PU R b
N R

N ~ 7 ,*0 "

PROPOSED BALCONY ™. ~__

OVER SETBACK \ ~__

N~ /

~_ /

>~

358 SQFT SNOW STORAGE >~

24" NDS DRY WELL SYSTEM Y ;}%SR(/?\ETESNOW
HEAT TRACE THRU DOWSPOUT / ,/ |
TO BELOW FROST LINE / |
NON-CONTIGUOUS / /
FOUNDATION i /
BETWEEN STRUCTURES

HEAT TRACE THRU
DOWSPOUT TO BELOW
FROST LINE /

/

2'919,, \

LINE OF /
FOUNDATION WALL /

COVERED
OUTDOOR AREA

, = \LINE OF ROOF EAVE

/ T >~

/ / EXISTING RS ~< / LINE OF
/ CLEANOUT 1y N / ~ FOUNDATION WALL /

/ AND - S
/ ~,/ 3N EXISTING ELECTRICAL / /

/ SANITARY N 33
/ 25 SEWER / S / Ay METER & CT CABINET /

p Q :4 n
/7 YOp
Os

. / / LOT 28

. / /

/ / EXISTING TREES
LOT 27 . 5, , /TYP WHERE

/A ELCJJFI{/IIIE/I?JNICATIONSPROPO& / SHOWN /
GREYS RIVER VILLAGE SECOND ADDITION YA cov S&p /
0.32 +/- ACRES /
CORNER LOT:

(2) FRONT SETBACKS
(2) SIDE SETBACKS

BURIED WATER LINE

EXISTING WATER METER

EXISTING ELECTRICAL
TRANSFORMER/JUNCTION

EXISTING
COMMUNICATIONS

PEDESTAL LINE /

BURIED ELECTRICAL /

/ SITE AREA CALCULATIONS

// 75 SITE AREA: 0.32 ACRES X 43,560 = 13,939.2 SQUARE FEET
/ § 0" MIN LANDSCAPED AREA REQUIRED: 1,393 SQUARE FEET
N LANDSCAPED AREA PROVIDED: 9,404 SQAURE FEET

/% PARKING: (4) SPACES PROVIDED
[EX'ST'NG SHED /& / ((2) INSIDE GARAGE AND (2) IN DRIVEWAY)

DRIVEWAY AREA: 1,042 SQUARE FEET

/ SNOW STORGAE REQURIED: 1,042 X 0.20 = 208.4 SQUARE FEET
SNOW STORAGE PROVIDED: 358 + 113 = 471 SQUARE FEET

LOT 26 Feple /

R / 7\ SITEPLAN
~ W 1/8" = 1'-0" \’/

NORTH REF

SCALE IN FEET
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0"
8/11/2025 12:22:36 PM| AAS # WOODEN SPUR |

MAX PROJECTION 3 FEET ~ /

ARCHITECT

ALPINE ARCHITECTURAL STUDIO, LLC
PO BOX 3975

ALPINE, WY 83128
bbennett@alpinearchstudio.com

STRUCTURAL ENGINEER
TSE ENGINEERS

136 S. STATE ST.

SHELLY, ID 83274
office@tetoneng.com

SHEET INDEX

GENERAL

G101 GENERAL NOTES & TYPICAL DETAILS

G102 MAP OF GREYS RIBER VILLAGE LOT-27

G103 EXISTING & DEMOLITION FLOOR PLANS

G104 EXISTING & DEMOLITION EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS

ARCHITECTURAL

A101 FIRST FLOOR PLAN

A102 SECOND FLOOR PLAN

A103 ROOF PLAN

A201 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS

A202 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS

A301 BUILDING SECTIONS

A302 BUILDING SECTIONS & SCHEDULES
A303 PERSPECTIVE

A601 DOOR & WINDOW INSTALLATION

STRUCTURAL

S1
S2
S3
S4
S5

GENERAL NOTES & TYPICAL DETAILS
SHEAR WALL PLANS

FOUNDATION PLAN

ROOF FRAMING PLANS

DETAILS

CODES UTILIZED

IRC

2021

TOWN OF ALPINE LAND USE DEVELOPMENT CODE

PROJECT DESCRIPTION
RESIDENTIAL GARAGE AND RENOVATION OF EXISTING SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING

OCCUPANCY
R101.2: ONE FAMILY DWELLING & ACCESSORY STRUCTURE

FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM

EXISTING: NO
PROPOSED: NO

FLOOR AREAS IN GROSS SQUARE FEET

ONE FAMILY DWELLING GROSS FLOOR AREAS:
EXISTING 1ST FLOOR DWELLING AREA: 1,216 SQFT
EXISTING ATTACHED GARAGE AREA: 528 SQFT
EXISTING 2ND FLOOR AREA: 295 SQFT
EXISTING 1ST COVERED PORCH: 132 SQFT

PROPOSED 1ST FLOOR ADDITION: 180 SQFT
COVERED PORCH TO LIVING ROOM: 132 SQFT
EXISTING GARAGE TO LIVING ROOM: 515 SQFT
PROPOSED DETACHED GARAGE: 676 SQFT
PROPOSED COVERED OUTDOOR AREA: 150 SQFT AT ENTRY + 312 SQFT AT DETACHED GARAGE

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION NOTES

1.

1.
12.

13.
14.

VICINITY MAP: NTS

THIS PROJECT SHALL COMPLY WITH THE 2021 VERSION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE INCLUDING ALL AMENDMENTS & THE TOWN OF ALPINE LAND USE
DEVELOPMENT CODE. ANY BUILDING OFFICIAL, SUBCONTRACTOR OR TRADES PERSON
NOTING DISCREPANCIES SHALL NOTIFY THE ARCHITECT IMMEDIATELY UPON DISCOVERY.
CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE ALL REQUIRED INSPECTIONS BY THE TOWN OF ALPINE
AND ANY OTHER GOVERNING AUTHORITIES, AS NECESSARY.

ALL CONSTRUCTION DEBRIS IS TO BE STOCKPILED NEATLY ON SITE UNTIL DISPOSAL,
WHICH SHALL BE DONE AT COUNTY LANDFILL OR RECYCLING FACILITY ONLY. NO DEBRIS
IS TO BE DISPOSED OF IN LOCAL WASTE COLLECTION FACILITIES.

UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED, ALL DIMENSIONS ARE GIVEN TO FACE OF ROUGH FRAMING,
CENTERLINE OF COLUMNS, OR FACE OF CONCRETE AND C.M.U. WALL.

CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE STORAGE FOR ALL BUILDING MATERIALS IN  ACCORDANCE
WITH MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS. STORAGE OF SUPPLIES SHALL REMAIN
DRY.

ALL SUBSTITUTIONS ARE TO BE APPROVED BY ARCHITECT/OWNER. ALONG WITH WRITTEN
REQUESTS CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE ALL INFORMATION REGARDING THE
SUBSTITUTION IN QUESTION, INCLUDING COST, AVAILABILITY AND REASON FOR
SUBSTITUTION.

NON-COMBUSTIBLE BLOCKING, INSULATION OR OTHER FIRESTOP MATERIAL IS TO BE
PROVIDED BETWEEN STORIES, BETWEEN TOP STORY AND ROOF SPACE, BETWEEN

STAIR STRINGERS AT TOP AND BOTTOM, BETWEEN STUDS ALONG STAIR RUNS AND AT
ALL OTHER PLACES THAT COULD ALLOW THE PASSAGE OF FLAME.

CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE SAMPLES OF ALL FINISHES AND STAIN COLORS FOR
APPROVAL BY ARCHITECT/OWNER. THIS INCLUDES BUT IS NOT LIMITED TO INTERIOR AND
EXTERIOR STAINS, INTERIOR PAINT, SHEETROCK TEXTURES, CHEMICALLY APPLIED METAL
PATINAS, AND STONE VENEER MATERIAL & MASONRY TECHNIQUE.

ALL ELECTRICAL WORK TO BE PERFORMED BY WY LICENSED ELECTRICIAN.

. ALL MATERIALS SHALL BE INSTALLED PER MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS AND

IN ACCORDANCE WITH WARRANTY GUIDELINES.

REFER TO GEOTECHNICAL REPORT PROVIDED BY OWNER.

CONTRACTOR RESPONSIBLE FOR PROVIDING, COORDINATION AND SUPERVISING
TRENCHING OF UTILITIES AND SERVICES TO AND FROM BUILDING. LOCATE ALL UTILITIES
PRIOR TO EXCAVATION. COORDINATION SHALL INCLUDE CONTRACTOR'S REASONABLE
EFFORTS TO COMBINE AS MANY DIFFERENT UTILITIES IN COMMON TRENCHES AS
PRACTICAL AND GOOD PRACTICE PERMIT.

VERIFY EXISTING BUILDING DIMENSIONS

VERIFY ALL BURIED UTILITIES PRIOR TO EXCAVATION.

Section 3, Itemc.

alpine
architectural studio

WOODEN SPUR RENOVATION

o]

368 WOODEN SPUR DR

ALPINE, WY 83128

il

=|

© 2025 | ALL RIGHTS RESERVED

PERMIT DRAWINGS

PROJECT LOCATION ‘@'

6.9.2025
DRAWN BY | BENNETT
CHECKED BY | BENNETT

REVISIONS
1 7.242025 GARAGE DIMs

COVER SHEET &
SITE PLAN

G101

cl

I I I 301 25] 20] A 15]

10]

5]

14




30|

25| 20|

15| 10|

5| 0
A A
gSERVOIR
| | CZ)
| | =
’ 7 OCCUPANT LOAD CALCS alpine
| S o IBC 2018: 20 SQFT PER OCCUPANT _ !
| | S < MAX UNDIVIDED FIRE AREA: 8,616 SQFT architectural studio
; | o9 8,616/20=431
— | z| >3 MAX OCCUPANT LOAD: 431 OCCUPANTS
o w
| e n O , MAX DIVIDED FIRE AREA: 4,418 SQFT
\ 2 IE z 4,418 SQFT/20=221
| | 8 B Z0 MAX OCCUPANT LOAD PER
| | < =0 MAX DIVIDED FIRE AREA: 221 OCCUPANTS
_| \ T L
| | | » 0
i | &g
> X N 1 | f | 5) <
- 50' UTILITY EASEMENT \ \ | } | } -
|
GUFFALO RUN o \ BASEBALL FIELD | | N
|
\ \ \ \ | N N
\ | l \ | \ AN
o o | | | AN
1 \ \ \ e[S
| \\ \ 1 J } =
| \ \
\ |
_ \ 1 l\ \ | -
| LOT 16 ) | | } |
| 2 5.27 +- ACRES S | | |
= l | A ‘ — ’ Z
} 5 P%)l‘ } A7 | o
<o | - — — (L)
. | " . | . | > o _
| » 1 ~ \ ELECTRIC e 0%
\ | | DISTRIBUTION EASEMENT & — > ] m o
| \ — = o
| | | 705PR812 g | N L
| HORSESHOE GAME AREA \ 694 PR 847 — — 4\ :
| . Lo — T ]! ®0 o
| . ’ ~ o TSk
. | T -~ . UTLITY EASEMENT | Lo 0§59 P _
| Db | I AGREEMENT | o )
| | T | e~ | o » 9 O
| TS o yTPROPOSED i | \‘ ] <Dz Q I_
| < | -7 |GRAVELPATH  — _ ~ == | | | » <
| O \ =3 ~ ~ ‘ = < L
\ oS -~ - \ \ ‘ <
} ,z g 720" , 26-6" 720" } : | o Q
<
T TYP
w - “HE I =
) o
K] | p— o / & | | e K
ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION | r————— o e ———— | | ! © 0O
ACCESSION NO. 807881 | r — ;:::::::; - SIDE SETBACK S 2 | ‘N | c/L |—I LI.
LOT 9 " VEHICULAR ) \ A = 2 D 2 | e O
| "ENTRANCE  \ Y/ SNOW STORAGE ! I = o I A . PARKING/ 77#4:;7 | ” E @ —— ~
- | Z | reocwtel \ Y staGiNG | | \/ \ DRIVE AREA ' MODULAR 2 | | I els Z —
‘ S w EXISTING FILL PILE <,\:l <:| AREA | ] k\ > | EDUCATIONAL GROUP-E | | ‘\ | S zZ
% Z [ |7 | UNSPRINKLERED | | m
> } o = i ] LT STAGING C\/ | | | N O — <4
| - o 1 10 1 9 /| | AR B ' | L = -
| E o j ] (1l | | 2HRFIRE || % PROPOSED | [ N a
— ™ S ’ / Lo RATED WALLS o — 10P0L(§)YSA|T=E'A+/- l n < —
| a a @ - PEDESTRIAN WALKWAY : ’, / - | MODULAR S | ’ e J l N 0
} = 1 10 1 /10 I/ }FI j} Tij‘ ‘ | | H‘ \ L‘IJ < 0
= | | | e (7))
» : /i R e B 22
| 3 F H=e = O [ | | R =z o
. | 5 =) —> o I e | | 23 T QO -
= IR R R | | s ZER —
L | 250 &I | [ | MODULAR 4 | | IS 1]Q 26y — I.IJ
20 / ) | | PROPOSED 1% b | Oan~
| i [/ | 200 - < )
\ ~ | < e L pss u B
a = — — T T——F S s e e e — — i — —| =) -
+ OO0 0000, I P i OO0 0§l 332 1= Z
| ® ° | @\ 89 5652 =, B O=¢o — < —
| “PROPERTY LINE  330.14' / I ] I 319.98 \ N % =0 - L n_
| | \ O w =z
| PROPOSED | @ ﬁ \ | | | »noOuw Zz =
| TREES PRIVACY FENCE / PRIVACY FENCE PROPOSED — | | | 'g (Zg 8 s o O -
- | PUMP TRACK | | | | <0< 2 - - < -
P | LOCATION | | Jm g < LLI < < P
\ |
N y | } =|F 5 =
| VEHICULAR LoT 14 } | 3 g >
— | ENTRANCE/EXIT 0.91 +- ACRES SKATE PARK | | fn i
| HAMMERHEAD IFC D103.1 | | | <
| y | | | Z
| 23 CHILD DEVELOPMENT ‘ | —
| 33 CENTER | | =
— () — -
S89°21' 14" W | | 4
} @ 374.64 —
RIVER VIEW MEADOWS ADDITION | / LLI
ACCESSION NO. | LOT 13 / ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION m
LOT 29 | 1.75 +- ACRES / ACCESSION NO. 807881 al
7 / © 2025 | ALL RIGHTS RESERVED [—
| / LOT 5 |
} / Z SCHEMATIC DESIGN
| O
_| | I_
| () | 811.2025
| DRAWN BY | BENNETT
i —) | CHECKED BY | BENNETT
o o m REVISIONS
Z
_ B : L e ; O i
/ ~
o / .
} } ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION S J/ m SITE PLAN LL
- 0 40 80 | \ ACCESSION NO. 807881 N , W " = 400" W SITE STUDY - A u
LOT 3 =
SCALE IN FEET NORTH REF O S P 1 O 1
SCALE: 1" = 40' prd
8/11/2025 10:22:25 AM | AAS # ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION L-15 | 15
I 301 25] 20] A 15] 10] I

5]

0l



CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR

ALPINE WEST LOCATION MAP counry or tnca | ™
THIRD ADDITION

T3 7N R778W‘ . I, Karl F. Scherbel, of Afton, Wyoming, hereby certify that this plat
’ was made from notes taken during an actual survey made by
—

Alpine West First Addition, of record in the Office of the Clerk of
Lincoln County with Accession No. 807881, being N82*1306°E.

3 o — — /' persons under my supervision during June 2025 and from records
L § == S = / / B in the Office of the Clerk of Lincoln County and that it correctly
A\ 7 represents ALPINE WEST THIRD ADDITION ;
, Lo LOT \3 cte ter = (314' - that said addition was accurately surveyed, that the parts thereof are
— ~———~ . - , ’ accurately staked off and marked with appropriate metal monuments,
" AN : ' c : / / including ‘magnetic iron, and inscribed at least with the registration
j : - number of the Land Surveyor to provide source identification at all lo
' » . b f the Land S t id identificati t all lot
. : 1 . _NN‘E C eLo LoT 1 €~9 corners of the addition, and that their locations are correctly shown
GLO LOT 1 : o : hereon;
, . ol B )
""""""""""""""" Lo /% . o] that, to the best of my knowledge, it conforms with the municipal code
cLO LOT & cLo LoT s - -i _— : of the Town of Alpine and to all applicable state statutes;
- \ : . - - . GLo LoT 7 ] that the error of closure is not greater than one part in five—thousand.
N '. A 7 GLo Lo : Encompassing an area of 11.18 acres, more or less.
~N —_— ) -
S~ . % - —SEE Rve® - — ! That said addition is described as follows:
— B DET. e .
_— ~— . PALISADES, HEIGETS - - - - R N A Sy A~y o S /- + . S - D - All of Lots 10, 11, and 12, and part of Elk Drive of Alpine West Second
g Iﬁo C \Zf"fa,":;:: Hir . 40 . b : .28 ﬁddition. o'f\I recgcgg"ig the Office of the Clerk of Lincoln County with
. - Rl A\ ' ccession No. .
| I % . pALISADES I CREYS RIVER
| 3= J - At ; B,
| "% (+75) . HVER VIEW MEADOWS PLAT NO. S49—4
| | @Q@ . [P v sea-0_, GLO LOT 7 2 W\
X : .
| | §nﬁ s
A , .
s 889 | - U7 XN
o o ' : .
| ol ‘§ 8§ N B
© 9O e
! T =d ’ %1 : (%
| | @ L )
O o
I I % 8 ~Vin
A\ I i o R
582 ENTERPRISES 3k
) N | | :%< £ :Egé g e
e . _ g _ i
FALO - KU baseball field | |\\&I O - s 256 a7 onas vaxe ssorriow—m . = The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by Karl F.
BUF I I AN i a S raney nveRe = Scherbel this day of 2025.
- = | | N\ ¢ SRD ADDITION PLAT NG 203 PLAT NO. 184
_ J— ’_\ < PLAT NO. 250-D , o TP
- . l i 1000’ 0’ 1000’ 2000’ 3000 Witness my hand and official seal.
I
I
| | . SCALE: 1” = 1000’
, | .S
I g E Notary Public
| o
I g 88 My Commission expires:
| =N
! Zhe
' LZR=RC)
 §Z R CERTIFICATE OF OWNERS
e | (&) a
' oy 8
. ' 88 STATE OF WYOMING
i / | a 4 ss.
1] | % 3] COUNTY OF LINCOLN
- Q
| I a << The undersigned hereby certify that the subdivision of part of Alpine West Second
! | | % Addition, within the incorporated limits of the Town of Alpine, Lincoln County,
N Eﬁg | Wyoming, as shown on this plat and more particularly described in the Certificate
1 Ik /gﬁ‘;‘: = | Ay of Surveyor, is with the free consent and in accordance with the desires of the
Aﬂpﬂﬂl@ West Eirst Additi | b Aﬁ;-:% | owners and proprietors of the described lands; LEGEND
Accession 1 ‘/§ ’ \° C;Il‘\ that the name of the addition shall be ALPINE WEST THIRD ADDITION to the town of Alpine; 0 indicates a corner record filed or to be filed in the Office of the
(22N \\\ Dy
Lot9 s o ] 3o | ' that they do hereby vacate Lots 10, 11, and 12 and that part of Elk Drive, as described Clerk of Lincoln County.
~ ol | | under the Certificate of Surveyor, in accordance with Section 34—-12-108, Wyomin% - » . . .
- ] °13 | I Statutes 2021, as amended, and respectfullg request the Clerk of Lincoln County to so © L%dICRGtIEGYS gOm?e'Dg‘ﬁg!}Pg?s_FtaR'ée R24$ 1'8'19 V;'th a met?I cap inscribed,
/\ /a ‘ Sip | I mark said plat in accordance with Section 34—12—-110; URV U L » found or of record.
Lo | . . ” ” . . . .
O a8 | that those rights of ingress, egress and utilities over, under, and along the vacated o indicates g 5/8" x 24" steel reinforcing rod with an aluminum cap
I+ —J / j’,"Ao : - : o portion of Elk Drive, shown hereon as the Fifty (50) foot Utility Easement, previously |fnscr|bed, fSURVEYOR SCHERBEL LTD", with appropriate details,
g S | I-Qil % granted to Lower Valley Energy, Silver Star Communications and other utility companies, ound or of record.
I | C XC I I Ql S g their heirs, successors and assigns, including, but not limited to, water, sewer, power, e indicates a 5/8"°x24" steel reinforcing rod with 2" aluminum cap inscribed
51010 ' ) 928 o e s g o e Heoiped®,ang fioation faciiies appurtanant FSURVETOR SETERGEL LT Wi apprapriote detols, sot s survey.
B I - .
i Y I : E‘E Q that said addition is subject to easements of record in the Office of the Clerk of E indicates an electrical transformer.
_ | — sman _II | g < &~ Lincoln County; A indicates a water valve, water meter or yard hydrant.
‘ S89°56'52"E 319.98" | ! J @eg 2 :Ilgébl;:/lkde[)c;ilgg’te?istgefl'l'-cetegut;llﬁ:?n this plat within the bounds of this addition is o indicates @ hydrant.
- ] ‘1 I Q ’
] I : 'S % % that all rights under and by virtue of the Homestead Exemption Laws of the State ® indicates a manhole.
5 | . 28F of Wyoming are hereby released. I dicates an easement.
— ] I
| I's : A |=§ % g § TOWN OF ALPINE g S indicates an underground sanitary sewer line.
= s .
- 0911‘°t 14 I " :‘S;) g 2 < attest: X x x-  indicates an existing fence line.
7 . < by ¥ ; - .
/\ : :8 § - indicates a centerline.
(/) . .
i i : Monica L. Chenault, Clerk Eric Green, Mayor The Basis of Bearing for this survey is the north line of Lot 12 of
7 _|

S89°21'14"W

T,

9 OWNERS: LAND USE TABLE:
= CERTIFICATE OF ACCEPTANCE
L PO Box 3070° Averoge Unit S 3,78+ Acres
r n : .
I 2 STATE OF WYOMING Alpine, Wyoming 83128 Tgteo?g:cres; ze 11,18+ Acres
- . SS. Use of Units: Commercial
| COUNTY OF LINCOLN SURVEYOR: Zoning: C—2 Commerical

I T T T T
AKE RIVER DR
| 1 | 1

The foregoint?_. ALPINE WEST THIRD ADDITION was approved at the regular
f

meeting of the Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Commission on the gucl;ve r 57c2I-éerbel. Ltd. DATE
day of —————— 2025, in accordance with Sections 15—1—-415 and .0. Box 728 o
CIJRVE TABLE A\ o 34—-12—-102, 103, Wyoming Statutes, 2021, as amended. Afton, Wyoming 83110

- - 7 307) 885-9319
| CURVE [ LENGTHA ARWS | [ CHORD BEARING [ CHORD | TANGENT Attest: Town of Alpine (307 June 2025
- CHY~ 2743 \ 25084 N353'55"Ef= 21.68’ 12.03’
/- C2r"/ 63.76’ %0.00' N30°'29'35"E 60.80’ 35.26°
c3 59°00°54” RO\  N2927'19"w 59.10° 33.96’ ’IHIRD
| c4 3 287°49’59” 600NN, N8258'57"W, 70.68 ALP INE “’ES T ADDIT ION
c5 71°44'11" 60.00'\\ (535'55'13"W 70.31’ 43.38’ Monica L. Chenault, Clerk Eric Green, Mayor
i ¢ C6 49\7’ 46°57°04" 60.0%[ \\\~ §23'25'25"EL,  47.80° 26.06’ “71\’
| \ C7 24.9% 57'08’51" 25.00'\ \| S18419'31"E 23.91° 13.62’ TO T-HE TO OF ALPM
\\ csl\ 108.68\ 16°36°20" L\ S18°33'04"W| 108.30’ 54.73
| \| \co|\| 46.93°N\ 619°38" . D NY2%44'37"E 46.91’ 23.49’ IDENT'ICAL WITH
“ AN\ o] \ 27.45°[\ 783% "20.00 L7 K66°09'59"E 25.34’ 16.38’
- NG 31.42° 00" | 2p 001 [ S450448°E|  28.08 20.00° CERTIFICATE OF RECORDATION LOTS 10, 1 1 ) A.ZVD 12 OF

?// Tnis )Ilo;tmwct:ﬁisfilid Cfigry record in the Office of the Clerk of Lincoln ALPHVE “fES T S ECOND ADDIT ION
Z WITHIN THE
SE1/4 SECTION 30

April Brunski, Clerk GLO LOT 5

SW1/4 SECTION 29
T37N R118W
, __LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING

)
O

7 60"

L L
| ) «\ W

ScaLE 1N\ /60"

PLOT DATE: 10 June 2025 J ‘ /,

/, a >

gy
= OR SCHERBEL., LTD.
A/‘gw SURIEVORS %

SD /Town offﬁane

—
Alp eWest:’:rd.oLa/




285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REPLACING 276 ORDINANCE NO. 2020-05 AND
PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2021
EDITION FOR THE TOWN OF ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.

276 Ordinance No. 2020-05 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION II.

Permit Required- Application.

It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, reconstruct, alter or change the use of any
building or other structure within the town limits without obtaining a building permit from the
Town of Alpine. The Town shall not issue any permit unless the plans of and for the proposed
erection, construction, reconstruction, alteration or use fully conforms to the zoning regulations,
subdivision regulations and building regulations then in effect. All applications for building
permits shall be accompanied by all documentations as required on the building permit
application. All building permit fees are to be determined by the town council by resolution or
ordinance and may be changed from time to time.

SECTION III.

International Building Code.

All buildings and temporary structures built or located within the Town from and after the
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed
in accordance with the requirements of the International Building Code (IBC) 2021 Edition as
published by the International Code Council, specifically excluding all appendices. The
International Building Code (OBC) 2018 Edition is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by
reference with the exception of the following amendments:

1. Section 101.4.8 Electrical shall read, “The provisions of the National Electrical Code
shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs,
replacement equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto”.

2. The last sentence of Section 101.4.3 Plumbing shall read, “The provisions of the
Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality shall apply to private sewage disposal
systems”.

3. Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance shall be deleted on its entirety.

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2021 EDITION
Page 1 of 5

17




© o N

Section 102.1 General shall have a second sentence added which shall read,
“Substitute the National Electrical Code for all reference to the ICC Electrical Code
throughout the IBC”.

Section 103.3 Deputies shall be amended by deleting the last sentence.

Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Delete #1 and #2. Item 11 shall read,
“Swings and other playground equipment”.

Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 105.5 Expiration shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 105.5 Expiration. The last sentence shall be revised to read, “The Town of
Alpine is authorized to grant in writing one extension of time for a period of not more
than one (1) year.

10.Section 107.1 General. Construction documents, special inspection and structural

observation programs, and other data shall be submitted in three sets with each
application for a permit. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered
design professional where required by the statues of the jurisdiction in which the project
is to be constructed. Where special conditions exist, the Planning and Zoning
Commission is authorized to require additional construction documents to be prepared
by a registered design professional.

11.Section 108.3 Temporary Power. The last sentence shall read, “The part covered by

the temporary certificate shall comply with the requirements specified for temporary
lighting, heat or power in the National Electrical Code”.

12.Section 109.6 Refunds shall read, “The governing authority is authorized to establish a

refund policy when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with
this code”.

13.Add Section 110.3.12 Re-inspection Fee. “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for

each inspection or re-inspection when such portion of the work for which inspection is
requested is not complete or when required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved plans are not readily available to
the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested
or for deviating from the plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine”.

14. A sixth sentence shall be added to the first paragraph of Section 1608.2 Ground Snow

Loads and shall read, “The roof snow load shall be 100 Ibs. per square foot”.

SECTION IV.

Stamp or Seal of Licensed Engineer Required.

All plans for structures submitted with a permit application as required under this Ordinance
shall be designed by a civil or structural engineer licensed in the State of Wyoming. Such
plans shall contain the stamp or seal of a civil or structural engineer licensed in the State of
Wyoming.

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2021 EDITION
Page 2 of 5

18




SECTION V.

Priority of Ordinances.
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified with any other sections of
the Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

SECTION V1.

Definitions.

The definitions as set forth in the International Building Code as said code is adopted in
Section Il of this Ordinance shall apply in interpretation of said code unless there is a
discrepancy between the definitions contained in said code and definitions found in Planning
and Zoning Ordinance Chapter Il of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and in that event the
definitions found in Planning and Zoning Ordinance Chapter Il of the Town of Alpine Municipal
Code shall take precedence.

SECTION VII.

Building Permit Issuance - Compliance Required.

The Town of Alpine shall not issue a building permit for any building or temporary structure to
be built within the town unless the plan submitted for such building or temporary structure
complies fully with the provisions of this chapter.

SECTION VIII.

Business License - Non-Issuance for Non-Compliance.

No business license shall be issued to any business located in any building or temporary
structure in which the building or temporary structure fails to comply with the provisions of this
chapter. No business license shall be issued to any business located in any building or
temporary structure which did not comply with the equivalent or applicable zoning or building
ordinance in effect at the time of the construction or placement of such building.

SECTION IX.

Appeal to Board of Adjustments.

An appeal from the provisions of the chapter shall be made to the Board of Adjustments on a
form to be furnished by the board which may be secured at the town office. Any
recommendations by the Board of Adjustments for departure from the provisions of this
chapter shall be subject to the approval of the Town Council.

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2021 EDITION
Page 3 of 5

19




SECTION X.

Severability.

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provision or application and to this
and the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION XI.

Ordinances Repealed.

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of these ordinances are
hereby repealed.

SECTION XII.

Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage provided; however, this
ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits.

PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 2NP READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 3RP READING THIS 17™ DAY OF MAY 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:
W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor

ATTEST:

BY:
Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk/Treasurer

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2021 EDITION
Page 4 of 5

20




ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK

STATE OF WYOMING )

)
COUNTY OF LINCOLN )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 was duly posted for ten (10)
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK/TREASURER

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2021 EDITION
Page 5 of 5

21




287 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-05

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 260 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-10 AND PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE
TOWN OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.

260 Ordinance No. 2018-10 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION II.

International Mechanical Code Adoption by Reference.

All buildings and structures constructed, located or placed within the town from and after the
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed
or built in accordance with the requirements of the 2021 Edition of the International Mechanical
Code, as promulgated by the International Code Council, and the said International
Mechanical Code 2021 Edition is adopted by reference the same as if it were more fully set
forth herein, except as follows:

1. Section 101.1 Title shall read, “These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical
Code of the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this code’.

2. Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be as adopted by
the Town of Alpine in the Mechanical/Fuel Gas fee schedule”.

3. A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.2.3 Approval Required and shall
read, “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection when
such portion of the work for which inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-inspection fees will be assessed when
the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector; for failure to provide
access on the date for which inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans
requiring the approval of the Building Official”.

4. Section 108.4 Violation penalties shall read, “Any person who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or
who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or
certificate of occupancy issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon
conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of
Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or revisions thereto.”

260 Ordinance No. 2018-10
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE — 2018 Edition
Page 1 of 3

22




5. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who
shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a
stop work, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111
Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments
or revisions thereto.”

6. A second sentence shall be added to Section 903.3 Unvented Decorative Room
Heaters and shall read, “Unvented gas logs shall; not be installed in habitable rooms
or spaces”.

SECTION IIl.

Priority of Ordinances.

In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

SECTION IV.

Severability.

If any provisions of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or application, and
to this and the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION V.

Ordinances Repealed.

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with provisions of this ordinance are hereby
repealed.

SECTION VI.

Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage, however, that this
Ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits.

PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

287 Ordinance No. 2022-05
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE — 2021 Edition
Page 2 of 3

23




PASSED 2NP READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 3RP READING THIS 17™ DAY OF MAY 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:

W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor
ATTEST:

BY:

Sharon L. Backus, Clerk/Treasurer

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK
STATE OF WYOMING )
)

COUNTY OF LINCOLN )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 287 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-05 was duly posted for ten

(10) days in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF

ORDINANCES VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK /TREASURER

287 Ordinance No. 2022-05
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE — 2021 Edition
Page 3 of 3

24




289 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-07

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 262 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-12 AND PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN
OF ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.

262 Ordinance No. 2018-12 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION Il.
International Plumbing Code- Adoption by reference.

All buildings and temporary structures built, located or placed within the town from and after
the established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance shall be properly
plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International Plumbing Code, 2021
Edition, as published by the International Code Council, specifically including “Appendix D”.
The said Code is incorporated herein by reference as if the same were more fully herein set
out except as follows:

1. Section 101.1 shall read. “These regulations shall be known as the International
Plumbing Code of the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this code”.

2. Section 101.6.2 Fee Schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be paid as required
in the adopted Town of Alpine plumbing fee schedule”.

3. Section 108.4 Violation penalties shall read, “ Any person who shall violate a provision
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall
erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction
documents, or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate of occupancy
issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon conviction, be punished as
provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any
amendments or revisions thereto”.

4. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No.
2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or revisions
thereto”.

289 Ordinance No. 2022-07
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE — 2021 Edition
Page 1 of 3

25




5. The last sentence of Section 305.4 Freezing shall read, “Exterior water supply system
piping shall be installed not less than 6 feet below grade”.

6. Section 305.4.1 Sewer depth shall read, “Building sewers shall be a minimum of 48
inches below grade or shall be protected from freezing in an approved manner by the
administrative authority”.

SECTION IIl.

Priority of Ordinances.

In the event any if the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any sections of the Town of
Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

SECTION IV.

Severability.

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions of application of
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provision or application, and to this
and the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION V.

Ordinances Repealed.

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are
hereby repealed.

SECTION V1.

Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage provided; however, that
this ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits.

PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022.

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 2\P READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022.

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

289 Ordinance No. 2022-07
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE — 2021 Edition
Page 2 of 3

26




PASSED 3RP READING THIS 17™ DAY OF MAY 2022.

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:

W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor
ATTEST:

BY:
Sharon L, Backus, Town Clerk/Treasurer

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK

STATE OF WYOMING )
COUNTY OF LINCOLN )
TOWN OF ALPINE )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 was duly posted for ten (10) days
in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK/TREASURER

289 Ordinance No. 2022-07
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE — 2021 Edition
Page 3 of 3

27




290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 263 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-13 AND PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN OF
ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.
263 Ordinance No. 2018-13 is hereby repealed in its entirety.
SECTION II.

There is hereby adopted by the Town Council of the Town of Alpine, for the purpose of prescribing
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous materials or
explosion, that certain Code and Standards known as the International Fire Code (“IFC”) 2021
Edition (“IFC”), including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G, published by the International Code
Council, hereby establishing an effect date upon approval and passage of this ordinance. The
International Fire Code is hereby incorporated by reference as if the same were more fully set out
herein.

SECTION III.

Priority of ordinances.

In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of the
adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the Town of
Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

SECTION IV.

Severability.

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is held
invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of this
Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this and
the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION V.

Ordinances Repealed.
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are hereby
repealed.

290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2021 Edition
Page 1 of 2

28




SECTION VI.

Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage.
PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 2" READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 3 READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:
W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor

ATTEST:

BY:
Sharon L. Backus, Clerk/Treasurer

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK
STATE OF WYOMING )

)
COUNTY OF LINCOLN )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08 was duly posted for ten (10) days
in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES VI,
TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK/TREASURER

290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2021 Edition
Page 2 of 2




286 ORDINANCE No. 2022-04

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 277 ORDINANCE NO. 2020-06 AND PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE
TOWN OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.

277 Ordinance No. 2020-06 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION II.

All detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses)
not more than three stories in height with separate means of egress built or located within the
town from and after the established effective date upon approval and passage of this
Ordinance shall be constructed in accordance with the requirements of the International
Residential Code, 2021 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, specifically
including Appendix F (Radon). The International Residential Code (IRC) 2021 Edition is
hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference, with the exception of the following
amendments:

1. Section R102.7 Existing structures. The first sentence shall read “The legal
occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, the
International Property Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code, or as is
deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the
occupants and the public”.

2. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit shall be amended by deleting numbers 1, 2
and 10.

3. Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application shall be deleted in its entirety.

4. Section 105.5 Expiration shall be deleted in its entirety.

5. Section 108.2 Schedule of permit fees shall be revised to read, “On buildings,
structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a
permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine
permit fee schedule.”

6. Section R113.4 Violation penalties shall be revised to read, “Any person who violates
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who
erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as provided in 111

286 Ordinance No. 2022-04
International Residential Code 2021
Page 1 of 4

30




Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or
revisions thereto.”

7. Section R114.2 Unlawful continuance shall read “Any person who shall continue any
work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition shall upon conviction be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01
of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions thereto.”

8. The first sentence in Section 301.1.3 Engineered design shall be revised to read, “All
residential structures shall be designed by a civil or structural engineer licensed in the
State of Wyoming”.

9. Table R302.13. Fire Protection of Floors Exceptions Sub-Section 2 shall be
revised to read “Floor assemblies located directly over a crawl space not intended for
storage or for the installation of electric-powered heating appliances.”

10.Table R302.6 Dwelling/Garage Separation, Under Material Heading shall be revised
to read all materials to be 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board.

11.Section R313 Automatic Sprinkler Systems shall be deleted in its entirety.

12.Sections 403.3 shall be replaced with the sentence reading, “Front protected shallow
foundations are prohibited”.

13.Section N1102.4 Air Leakage, shall be deleted in its entirety.

14.Section N1102.4.1.2 Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety.

15.Section N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) Duct Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety.

16.The first sentence of Section N1102.2.10 shall be changed to read, “Where the floor
above the crawl space is un-insulated, insulation shall be installed on the crawl space
walls and a Class | vapor retarder be installed according to this code”.

17.Section G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations. Delete Exceptions .3 and .4 in their
entirety.

18.Section G2445.2 (621.2) Prohibited Use shall read, “Unvented room heaters shall not
be installed in habitable rooms or spaces”.

19.A second sentence shall be added to section G2445.7 Unvented Decorative Room
Heaters and shall read, “Unvented decorative room heaters shall not be installed in
habitable rooms or spaces”.

20.Section P2603.5.1 Sewer depth shall be amended to read, “Building sewers shall be a
minimum of 48 inches below grade or shall be protected from freezing in an approved
manner by the administrative authority”.

21.AF104 Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety.

SECTION! L.

Priority of ordinances.

In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

286 Ordinance No. 2022-04
International Residential Code 2021
Page 2 of 4

31




SECTION V.

Severability.

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to
this and the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION V.

Ordinances Repealed.

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are
hereby repealed.

SECTION VI.

Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage, however, that this
ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits.

PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022.

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 2NP READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022.

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED ON 3RP READING THIS 17T DAY OF MAY 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

By:

W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor

Attest:

By:

Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk

286 Ordinance No. 2022-04
International Residential Code 2021
Page 3 of 4

32




ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLARK

STATE OF WYOMING )
COUNTY OF LINCOLN )
TOWN OF ALPINE )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 was duly posted for ten (10)
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF
ORDINANCES VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK

286 Ordinance No. 2022-04
International Residential Code 2021
Page 4 of 4

33




288 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-06

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 261 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-11 AND PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN
OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:

SECTION I.

261 Ordinance No. 2018-11 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION II.

International Fuel Gas Code - Adoption by reference.

All buildings and structures constructed, located or placed within the town from and after the
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed
or built in accordance with the requirements of the 2021 Edition of the International Fuel Code
(IFGC), as promulgated by the International Code Council, and the said International Fuel Gas
Code is adopted by reference the same if it were fully set forth herein, except as follows:

1. Section 101.1 Title shall read, “These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code
of the Town of Alpine, hereinafter referred to as ‘this code™.

2. Section 106.6.2 Fee Schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be indicated in the
adopted Town of Alpine Mechanical/Plumbing permit schedule”.

3. A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.3.3 Re-inspection and testing and
shall read, “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection
when such portion or the work for which inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-inspection fees may be assessed when
the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failure to provide
access on the date for which inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans
requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine”.

4. Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall read, “Any person who violates a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
install, alter or repair plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate of
occupancy issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon conviction, be punished
as provided in 111-Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any
amendments or revisions thereto.”

288 Ordinance No. 2022-06
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE - 2021 EDITION
Page 1 of 3

34




5. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who shall
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111-Ordinance No.
2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions
thereto”.

Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations Exception number 3 and 4 shall be deleted.
Unvented Decorative Room Heaters. “Unvented Decorative Room Heaters shall not
be installed in habitable spaces”.

N o

SECTION lII.
Priority of ordinances.
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

SECTION IV.
Severability.
If any provisions of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or application, and
to this and the provisions of this act are severable.

SECTION V.
Ordinances Repealed.
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with provisions of this ordinance are hereby
repealed.

SECTION VI.
Effective Date.
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage.

PASSED 15T READING THIS 15™ DAY OF MARCH 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

288 Ordinance No. 2022-06
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE - 2021 EDITION
Page 2 of 3

35




PASSED 2NP READING THIS 19™ DAY OF APRIL 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

PASSED 3RP READING THIS 17™H DAY OF MAY 2022

Vote: yes, no, abstain, absent.

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:

W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor

ATTEST:

BY:

Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK

STATE OF WYOMING )
COUNTY OF LINCOLN )
TOWN OF ALPINE )

| hereby certify that the forgoing 288 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-06 was duly posted for ten (10)
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.

| further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING.

ATTEST:

SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK/TREASURER

288 Ordinance No. 2022-06
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE - 2021 EDITION
Page 3 of 3

36




TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODES

Ordinance No. 2025-xxx

Table of Contents

PART 1 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES

1. General

[ oV =T oY o =P
1

1.1 Intent

1.4 Exemptions to Adopted Building Codes
2. International Building Code (IBC)

3.2 Implementation and
12T 0] ] (T 6

4. International Plumbing Code (IPC)

5.1 Applicability




TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODES

................................................................................. 13
6. International Fire Code (IFC)
.................................................................................... 17
6.1 Applicability

6.2 Implementation and exemptions
................................................................................. 17

7. International Fuel Gas Code
2T 0o O 17
7.1 Applicability

7.2 Implementation and
X MNP ONS . .t 18

8. Grace Period for Building Design Phase and
Applications..........ccocviiiiiiiiiiicreees 21

9. Violations, Penalties, and
3= 1.4 L= L= 21

9.1 Unlawful to Violate Ordinance

..................................................................................... 22
9.2 Continuing Violations and Penalties
............................................................................ 22

9.3 Town Enforce through Appropriate Civil Remedy
......................................................... 22

9.4 Actions for Penalties or Fines
....................................................................................... 22

38




TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING
ORDINANCE NO. 2025-xxx
AN ORDINANCE XXX ORDINANCE NO. AND PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION
OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE- INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES FOR THE
TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING

WHEREAS, the International Code Council (ICC) is a leading organization that develops model
codes and standards used in the design, construction, and compliance process of buildings and
structures; and

WHEREAS, the Town of Alpine, Wyoming, has reviewed and‘determined that it is in the best
interest of the public to adopt the most recent versions of the/lICC International Building Code

(IBC), International Residential Code (IRC), InternationahPltumbing Codex(IPC), International

Mechanical Code (IMC), International Fire Code, anddnternational Fuel and'Gas Code (IFGC)
currently adopted by the State of Wyoming.

WHEREAS, the adoption of the ICC International Cedes help@nsure safe, affordable, and
sustainable communities and buildings and structures.whichf@re constructed in the Town of
Alpine; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE
TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING:

Section 1. The following/Ordinances are repealed in their entirety

i) 285 Ordinance N0.2022-03
i) 286 Ordinanee No. 2022-04
iii) 287 Ordinance No. 2022-05
iv) 288 Ordinance No. 2022-06
v) 289 Ordinance No. 2022-07
Vi) 290 OrdinancexNo.2022-08

Section'2. ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING MOST RECENT INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL CODES IN USE BY THE STATE OF WYOMING

Section 4. EFFECTIVEDATE: This ordinance shall take effect upon final passage and
approval as required by‘law. This ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building
permits.

Section 5. PRIORITY OF ORDINANCES
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town, as codified in this code as of the date of

the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section, conflict with any other sections of the
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX — International Code Council

Page 1 of 3

39




Section 6. SEVERABILITY

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is held
invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of this
Ordinance which can be given effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this
and the provisions of this act are severable.

Section 7. ORDINANCES REPEALED

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provi of this ordinance are

hereby repealed.

Passed First Reading this day of 2025
VOTE: _ YES, _ NO, _ ABSTAIN, _ ABSENT

Passed Second Reading Day of 2025
VOTE: _ YES, _ NO, _ ABSTAIN, _A

Passed on Third a al Readi
VOTE: _YES, ABSTA

TOWN OF ALPINE

BY:

Eric Green

ATTEST:

BY:

Monica Chenault, Clerk

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX — International Code Council

Page 2 of 3

40




STATE OF WYOMING )

COUNTY OF LINCOLN )

I hereby certify that the forgoing ORDINANCE NO. 2025-xxx was duly posted for ten (10)
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.

ATTEST:

Monica Chenault, Clerk

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX — International Code Council

Page 3 of 3

41




TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODE

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES

1. GENERAL PROVISIONS

1.1INTENT: The International Code Council (ICC) is a leading
organization that develops model codes and standards used in the
design, construction, and compliance process of buildings and
structures. The Town of Alpine, Wyoming, has reviewed and
determined that it is in the best interest of the public to adopt the most
recent versions of the ICC International Building Code (IBC),
International Residential Code (IRC), International Plumbing Code
(IPC), International Mechanical Cod e (IMC), International Fire Code
(IFC), and International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), as currently ad opted
by the State of Wyoming.

1.2SCOPE: These codes, along with the Town of Alpine’s Land Use
Development Code (LUDC), help ensure that buildings and structures
constructed in the Town of Alpine are safe, affordable, and sustainable.

1.3POTENTIAL CONFLICTS IN DEFINITIONS: The definitions contained
in the International Building Code shall apply in the interpretation of the
International Building Code unless there is a discrepancy between the
definitions contained in the International Building Code and the
definitions contained in the Alpine Land Use and Development Code.
In this case, the definitions contained in the Alpine Land Use and
Development Code shall take precedence.

1.4 EXEMPTIONS TO ADOPTED BUILDING CODES: The following
codes will be adopted by reference, except for the amendments listed
in each Code.

2 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)

2.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located
or placed within the town from and after the established effective date,
upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be properly built in
accordance with the requirements of the International Building Code
(IBC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published
by the International Code Council. The said Code is incorporated
herein by reference as if the same were more fully here in set out here,
except as follows:

2.2IMPLEMENTATION: The International Building Code is hereby
adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following
amendments:

2.2.1 Section 101.1: Title. Shall read these regulations shall
be known as the Building Code of the Town of Alpine,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”




2.2.2

223

224

2.2.5

2.2.6

2.2.7

228

2.2.9

The last sentence of Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Shall
read, “The provisions of the Wyoming Department of
Environmental Quality shall apply to private sewage
disposal systems.”

Section 101.4.4: Property Maintenance. shall be
deleted in its entirety.

Add Section 101.4.8: Electrical. Shall read, “The
provisions of the National Electrical Code shall apply
to the installation of electrical systems, including
alterations, repairs, replacement equipment,
appliances, fixtures, fittings, and appurtenances
thereto”.

Section 102.1: General shall have a second sentence
added which shall read, “Substitute the National
Electrical Code for all references to the ICC Electrical
Code throughout the IBC”.

Section 103.1: Creation of enforcement agency. Shall
read “The Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning
Department and the official in charge thereof shall be
known as the Planning and Zoning Administrator. The
function of the agency shall be the implementation,
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of
this code.”

Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall be-amended-by
deleting-the-lastsentence- read “In accordance with

the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and with
the concurrence of the appointing authority, the chief
appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have the
authority to ap point a building official, other related
technical officers, inspectors, and other employees.
Such employees shall have powers delegated by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read
“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive
applications. The Building Official shall review
construction documents. The Planning and Zoning

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
2

43




Commission shall review site plans. The Design
Review Committee shall review construction
documents and design for compliance with the current
adopted Design Review Standards . The Town Clerk
shall issue permits upon approval when presented
with a complete application b y the Planning and
Zoning Administrator, approval of construction
documents by the Building Official, approval of the
site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission,
and approval of the building design by the Design
Review Committee if applicable.

2.2.10 Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator
shall replace building official.

2.2.11 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace building official.

2.2.12 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace building official.

2.2.13 Section 105.1: Required. The Town of Alpine shall
replace building official.

2.2.14 Section 105.2: Work exempt from permit. Delete #1
and #2. Item #11 shall read, “Swings and other
playground equipment”.

2.2.15 Section 105.2.1: Emergency repairs. The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building
official.

2.2.16 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Department of
Building Safety shall be replaced with the Town of
Alpine.

2.2.17 Section 105.3: Application for permit. 7. Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official.

2.2.18 Section 105.3.1: Action on application. Shall in the
first sentence, the Planning and Zoning Administrator
replace Building Official. The last sentence shall read
If the Building Official is satisfied that the proposed
work conforms to the requirements of this code and
laws and ordinances applicable thereto, the Town
Clerk shall issue a permit therefor as soon as
practicable.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
3

44




2.2.19 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application. Shall
be deleted in its entirety.

2.2.20 Section 105.5: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its
entirety.

2.2.21 Section 105.5: Expiration. The last sentence shall be
revised to read, “FheFfewn-ofAlpine The governing
authority is authorized to grant in writing one
extension of time for a period of not more than one (1)
year.

2.2.22 Section 107.1: General. Construction documents,
special inspection and structural observation
programs, and other data shall be submitted in three
two paper sets and one digital set with each
application for a permit. The construction documents
shall be prepared by a registered design professional
where required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in
which the project is to be constructed. Where special
conditions exist, the Planning and Zoning
Commission is authorized to require additional
construction documents to be prepared by a
registered design professional.

2.2.23 Section 108.3: Temporary Pewer. Service utilities. The
last sentence shall read, “The part covered by the
temporary certificate shall comply with the
requirements specified for temporary lighting, heat, or
power in the National Electrical Code.”

2.2.24 Section R109.2: Schedule of permit fees shall be
revised to read, “On buildings, structures, electrical,
gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid
as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine permit fee
schedule.”

2.2.25 Section 109.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence:
The governing authority shall replace the building
official.

2.2.26 Section 109.4: Work commencing before permit
issuance. The governing authority shall replace the
building official.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
4

45




2.2.27 Section 109.6: Refunds shall read, “The governing
authority is authorized to establish a refund policy
when no work has been done under a permit issued
in accordance with this code”.

2.2.28 Add Section 110.3.12.1: Re-inspection Fee. “Are-
inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or
re-inspection when such portion of the work for which
inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved
plans are not readily available to the inspector, for
failure to provide access on the date for which
inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans
requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.”

2.2.29 Section 115 .4: Failure to comply shall read “Any
person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition
shall upon conviction be punished as provided in 111
Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine
Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions
thereto.”

2.2.30 Section 116.3: Notice. “Or Planning and Zoning
Administrator” shall be added after the building
official.

2.2.31 Section 1608.2: Ground Snow Loads. A sixth
sentence shall be added to the first paragraph and
shall read, “The ground snow load shall be one
hundred forty-three (143) pounds per square foot, and
the roof snow load shall be one hundred (100) tbs-
pounds per square foot.”

3. INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC)

3.1 APPLICABILITY: All detached one- and two-family dwellings and
multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three
stories in height with separate means of egress built or located within
the town from and after the established effective date upon approval
and passage o f this Ordinance shall be constructed in accordance
with the requirements of International Residential Code (IRC), Edition

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
5




currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published by the Inter
national Code Council, specifically including Appendix BE (Radon
Control Methods).

3.2IMPLEMENTATION: The International Residential Code is hereby
adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following

amendments:
3.2.1

3.2.2

3.2.3

3.2.4

3.2.5

Section R101.1: Title. Shall read these provisions
shall be known as the Residential Code for One-and
Two-family Dwellings of the Town of Alpine,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section R103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The
Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and
the official in charge thereof shall be known as the
Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of
the agency shall be the implementation,
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of
this code.”

Section R103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The
Planning and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed
by the chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”
Section R103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance
with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and
with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have
the authority to appoint a building official, other related
technical officers, inspectors, and other employees.
Such employees shall have powers delegated by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section R104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read
“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive
applications. The Building Official shall review
construction documents. The Planning and Zoning
Commission shall review site plans. The Design
Review Committee shall review construction
documents and design for compliance with the current
adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk
shall issue permits upon approval when presented
with a complete application by the Planning and
Zoning Administrator, approval of construction

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
6

47




documents by the Building Official, approval of the
site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission,
and approval of the building design by the Design
Review Committee if applicable.

3.2.6 Section R104.7: Official records. The Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official.

3.2.7 Section R104.7.1: Approvals. The Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official.

3.2.8 Section R104.7.5: Fees. The Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace the building official.

3.2.9 Section R105.1: Required. The Town of Alpine shall
replace the building official.

3.2.10 Section R105.2: Work exempt from permit shall be
amended by deleting numbers #1, #2, and #10.

3.2.11 Section R105.2.1: Emergency repairs. The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building
official.

3.2.12 Section R105.3: Application for permit. Department of
Building Safety shall be replaced with the Town of
Alpine.

3.2.13 Section R105.3: Application for permit. 7. Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building
official.

3.2.14 Section R105.3.2: The Time limitation of application.
Shall be deleted in its entirety.

3.2.15 Section R105.5: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its
entirety.

3.2.16 Section R106.1.: Submittal documents. Shall read
“Construction documents, special inspection and
structural observation programs, and other data shall
be submitted in two paper sets and one digital set
with each application for a permit. The construction
documents shall be prepared by a registered design
professional where required by the statutes of the
jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed.
Where special conditions exist, the Planning and
Zoning Commission is authorized to require additional
construction documents to be prepared by a
registered design professional.”

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
7

48




3.2.17 Section 107.3: Temporary Power. The last sentence
shall read, “The part covered by the temporary
certificate shall comply with the requirements
specified for temporary lighting, heat, or power in the
National Electrical Code.”

3.2.18 Section R108.2: Schedule of permit fees shall be
revised to read, “On buildings, structures, electrical,
gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid
as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine permit fee
schedule.”

3.2.19 Section R108.5: Refunds. Shall read, “The governing
authority is authorized to establish a refund policy
when no work has been done under a permit issued
in accordance with this code”.

3.2.20 Section R108.6: Work commencing before permit
issuance. The governing authority shall replace the
Building Official.

3.2.21 Add Section R109.3.1: Re-inspection Fee. “Are-
inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or
re-inspection when such portion of the work for which
inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved
plans are not readily available to the inspector, for
failure to provide access on the date for which
inspection is requested, or for deviating from the
plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.”

3.2.22 Section 113.2: Notice of violation. “or the Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall be added after the
building official.”

3.2.23 Section R113.4: Violation penalties shall be revised to
read, “Any person who violates a provision of this
code or fails to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the
provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
8

49




as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the
Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or
revisions thereto.”

3.2.24 Section R114.2:4: Unlawful-continuanee Failure to
comply. Shall read “Any person who shall continue
any work in or about the structure after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition shall upon conviction be
punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01
of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any
amendments or revisions there.

3.2.25 The first sentence in Section R301.1.3: Engineered
design shall be revised to read, “All residential
structures shall be designed by a civil or structural
engineer licensed in the State of Wyoming”.

3.2.26 Section R301.2.3: Snow Loads. A fourth sentence
shall be added to the first paragraph and shall read,
“The ground snow load shall be one hundred forty-
three (143) pounds per square foot and the roof snow
load shall be one hundred (100) pounds per square
foot.”

3.2.27 Table R302.13: Fire Protection of Floors Exceptions
Sub-Section 2 shall be revised to read “Floor
assemblies located directly over a crawl space not
intended for storage or for the installation of electric-
powered heating appliances.”

3.2.28 Table R302.6; Dwelling/Garage Separation. Under
Material Heading, shall be revised to read “all
materials to be 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board.”

3.2.29 Section R313: Automatic Sprinkler Systems shall be
deleted in its entirety.

3.2.30 Section R403.3: Frost protection. Shall be replaced
with the sentence reading, “Front-protected shallow
foundations are prohibited”.

3.2.31 Section N1102.2.11: Crawl Space Wall. The first
sentence shall be changed to read, “Where the floor
above the crawl space is uninsulated, insulation shall
be installed on the crawl space walls and a Class |

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
9

50




vapor retarder shall be installed according to this
code”.

3.2.32 Section N1102.4-5: Air Leakage. Shall be deleted in
its entirety.

3.2.33 Section N1102.4-5.1.2: Air Leakage Testing. Shall be
deleted in its entirety.

3.2.34 Section N1103.3.5-7 : Duct System Testing. Shall be
deleted in its entirety.

3.2.35 Section G2406.2: Prohibited Locations. Delete
Exceptions #3 and #4 in their entirety.

3.2.36 Section G2445.2: Prohibited Use. Shall read,
“‘Unvented room heaters shall not be installed in
habitable rooms or spaces.”

3.2.37 A second sentence shall be added to section
G2445.7: Unvented Decorative Room Heaters and
shall read, “Unvented decorative room heaters shall
not be installed in habitable rooms or spaces”.

3.2.38 Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth shall be amended to
read, “Building sewers shall be a minimum of 48
inches below grade or shall be protected from
freezing in an approved manner by the administrative
authority”.

3.2.39 AF104-BE104.1: Testing. Shall be deleted in its
entirety.

4. INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (IPC)

4.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located
or placed within the town from and after the established effective date,
upon approval and passage of this Ordinance s hall be properly
plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International
Plumbing Code (IPC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming,
as published by the International Cod e Council, specifically including
“‘Appendix D”. The said Code is incorporated herein by reference as if
the same were more fully herein set out except as follows:

4.2IMPLEMENTATION: The International Plumbing Code is hereby
adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following
amendments:

4.2.1 Section 101.1 Title. Shall read. “These regulations
shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
10

51




422

423

424

4.2.5

4.2.6

the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this
code”™.

Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official
shall replace code official throughout this code unless
otherwise specified below.

Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The
Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and
the official in charge thereof shall be known as the
Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of
the agency shall be the implementation,
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of
this code unless otherwise specified in the
amendments below.”

Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance
with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and
with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have
the authority to appoint a building official, other related
technical officers, inspectors, and other employees.
Such employees shall have powers delegated by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read
“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive
applications. The Building Official shall review
construction documents. The Planning and Zoning
Commission shall review site plans. The Design
Review Committee shall review construction
documents and design for compliance with the current
adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk
shall issue permits upon approval when presented
with a complete application by the planning and
zoning administrator, approval of construction
documents by the Building Official, approval of the
site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission,
and approval of the building design by the Design
Review Committee if applicable.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
11

52




4.2.7 Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator
shall replace code official.

4.2.8 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

4.2.9 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

4.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine
shall replace code official.

4.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall replace code official.

4.2.12 Section 105.5.3: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its
entirety.

4.2.13 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first
sentence shall read, “Construction documents,
engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data
shall be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital
set, with each permit application.”

4.2.14 Add Section 111.2.1: Re-inspection Fee. “Are-
inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or
re-inspection when such portion of the work for which
inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved
plans are not readily available to the inspector, for
failure to provide access on the date for which
inspection is requested, or for deviating from the
plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.”

4.2.15 Section 114.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building
Official.

4.2.16 Section 408-4 114.4 Violation Penalties. Shall read, “
Any person who shall violate a provision of this code
or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
plumbing work in violation of the approved
construction documents, or directive of the code
official, or a permit or certificate of occupancy issued
under the provisions of this code, shall, upon
conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
12

53




No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code
and any amendments or revisions thereto”.

4.2.17 Fhelastsentence-of Section 408.5 115.4 Failure to
Comply. The last sentence Stop-werk-orders- shall
read, “Any person who shall continue any work in or
about the structure after having been served with a
stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as
provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of
Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or
revisions thereto”.

4.2.18 The last sentence of Section 305.4 Freezing. Shall
read, “Exterior water supply system piping shall be
installed not less than 6 feet below grade”.

4.2.19 Section 305.4.1 Sewer depth. Shall read, “Building
sewers shall be a minimum of 48 inches below grade
or shall be protected from freezing in an approved
manner by the administrative authority”.

5. INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (IMC)
5.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located
or placed within the town from and after the established effective date,
upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be properly plumbed
in accordance with the requirements of the International Mechanical C ode
(IMC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published by
the International Code Council. The said Code is incorporated herein by
reference as if the same were more fully set out herein, except as follows:
5.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Mechanical Code is hereby
adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following
amendments:

5.2.1 Section 101.1 Title. Shall read, “These regulations shall
be known as the Mechanical Code of the Town of Alpine,
herein after referred to as ‘this code™.

5.2.2 Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official
shall replace code official throughout this code.

5.2.3 Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The Town
of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and the
official in charge thereof shall be known as the Planning
and Zoning Administrator. The function of the agency

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
13

54




524

5.2.5

5.2.6

5.2.7

5.2.8

5.2.9

shall be the implementation, administration, and
enforcement of the provisions of this code unless
otherwise specified in the amendments below.”

Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the chief
appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance with
the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and with the
concurrence of the appointing authority, the chief
appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have the
authority to appoint a building official, other related
technical officers, inspectors, and other employees.
Such employees shall have powers delegated by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read “The
Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive
applications. The Building Official shall review
construction documents. The Planning and Zoning
Commission shall review site plans. The Design Review
Committee shall review construction documents and
design for compliance with the current adopted Design
Review Standards. The Town Clerk shall issue permits
upon approval when presented with a complete
application by the planning and zoning administrator,
approval of construction documents by the Building
Official, approval of the site plan by the Planning and
Zoning Commission, and approval of the building design
by the Design Review Committee if applicable.

Section 104.7: Official records. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

5.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine shall

replace code official.

5.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and

Zoning Administrator shall replace code official.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
14

55




5.2.12 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application. Shall be
deleted in its entirety.

5.2.13 Section 105.4.3: Expiration shall be deleted in its
entirety.

5.2.14 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first
sentence shall read, “Construction documents,
engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data shall
be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital set, with
each permit application.”

5.2.15 Section 108.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence: The
governing authority shall replace the Building Official.

5.2.16 Section 108.4: Work commencing before permit
issuance. The governing authority shall replace code
official.

5.2.17 Section 108.6: Refunds. Shall read, “The governing
authority is authorized to establish a refund policy when
no work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code”.

5.2.18 Add Section 111.2.2: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-inspection
fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection
when such portion of the work for which inspection is
requested is not complete or when required corrections
have not been made. Re-inspection fees may be
assessed when the approved plans are not readily
available to the inspector, for failure to provide access on
the date for which inspection is requested, or for
deviating from the plans requiring the approval of the
Town of Alpine.”

5.2.19 Section 114.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building
Official.

5.2.20 Section 114.4: Violation penalties. Shall read “Persons
who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall
erect, install, alter or repair mechanical work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of
the Building Official, or permit or certificate issued under
the provisions of this co de, shall be subject to penalties
as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
15

56




Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions
thereto.”

5.2.21 Section 115.4: Failure to comply shall read “Any person
who shall continue any work after having been served
with a stop work order, except such work as that person
is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition shall upon conviction be punished as provided
in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine
Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions
thereto.”

5.2.22 Athird-sentence-shallbe-added-to-Section 10723

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
16

57




5.2.25 A second sentence shall be added to Section 903.3
Unvented Decerative-Room gas log heaters. Shall read,
“‘Unvented gas logs shall not be installed in habitable
rooms or spaces.”

. INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE (IFC)

6.1 APPLICABILITY: There is hereby adopted by the Town Council of the
Town of Alpine, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous
materials or explosion, that certain Code and Standards known as the
International Fire Code (IFC). Edition currently in use by the state of
Wyoming), including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G, published by the
International Code Council, hereby establishing an effective date upon
approval and passage of this ordinance. The International Fire Code is
hereby incorporated by reference as if the same were more fully set
out herein.

6.2IMPLEMENTATION: The International Fire Code is hereby adopted
and incorporated herein by reference.

. INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (IFGC)

7.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located
or placed within the town from and after the established effective date,
upon approval and passage of this Ordinance s hall be properly
plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International Fuel
Gas Code (IFGC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as
published by the International Co de Council. The said Code is
incorporated herein by reference as if the same were more fully he rein
set out except as follows:

7.2IMPLEMENTATION: The International Fuel Gas Code is hereby
adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following
amendments:

7.2.1 Section 101.1: Title. shall read, “These regulations
shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the Town of
Alpine, hereinafter referred to as ‘this code”.

7.2.2 Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official
shall replace code official throughout this code unless
otherwise specified below.

7.2.3 Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The
Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
17




7.2.4

7.2.5

7.2.6

7.2.7

7.2.8

7.2.9

the official in charge thereof shall be known as the
Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of
the agency shall be the implementation,
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of
this code unless otherwise specified in the
amendments below.”

Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning
and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance
with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and
with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have
the authority to appoint a building official, other related
technical officers, inspectors, and other employees.
Such employees shall have powers delegated by the
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”

Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read
“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive
applications. The Building Official shall review
construction documents. The Planning and Zoning
Commission shall review site plans. The Design
Review Committee shall review construction
documents and design for compliance with the current
adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk
shall issue permits upon approval when presented
with a complete application by the planning and
zoning administrator, approval of construction
documents by the Building Official, approval of the
site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission,
and approval of the building design by the Design
Review Committee if applicable.

Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator
shall replace code official.

Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning
Administrator shall replace code official.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
18

59




7.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine
shall replace code official.

7.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall replace code official.

7.2.12 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application shall be
deleted in its entirety.

7.2.13 Section 105.4.3: Expiration shall be deleted in its
entirety.

7.2.14 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first
sentence shall read, “Construction documents,
engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data
shall be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital
set, with each permit application.”

i 4 | of the T £ Aline”

7.2.16 Section 108.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence:
The governing authority shall replace Building Official.

7.2.17 Section 108.4: Work commencing before permit
issuance. The governing authority shall replace code
official.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
19

60




7.2.19 Section 108.6: Refunds shall read, “The governing
authority is authorized to establish a refund policy
when no work has been done under a permit issued
in accordance with this code”.

7.2.20 Add Section 111.3.3.1: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-
inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or
re-inspection when such portion of the work for which
inspection is requested is not complete or when
required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved
plans are not readily available to the inspector, for
failure to provide access on the date for which
inspection is requested, or for deviating from the
plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.”

7.2.21 Section 113.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and
Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building
Official.

7.2.22 Section 4084 113.4 Violation Penalties. Shall read,
“Any person who violates a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the
code official, or of a permit or certificate of occupancy
issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon
conviction, be punished as provided in 111-Ordinance
No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or
any amendments or revisions thereto.”

7.2.23 Section 114.4: Failure to comply. Shall read “Any
person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition shall upon conviction be
punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01
of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any
amendments or revisions thereto.”

7.2.24 Section 303.3: Prohibited Locations. Exception
numbers 3 and 4 shall be deleted.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
20




7.2.25 Section 303.3.1: Fireplaces and decorative
appliances in Group I-2 occupancies. A third sentence
will be added and read Unvented Decorative Room
Heaters. “Unvented Decorative Room Heaters shall
not be installed in habitable spaces”.

8. GRACE PERIOD FOR BUILDING DESIGN PHASE AND APPLICATIONS:
Projects that are in the building design phase and have submitted relevant
applications before the effective date of this ordinance shall be granted a grace
period of six (6) months from the effective date of the newly implemented codes
to obtain a building permit. During this grace period, such projects may proceed
under the standards, regulations, and requirements that were in effect at the time
of application submission and will not be subject to the new provisions introduced
by this ordinance. If a building permit is not obtained within the six-month grace
period, the application shall be deemed void, and any associated application fees
will be forfeited. A new application must then be submitted in compliance with the
currently adopted ICC codes in effect at that time.

9. VIOLATIONS, PENALTIES, AND REMEDIES

9.1 Unlawful to Violate Ordinance: It will be unlawful for any person, private
firm or corporation, or public agency to construct, alter, expand,
renovate, or demolish any building or structure in violation of the Alpine
Land Use and Development Code.

9.2 Continuing Violations and Penalties: Any person, group, firm, or
corporation whether as principle, agent, employee, or otherwise,
violating, causing, or permitting the violation of the provisions of this
ordinance will be guilty of a misdemeanor, subject to a Seven Hundred
and Fifty ($750) dollar fine, such person, group, firm, or corporation will
be deemed to be guilty of a separate offense for each and every d ay
during which any violation of this ordinance is committed, continues or
results from the act ion or inaction of such person, group, firm, or
corporation.

9.3 Town Enforce through Appropriate Civil Remedy: The Town may also
enforce this ordinance through any appropriate civil remedy.

9.4 Actions for Penalties or Fines:

9.4.1 To be brought in Corporate Name. All actions brought
to recover any penalty or fine will be brought in the
corporate name of the municipality.

9.4.2 Disposition of Recoveries. The recoveries, when
collected, will be paid into the treasury of the
municipality.

Town of Alpine- Building Code

Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
21

62




9.5 Applicability of “Wyoming Administrative Procedure Act”: In all
proceedings before an agency or board pursuant to the rules set forth
in this article, the "Wyoming Administrative Procedure Act" will apply. If
a conflict arises between such act and the rules set forth in this article,
the act will supersede these rules.

9.6 Ordinance Enforceable in Addition to Other Remedies: The Alpine
International Code Council Codes will be enforceable in addition to the
other remedies provided by law, by injunction, mandamus, or
proceedings in abatement.

Town of Alpine- Building Code
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx
22

63




	Top
	Section 3, Itema.	PANTONE, ANNA Lot #40 of Forest Meadow. 504 Three Rivers Dr. (G-0725-0001)- New detached garage/accessory building
	Elevations 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot #40 Forest Meadows Garage-Pantone
	Application 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot # 40 Forest Meadows- garage-Pantone
	Plans 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot #40 Forest MeadowsGargage-Pantone

	Section 3, Itemc.	BENNETT, BRETT, AND META Lot #27 Greys River Village, 368 Wooden Spur Dr. (REM-0625-0001)- Remodel and addition to existing home and addition of an accessory building. Modification to accessory building size.
	2025-08-11_368 WD SPR_MINOR REV

	Section , Item	ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION- Proposed  Lot #15 of the Alpine West Third Edition- Review site plan for compliance and suggestions.
	2025-08-11_AEF - SP101 SITE STUDY
	2025-0721 AlpineWest3rd TOPO

	Section , Item	Updating to the 2024 International Code Council Codes.
	285 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2022-03
	287 Ordinance 2022-05 Mechanical Code  2021 Edition
	289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 PLUMBING CODE 2021
	290 Ord No. 2022 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2021
	286 ORDINANCE No. 2022-04 International Residential Code 2021
	288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 International Fuel & Gas Code 2021 Edition
	Town of Alpine- Building Code Table of Contents
	COMBINED ICC- Building Code ORDINANCE
	Town of Alpine- Building Code

	Bottom

