
 

PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION 

August 12, 2025, at 7:00 PM 

 250 River Circle - Alpine, WY 83128  

AGENDA 

1. CALL TO ORDER: 

2. ROLL CALL & ESTABLISH QUORUM: 

3. TONIGHT'S APPOINTMENTS/ NEW BUSINESS: 

a. PANTONE, ANNA Lot #40 of Forest Meadow. 504 Three Rivers Dr. (G-0725-0001)- New 
detached garage/accessory building 

b. NORTH LINCOLN COUNTY HOSPITAL, DBA STAR VALLEY HEALTH- 37 WINTERGREEN 
DRIVE, LOT #189 OF ALPINE MEADOWS-Installation of a Helipad 

c. BENNETT, BRETT, AND META Lot #27 Greys River Village, 368 Wooden Spur Dr. (REM-
0625-0001)- Remodel and addition to existing home and addition of an accessory building 

4. TABLED ITEMS:  

5. UNFINISHED/ONGOING BUSINESS: 

6. PLANNING/ZONING CORRESPONDENCE: 

PLANNING AND ZONING DISCUSSION ITEMS: 

a. ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION- Proposed  Lot #15 of the Alpine West Third Edition- 
Review site plan for compliance and suggestions. 
 

b. Updating to the 2024 International Code Council Codes. 

7. APPROVAL OF MINUTES:  

a. Approval of July 8, 2025, meeting minutes 

8. TOWN COUNCIL ASSIGNMENT:  

9. ADJOURN MEETING: 

1

appISfb53d9a30a39421cae5fb7c5f5e68697


2

Section 3, Itema.



3

Section 3, Itema.



4

Section 3, Itema.



5

Section 3, Itema.



6

Section 3, Itema.



7

Section 3, Itema.



8

Section 3, Itema.



9

Section 3, Itema.



10

Section 3, Itema.



11

Section 3, Itema.



12

Section 3, Itema.



13

Section 3, Itema.



PROPOSED ADDITION: A 

PROPOSED 
RESIDENTIAL 

GARAGE

COVERED WALKWAY

5'-3"

PROPOSED BALCONY
MAX PROJECTION 3 FEET 
OVER SETBACK

15' SIDE SETBACK 

15
' S

ID
E 

SE
TB

AC
K 

SHED SETBACK 

GREYS RIVER VILLAGE SECOND ADDITION
0.32 +/- ACRES
CORNER LOT:

(2) FRONT SETBACKS 
(2) SIDE SETBACKS

25
' F

RO
NT

 S
ET

BA
CK

 

25' FRONT SETBACK 

LINE OF 
FOUNDATION WALL

LINE OF ROOF EAVE
1,

86
0 

EX
IS

TI
NG

 

ST
RU

CT
UR

E 
FO

O
TP

RI
NT

 

62
'

30'-0"

1'-6"

26'-0"

1'-6"

COVERED 
OUTDOOR AREA

NON-CONTIGUOUS 
FOUNDATION
BETWEEN STRUCTURES

M
AX3'
-0

"

WOODEN SPUR DR

SA
W

M
IL

L 
 R

D

LOT 28

LOT 26

LOT 27

EXISTING SHED

EXISTING TREES
TYP WHERE 
SHOWN

EXISTING WATER METER

EXISTING ELECTRICAL 
TRANSFORMER/JUNCTION

EXISTING 
COMMUNICATIONS 

PEDESTAL

CL

C L

EXISTING 
CLEANOUT 

AND 
SANITARY 

SEWER

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

2"
 / 

1'
-0

"

RIDGE

RI
DG

E

RI
DG

E

1"
 / 

1'
-0

"

15
'-0

"

2'

2'

2'

2'

3'
-0

"

28
'-0

"

11
'-0

"
15'-0"

CL

25
° 3

7' 
00

"
15

2.
54

'

N

E

64° 05' 53"93.69'

S

E

23
° 5

7'
 0

0"
12

4.
86

'

S

W

69° 16' 06"79.32'

N

W

R=
L= 27.48'20.00'

BURIED WATER LINE

BURIED 
COMMUNICATIONS 
LINE

BURIED ELECTRICAL 
LINE

EXISTING ELECTRICAL 
METER & CT CABINET

3' MAX PROJECTION 

3'
-0

"

25'-0"

SH
ED

 S
ET

BA
CK

 

3' 
M

AX
 P

RO
JE

CT
IO

N 

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

6" / 1'-0"

10'-0"  MIN

24"⌀ NDS DRY 
WELL SYSTEM

EXISTING EDGE OF ASPHALT

24"⌀ NDS DRY WELL SYSTEM

EX
IS

TI
NG

 E
DG

E 
O

F 
AS

PH
AL

T

PROPOSED CONCRETE 
OR ASPHALT DRIVE

EXISTING

19'-5"

EX
IS

TI
NG

26
'-2

"

EX
IS

TI
NG

57
'-2

"

PR
O

PO
SE

D

47
'-2

"

PROPOSED

25'-4"

PROPOSED

51'-6"

HEAT TRACE THRU 
DOWSPOUT TO BELOW 
FROST LINE 

HEAT TRACE THRU DOWSPOUT 
TO BELOW FROST LINE 

SITE AREA: 0.32 ACRES X 43,560 = 13,939.2 SQUARE FEET
MIN LANDSCAPED AREA REQUIRED: 1,393 SQUARE FEET
LANDSCAPED AREA PROVIDED: 9,404 SQAURE FEET

PARKING: (4) SPACES PROVIDED 
((2) INSIDE GARAGE AND (2) IN DRIVEWAY)

DRIVEWAY AREA: 1,042 SQUARE FEET
SNOW STORGAE REQURIED: 1,042 X 0.20 = 208.4 SQUARE FEET
SNOW STORAGE PROVIDED: 358 + 113 = 471 SQUARE FEET

18'-0"

113 SQFT SNOW 
STORAGE 

25
'-4

 1
1/

16
"

29
'-9

"

LINE OF 
FOUNDATION WALL

358 SQFT SNOW STORAGE 

SITE AREA CALCULATIONS

1'

1

REVISIONS

051015202530

051015202530

A

F

K

P

U

A

F

K

P

U

8/11/2025 12:22:36 PM

COVER SHEET &
SITE PLAN

G101

W
O

O
D

EN
 S

PU
R

 R
EN

O
VA

TI
O

N
36

8 
W

O
O

D
EN

 S
PU

R
 D

R

6.9.2025

CHECKED BY | BENNETT

©  2025 | ALL  RIGHTS  RESERVED

AL
PI

N
E,

 W
Y 

83
12

8

DRAWN BY | BENNETT

PERMIT DRAWINGS

  |  AAS # WOODEN SPUR  |

 1/8" = 1'-0"G101

1 SITE PLAN

1680

SCALE IN FEET
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0"

NORTH REF

1 7.24.2025 GARAGE DIMs

ARCHITECTURAL
A101 FIRST FLOOR PLAN
A102 SECOND FLOOR PLAN
A103 ROOF PLAN
A201 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS
A202 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS
A301 BUILDING SECTIONS
A302 BUILDING SECTIONS & SCHEDULES
A303 PERSPECTIVE
A601 DOOR & WINDOW INSTALLATION

STRUCTURAL ENGINEER
TSE ENGINEERS
136 S. STATE ST.
SHELLY, ID 83274
office@tetoneng.com

CODES UTILIZED
IRC 2021
TOWN OF ALPINE LAND USE DEVELOPMENT CODE

OCCUPANCY
R101.2: ONE FAMILY DWELLING & ACCESSORY STRUCTURE

FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM
EXISTING: NO
PROPOSED: NO

PROJECT DESCRIPTION
RESIDENTIAL GARAGE AND RENOVATION OF EXISTING SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING

FLOOR AREAS IN GROSS SQUARE FEET
ONE FAMILY DWELLING GROSS FLOOR AREAS: 
EXISTING 1ST FLOOR DWELLING AREA: 1,216 SQFT
EXISTING ATTACHED GARAGE AREA: 528 SQFT
EXISTING 2ND FLOOR AREA: 295 SQFT
EXISTING 1ST COVERED PORCH: 132 SQFT

PROPOSED 1ST FLOOR ADDITION: 180 SQFT
COVERED PORCH TO LIVING ROOM: 132 SQFT
EXISTING GARAGE TO LIVING ROOM: 515 SQFT
PROPOSED DETACHED GARAGE: 676 SQFT
PROPOSED COVERED OUTDOOR AREA: 150 SQFT AT ENTRY + 312 SQFT AT DETACHED GARAGE

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION NOTES

1. THIS PROJECT SHALL COMPLY WITH THE 2021 VERSION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
RESIDENTIAL CODE INCLUDING ALL AMENDMENTS & THE TOWN OF ALPINE LAND USE 
DEVELOPMENT CODE. ANY BUILDING OFFICIAL, SUBCONTRACTOR OR TRADES PERSON 
NOTING DISCREPANCIES SHALL NOTIFY THE ARCHITECT IMMEDIATELY UPON DISCOVERY.

2. CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE ALL REQUIRED INSPECTIONS BY THE TOWN OF ALPINE 
AND ANY OTHER GOVERNING AUTHORITIES, AS NECESSARY.

3.  ALL CONSTRUCTION DEBRIS IS TO BE STOCKPILED NEATLY ON SITE UNTIL DISPOSAL, 
WHICH SHALL BE DONE AT COUNTY LANDFILL OR RECYCLING FACILITY ONLY. NO DEBRIS 
IS TO BE DISPOSED OF IN LOCAL WASTE COLLECTION FACILITIES. 

4. UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED, ALL DIMENSIONS ARE GIVEN TO FACE OF ROUGH FRAMING, 
CENTERLINE OF COLUMNS, OR FACE OF CONCRETE AND C.M.U. WALL.

5. CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE STORAGE FOR ALL BUILDING MATERIALS IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH MANUFACTURER'S  RECOMMENDATIONS. STORAGE OF SUPPLIES SHALL REMAIN 
DRY.

6. ALL SUBSTITUTIONS ARE TO BE APPROVED BY ARCHITECT/OWNER. ALONG WITH WRITTEN 
REQUESTS CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE ALL INFORMATION REGARDING THE 
SUBSTITUTION IN QUESTION, INCLUDING COST, AVAILABILITY AND REASON FOR 
SUBSTITUTION.

7. NON-COMBUSTIBLE BLOCKING, INSULATION OR OTHER FIRESTOP MATERIAL IS TO BE 
PROVIDED BETWEEN STORIES, BETWEEN TOP STORY AND ROOF SPACE, BETWEEN 
STAIR STRINGERS AT TOP AND BOTTOM, BETWEEN STUDS ALONG STAIR RUNS AND AT 
ALL OTHER PLACES THAT COULD ALLOW THE PASSAGE OF FLAME. 

8. CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE SAMPLES OF ALL FINISHES AND STAIN COLORS FOR 
APPROVAL BY ARCHITECT/OWNER. THIS INCLUDES BUT IS NOT LIMITED TO INTERIOR AND 
EXTERIOR STAINS, INTERIOR PAINT, SHEETROCK TEXTURES, CHEMICALLY APPLIED METAL 
PATINAS, AND STONE VENEER MATERIAL & MASONRY TECHNIQUE.

9. ALL ELECTRICAL WORK TO BE PERFORMED BY WY LICENSED ELECTRICIAN.
10. ALL MATERIALS SHALL BE INSTALLED PER MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS AND 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH WARRANTY GUIDELINES.
11. REFER TO GEOTECHNICAL REPORT PROVIDED BY OWNER.
12. CONTRACTOR RESPONSIBLE FOR PROVIDING, COORDINATION AND SUPERVISING 

TRENCHING OF UTILITIES AND SERVICES TO AND FROM BUILDING. LOCATE ALL UTILITIES 
PRIOR TO EXCAVATION. COORDINATION SHALL INCLUDE CONTRACTOR'S REASONABLE 
EFFORTS TO COMBINE AS MANY DIFFERENT UTILITIES IN COMMON TRENCHES AS 
PRACTICAL AND GOOD PRACTICE PERMIT. 

13. VERIFY EXISTING BUILDING DIMENSIONS
14. VERIFY ALL BURIED UTILITIES PRIOR TO EXCAVATION.

ARCHITECT
ALPINE ARCHITECTURAL STUDIO, LLC
PO BOX 3975
ALPINE, WY 83128
bbennett@alpinearchstudio.com

SHEET INDEX

STRUCTURAL
S1 GENERAL NOTES & TYPICAL DETAILS
S2 SHEAR WALL PLANS
S3 FOUNDATION PLAN
S4 ROOF FRAMING PLANS
S5 DETAILS

VICINITY MAP: NTS PROJECT LOCATION 

GENERAL
G101 GENERAL NOTES & TYPICAL DETAILS
G102 MAP OF GREYS RIBER VILLAGE LOT-27
G103 EXISTING & DEMOLITION FLOOR PLANS
G104 EXISTING & DEMOLITION EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS

GREYS RIVER ROAD

SA
W

M
IL

L

WOODEN SPUR

14

Section 3, Itemc.



HWY 89

RIVER CIR

ELK RUN

BU
FF

AL
O

 D
R

SNAKE RIVER DR

5676.4ft

5669.8ft

5669.5ft

5669.6ft

5670.0ft

5676.4ft

5681.8ft

5676.4ft

5668.4ft

5668.2ft

5676.2ft

5668.2ft

5668.3ft

5667.8ft

5668.1ft

5671.3ft

5667.8ft

5665.1ft
5665.1ft

5666.8ft

5676.8ft

5663.7ft

5664.0ft
5664.0ft

5665.2ft

5664.9ft

5666.7ft

5664.9ft 5664.8ft

5666.7ft

5664.8ft

5665.1ft

5665.1ft

5665.4ft5664.9ft

5668.4ft

5674.4ft

5666.8ft

5665.3ft5665.1ft

5665.3ft

5665.1ft

5665.3ft

5665.4ft

5667.1ft

5661.3ft 5660.2ft

5661.0ft5662.6ft5661.5ft

5663.1ft

5668.0ft

5668.3ft

5668.5ft
5668.4ft

5668.2ft

5668.0ft

5670.6ft

5654.0ft

5653.9ft

5653.9ft

5653.8ft

5657.5ft

5648.7ft
5648.1ft

5648.8ft
5647.5ft

5651.8ft

5667.2ft

5667.1ft

5673.6ft

5666.3ft

5666.3ft

5666.5ft

5672.9ft

5667.2ft

5667.2ft

5667.4ft

5667.3ft5667.2ft

5667.3ft

5669.7ft

5669.7ft

5673.8ft

5676.5ft

5673.8ft

5669.0ft

5668.7ft

5681.6ft

LOT 16
5.27 +- ACRES

LOT 15
3.37 +- ACRES

LOT 13
1.75 +- ACRES

LOT 14
0.91 +- ACRES

89° 56' 52"
431.78'

S E

89° 56' 52"
330.14'

N W

0°
 0

4'
 4

8"
19

3.
99

'
S

E
0°

 0
4'

 4
8"

16
1.

19
'

N
W

0°
 0

4'
 4

8"
27

6.
07

'
S

W

82° 13' 06"

364.20'S
W

82° 13' 06"
50.13'S

W

82° 13' 06"

358.79'S
W

89° 21' 14"
374.64'

S W

89° 56' 52"
319.98'

N W

26
° 5

1' 
14

"
86

.6
6'

S

W

71° 31' 15"117.64'

N

W

0° 30' 00"
111.35'

S
E

0° 30' 00"
145.51'

S
E

0° 30' 00"
112.73'

N
W

0° 30' 00"
132.15'

N
W

67° 55' 20"

362.56'N

E

50' UTILITY EASEMENT

50'-0"

TY
P

27
'-7

 1
/2

"

TYP
72'-0" 26'-6" 72'-0"

TY
P

16
'-0

"

15
8'

-6
"

PA
R

KI
N

G
 S

ET
BA

C
K

5'
-1

 1
/4

" T
YP

25'-0"

15
'-0

"

15
'-0

"

20'-0"

15
'-0

"

15'-0"

1

13
9'

-0
"

PROPOSED
PLAY AREA 

10,000 SQFT +/-

EDUCATIONAL GROUP-E
UNSPRINKLERED 

MODULAR 1 

MODULAR 2 

MODULAR 3 

MODULAR 4 

2HR FIRE 
RATED WALLS

PARKING/
DRIVE AREA

PROPOSED
TREES 

PROPOSED
TREES 

FR
O

N
T 

SE
TB

AC
K

SIDE SETBACK

R
EA

R
 S

ET
BA

C
K

PROPERTY LINE

PR
O

PE
R

TY
 L

IN
E

PROPERTY LINE

SIDE SETBACK

PR
O

PE
R

TY
 L

IN
E

VEHICULAR 
ENTRANCE 

VEHICULAR 
ENTRANCE/EXIT

HAMMERHEAD IFC  D103.1 

SNOW STORAGE
11,200 SQFT

VEHICULAR 
ACCESS

20

1 10

1 10 1 9

1 10

STAGING 
AREA

STAGING 
AREA

PEDESTRIAN WALKWAY

PRIVACY FENCEPRIVACY FENCE

RIVER VIEW MEADOWS ADDITION
ACCESSION NO.

LOT 29

ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION
ACCESSION NO. 807881

LOT 9

PAVILION

PA
LI

SA
D

ES
 H

EI
G

H
TS

 T
O

W
N

H
O

M
ES

A
 C

O
N

D
O

M
IN

IU
M

 A
D

D
IT

IO
N

A
C

C
ES

SI
O

N
 N

O
. 7

72
75

0

PA
LI

SA
D

ES
 H

EI
G

H
TS

 S
U

B
D

IV
IS

IO
N

A
C

C
ES

SI
O

N
 N

O
. 5

48
81

0
LO

T 
6

PA
LI

SA
D

ES
 H

EI
G

H
TS

 S
U

B
D

IV
IS

IO
N

A
C

C
ES

SI
O

N
 N

O
. 5

48
81

0
LO

T 
5

B
U

FF
A

LO
 R

U
N

P A L I S A D E S     R E S E R V O I R

BUREAU OF RECLAMATION

PALISADES RESERVOIR TAKE LINE

BUFFALO RUN

LOT 16
5.27 +- ACRES

UTILITY EASEMENT
AGREEMENT

PR

ELECTRIC 
DISTRIBUTION EASEMENT

705 PR 812
694 PR 847

BASEBALL FIELD

SKATE PARK

CHILD DEVELOPMENT
CENTER

LOT 13
1.75 +- ACRES

LOT 14
0.91 +- ACRES

ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION
ACCESSION NO. 807881

LOT 5

ALPINE WEST FIRST ADDITION
ACCESSION NO. 807881

LOT 3

S

S

S
S

S

HORSESHOE GAME AREA

PROPOSED
GRAVEL PATH

RELOCATE 
EXISTING FILL PILE

PROPOSED 
PUMP TRACK 
LOCATION 

NORTH REF

N
O

T 
FO

R
 C

O
N

ST
R

U
C

TI
O

N
 - 

PR
EL

IM
IN

AR
Y 

D
ES

IG
N

REVISIONS

051015202530

051015202530

A

F

K

P

U

A

F

K

P

U

8/11/2025 10:22:25 AM

SITE STUDY - A

SP101

A
LP

IN
E 

ED
U

C
A

TI
O

N
 F

O
U

N
D

A
TI

O
N

AL
PI

N
E 

W
ES

T 
TH

IR
D

 A
D

D
IT

IO
N

  L
O

T-
15

8.11.2025

CHECKED BY | BENNETT

©  2025 | ALL  RIGHTS  RESERVED

AL
PI

N
E,

 W
Y

DRAWN BY | BENNETT

SCHEMATIC DESIGN

  |  AAS # ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION L-15  |

80400

SCALE IN FEET
SCALE: 1" = 40'

OCCUPANT LOAD CALCS
IBC 2018: 20 SQFT PER OCCUPANT
MAX UNDIVIDED FIRE AREA: 8,616 SQFT
8,616/20=431 
MAX OCCUPANT LOAD: 431 OCCUPANTS

MAX DIVIDED FIRE AREA: 4,418 SQFT
4,418 SQFT/20=221
MAX OCCUPANT LOAD PER 
MAX DIVIDED FIRE AREA: 221 OCCUPANTS

 1" = 40'-0"SP101

1 SITE PLAN

15



16



 

285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE – 2021 EDITION 

Page 1 of 5 

 

    285 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-03 
 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REPLACING 276 ORDINANCE NO. 2020-05 AND 
PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2021 
EDITION FOR THE TOWN OF ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.  
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT:  
  
 
SECTION I.  
   
276 Ordinance No. 2020-05 is hereby repealed in its entirety.  
 
 
SECTION II.  
 
Permit Required- Application. 
It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, reconstruct, alter or change the use of any 
building or other structure within the town limits without obtaining a building permit from the 
Town of Alpine. The Town shall not issue any permit unless the plans of and for the proposed 
erection, construction, reconstruction, alteration or use fully conforms to the zoning regulations, 
subdivision regulations and building regulations then in effect. All applications for building 
permits shall be accompanied by all documentations as required on the building permit 
application. All building permit fees are to be determined by the town council by resolution or 
ordinance and may be changed from time to time.  
 
 
SECTION III.  
 
International Building Code. 
All buildings and temporary structures built or located within the Town from and after the 
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed 
in accordance with the requirements of the International Building Code (IBC) 2021 Edition as 
published by the International Code Council, specifically excluding all appendices. The 
International Building Code (OBC) 2018 Edition is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by 
reference with the exception of the following amendments: 
 

1. Section 101.4.8 Electrical shall read, “The provisions of the National Electrical Code 
shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs, 
replacement equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto”. 

2. The last sentence of Section 101.4.3 Plumbing shall read, “The provisions of the 
Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality shall apply to private sewage disposal 
systems”. 

3. Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance shall be deleted on its entirety.  

17



 

 
285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 2 of 5 

 

4. Section 102.1 General shall have a second sentence added which shall read, 
“Substitute the National Electrical Code for all reference to the ICC Electrical Code 
throughout the IBC”. 

5. Section 103.3 Deputies shall be amended by deleting the last sentence. 
6. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Delete #1 and #2. Item 11 shall read, 

“Swings and other playground equipment”.    
7. Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application shall be deleted in its entirety. 
8. Section 105.5 Expiration shall be deleted in its entirety. 
9. Section 105.5 Expiration. The last sentence shall be revised to read, “The Town of 

Alpine is authorized to grant in writing one extension of time for a period of not more 
than one (1) year.  

10. Section 107.1 General. Construction documents, special inspection and structural 
observation programs, and other data shall be submitted in three sets with each 
application for a permit. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered 
design professional where required by the statues of the jurisdiction in which the project 
is to be constructed. Where special conditions exist, the Planning and Zoning 
Commission is authorized to require additional construction documents to be prepared 
by a registered design professional.  

11. Section 108.3 Temporary Power. The last sentence shall read, “The part covered by 
the temporary certificate shall comply with the requirements specified for temporary 
lighting, heat or power in the National Electrical Code”. 

12. Section 109.6 Refunds shall read, “The governing authority is authorized to establish a 
refund policy when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with 
this code”. 

13. Add Section 110.3.12 Re-inspection Fee. “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for 
each inspection or re-inspection when such portion of the work for which inspection is 
requested is not complete or when required corrections have not been made. Re-
inspection fees may be assessed when the approved plans are not readily available to 
the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested 
or for deviating from the plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine”. 

14. A sixth sentence shall be added to the first paragraph of Section 1608.2 Ground Snow 
Loads and shall read, “The roof snow load shall be 100 lbs. per square foot”. 
 

 
SECTION IV.  

 
Stamp or Seal of Licensed Engineer Required. 
All plans for structures submitted with a permit application as required under this Ordinance 
shall be designed by a civil or structural engineer licensed in the State of Wyoming.  Such 
plans shall contain the stamp or seal of a civil or structural engineer licensed in the State of 
Wyoming.  
 

 
 
 
 

18



 

 
285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 3 of 5 

 

SECTION V. 
 

Priority of Ordinances. 
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified with any other sections of 
the Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.  

 
 

SECTION VI. 
 
Definitions. 
The definitions as set forth in the International Building Code as said code is adopted in 
Section III of this Ordinance shall apply in interpretation of said code unless there is a 
discrepancy between the definitions contained in said code and definitions found in Planning 
and Zoning Ordinance Chapter II of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and in that event the 
definitions found in Planning and Zoning Ordinance Chapter II of the Town of Alpine Municipal 
Code shall take precedence. 

 
 
SECTION VII.  

 
Building Permit Issuance - Compliance Required. 
The Town of Alpine shall not issue a building permit for any building or temporary structure to 
be built within the town unless the plan submitted for such building or temporary structure 
complies fully with the provisions of this chapter. 

 
 
SECTION VIII. 

 
Business License - Non-Issuance for Non-Compliance. 
No business license shall be issued to any business located in any building or temporary 
structure in which the building or temporary structure fails to comply with the provisions of this 
chapter.  No business license shall be issued to any business located in any building or 
temporary structure which did not comply with the equivalent or applicable zoning or building 
ordinance in effect at the time of the construction or placement of such building.  

 
 
SECTION IX. 

 
Appeal to Board of Adjustments. 
An appeal from the provisions of the chapter shall be made to the Board of Adjustments on a 
form to be furnished by the board which may be secured at the town office. Any 
recommendations by the Board of Adjustments for departure from the provisions of this 
chapter shall be subject to the approval of the Town Council. 

 
 
 

19



 

 
285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 4 of 5 

 

 
SECTION X. 

 
Severability.  
If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is 
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of 
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provision or application and to this 
and the provisions of this act are severable.  

 
 
SECTION XI.  

 
Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of these ordinances are 
hereby repealed.  
 
 
SECTION XII. 

 
Effective Date.  
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage provided; however, this 
ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits. 

 
PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 2ND READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 3RD READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
TOWN OF ALPINE 

 
       BY: _______________________________ 
              W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
        
BY: _________________________________ 

 Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk/Treasurer 

20



 

 
285 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-03 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 5 of 5 

 

    
ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 

 
 
 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
    ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 

 
 

I hereby certify that the forgoing 285 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-03 was duly posted for ten (10) 
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.  

 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES 
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 

 
 
 
 

ATTEST: 
 

 
 
 
 

_________________________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK/TREASURER    

21



 

260 Ordinance No. 2018-10 
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE – 2018 Edition 

Page 1 of 3 

 

     

287 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-05 
 

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 260 ORDINANCE NO.  2018-10 AND PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE  2021 EDITION FOR THE 
TOWN OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.  
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT: 
 
 
SECTION I. 
 
260 Ordinance No. 2018-10 is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
   
SECTION II. 
 
 International Mechanical Code Adoption by Reference. 
All buildings and structures constructed, located or placed within the town from and after the 
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed 
or built in accordance with the requirements of the 2021 Edition of the International Mechanical 
Code, as promulgated by the International Code Council, and the said International 
Mechanical Code 2021 Edition is adopted by reference the same as if it were more fully set 
forth herein, except as follows:  

 
1. Section 101.1 Title shall read, “These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical 

Code of the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this code’”.  
2. Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be as adopted by 

the Town of Alpine in the Mechanical/Fuel Gas fee schedule”.  
3. A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.2.3 Approval Required and shall 

read, “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection when 
such portion of the work for which inspection is requested is not complete or when 
required corrections have not been made. Re-inspection fees will be assessed when 
the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector; for failure to provide 
access on the date for which inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans 
requiring the approval of the Building Official”.  

4. Section 108.4 Violation penalties shall read, “Any person who shall violate a 
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or 
who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the 
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or 
certificate of occupancy issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon 
conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of 
Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or revisions thereto.” 

22



 

 
287 Ordinance No. 2022-05 

 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE – 2021 Edition 
Page 2 of 3 

 

5. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who 
shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a 
stop work, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 
violation or unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111 
Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments 
or revisions thereto.” 

6. A second sentence shall be added to Section 903.3 Unvented Decorative Room 
Heaters and shall read, “Unvented gas logs shall; not be installed in habitable rooms 
or spaces”. 
 

 
SECTION III.  

 
Priority of Ordinances.  
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of 
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the 
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply. 

 
 
SECTION IV. 

 
Severability.  
If any provisions of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is 
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or application, and 
to this and the provisions of this act are severable.  

 
 
SECTION V.  

 
Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with provisions of this ordinance are hereby 
repealed.  

 
 
SECTION VI. 

 
Effective Date.  
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage, however, that this 
Ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits. 
 

PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
 
 

23



 

 
287 Ordinance No. 2022-05 

 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE – 2021 Edition 
Page 3 of 3 

 

PASSED 2ND READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 3RD READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
     
        TOWN OF ALPINE 
 
 
       BY: _______________________________ 
        W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
        
BY: _______________________________ 

        Sharon L. Backus, Clerk/Treasurer 
 
 
 
    ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 
 
STATE OF WYOMING  ) 
     ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 

 
I hereby certify that the forgoing 287 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-05 was duly posted for ten  
(10) days in the Town Clerk’s Office.  
 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF 
ORDINANCES VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 
 
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK /TREASURER 

24



289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 
 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE – 2021 Edition 

Page 1 of 3 

 

 

       

 

289 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-07 
 

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 262 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-12 AND PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN 
OF ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.  
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT: 
 
 
SECTION I.  
 
262 Ordinance No. 2018-12 is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
 
SECTION II.  
 
International Plumbing Code- Adoption by reference. 
 
All buildings and temporary structures built, located or placed within the town from and after 
the established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance shall be properly 
plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International Plumbing Code, 2021 
Edition, as published by the International Code Council, specifically including “Appendix D”. 
The said Code is incorporated herein by reference as if the same were more fully herein set 
out except as follows: 
 

1. Section 101.1 shall read. “These regulations shall be known as the International 
Plumbing Code of the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this code’”. 

2. Section 101.6.2 Fee Schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be paid as required 
in the adopted Town of Alpine plumbing fee schedule”. 

3. Section 108.4 Violation penalties shall read, “ Any person who shall violate a provision 
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall 
erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction 
documents, or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate of occupancy 
issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon conviction, be punished as 
provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any 
amendments or revisions thereto”.  

4. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who shall 
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work 
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 
2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or revisions 
thereto”.  

25



 

289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 
 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE – 2021 Edition 

Page 2 of 3 

 

 

5. The last sentence of Section 305.4 Freezing shall read, “Exterior water supply system 
piping shall be installed not less than 6 feet below grade”. 

6. Section 305.4.1 Sewer depth shall read, “Building sewers shall be a minimum of 48 
inches below grade or shall be protected from freezing in an approved manner by the 
administrative authority”. 
 
 

SECTION III. 
 

Priority of Ordinances. 
In the event any if the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of 
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any sections of the Town of 
Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply. 
 

 
SECTION IV. 

 
Severability.  
If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstances is 
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions of application of 
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provision or application, and to this 
and the provisions of this act are severable.  
 

 
SECTION V.  

 
Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are  
hereby repealed.  
 

 
SECTION VI. 

 
Effective Date.  
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage provided; however, that 
this ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits. 

 
PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022. 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 

 
PASSED 2ND READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022.  
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 

26



 

289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 
 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE – 2021 Edition 

Page 3 of 3 

 

 

 
PASSED 3RD READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022. 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
            

TOWN OF ALPINE 
 
 
 
       BY:_______________________________ 
        W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 

 
BY:_________________________________ 

Sharon L, Backus, Town Clerk/Treasurer 
 
 
 
    ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 
 
 
 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 
TOWN OF ALPINE  ) 
 
I hereby certify that the forgoing 289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 was duly posted for ten (10) days 
in the Town Clerk’s Office.  
 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES 
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 
 
 

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
 
__________________________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK/TREASURER     

27



 

290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08 
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2021 Edition 

Page 1 of 2 
 

 

   

290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08 
 

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 
 
AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 263 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-13 AND PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN OF 
ALPINE AND PROVIDING FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT: 
 
SECTION I. 
 
263 Ordinance No. 2018-13 is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
SECTION II. 
 
There is hereby adopted by the Town Council of the Town of Alpine, for the purpose of prescribing 
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous materials or 
explosion, that certain Code and Standards known as the International Fire Code (“IFC”) 2021 
Edition (“IFC”), including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G, published by the International Code 
Council, hereby establishing an effect date upon approval and passage of this ordinance. The 
International Fire Code is hereby incorporated by reference as if the same were more fully set out 
herein.  
 
SECTION III. 
 
Priority of ordinances. 
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of the 
adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the Town of 
Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.  
 
SECTION IV.  
 
Severability.  
If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is held 
invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of this 
Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this and 
the provisions of this act are severable. 
 
SECTION V. 
 
Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are hereby 
repealed.  
 
 

28



 

290 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-08 
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2021 Edition 

Page 2 of 2 
 

 

SECTION VI. 
 
Effective Date.  
 
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage. 

 
PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 2nd READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 3rd READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 

TOWN OF ALPINE 
 
 
           BY: _______________________________ 
        W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
  
       
BY: _______________________________ 

 Sharon L. Backus, Clerk/Treasurer 
 
   
    ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 
 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
    ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 

 
I hereby certify that the forgoing 290 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-08 was duly posted for ten (10) days 
in the Town Clerk’s Office.  

 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES VI, 
TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, CLERK/TREASURER  

29



 

 
286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 

International Residential Code 2021 
Page 1 of 4 

 

286 ORDINANCE No. 2022-04 
 

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 277 ORDINANCE NO. 2020-06 AND PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 2021 EDITION FOR THE 
TOWN OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT: 
 
 
SECTION I. 
 
277 Ordinance No. 2020-06 is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
 
SECTION II. 
All detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) 
not more than three stories in height with separate means of egress built or located within the 
town from and after the established effective date upon approval and passage of this 
Ordinance shall be constructed in accordance with the requirements of the International 
Residential Code, 2021 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, specifically 
including Appendix F (Radon). The International Residential Code (IRC) 2021 Edition is 
hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference, with the exception of the following 
amendments:  
 

1. Section R102.7 Existing structures. The first sentence shall read “The legal 
occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be 
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, the 
International Property Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code, or as is 
deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the 
occupants and the public”. 

2. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit shall be amended by deleting numbers 1, 2 
and 10. 

3. Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application shall be deleted in its entirety. 
4. Section 105.5 Expiration shall be deleted in its entirety. 
5. Section 108.2 Schedule of permit fees shall be revised to read, “On buildings, 

structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 
permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine 
permit fee schedule.”  

6. Section R113.4 Violation penalties shall be revised to read, “Any person who violates 
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who 
erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate 
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as provided in 111 

30



 

 
286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 

International Residential Code 2021 
Page 2 of 4 

 

Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or 
revisions thereto.”  

7. Section R114.2 Unlawful continuance shall read “Any person who shall continue any 
work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except 
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 
condition shall upon conviction be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 
of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions thereto.”  

8. The first sentence in Section 301.1.3 Engineered design shall be revised to read, “All 
residential structures shall be designed by a civil or structural engineer licensed in the 
State of Wyoming”.  

9. Table R302.13. Fire Protection of Floors Exceptions Sub-Section 2 shall be 
revised to read “Floor assemblies located directly over a crawl space not intended for 
storage or for the installation of electric-powered heating appliances.” 

10. Table R302.6 Dwelling/Garage Separation, Under Material Heading shall be revised 
to read all materials to be 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board. 

11. Section R313 Automatic Sprinkler Systems shall be deleted in its entirety.  
12. Sections 403.3 shall be replaced with the sentence reading, “Front protected shallow 

foundations are prohibited”. 
13. Section N1102.4 Air Leakage, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
14. Section N1102.4.1.2 Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
15. Section N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) Duct Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
16. The first sentence of Section N1102.2.10 shall be changed to read, “Where the floor 

above the crawl space is un-insulated, insulation shall be installed on the crawl space 
walls and a Class I vapor retarder be installed according to this code”. 

17. Section G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations. Delete Exceptions .3 and .4 in their 
entirety. 

18. Section G2445.2 (621.2) Prohibited Use shall read, “Unvented room heaters shall not 
be installed in habitable rooms or spaces”. 

19. A second sentence shall be added to section G2445.7 Unvented Decorative Room 
Heaters and shall read, “Unvented decorative room heaters shall not be installed in 
habitable rooms or spaces”. 

20. Section P2603.5.1 Sewer depth shall be amended to read, “Building sewers shall be a 
minimum of 48 inches below grade or shall be protected from freezing in an approved 
manner by the administrative authority”. 

21. AF104 Testing, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
 
 
SECTION III. 
Priority of ordinances. 
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of 
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the 
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.  
 
 
 
 
 

31



 

 
286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 

International Residential Code 2021 
Page 3 of 4 

 

SECTION IV.  
Severability.  
If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is 
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of 
this Ordinance which can be given affect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to 
this and the provisions of this act are severable. 
 
 
SECTION V. 
Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 
hereby repealed.  
 
 
SECTION VI. 
Effective Date.  
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage, however, that this 
ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building permits. 
 

 
PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022. 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 2ND READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022.  
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED ON 3RD READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 

   

TOWN OF ALPINE 
 
 

By:  __________________________________ 
                 W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 

 
Attest: 
 
 
 
 
By:   ____________________________________ 
       Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk 

32



 

 
286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 

International Residential Code 2021 
Page 4 of 4 

 

      
    ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLARK 
 
 
  
STATE OF WYOMING  ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 
TOWN OF ALPINE  ) 
 
I hereby certify that the forgoing 286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 was duly posted for ten (10) 
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.  
 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF 
ORDINANCES VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 
 
 
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
 
_______________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK    

33



 

 
288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 1 of 3 

 

288 ORDINANCE NO. 2022-06 
 

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 
  

 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING 261 ORDINANCE NO. 2018-11 AND PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE  2021 EDITION FOR THE TOWN 
OF ALPINE, AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING IN 
REGULAR SESSION DULY ASSEMBLED THAT: 
 
 
SECTION I. 
 
261 Ordinance No. 2018-11 is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
 
SECTION II. 
 
International Fuel Gas Code - Adoption by reference. 
All buildings and structures constructed, located or placed within the town from and after the 
established effective date, upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be constructed 
or built in accordance with the requirements of the 2021 Edition of the International Fuel Code 
(IFGC), as promulgated by the International Code Council, and the said International Fuel Gas 
Code is adopted by reference the same if it were fully set forth herein, except as follows: 
 

1. Section 101.1 Title shall read, “These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code 
of the Town of Alpine, hereinafter referred to as ‘this code’”. 

2. Section 106.6.2 Fee Schedule shall read, “The fees for work shall be indicated in the 
adopted Town of Alpine Mechanical/Plumbing permit schedule”. 

3. A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.3.3 Re-inspection and testing and 
shall read, “A re-inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection 
when such portion or the work for which inspection is requested is not complete or when 
required corrections have not been made. Re-inspection fees may be assessed when 
the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failure to provide 
access on the date for which inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans 
requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine”. 

4. Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall read, “Any person who violates a provision of 
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, 
install, alter or repair plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate of 
occupancy issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon conviction, be punished 
as provided in 111-Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any 
amendments or revisions thereto.” 

34



 

 
288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 2 of 3 

 

5. The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders shall read, “Any person who shall 
continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work 
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111-Ordinance No. 
2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions 
thereto”. 

6. Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations Exception number 3 and 4 shall be deleted. 
7. Unvented Decorative Room Heaters. “Unvented Decorative Room Heaters shall not 

be installed in habitable spaces”. 
 

 
SECTION III. 
 

Priority of ordinances. 
In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town as codified in this code as of the date of 
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section conflict with any other sections of the 
Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.  

 
 
SECTION IV. 
 

Severability.  
If any provisions of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is 
held invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or application, and 
to this and the provisions of this act are severable.  

 
 
SECTION V. 
 

Ordinances Repealed.  
All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with provisions of this ordinance are hereby 
repealed.  

 
 
SECTION VI. 
 

Effective Date.  
 
This Ordinance shall become effective from the date of its passage. 

 
PASSED 1ST READING THIS 15TH DAY OF MARCH 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
. 
 
 

35



 

 
288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE – 2021 EDITION 
Page 3 of 3 

 

PASSED 2ND READING THIS 19TH DAY OF APRIL 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 
PASSED 3RD READING THIS 17TH DAY OF MAY 2022 
 

Vote: ____ yes, ____ no, ____ abstain, ____ absent. 
 

TOWN OF ALPINE 
 
 
       BY: _______________________________ 
        W. Kennis Lutz, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
        
BY: ________________________________ 

        Sharon L. Backus, Town Clerk 
     
 

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 
 
 
STATE OF WYOMING  ) 
COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 
TOWN OF ALPINE  ) 
 
 

I hereby certify that the forgoing 288 ORDINANCE NO.  2022-06 was duly posted for ten (10) 
days in the Town Clerk’s Office.  

 
I further certify that the forgoing Ordinance was duly recorded in the BOOK OF ORDINANCES 
VI, TOWN OF ALPINE, LINCOLN COUNTY, WYOMING. 

 
 
 
 

ATTEST: 
 
 
 

__________________________________________ 
SHARON L. BACKUS, TOWN CLERK/TREASURER      

36



TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODES 

I 
 

Ordinance No. 2025-xxx 

 

Table of Contents 
 

PART 1    INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES 

1. General 

Provisions……………………………………………………………………………….……….

1 

1.1 Intent 

………………………………………………………………………………………………………

……..1 

1.2 Scope 

………………………………………………………………………………………………………

…….1 

1.3 Potential Conflicts in Definitions 

………………………………………………………………………..1 

1.4 Exemptions to Adopted Building Codes 

2. International Building Code (IBC) 

……………………………………………………………………1 

2.1 Applicability 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………….1 

2.2 Implementation and exemptions 

………………………………………………………………………..1 

3. International Residential Code (IRC) 

……………………………………………………………….6 

3.1 Applicability 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………….6 

3.2 Implementation and 

exemptions…………………………………………………………………………6 

4. International Plumbing Code (IPC) 

…………………………………………………………………10 

4.1 Applicability 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………..11 

4.2 Implementation and exemptions 

………………………………………………………………………11 

5. International Mechanical Code (IMC) 

…………………………………………………………….13 

5.1 Applicability 

37



TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODES 

II 
 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………..13 

5.2 Implementation and exemptions 

……………………………………………………………………...13 

6. International Fire Code (IFC) 

…………………………………………………………………….…..17 

6.1 Applicability 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………..17 

6.2 Implementation and exemptions 

………………………………………………………………………17 

7. International Fuel Gas Code 

(IFGC)………………………………………………………………..17 

7.1 Applicability 

…………………………………………………………………………………………………..17 

7.2 Implementation and 

exemptions……………………………………………………………………….18 

8. Grace Period for Building Design Phase and 

Applications………………………………….21 

9. Violations, Penalties, and 

Remedies………………………………………………………………21 

9.1 Unlawful to Violate Ordinance 

………………………………………………………………………….22 

9.2 Continuing Violations and Penalties 

………………………………………………………………….22 

9.3 Town Enforce through Appropriate Civil Remedy 

…………………………………………………22 

9.4 Actions for Penalties or Fines 

……………………………………………………………………………22 

9.5 Applicability of “Wyoming Administrative Procedure Act” 

……………………………………..22 

9.6 Ordinance Enforceable in Addition to Other Remedies 

…………………………………………22 

38



 

 

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX – International Code Council  

 

Page 1 of 3 

TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING 

ORDINANCE NO. 2025-xxx 

AN ORDINANCE XXX ORDINANCE NO. AND PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION 

OF THE TOWN OF ALPINE- INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES FOR THE 

TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING 

WHEREAS, the International Code Council (ICC) is a leading organization that develops model 

codes and standards used in the design, construction, and compliance process of buildings and 

structures; and 

WHEREAS, the Town of Alpine, Wyoming, has reviewed and determined that it is in the best 

interest of the public to adopt the most recent versions of the ICC International Building Code 

(IBC), International Residential Code (IRC), International Plumbing Code (IPC), International 

Mechanical Code (IMC), International Fire Code, and International Fuel and Gas Code (IFGC) 

currently adopted by the State of Wyoming. 

WHEREAS, the adoption of the ICC International Codes help ensure safe, affordable, and 

sustainable communities and buildings and structures which are constructed in the Town of 

Alpine; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE 

TOWN OF ALPINE, WYOMING: 

Section 1. The following Ordinances are repealed in their entirety 

i) 285 Ordinance No.2022-03  

ii) 286 Ordinance No. 2022-04 

iii) 287 Ordinance No. 2022-05 

iv) 288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 

v) 289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 

vi) 290 Ordinance No.2022-08 

Section 2. ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING MOST RECENT INTERNATIONAL 

CODE COUNCIL CODES IN USE BY THE STATE OF WYOMING 

Section 4. EFFECTIVE DATE: This ordinance shall take effect upon final passage and 

approval as required by law. This ordinance shall not apply to any previously approved building 

permits. 

Section 5. PRIORITY OF ORDINANCES 

 

In the event any of the adopted ordinances of the town, as codified in this code as of the date of 

the adoption of the ordinance codified in this section, conflict with any other sections of the 

Town of Alpine Municipal Code, the most restrictive shall apply.  

 

39



 

 

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX – International Code Council  

 

Page 2 of 3 

Section 6. SEVERABILITY  
 

If any provision of this Ordinance or the application thereof any person or circumstances is held 

invalid or unconstitutional, the invalidity shall not affect other provisions or applications of this 

Ordinance which can be given effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this 

and the provisions of this act are severable. 

 

 

Section 7. ORDINANCES REPEALED  

 

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 

hereby repealed.  

 

 

 

 

Passed First Reading this  day of  2025 

VOTE:     YES,     NO,     ABSTAIN,     ABSENT 

 

Passed Second Reading  Day of 2025 

VOTE:     YES,     NO,     ABSTAIN,     ABSENT 

 

Passed on Third and Final Reading  Day of  2025 

VOTE:     YES,     NO,     ABSTAIN,     ABSENT 

 

TOWN OF ALPINE 

 

 

      BY: _______________________________ 

        Eric Green 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

        

BY: _________________________________ 

Monica Chenault, Clerk 

 

 

ATTESTATION OF THE TOWN CLERK 

 

40



 

 

Town of Alpine Ordinance No. 2025-XXX – International Code Council  

 

Page 3 of 3 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 

    ) 

COUNTY OF LINCOLN ) 

 

 

 

I hereby certify that the forgoing ORDINANCE NO.  2025-xxx was duly posted for ten (10) 

days in the Town Clerk’s Office.  

 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

 

_________________________________________ 

Monica Chenault, Clerk 

41



TOWN OF ALPINE- BUILDING CODE 
 

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES 

1. GENERAL PROVISIONS 

1.1 INTENT: The International Code Council (ICC) is a leading 

organization that develops model codes and standards used in the 

design, construction, and compliance process of buildings and 

structures. The Town of Alpine, Wyoming, has reviewed and 

determined that it is in the best interest of the public to adopt the most 

recent versions of the ICC International Building Code (IBC), 

International Residential Code (IRC), International Plumbing Code 

(IPC), International Mechanical Cod e (IMC), International Fire Code 

(IFC), and International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), as currently ad opted 

by the State of Wyoming.  

1.2 SCOPE: These codes, along with the Town of Alpine’s Land Use 

Development Code (LUDC), help ensure that buildings and structures 

constructed in the Town of Alpine are safe, affordable, and sustainable. 

1.3 POTENTIAL CONFLICTS IN DEFINITIONS: The definitions contained 

in the International Building Code shall apply in the interpretation of the 

International Building Code unless there is a discrepancy between the 

definitions contained in the International Building Code and the 

definitions contained in the Alpine Land Use and Development Code. 

In this case, the definitions contained in the Alpine Land Use and 

Development Code shall take precedence. 

1.4  EXEMPTIONS TO ADOPTED BUILDING CODES: The following 

codes will be adopted by reference, except for the amendments listed 

in each Code.  

2 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)  

2.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located 

or placed within the town from and after the established effective date, 

upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be properly built in 

accordance with the requirements of the International Building Code 

(IBC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published 

by the International Code Council. The said Code is incorporated 

herein by reference as if the same were more fully here in set out here, 

except as follows:  

2.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Building Code is hereby 

adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following 

amendments: 

2.2.1 Section 101.1: Title. Shall read these regulations shall 

be known as the Building Code of the Town of Alpine, 

hereinafter referred to as “this code.”  

42



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

2 
 

2.2.2 The last sentence of Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Shall 

read, “The provisions of the Wyoming Department of 

Environmental Quality shall apply to private sewage 

disposal systems.”  

2.2.3 Section 101.4.4: Property Maintenance. shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

2.2.4 Add Section 101.4.8: Electrical. Shall read, “The 

provisions of the National Electrical Code shall apply 

to the installation of electrical systems, including 

alterations, repairs, replacement equipment, 

appliances, fixtures, fittings, and appurtenances 

thereto”. 

2.2.5 Section 102.1: General shall have a second sentence 

added which shall read, “Substitute the National 

Electrical Code for all references to the ICC Electrical 

Code throughout the IBC”.  

2.2.6 Section 103.1: Creation of enforcement agency. Shall 

read “The Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning 

Department and the official in charge thereof shall be 

known as the Planning and Zoning Administrator. The 

function of the agency shall be the implementation, 

administration, and enforcement of the provisions of 

this code.”  

2.2.7 Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”  

2.2.8 Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall be amended by 

deleting the last sentence. read “In accordance with 

the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and with 

the concurrence of the appointing authority, the chief 

appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have the 

authority to ap point a building official, other related 

technical officers, inspectors, and other employees. 

Such employees shall have powers delegated by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”   

2.2.9 Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read 

“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive 

applications. The Building Official shall review 

construction documents. The Planning and Zoning 

43



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

3 
 

Commission shall review site plans. The Design 

Review Committee shall review construction 

documents and design for compliance with the current 

adopted Design Review Standards . The Town Clerk 

shall issue permits upon approval when presented 

with a complete application b y the Planning and 

Zoning Administrator, approval of construction 

documents by the Building Official, approval of the 

site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission, 

and approval of the building design by the Design 

Review Committee if applicable. 

2.2.10 Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator 

shall replace building official.  

2.2.11 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace building official.  

2.2.12 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace building official. 

2.2.13 Section 105.1: Required. The Town of Alpine shall 

replace building official.  

2.2.14 Section 105.2: Work exempt from permit. Delete #1 

and #2. Item #11 shall read, “Swings and other 

playground equipment”. 

2.2.15 Section 105.2.1: Emergency repairs. The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building 

official.  

2.2.16 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Department of 

Building Safety shall be replaced with the Town of 

Alpine. 

2.2.17 Section 105.3: Application for permit. 7. Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official. 

2.2.18 Section 105.3.1: Action on application. Shall in the 

first sentence, the Planning and Zoning Administrator 

replace Building Official. The last sentence shall read 

If the Building Official is satisfied that the proposed 

work conforms to the requirements of this code and 

laws and ordinances applicable thereto, the Town 

Clerk shall issue a permit therefor as soon as 

practicable. 

44



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

4 
 

2.2.19 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application. Shall 

be deleted in its entirety. 

2.2.20 Section 105.5: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its 

entirety. 

2.2.21 Section 105.5: Expiration. The last sentence shall be 

revised to read, “The Town of Alpine The governing 

authority is authorized to grant in writing one 

extension of time for a period of not more than one (1) 

year. 

2.2.22 Section 107.1: General. Construction documents, 

special inspection and structural observation 

programs, and other data shall be submitted in three 

two paper sets and one digital set with each 

application for a permit. The construction documents 

shall be prepared by a registered design professional 

where required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in 

which the project is to be constructed. Where special 

conditions exist, the Planning and Zoning 

Commission is authorized to require additional 

construction documents to be prepared by a 

registered design professional. 

2.2.23 Section 108.3: Temporary Power. Service utilities. The 

last sentence shall read, “The part covered by the 

temporary certificate shall comply with the 

requirements specified for temporary lighting, heat, or 

power in the National Electrical Code.”  

2.2.24 Section R109.2: Schedule of permit fees shall be 

revised to read, “On buildings, structures, electrical, 

gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations 

requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid 

as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine permit fee 

schedule.”  

2.2.25 Section 109.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence: 

The governing authority shall replace the building 

official. 

2.2.26 Section 109.4: Work commencing before permit 

issuance. The governing authority shall replace the 

building official. 

45



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

5 
 

2.2.27 Section 109.6: Refunds shall read, “The governing 

authority is authorized to establish a refund policy 

when no work has been done under a permit issued 

in accordance with this code”.  

2.2.28 Add Section 110.3.12.1: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-

inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or 

re-inspection when such portion of the work for which 

inspection is requested is not complete or when 

required corrections have not been made. Re-

inspection fees may be assessed when the approved 

plans are not readily available to the inspector, for 

failure to provide access on the date for which 

inspection is requested or for deviating from the plans 

requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.” 

2.2.29 Section 115 .4: Failure to comply shall read “Any 

person who shall continue any work in or about the 

structure after having been served with a stop work 

order, except such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition 

shall upon conviction be punished as provided in 111 

Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine 

Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions 

thereto.”  

2.2.30 Section 116.3: Notice. “Or Planning and Zoning 

Administrator” shall be added after the building 

official. 

2.2.31 Section 1608.2: Ground Snow Loads. A sixth 

sentence shall be added to the first paragraph and 

shall read, “The ground snow load shall be one 

hundred forty-three (143) pounds per square foot, and 

the roof snow load shall be one hundred (100) lbs. 

pounds per square foot.” 

3. INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC)  

3.1 APPLICABILITY: All detached one- and two-family dwellings and 

multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three 

stories in height with separate means of egress built or located within 

the town from and after the established effective date upon approval 

and passage o f this Ordinance shall be constructed in accordance 

with the requirements of International Residential Code (IRC), Edition 

46



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

6 
 

currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published by the Inter 

national Code Council, specifically including Appendix BE (Radon 

Control Methods). 

3.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Residential Code is hereby 

adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following 

amendments:  

3.2.1 Section R101.1: Title. Shall read these provisions 

shall be known as the Residential Code for One-and 

Two-family Dwellings of the Town of Alpine, 

hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 

3.2.2 Section R103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The 

Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and 

the official in charge thereof shall be known as the 

Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of 

the agency shall be the implementation, 

administration, and enforcement of the provisions of 

this code.”  

3.2.3 Section R103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The 

Planning and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed 

by the chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

3.2.4 Section R103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance 

with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and 

with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have 

the authority to appoint a building official, other related 

technical officers, inspectors, and other employees. 

Such employees shall have powers delegated by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

3.2.5 Section R104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read 

“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive 

applications. The Building Official shall review 

construction documents. The Planning and Zoning 

Commission shall review site plans. The Design 

Review Committee shall review construction 

documents and design for compliance with the current 

adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk 

shall issue permits upon approval when presented 

with a complete application by the Planning and 

Zoning Administrator, approval of construction 

47



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

7 
 

documents by the Building Official, approval of the 

site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission, 

and approval of the building design by the Design 

Review Committee if applicable. 

3.2.6 Section R104.7: Official records. The Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official. 

3.2.7 Section R104.7.1: Approvals. The Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace the building official. 

3.2.8 Section R104.7.5: Fees. The Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace the building official. 

3.2.9 Section R105.1: Required. The Town of Alpine shall 

replace the building official. 

3.2.10 Section R105.2: Work exempt from permit shall be 

amended by deleting numbers #1, #2, and #10. 

3.2.11 Section R105.2.1: Emergency repairs. The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building 

official.  

3.2.12 Section R105.3: Application for permit. Department of 

Building Safety shall be replaced with the Town of 

Alpine. 

3.2.13 Section R105.3: Application for permit. 7. Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall replace the building 

official. 

3.2.14 Section R105.3.2: The Time limitation of application. 

Shall be deleted in its entirety. 

3.2.15 Section R105.5: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its 

entirety.  

3.2.16 Section R106.1.: Submittal documents. Shall read 

“Construction documents, special inspection and 

structural observation programs, and other data shall 

be submitted in two paper sets and one digital set 

with each application for a permit. The construction 

documents shall be prepared by a registered design 

professional where required by the statutes of the 

jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed. 

Where special conditions exist, the Planning and 

Zoning Commission is authorized to require additional 

construction documents to be prepared by a 

registered design professional.”  

48



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

8 
 

3.2.17 Section 107.3: Temporary Power. The last sentence 

shall read, “The part covered by the temporary 

certificate shall comply with the requirements 

specified for temporary lighting, heat, or power in the 

National Electrical Code.” 

3.2.18 Section R108.2: Schedule of permit fees shall be 

revised to read, “On buildings, structures, electrical, 

gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations 

requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid 

as set forth in the adopted Town of Alpine permit fee 

schedule.” 

3.2.19 Section R108.5: Refunds. Shall read, “The governing 

authority is authorized to establish a refund policy 

when no work has been done under a permit issued 

in accordance with this code”. 

3.2.20 Section R108.6: Work commencing before permit 

issuance. The governing authority shall replace the 

Building Official. 

3.2.21 Add Section R109.3.1: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-

inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or 

re-inspection when such portion of the work for which 

inspection is requested is not complete or when 

required corrections have not been made. Re-

inspection fees may be assessed when the approved 

plans are not readily available to the inspector, for 

failure to provide access on the date for which 

inspection is requested, or for deviating from the 

plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.” 

3.2.22 Section 113.2: Notice of violation. “or the Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall be added after the 

building official.” 

3.2.23 Section R113.4: Violation penalties shall be revised to 

read, “Any person who violates a provision of this 

code or fails to comply with any of the requirements 

thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure in violation of the approved 

construction documents or directive of the building 

official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the 

provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties 

49



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

9 
 

as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the 

Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or 

revisions thereto.”  

3.2.24 Section R114.2.4: Unlawful continuance Failure to 

comply. Shall read “Any person who shall continue 

any work in or about the structure after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as 

that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe condition shall upon conviction be 

punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 

of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any 

amendments or revisions there.  

3.2.25 The first sentence in Section R301.1.3: Engineered 

design shall be revised to read, “All residential 

structures shall be designed by a civil or structural 

engineer licensed in the State of Wyoming”. 

3.2.26 Section R301.2.3: Snow Loads. A fourth sentence 

shall be added to the first paragraph and shall read, 

“The ground snow load shall be one hundred forty-

three (143) pounds per square foot and the roof snow 

load shall be one hundred (100) pounds per square 

foot.” 

3.2.27 Table R302.13: Fire Protection of Floors Exceptions 

Sub-Section 2 shall be revised to read “Floor 

assemblies located directly over a crawl space not 

intended for storage or for the installation of electric-

powered heating appliances.” 

3.2.28 Table R302.6; Dwelling/Garage Separation. Under 

Material Heading, shall be revised to read “all 

materials to be 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board.” 

3.2.29 Section R313: Automatic Sprinkler Systems shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

3.2.30 Section R403.3: Frost protection. Shall be replaced 

with the sentence reading, “Front-protected shallow 

foundations are prohibited”. 

3.2.31 Section N1102.2.11: Crawl Space Wall. The first 

sentence shall be changed to read, “Where the floor 

above the crawl space is uninsulated, insulation shall 

be installed on the crawl space walls and a Class I 

50



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

10 
 

vapor retarder shall be installed according to this 

code”. 

3.2.32 Section N1102.4.5: Air Leakage. Shall be deleted in 

its entirety.  

3.2.33 Section N1102.4.5.1.2: Air Leakage Testing. Shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

3.2.34 Section N1103.3.5.7 : Duct System Testing. Shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

3.2.35 Section G2406.2: Prohibited Locations. Delete 

Exceptions #3 and #4 in their entirety. 

3.2.36 Section G2445.2: Prohibited Use. Shall read, 

“Unvented room heaters shall not be installed in 

habitable rooms or spaces.” 

3.2.37 A second sentence shall be added to section 

G2445.7: Unvented Decorative Room Heaters and 

shall read, “Unvented decorative room heaters shall 

not be installed in habitable rooms or spaces”.  

3.2.38 Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth shall be amended to 

read, “Building sewers shall be a minimum of 48 

inches below grade or shall be protected from 

freezing in an approved manner by the administrative 

authority”. 

3.2.39 AF104 BE104.1: Testing. Shall be deleted in its 

entirety.  

4. INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (IPC) 

4.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located 

or placed within the town from and after the established effective date, 

upon approval and passage of this Ordinance s hall be properly 

plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International 

Plumbing Code (IPC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, 

as published by the International Cod e Council, specifically including 

“Appendix D”. The said Code is incorporated herein by reference as if 

the same were more fully herein set out except as follows: 

4.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Plumbing Code is hereby 

adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following 

amendments: 

4.2.1  Section 101.1 Title. Shall read. “These regulations 

shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of 

51



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

11 
 

the Town of Alpine, herein after referred to as ‘this 

code’”. 

4.2.2 Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official 

shall replace code official throughout this code unless 

otherwise specified below. 

4.2.3 Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The 

Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and 

the official in charge thereof shall be known as the 

Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of 

the agency shall be the implementation, 

administration, and enforcement of the provisions of 

this code unless otherwise specified in the 

amendments below.”  

4.2.4 Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”  

4.2.5 Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance 

with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and 

with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have 

the authority to appoint a building official, other related 

technical officers, inspectors, and other employees. 

Such employees shall have powers delegated by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

4.2.6 Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read 

“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive 

applications. The Building Official shall review 

construction documents. The Planning and Zoning 

Commission shall review site plans. The Design 

Review Committee shall review construction 

documents and design for compliance with the current 

adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk 

shall issue permits upon approval when presented 

with a complete application by the planning and 

zoning administrator, approval of construction 

documents by the Building Official, approval of the 

site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission, 

and approval of the building design by the Design 

Review Committee if applicable. 

52



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

12 
 

4.2.7 Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator 

shall replace code official. 

4.2.8 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

4.2.9 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

4.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine 

shall replace code official. 

4.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace code official. 

4.2.12 Section 105.5.3: Expiration. Shall be deleted in its 

entirety. 

4.2.13 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first 

sentence shall read, “Construction documents, 

engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data 

shall be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital 

set, with each permit application.”  

4.2.14 Add Section 111.2.1: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-

inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or 

re-inspection when such portion of the work for which 

inspection is requested is not complete or when 

required corrections have not been made. Re-

inspection fees may be assessed when the approved 

plans are not readily available to the inspector, for 

failure to provide access on the date for which 

inspection is requested, or for deviating from the 

plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.” 

4.2.15 Section 114.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building 

Official. 

4.2.16 Section 108.4 114.4 Violation Penalties. Shall read, “ 

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code 

or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements 

thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair 

plumbing work in violation of the approved 

construction documents, or directive of the code 

official, or a permit or certificate of occupancy issued 

under the provisions of this code, shall, upon 

conviction, be punished as provided in 111 Ordinance 

53



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

13 
 

No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code 

and any amendments or revisions thereto”. 

4.2.17 The last sentence of Section 108.5 115.4 Failure to 

Comply. The last sentence Stop work orders. shall 

read, “Any person who shall continue any work in or 

about the structure after having been served with a 

stop work order, except such work as that person is 

directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as 

provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of 

Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments or 

revisions thereto”. 

4.2.18 The last sentence of Section 305.4 Freezing. Shall 

read, “Exterior water supply system piping shall be 

installed not less than 6 feet below grade”. 

4.2.19 Section 305.4.1 Sewer depth. Shall read, “Building 

sewers shall be a minimum of 48 inches below grade 

or shall be protected from freezing in an approved 

manner by the administrative authority”. 

5. INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (IMC) 

5.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located 

or placed within the town from and after the established effective date, 

upon approval and passage of this Ordinance, shall be properly plumbed 

in accordance with the requirements of the International Mechanical C ode 

(IMC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as published by 

the International Code Council. The said Code is incorporated herein by 

reference as if the same were more fully set out herein, except as follows:  

5.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Mechanical Code is hereby 

adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following 

amendments: 

5.2.1 Section 101.1 Title. Shall read, “These regulations shall 

be known as the Mechanical Code of the Town of Alpine, 

herein after referred to as ‘this code’”. 

5.2.2 Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official 

shall replace code official throughout this code. 

5.2.3 Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The Town 

of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and the 

official in charge thereof shall be known as the Planning 

and Zoning Administrator. The function of the agency 

54



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

14 
 

shall be the implementation, administration, and 

enforcement of the provisions of this code unless 

otherwise specified in the amendments below.”  

5.2.4 Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the chief 

appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

5.2.5 Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance with 

the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and with the 

concurrence of the appointing authority, the chief 

appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have the 

authority to appoint a building official, other related 

technical officers, inspectors, and other employees. 

Such employees shall have powers delegated by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

5.2.6 Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read “The 

Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive 

applications. The Building Official shall review 

construction documents. The Planning and Zoning 

Commission shall review site plans. The Design Review 

Committee shall review construction documents and 

design for compliance with the current adopted Design 

Review Standards. The Town Clerk shall issue permits 

upon approval when presented with a complete 

application by the planning and zoning administrator, 

approval of construction documents by the Building 

Official, approval of the site plan by the Planning and 

Zoning Commission, and approval of the building design 

by the Design Review Committee if applicable. 

5.2.7 Section 104.7: Official records. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

5.2.8 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official.  

5.2.9 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

5.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine shall 

replace code official. 

5.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace code official. 

55



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

15 
 

5.2.12 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application. Shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

5.2.13 Section 105.4.3: Expiration shall be deleted in its 

entirety. 

5.2.14 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first 

sentence shall read, “Construction documents, 

engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data shall 

be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital set, with 

each permit application.” 

5.2.15 Section 108.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence: The 

governing authority shall replace the Building Official. 

5.2.16 Section 108.4: Work commencing before permit 

issuance. The governing authority shall replace code 

official. 

5.2.17 Section 108.6: Refunds. Shall read, “The governing 

authority is authorized to establish a refund policy when 

no work has been done under a permit issued in 

accordance with this code”.  

5.2.18 Add Section 111.2.2: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-inspection 

fee will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection 

when such portion of the work for which inspection is 

requested is not complete or when required corrections 

have not been made. Re-inspection fees may be 

assessed when the approved plans are not readily 

available to the inspector, for failure to provide access on 

the date for which inspection is requested, or for 

deviating from the plans requiring the approval of the 

Town of Alpine.” 

5.2.19 Section 114.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building 

Official. 

5.2.20 Section 114.4: Violation penalties. Shall read “Persons 

who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall 

erect, install, alter or repair mechanical work in violation 

of the approved construction documents or directive of 

the Building Official, or permit or certificate issued under 

the provisions of this co de, shall be subject to penalties 

as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of 

56



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

16 
 

Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions 

thereto.” 

5.2.21 Section 115.4: Failure to comply shall read “Any person 

who shall continue any work after having been served 

with a stop work order, except such work as that person 

is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition shall upon conviction be punished as provided 

in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine 

Municipal Code or any amendments or revisions 

thereto.” 

5.2.22 A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.2.3 

Approval Required and shall read, “A re-inspection fee 

will be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection 

when such portion of the work for which inspection is 

requested is not complete or when required corrections 

have not been made. Re-inspection fees will be 

assessed when the approved plans are not readily 

available to the inspector; for failure to provide access 

on the date for which inspection is requested or for 

deviating from the plans requiring the approval of the 

Building Official”. 

5.2.23 Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Shall read, “Any 

person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 

fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or 

who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing or 

mechanical work in violation of the approved 

construction documents or directive of the code official, 

or of a permit or certificate of occupancy issued under 

the provisions of this code, shall, upon conviction, be 

punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 of 

the Town of Alpine Municipal Code and any amendments 

or revisions thereto.” 

5.2.24 The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders 

shall read, “Any person who shall continue any work in 

or about the structure after having been served with a 

stop work, except such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition shall, 

upon conviction, be punished as provided in 111 

57



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

17 
 

Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal 

Code and any amendments or revisions thereto.”  

5.2.25 A second sentence shall be added to Section 903.3 

Unvented Decorative Room gas log heaters. Shall read, 

“Unvented gas logs shall not be installed in habitable 

rooms or spaces.” 

6. INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE (IFC) 

6.1 APPLICABILITY: There is hereby adopted by the Town Council of the 

Town of Alpine, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing 

conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous 

materials or explosion, that certain Code and Standards known as the 

International Fire Code (IFC). Edition currently in use by the state of 

Wyoming), including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G, published by the 

International Code Council, hereby establishing an effective date upon 

approval and passage of this ordinance. The International Fire Code is 

hereby incorporated by reference as if the same were more fully set 

out herein. 

6.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Fire Code is hereby adopted 

and incorporated herein by reference. 

7. INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (IFGC) 

7.1 APPLICABILITY: All buildings and temporary structures built, located 

or placed within the town from and after the established effective date, 

upon approval and passage of this Ordinance s hall be properly 

plumbed in accordance with the requirements of the International Fuel 

Gas Code (IFGC), Edition currently in use by the state of Wyoming, as 

published by the International Co de Council. The said Code is 

incorporated herein by reference as if the same were more fully he rein 

set out except as follows: 

7.2 IMPLEMENTATION: The International Fuel Gas Code is hereby 

adopted and incorporated herein by reference, except for the following 

amendments: 

7.2.1 Section 101.1: Title. shall read, “These regulations 

shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the Town of 

Alpine, hereinafter referred to as ‘this code’”.  

7.2.2 Add Section 101.1.1 Building Official. Building Official 

shall replace code official throughout this code unless 

otherwise specified below. 

7.2.3 Section 103.1: Creation of agency. Shall read “The 

Town of Alpine Planning and Zoning Department and 

58



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

18 
 

the official in charge thereof shall be known as the 

Planning and Zoning Administrator. The function of 

the agency shall be the implementation, 

administration, and enforcement of the provisions of 

this code unless otherwise specified in the 

amendments below.”  

7.2.4 Section 103.2: Appointment. Shall read “The Planning 

and Zoning Administrator shall be appointed by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.”  

7.2.5 Section 103.3: Deputies. Shall read “In accordance 

with the prescribed procedures of the jurisdiction and 

with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction shall have 

the authority to appoint a building official, other related 

technical officers, inspectors, and other employees. 

Such employees shall have powers delegated by the 

chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction.” 

7.2.6 Section 104.3: Applications and permits. Shall read 

“The Planning and Zoning Administrator shall receive 

applications. The Building Official shall review 

construction documents. The Planning and Zoning 

Commission shall review site plans. The Design 

Review Committee shall review construction 

documents and design for compliance with the current 

adopted Design Review Standards. The Town Clerk 

shall issue permits upon approval when presented 

with a complete application by the planning and 

zoning administrator, approval of construction 

documents by the Building Official, approval of the 

site plan by the Planning and Zoning Commission, 

and approval of the building design by the Design 

Review Committee if applicable. 

7.2.7 Section 104.7: Planning and Zoning Administrator 

shall replace code official. 

7.2.8 Section 104.7.1: Approvals. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

7.2.9 Section 104.7.5: Fees. Planning and Zoning 

Administrator shall replace code official. 

59



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

19 
 

7.2.10 Section 105.1: Where required. The Town of Alpine 

shall replace code official. 

7.2.11 Section 105.3: Application for permit. Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall replace code official. 

7.2.12 Section 105.3.2: Time limitation of application shall be 

deleted in its entirety. 

7.2.13 Section 105.4.3: Expiration shall be deleted in its 

entirety. 

7.2.14 Section 106.1: Construction documents. The first 

sentence shall read, “Construction documents, 

engineering calculations, diagrams, and other data 

shall be submitted in two paper sets, and one digital 

set, with each permit application.” 

7.2.15 A third sentence shall be added to Section 107.3.3 

Re-inspection and testing and shall read, “A re-

inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or 

re-inspection when such portion of the work for which 

inspection is requested is not complete or when 

required corrections have not been made. Re-

inspection fees may be assessed when the approved 

plans are not readily available to the inspector, for 

failure to provide access on the date for which 

inspection is requested, or for deviating from the 

plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine” 

7.2.16 Section 108.3: Permit valuations. The last sentence: 

The governing authority shall replace Building Official. 

7.2.17 Section 108.4: Work commencing before permit 

issuance. The governing authority shall replace code 

official. 

7.2.18 The last sentence of Section 108.5 Stop work orders 

shall read, “Any person who shall continue any work 

in or about the structure after having been served with 

a stop work order, except such work as that person is 

directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition shall, upon conviction, be punished as 

provided in 111-Ordinance No. 2005-01 of the Town of 

Alpine Municipal Code or any amendments or 

revisions thereto”. 

60



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

20 
 

7.2.19 Section 108.6: Refunds shall read, “The governing 

authority is authorized to establish a refund policy 

when no work has been done under a permit issued 

in accordance with this code”. 

7.2.20 Add Section 111.3.3.1: Re-inspection Fee. “A re-

inspection fee will be assessed for each inspection or 

re-inspection when such portion of the work for which 

inspection is requested is not complete or when 

required corrections have not been made. Re-

inspection fees may be assessed when the approved 

plans are not readily available to the inspector, for 

failure to provide access on the date for which 

inspection is requested, or for deviating from the 

plans requiring the approval of the Town of Alpine.” 

7.2.21 Section 113.2: Notice of violation. Or Planning and 

Zoning Administrator shall be added after Building 

Official. 

7.2.22 Section 108.4 113.4 Violation Penalties. Shall read, 

“Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

shall fail to comply with any of the requirements 

thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair 

plumbing or mechanical work in violation of the 

approved construction documents or directive of the 

code official, or of a permit or certificate of occupancy 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall, upon 

conviction, be punished as provided in 111-Ordinance 

No. 2005-01 of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or 

any amendments or revisions thereto.” 

7.2.23 Section 114.4: Failure to comply. Shall read “Any 

person who shall continue any work after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as 

that person is directed to perform to remove a 

violation or unsafe condition shall upon conviction be 

punished as provided in 111 Ordinance No. 2005-01 

of the Town of Alpine Municipal Code or any 

amendments or revisions thereto.” 

7.2.24 Section 303.3: Prohibited Locations. Exception 

numbers 3 and 4 shall be deleted. 

61



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

21 
 

7.2.25 Section 303.3.1: Fireplaces and decorative 

appliances in Group I-2 occupancies. A third sentence 

will be added and read Unvented Decorative Room 

Heaters. “Unvented Decorative Room Heaters shall 

not be installed in habitable spaces”. 

8. GRACE PERIOD FOR BUILDING DESIGN PHASE AND APPLICATIONS: 

Projects that are in the building design phase and have submitted relevant 

applications before the effective date of this ordinance shall be granted a grace 

period of six (6) months from the effective date of the newly implemented codes 

to obtain a building permit. During this grace period, such projects may proceed 

under the standards, regulations, and requirements that were in effect at the time 

of application submission and will not be subject to the new provisions introduced 

by this ordinance. If a building permit is not obtained within the six-month grace 

period, the application shall be deemed void, and any associated application fees 

will be forfeited. A new application must then be submitted in compliance with the 

currently adopted ICC codes in effect at that time. 

9. VIOLATIONS, PENALTIES, AND REMEDIES  

9.1 Unlawful to Violate Ordinance: It will be unlawful for any person, private 

firm or corporation, or public agency to construct, alter, expand, 

renovate, or demolish any building or structure in violation of the Alpine 

Land Use and Development Code. 

9.2  Continuing Violations and Penalties: Any person, group, firm, or 

corporation whether as principle, agent, employee, or otherwise, 

violating, causing, or permitting the violation of the provisions of this 

ordinance will be guilty of a misdemeanor, subject to a Seven Hundred 

and Fifty ($750) dollar fine, such person, group, firm, or corporation will 

be deemed to be guilty of a separate offense for each and every d ay 

during which any violation of this ordinance is committed, continues or 

results from the act ion or inaction of such person, group, firm, or 

corporation. 

9.3  Town Enforce through Appropriate Civil Remedy: The Town may also 

enforce this ordinance through any appropriate civil remedy. 

9.4  Actions for Penalties or Fines:  

9.4.1 To be brought in Corporate Name. All actions brought 

to recover any penalty or fine will be brought in the 

corporate name of the municipality. 

9.4.2 Disposition of Recoveries. The recoveries, when 

collected, will be paid into the treasury of the 

municipality.  

62



 

Town of Alpine- Building Code 
Adopted- xx/xx/xxxx Ordinance 2025-xx 

22 
 

9.5  Applicability of “Wyoming Administrative Procedure Act”: In all 

proceedings before an agency or board pursuant to the rules set forth 

in this article, the "Wyoming Administrative Procedure Act" will apply. If 

a conflict arises between such act and the rules set forth in this article, 

the act will supersede these rules. 

9.6  Ordinance Enforceable in Addition to Other Remedies: The Alpine 

International Code Council Codes will be enforceable in addition to the 

other remedies provided by law, by injunction, mandamus, or 

proceedings in abatement. 

63


	Top
	Section 3, Itema.	PANTONE, ANNA Lot #40 of Forest Meadow. 504 Three Rivers Dr. (G-0725-0001)- New detached garage/accessory building
	Elevations 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot #40 Forest Meadows Garage-Pantone
	Application 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot # 40 Forest Meadows- garage-Pantone
	Plans 504 Three Rivers Dr. Lot #40 Forest MeadowsGargage-Pantone

	Section 3, Itemc.	BENNETT, BRETT, AND META Lot #27 Greys River Village, 368 Wooden Spur Dr. (REM-0625-0001)- Remodel and addition to existing home and addition of an accessory building. Modification to accessory building size.
	2025-08-11_368 WD SPR_MINOR REV

	Section , Item	ALPINE EDUCATION FOUNDATION- Proposed  Lot #15 of the Alpine West Third Edition- Review site plan for compliance and suggestions.
	2025-08-11_AEF - SP101 SITE STUDY
	2025-0721 AlpineWest3rd TOPO

	Section , Item	Updating to the 2024 International Code Council Codes.
	285 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2022-03
	287 Ordinance 2022-05 Mechanical Code  2021 Edition
	289 Ordinance No. 2022-07 PLUMBING CODE 2021
	290 Ord No. 2022 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2021
	286 ORDINANCE No. 2022-04 International Residential Code 2021
	288 Ordinance No. 2022-06 International Fuel & Gas Code 2021 Edition
	Town of Alpine- Building Code Table of Contents
	COMBINED ICC- Building Code ORDINANCE
	Town of Alpine- Building Code

	Bottom

